Buyer: Mary Lanning

3644 OF

Department of Education

Opening Date: 05/17/2011

Video Conferencing Equipment Aves Audio \Iﬁ:?al Systems, B & H Photo Video Business Services
.% Description QTY UOoM Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
1 [FUBSTQ . . 15| EA |s$ 17300|$ 259500|$% 169.00|$  253500|$  236.98|$  3,554.70
Audio-Technica, Cardioid Condenser Gooseneck Microphone (phantom powered)
2 [FATBOATOMS wicroohone Mue 15| EA |[$ 7000|$  105000|$ 6100 $ 91500 |$  89.98|$  1,349.70
3 [DMEGAN 1| EA NO BID NO BID $ 7,559.98|$  7,550.98
Yamaha, Digital Audio Processor
4 @ﬁﬁﬁ’ﬁﬁ /GOA AZS Expansion Module 2| EA NO BID $ 51500|$  103000|$ 62698|$  1,253.96
5 iﬁnﬁigiemotely Controllable 8-Channel 24-bit Head AMP and AD Converter 1 EA NO BID NO BID Not Available
6 17\g:LaAanDa?a_',RRemoter Controllable 8-Channel 24-bit Head AMP and AD Converter 1 EA NO BID NO BID Not Available
7 iﬁnﬁigiemotely Controllable 8-Channel 24-bit Head AMP and AD Converter 1 EA NO BID NO BID Not Available
B [ D oA ALS gt 2| Ea NO BID $ 35600 $ 712.00 Not Available
9 f?nf;ay Cable fom MY L6AE ADEHR 3| EA NO BID NO BID Not Available
10 ?jaan;?]S’ Break-Out Cable from MY8-DA96 to XLR-M's 2 EA NO BID NO BID Not Available
11 ’gﬁggfﬁ%igm refephone Hybrid 1| EA NO BID NO BID Not Available
12 igtii?c;?r(l\)ﬂ??;iznllzrofile Wall Mount for TANDBERG Precision HD Cameras 3 EA NO BID $ 107.95) 3 32385 Not Available
13 ir[;z:lr;,\rﬂg)%g(gigitalMe T Stcher 1| EA |$ 219500|$  2195.00 NO BID Not Available
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3644 OF
Department of Education

Opening Date: 05/17/2011

Video Conferencing Equipment Aves Audio \Iﬁ:?al Systems, B & H Photo Video Business Services
.% Description QTY UOoM Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
14 izzfr;z?(éi;g;;\nidia 8GTM Shielded Twisted Pair Transmitter 201 6 EA $ 667.00 | $ 4,002.00 NO BID Not Available
15 17irlvDezlrcc):n-,cl:DigitalMedia 8GTM STP Input Card for DMTM Switchers 6 EA $ 565.00| $ 3,390.00 NO BID Not Available
16 izzlrgr;mDDM@ Input Card for DigitalMedia TM Switchers 2 EA $ 420003 840.00 NO BID Not Available
17 ’gzggﬁﬁﬂ 66 STP wi2 HOM Output Card 1| EA |$ 1,34500|$  1,345.00 NO BID Not Available
18 igg&c”ffm it Stereo Analog Audio Output Card 1| Ea |s 72000(s 729.00 NO BID Not Available
#DM-RMC-100-C
19 |Crestron, DigitalMedia 8GTM Shielded Twisted Pair Receiver & Room Controller 3 EA $ 415.00( $ 1,245.00 NO BID Not Available
100
20 igggfﬁ;‘;im nmanaged) 1| EA |$ 215008 215.00 NO BID Not Available
21 ’:gsloi"";owemfe 15w Multimedia Projector 1| EA NO BID $ 1,00500|$  1,00500|$% 1,08098|$  1,089.98
22 ﬁZaJrIEszs-,lCeiling Mount for Epson 915W Projector 1 EA NO BID $ 5400 $ 54.00 | $ 79.98| % 79.98
23 Zr';acn;ig,'fE7D3fikm b Tv-1080p (FUlkO) 1| Ea NO BID $ 2,850.00| $  2,850.00 | $ 3,119.98|$  3,119.98
24 [t LCD Tv-1080 (FHD) 1| EA NO BID $ 285000 $  2850.00|$ 3119.98|$  3,119.98
25 17cgthl:i)elfj,FLQJ;Ji\I/?:ersaI Flat Panel Dual Swing Arm Wall Mount (42-71" Displays), Black 2 EA NO BID $ 57000| $ 1,140.00 | $ 516.98| $ 1,033.96
26 ﬁf;';gf’ o2 Control System 1| EA |$ 184600 %  1,846.00 NO BID No Bid
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3644 OF
Department of Education

Opening Date: 05/17/2011

Video Conferencing Equipment Aves Audio \Iﬁ:?al Systems, B & H Photo Video Business Services
.% Description QTY UOoM Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
27 iggtrEo’:,ES-irr;;I.e Ethernet Port Module for PRO2 1 EA $ 475.00 | $ 475.00 NO BID No Bid
28 ZIDSIQ,I?Pad for Touch Panel Interface (via App) 1 EA NO BID NO BID No Bid
29 [F S b0 1| EA NO BID NO BID No Bid
30 ﬁzgr;(r?BDng-fa?l\/-lzizggﬁ Cable, plenum, 500 ft spool 2 EA NO BID NO BID No Bid
31 izz:lr-oi,GE;giglNM’::i:ilngTM Cable Connector, 100-Pack 1 EA NO BID NO BID No Bid
32 ﬁzgroiecgm?lrl:ﬂgiool for DM-8G-CONN 1 EA NO BID NO BID No Bid
33 igké(iﬁéﬁgii?nera VISCA Remote Control (plenum rated) 250 EA NO BID NO BID No Bid
34 ﬁl(a::;(é;ﬁ;ﬁg?ﬂlig;shbfes (plenum rated) 1,800 EA NO BID NO BID No Bid
35 ﬁﬁiﬁm Male Shielded Connectors 15 EA NO BID NO BID No Bid
36 zgjgégljoailiztge-g?ﬂ:j'I?ransmitter CWDM DFB Laser 1310 nm 1 EA NO BID NO BID No Bid
37 iz;t(;?I?DEngp;iTt%g;ftﬁcgl Converter, High Sensitivity 1 EA NO BID NO BID No Bid
3g [FCONVMCAUDS _ 1| EA NO BID $ 39800 $ 39800 |$  509.98 | $ 509.98
Blackmagic, Mini-converter - Audio to SDI
39 ggflfn’:‘;g'i\ﬁﬂ'?nionvener_ . 1| Ea NO BID $ 41500 $ 41500 $ 50098 $ 509.98
40 zimd':e(;i-s't:ir% :!!eBrlfr?mESXO—II—BEB'\;sSeIr?eNm to 6th Floor 1 EA NO BID NO BID No Bid
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3644 OF

Department of Education

Opening Date: 05/17/2011

Video Conferencing Equipment Aves Audio \Igts;ual Systems, B & H Photo Video Business Services
)
.5 Description QTY UOoM Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
#FC-FC FEMALE ADAPTER .
41 FC to FC Single-Mode for F to F adapter 2 EA NO BID NO BID No Bid
#STREAMZ-LIVE-1400 FLASH VP6
Digital Rapids, 1RU Single-channel Adobe Flash 8 (On2 VP6) 1RU analog/digital
DS live streaming/archiving encoder, SDI, Component, S-Video and Composite
42 video inputs; 8-channel audio input (4 balanced analog, 4 unbalanced analog, AES, 1 EA NO BID NO BID $ 1029998 | $ 10,299.98
embedded SDI). SDI connection module included; optional breakout cable or
breakout box required for analog and AES. Windows Media Codec is provided.
The ability to make an early delivery may be a factor in determining the award. Be
specific regarding the delivery schedule.
Delivery: days 7-14 7-10 12-14
ARO (After Receipt of Order)
**NO SUBSTITUTES ON ALL ITEMS*** ***NO SUBSTITUTES ON ALL ITEMS***
Totals: $ 19,927.00 | $ 14,227.85 | $ 33,482.16
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 0% 10
Delivery Days ARO: 30 7-10 12 -14
Comments: "Free Shipping"
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

Department of Education

3644 OF

Opening Date: 05/17/2011

AWARD
Video Conferencing Equipment Concepts AV Integration Conference Technologies Howard Industries, Inc.
)
.5 Description QTY uoM Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
1 [#UBSTQ 15| EA |$ 10116|$ 286740 $ 190.84|$ 286260 $ 19200|$  2,880.00
Audio-Technica, Cardioid Condenser Gooseneck Microphone (phantom powered) ' ' ' : ’ ’ ’ ' '
o |FATBE47QMS _ 15| EA |$ 7020|$ 105300|$ 70.08|$ 1,05120|$ 7800|$  1,170.00
Audio-Technica, Base w/Microphone Mute
3 |FDMEGAN 1| EA No Bid $ 588233|$ 588233|$ 7,64000|$  7,640.00
Yamaha, Digital Audio Processor
#MY16-AE -
4 Yamaha, Mini YGDAI AES Expansion Module 2 EA No Bid $ 58051 | $ 1,161.02 | $ 655.00 | $ 1,310.00
#AD8BHR .
s Yamaha, Remotely Controllable 8-Channel 24-bit Head AMP and AD Converter 1 EA No Bid $ 211086 | $ 2,110.86
#ADBHR -
6 Yamaha, Remotely Controllable 8-Channel 24-bit Head AMP and AD Converter 1 EA No Bid $ 211086 | $ D
#AD8BHR .
7 Yamaha, Remotely Controllable 8-Channel 24-bit Head AMP and AD Converter 1 EA No Bid $ 211086 | $ 2,110.86
#AMY8-DA96 -
8 Yamaha, Mini YGDAI AES Digital Output 2 EA No Bid $ 407.76 | $ e
#D24 .
9 Yamaha, Cable from MY16-AE ADSHR 3 EA No Bid $ 12949 | $ 388.47
#DA96 -
10 Yamaha, Break-Out Cable from MY8-DA96 to XLR-M's 2 EA No Bid $ 60.14  $ Het 2
#XAP400 .
11 ClearOne, Digital Telephone Hybrid 1 EA No Bid $ 163235 % 1,632.35
#535-2000-217
12 Vaddio TM, Thin Profile Wall Mount for TANDBERG Precision HD Cameras 3 EA $ 97.20 | $ 291.60 | 97.04 % 22
#DM-MD8X8
13 Crestron, 8X8 DigitalMedia TM Switcher 1 EA $ 2,322.00| $ 2,322.00 ($ 2,318.06 | $ 2,318.06

Page 5 of 12




Buyer: Mary Lanning

Department of Education

3644 OF

Opening Date: 05/17/2011

Video Conferencing Equipment Concepts AV Integration Conference Technologies Howard Industries, Inc.

.% Description QTY uoM Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
14 ﬁlr:)e,s\{lr-o-rn,)gi;gil;\llidia 8GTM Shielded Twisted Pair Transmitter 201 6 EA $ 702.00 | $ 4,212.00 | $ 70081 ( $ 4,204.86
15 ﬁlr?az:lrtc):n-,(lz)igitalMedia 8GTM STP Input Card for DMTM Switchers 6 EA $ 594.00| $ 3,564.00 ||'$ 50299 | $ SR
16 ﬁlr:)e,s\{lrgr;l_l'-lDDM@ Input Card for DigitalMedia TM Switchers 2 EA $ 432001 % 864.00 ALl B2
17 ﬁzzﬂfﬁﬁﬂ 56 STP wi2 HOMI Outout Card 1| EA |$ 140400|$ 140400 | $ 1,40162|$  1,401.62
18 ﬁlr:)e,s\{lrgn(,):l:gHsDMl w/4 Stereo Analog Audio Output Card 1 EA $ 756.00| $ 756.00 (g ez [

#DM-RMC-100-C
19 |crestron, DigitalMedia 8GTM Shielded Twisted Pair Receiver & Room Controller 3 EA $ 486.00( $ 1,458.00| $ 485.18( $ 1,455.54

100
20 ﬁiggfﬁﬁgiwimh nmanaged) 1| EA |$ 216008 216.00 | $ 21563 | $ 215.63
21 1'JLI-'ELL;?s];)i‘li\,l\liowerLife 915W Multimedia Projector 1 EA No Bid $ 112992 $ Lilzeiee
22 ﬁ:e\ilzszs-,lceiling Mount for Epson 915W Projector 1 EA $ 5430| % 5430 % ezl SRzl
23 zt';a%??g"rLEEL:“fikm LD Tv-1080p (FUIHO) 1| EaA |s$ 273888|3$ 273888|$ 2,70404|$  2,704.04
24 [ LCD Tv-1080p (FUlHD) 1| EA |$ 273888|$ 273883 |$ 270404($  2,704.04
25 fr::i)e?stji\irsal Flat Panel Dual Swing Arm Wall Mount (42-71" Displays), Black 2 EA $ 50479 | $ 1,009.58 (% 587.92 | $ Ll
26 [PRO2 1| EA |$ 1,94400|$  194400|$ 1,94070| $  1,940.70

Crestron, Pro2 Control System
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

Department of Education

3644 OF

Opening Date: 05/17/2011

Video Conferencing Equipment Concepts AV Integration Conference Technologies Howard Industries, Inc.
.% Description QTY uoM Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
27 ﬁriftlli)’:,ES-il;gl-e Ethernet Port Module for PRO2 1 EA No Bid $ 485.18 | $ 485.18
28 f:::lg?Pad for Touch Panel Interface (via App) 1 EA No Bid $ 538.01| % seaied
29 ﬁiigf’m;e o 1| EA No Bid $ 107.81 | $ 107.81
30 ﬁlr?az:lr:)criBDITg-faCI;‘l\;EdE';g‘?l\a Cable, plenum, 500 ft spool 2 EA $ 324001 % 648.00 |'$ 32345 % eray
31 ﬁlr:)e,s\{lr;i,GD-giglNM’:;i:iLaogGTM Cable Connector, 100-Pack 1 EA $ 270.00 | $ 270.00 | $ 269.54 | $ 269.54
32 ﬁzgr;ii‘fmi'm“"giool ot DVLEG.CONN 1| EA |$ 43200]$ 43200 | $ 43127 $ 431.27
33 ﬁgrll_(,A(iltfl-eﬁjiiiera VISCA Remote Control (plenum rated) 250 EA No Bid $ 1081 $ 2O
34 ﬁgié(iﬁéég?ﬂligcfhﬂges (plenum rated) 1,800 EA No Bid $ 070 % N
35 lflz(ulzrl?(,-lgLR Male Shielded Connectors 15 EA No Bid $ 539 % 80.85
36 i&:‘tg,SEDoaiia—trtae-ngti:jaansmmer CWDM DFB Laser 1310 nm 1 EA No Bid $ 235040 $ sl
37 gZng?SDET-VHODp;iTtE(I;I-:;ftlr?iclil Converter, High Sensitivity 1 EA No Bid $ 260916 | & 2,609.16
38 ggiﬂa\gr’%ﬁggfmer I 1| EA |$ 427688 42768|$ 507.01| $ 507.01
39 ggﬁgﬁ‘g‘ﬁ;'ﬂimvﬂmr oM 6 <Dy 1| EA |$ 42768 42768 | $ 44403 | $ 444.03
40 iimd':efi-s't:ir% Li:tI)eBrEr?mESXOLEBNasS;n?eﬂt to 6th Floor 1 EA No Bid $ 108| % L0
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3644 OF

Department of Education

Opening Date: 05/17/2011

Video Conferencing Equipment

Concepts AV Integration

Conference Technologies

Howard Industries, Inc.

[}
.5 Description QTY uoM Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
#FC-FC FEMALE ADAPTER :
41 FC to FC Single-Mode for F to F adapter 2 EA No Bid $ 45318 9.06
#STREAMZ-LIVE-1400 FLASH VP6
Digital Rapids, 1RU Single-channel Adobe Flash 8 (On2 VP6) 1RU analog/digital
DS live streaming/archiving encoder, SDI, Component, S-Video and Composite :
42 video inputs; 8-channel audio input (4 balanced analog, 4 unbalanced analog, AES, 1 EA No Bid $11,320.75 | $ LLER T
embedded SDI). SDI connection module included; optional breakout cable or
breakout box required for analog and AES. Windows Media Codec is provided.
The ability to make an early delivery may be a factor in determining the award. Be
specific regarding the delivery schedule.
Delivery: days 14 30
ARO (After Receipt of Order)
***NO SUBSTITUTES ON ALL ITEMS*** **NO SUBSTITUTES ON ALL ITEMS***
Totals: $ 29,699.00 | $ 66,348.18 | $ 13,000.00
Payment Terms: 0% O NA 0%
Delivery Days ARO: 14 10- 14

Comments:

All Warranties Per Stated
Manufactures
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

Department of Education

3644 OF

Opening Date: 05/17/2011

Video Conferencing Equipment VSA, Inc. VSA, Inc. I\D/IZCvEsi?itaI Video
'% Description QTY | UOM | UnitPrice | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
1 ZtLLJJd?oEj'Zchhnica, Cardioid Condenser Gooseneck Microphone (phantom powered) 15 EA $ 15651 | $ 2,347.65 NB
2 fﬁj—i[;)s—'?:cigcl:\g,SBase w/Microphone Mute 15 EA $ 59.12  $ 886.80 NB
3 f:aDm,\gEa(,i‘lD'i\;ital Audio Processor 1 EA $ 5574.00| $ 5,574.00 NB
4 iZnYa:rIl-aG,-Cilr?i YGDAI AES Expansion Module 2 EA $ 541.00 | $ 1,082.00 NB
5 f:aArr?'iz II?feemotely Controllable 8-Channel 24-bit Head AMP and AD Converter 1 EA $ 198300 $ 1,983.00 NB
6 i?ni?: RRemotely Controllable 8-Channel 24-bit Head AMP and AD Converter 1 EA $ 1,983.00| $ 1,983.00 NB
! f:aArr?'iz II?feemotely Controllable 8-Channel 24-bit Head AMP and AD Converter 1 EA $ 198300 $ 1,983.00 NB
8 ﬁ?ﬂl:ﬂa:](f '\Ii::\ ?(GGDAI AES Digital Output 2| EA |$ 38300|% 766.00 NB
o ?aDmﬁa, Cable from MY16-AE AD8HR 3| EA |$ 11200($ 336.00 NB
10 iaan;?lS Break-Out Cable from MY8-DAY6 to XLR-M's 2| EA [$ 58.00 | $ 116.00 NB
11 ﬁi:aArg:tgoDigital Telephone Hybrid 1 EA NB NB
12 ii{ij?c;i?ﬂ(,)?'hiznlgoﬂle Wall Mount for TANDBERG Precision HD Cameras 3 EA $ 98.77 | $ 296.31 NB
13 ﬁlr:)e,s\{lr-c:\rﬂzsggigitalMedia TM Switcher 1 EA NB $ 2,241.00( $ 2,241.00
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3644 OF

Department of Education

Opening Date:

Video Conferencing Equipment VSA, Inc. VSA, Inc. I\D/IZCvle?si?itaI Video
.% Description QTY uoMm Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
14 ﬁlr:)e,s\{lr-o-rnﬁ:-)i;g;;\/lidia 8GTM Shielded Twisted Pair Transmitter 201 6] EA NB $ 67700 $  4,062.00
15 ﬁlr?azfrtc):n-,CDigitalMedia 8GTM STP Input Card for DMTM Switchers 6 EA NB $ 569.00 | $ 3,414.00
16 ?i’s\frgr;:%M@ Input Card for DigitalMedia TM Switchers 2| EA NB $ 41600 | $ 832.00
17 ilr?e!fr(():n,o;sDSM 8G STP w/2 HDMI Output Card 11 EA NB $ 1,34400| $ 1,344.00
18 ﬁlr:)e,s\{lrgn(,):l:gHsDMl w/4 Stereo Analog Audio Output Card 1 EA NB $ 727.00 | $ 727.00
#DM-RMC-100-C
19 |crestron, DigitalMedia 8GTM Shielded Twisted Pair Receiver & Room Controller 3 EA NB $ 472.00( $ 1,416.00
100
20 ﬁrigsr;,ss-\/\li-ol::t%slfsmtch (unmanaged) 1 EA NB $ 215.00 [ $ 215.00
21 #Etgs];)?\\,l\liowerufe 915W Multimedia Projector 1 EA $ 101731 $ 1,017.31 NB
22 Iﬁ:e\ilzszs-,lceiling Mount for Epson 915W Projector 1 EA [ $ 53.12 | $ 53.12 NB
23 ztl:;:r;zg‘l‘_l_EgDs—saliklit LCD TV-1080p (FullHD) 1] EA [$ 267900 3%  2,679.00 NB
24 zrf;gl'_LEE?D?ﬁikln LCD TV-1080p (FullHD) 1] EA [$ 2679.00|$  2,679.00 NB
25 fr::i)el?stji\irsal Flat Panel Dual Swing Arm Wall Mount (42-71" Displays), Black 2 EA $ 501.12 | $ 1,002.24 NB
26 ﬁ::::trco)n2 Pro2 Control System 1 EA NB $ 1,840.00 | $ 1,840.00
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3644 OF

Department of Education

Opening Date:

Video Conferencing Equipment VSA, Inc. VSA, Inc. I\D/IZCvle?si?itaI Video
.% Description QTY uoMm Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
27 ﬁriftlli)’:,ES-il;gl-e Ethernet Port Module for PRO2 1 EA NB $ 477.00 | $ 477.00
28 f:::l’i?Pad for Touch Panel Interface (via App) 1 EA NB NB
20 |2 ecvon Mobie 1o 1| ea | e NE
30 ﬁzm;ﬁiifﬁ&;iiggla Cable, plenum, 500 ft spool 2 EA NB $ 384.00 | $ 768.00
31 ﬁgls\fr;i,eo-;glNM’:;ilaogGTM Cable Connector, 100-Pack 1] EA NB $ 266.00| $ 266.00
32 ilr?e!froiecﬁ:mi:nMgPTool for DM-8G-CONN 1] EA NB $ 41900 | $ 419.00
33 ﬁgrll_(,Aczltfl-eﬁjiiiera VISCA Remote Control (plenum rated) 250 EA NB NB
34 ﬁgiA(iﬁI;Af(l)-: If/lligcfhl:)}:es (plenum rated) 1,800 EA NB NB
35 ﬁ?u%:?(?IELR Male Shielded Connectors 15 EA NB NB
36 #Et\?:‘g,SEDoSiia—trtae-ngti:jaansmmer CWDM DFB Laser 1310 nm 1 EA No Bid NB
37 gZZn(i?l-ioDE'l:\/HODpTi(ithCE:I:‘ft'r?icLil Converter, High Sensitivity 1 EA NB NB
38 #Btg(ig;g:\c/l,(lf/lﬁli{gfverter - Audio to SDI 1 EA $ 42364 $ 423.64 NB
39 gggirwx;:\gﬁ'nﬁconverter - HDMI to SDI 1 EA |[$ 42364| $ 423.64 NB
40 #EtimdFeSi:t:ir% Li:tI)eBrEr?mESXOWI—BEBNasSe:n?eﬁt to 6th Floor 1 EA NB NB
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Buyer: Mary Lanning 3644 OF
Department of Education

Opening Date:

Video Conferencing Equipment

VSA, Inc.

VSA, Inc. DBA Digital Video
Midwest

Line

Description QTY uoMm

Unit Price Extended Price

Unit Price | Extended Price

#FC-FC FEMALE ADAPTER
FC to FC Single-Mode for F to F adapter

N
U

NB

NB

#STREAMZ-LIVE-1400 FLASH VP6

Digital Rapids, 1RU Single-channel Adobe Flash 8 (On2 VP6) 1RU analog/digital
42 DS live streaming/archiving encoder, SDI, Component, S-Video and Composite 1 EA
video inputs; 8-channel audio input (4 balanced analog, 4 unbalanced analog, AES,
embedded SDI). SDI connection module included; optional breakout cable or
breakout box required for analog and AES. Windows Media Codec is provided.

No Bid

NB

The ability to make an early delivery may be a factor in determining the award. Be
specific regarding the delivery schedule.

Delivery: days

ARO (After Receipt of Order)

30

30

**NO SUBSTITUTES ON ALL ITEMS***

***NO SUBSTITUTES ON ALL ITEMS***

Totals:

$ 25,631.71

$ 18,021.00

Payment Terms:

0% Net 30

0% Net 30

Delivery Days ARO:

30

Comments:

Add #1 received

Addendum #1 received

Page 12 of 12

Award Explanation:
Awarded as a total
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