
Buyer: Rita Kucera 3600 OF
Game and Parks Commission

Opening Date:  04/06/2011

Li
ne Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price

1 20 Gauge Adult Semi-Automatic
Shotgun with Sights 10 EA 527.46$    5,274.60$ 527.78$    5,277.80$ 621.60$    6,216.00$ 619.99$    6,199.90$ 

2
20 Gauge O/U Shotgun with
Sights and a Minimum of Three (3) Magazines 
and a Maximum of Five (5) Magazines with each Shotgun.

6 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,395.40$ 8,372.40$ 1,499.99$ 8,999.94$ 

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

5,277.80$                      

Line 1:   29827 28"

30 - 60

5,274.60$                      

Lawmen's & Shooters' 
Supply Inc

Line 1:   29825 26"

Personal Protection 
Group, LLC

14,588.40$                    

30 - 60

Comments:

Delivery Days ARO:

Payment Terms:

Totals

Net 30

60 - 90

Award Explanation:
Recommend awarding Line 1 to apparent First Lowest Bidder, Lawmen's Shooters' Supply Inc for the 

20 Guage Adult Semi-Automatic Shotguns.

The apparent First Lowest Bidder for Line 2, Personal Protection Group, LLC, could not meet the 
delivery specification of E.1. "Delivery is to be within 30 days ARO".

Recommend awarding Line 2 to apparent Second Lowest Bidder, Scheels for the 20 Guage 
Over/Under Shotguns.

20 Gauge Semi-Automatic Shotguns and 20 Gauge Over/Under Shotguns Lawmen's & Shooters' 
Supply Inc

Line 2:               
All Magazines are 

Excluded

Scheels

15,199.84$                    
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