Buyer:

Suzanne Siemer

3591 OF
Nebraska Department of Roads

PARTIAL
AWARD

Opening Date: 03/29/2011

PARTIAL
AWARD

PARTIAL
AWARD

PARTIAL
AWARD

Chip Seal Ledge Rock

Hills Materials
Company

K4 Trucking LLC

L.G. Everist, Inc.

Pete Lien & Sons,
Inc.

Spencer Quarries,
Inc.

Westover Rock &
Sand, Inc.

Line

Description

QTY

UOM

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

=

D-3 Chip Seal Ledge Rock
W Edge of Clearwater S Side
HWY 275 RP 31 Area 321

1250

TN

No Bid

$ 42.35

$ 26.45

$ 31.85

D-3 Chip Seal Ledge Rock
1 MI E of Bloomfield
HWY 84 RP 1 (Bloomfield Yard) Area 322

500

TN

No Bid

$ 35.35

$ 22.92

$ 27.70

D-3 Chip Seal Ledge Rock
1/2 MI' W of Concord JCT 116 & S26B Spur
HWY 116 RP 1.01 Right Side Area 351

1390

TN

No Bid

$ 28.35

$ 25.56

$ 23.80

D-3 Chip Seal Ledge Rock
2 MI N of Laurel @ DOT Scale
HWY 20 RP 394.5 Left Side Area 353

1150

TN

No Bid

$ 28.35

$ 24.29

$ 23.80

D-3 Chip Seal Ledge Rock
8 MI W of Hartington
HWY 84 RP 34 on Left Side Area 352

1240

TN

No Bid

$ 33.35

$ 21.59

$ 27.00

D-5 Chip Seal Ledge Rock
Gering Maintenance Yard
Area 524

2000

TN

37.17

$ 39.78

$ 42.68

D-5 Chip Seal Ledge Rock
Chadron Maintenance Yard
Area 511

2000

TN

28.30

$ 27.19

D-5 Chip Seal Ledge Rock
Harrison Maintenance Yard
Area 512

1000

TN

31.70

$ 42.75

$ 33.53

D-5 Chip Seal Ledge Rock
N of Alliance, US 385 RP 116
Area 514

1000

TN

29.83

$ 35.01

10

D-5 Chip Seal Ledge Rock
S of Chadron, US 385 RP 132
Area 511

1000

TN

29.83

$ 28.23

11

D-5 Chip Seal Ledge Rock
Crawford Maintenance Yard
Area 512

1000

TN

28.80

$ 29.70

12

D-5 Chip Seal Ledge Rock
Gordon Maintenance Yard
Area 513

1000

TN

30.91

$ 34.13

13

D-6 Chip Seal Ledge Rock
Maxwell, JCT S56A & 1-80 RP 3
Area 620

1000

TN

No Bid

$ 33.50

$ 59.00

14

D-8 Chip Seal Ledge Rock
Ainsworth, HWY 20 PR 242
Area 810

300

TN

No Bid

$ 27.61
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Buyer: Suzanne Siemer

3591 OF
Nebraska Department of Roads

Opening Date: 03/29/2011

Chip Seal Ledge Rock

Hills Materials

K4 Trucking LLC

L.G. Everist, Inc.

Pete Lien & Sons,

Spencer Quarries,

Westover Rock &

SPECIFICATIONS

Company Inc. Inc. Sand, Inc.
.% Description QTY UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
D-8 Chip Seal Ledge Rock
15 |O'Neill, HWY 20 RP 307 2200 TN No Bid $ - $ 2245 | $ 40.25
Area 820
D-8 Chip Seal Ledge Rock
16 |Emmet, HWY 20 RP 289 2200 TN No Bid $ - $ 2350 | $ 41.25
Area 820
Payment Terms: 0% N/30 0% 30 100% 30 100% 30 100% 30
. . PER
Delivery Days ARO: 30 15 14-21 AS ORDERED

Comments:
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