
Buyer:  Mary Lanning 3588 OF
Department of Corrections

Opening Date:  03/23/2011
Li

ne Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended
Price Unit Price Extended

Price Unit Price Extended
Price Unit Price Extended

Price Unit Price Extended
Price

1 64 Channel 9TB Network Recorder
Panasonic WJ-ND400/9000 1 EA 10,281.00$ 10,281.00$ 11,228.00$ 11,228.00$ 11,259.00$ 11,259.00$ 13,119.98$ 13,119.98$ 11,913.46$ 11,913.46$ 

2 Outdoor Pan/Tilt/Zoom Camera
Panasonic #WV-NW964 7 EA 2,479.00$   17,353.00$ 2,708.00$   18,956.00$ 2,699.00$   18,893.00$ 3,169.98$   22,189.86$ 2,872.80$   20,109.60$ 

3 Indoor Pan/Tilt/Zoom Camera
Panasonic #WV-NS954 3 EA 1,916.00$   5,748.00$   2,096.00$   6,288.00$   2,195.00$   6,585.00$   2,669.98$   8,009.94$   2,221.56$   6,664.68$   

4 Vandal Resistant Dome Camera
Panasonic #WV-NW484S 8 EA 753.00$      6,024.00$   821.88$      6,575.04$   819.00$      6,552.00$   966.98$      7,735.84$   873.64$      6,989.12$   

5 Indor IP/POE Pan/Tilt.Zoom
Panasonic #WV-NW202A 10 EA 884.00$      8,840.00$   966.18$      9,661.80$   959.00$      9,590.00$   1,099.98$   10,999.80$ 1,024.92$   10,249.20$ 

6 Fixed IP/POE Dome Camera Smoke
Panasonic WV-NW502S 15 EA 924.00$      13,860.00$ 1,018.00$   15,270.00$ 1,020.00$   15,300.00$ 1,259.98$   18,899.70$ 1,082.16$   16,232.40$ 

7 Recessed Mount for 502
Panasonic #WV-Q169 15 EA 186.00$      2,790.00$   208.00$      3,120.00$   No Bid No Bid 209.98$      3,149.70$   214.92$      3,223.80$   

8 Fixed IP/POE Box Camera 
Panasonic WV-NP502 6 EA 781.00$      4,686.00$   854.88$      5,129.28$   859.00$      5,154.00$   996.98$      5,981.88$   906.12$      5,436.72$   

9 Lens 5-50 MM 10X for NP502
Panasonic #PLamp0550 4 EA 131.00$      524.00$      148.00$      592.00$      No Bid No Bid 209.98$      839.92$      155.10$      620.40$      

10 Lens 2.8-12 MM 4X for NP502
Panasonic #PLamp2812 1 EA 99.00$        99.00$        114.00$      114.00$      No Bid No Bid 139.98$      139.98$      115.50$      115.50$      

11 Lens 2.8-6MM 2X Veri-Focal 502
Panasonic #WV-LZA52/2 1 EA 186.00$      186.00$      214.00$      214.00$      No Bid No Bid 239.98$      239.98$      223.30$      223.30$      

12 Management Software
Panasonic $WV-ASM970 1 EA 4,518.00$   4,518.00$   4,930.00$   4,930.00$   No Bid No Bid 5,209.98$   5,209.98$   5,282.14$   5,282.14$   

13 System Server
Panasonic #PMPU1000 1 EA 4,518.00$   4,518.00$   4,930.00$   4,930.00$   No Bid No Bid 4,999.98$   4,999.98$   5,282.14$   5,282.14$   

No Substitues on all Items

30 10 Attached

N/A   Net 30 0%   30
92,342.46$                        Totals:

14  -  21

N/A
79,427.00$                        87,008.12$                        73,333.00$                        101,516.54$                      

Panasonic Security Equipment

Comments:

Delivery Days ARO:

Payment Terms:

Alpha Video & Audio Aprisa Technology LLC B & H Photo Video Business Services Electronic Engineering
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Buyer:  Mary Lanning 3588 OF
Department of Corrections

Opening Date:  03/23/2011
Li

ne Description QTY UOM 

1 64 Channel 9TB Network Recorder
Panasonic WJ-ND400/9000 1 EA

2 Outdoor Pan/Tilt/Zoom Camera
Panasonic #WV-NW964 7 EA

3 Indoor Pan/Tilt/Zoom Camera
Panasonic #WV-NS954 3 EA

4 Vandal Resistant Dome Camera
Panasonic #WV-NW484S 8 EA

5 Indor IP/POE Pan/Tilt.Zoom
Panasonic #WV-NW202A 10 EA

6 Fixed IP/POE Dome Camera Smoke
Panasonic WV-NW502S 15 EA

7 Recessed Mount for 502
Panasonic #WV-Q169 15 EA

8 Fixed IP/POE Box Camera 
Panasonic WV-NP502 6 EA

9 Lens 5-50 MM 10X for NP502
Panasonic #PLamp0550 4 EA

10 Lens 2.8-12 MM 4X for NP502
Panasonic #PLamp2812 1 EA

11 Lens 2.8-6MM 2X Veri-Focal 502
Panasonic #WV-LZA52/2 1 EA

12 Management Software
Panasonic $WV-ASM970 1 EA

13 System Server
Panasonic #PMPU1000 1 EA

No Substitues on all Items

Totals:

Panasonic Security Equipment

Comments:

Delivery Days ARO:

Payment Terms:

Unit Price Extended
Price Unit Price Extended

Price Unit Price Extended
Price Unit Price Extended

Price Unit Price Extended
Price

11,064.00$ 11,064.00$ 9,875.00$   9,875.00$   10,451.48$ 10,451.48$ 11,664.00$ 11,664.00$ 12,144.00$ 12,144.00$ 

2,668.00$   18,676.00$ 2,382.00$   16,674.00$ 2,519.72$   17,638.04$ 2,812.00$   19,684.00$ 2,961.00$   20,727.00$ 

2,063.50$   6,190.50$   1,848.00$   5,544.00$   1,948.57$   5,845.71$   2,175.00$   6,525.00$   2,290.00$   6,870.00$   

810.35$      6,482.80$   655.00$      5,240.00$   765.23$      6,121.84$   854.00$      6,832.00$   900.00$      7,200.00$   

951.35$      9,513.50$   852.00$      8,520.00$   898.31$      8,983.10$   1,003.00$   10,030.00$ 1,055.00$   10,550.00$ 

1,005.30$   15,079.50$ 900.00$      13,500.00$ 949.32$      14,239.80$ 1,060.00$   15,900.00$ 1,102.00$   16,530.00$ 

199.65$      2,994.75$   180.00$      2,700.00$   188.54$      2,828.10$   211.00$      3,165.00$   220.00$      3,300.00$   

840.90$      5,045.40$   754.00$      4,524.00$   794.06$      4,764.36$   886.00$      5,316.00$   933.00$      5,598.00$   

140.90$      563.60$      126.00$      504.00$      133.08$      532.32$      149.00$      596.00$      156.00$      624.00$      

105.70$      105.70$      95.00$        95.00$        99.81$        99.81$        112.00$      112.00$      117.00$      117.00$      

203.00$      203.00$      182.00$      182.00$      191.86$      191.86$      214.00$      214.00$      225.00$      225.00$      

4,862.00$   4,862.00$   4,330.00$   4,330.00$   4,591.37$   4,591.37$   5,021.00$   5,021.00$   5,288.00$   5,288.00$   

4,862.00$   4,862.00$   4,330.00$   4,330.00$   4,591.43$   4,591.43$   2,124.00$   2,124.00$   5,288.00$   5,288.00$   

Line 4:  End of life product. 
The vendor has adiquate 
stock at this time, but the 
may be out of stock in the 
near future. A sbstitute wil 
be required if stock is 
depleted.

Bidding per spec.

15  -  305  -  7  unless ordered by 
Panasonic

14 14

1/2%   15N30 0%
94,461.00$                        85,642.75$                        76,018.00$                        80,879.22$                        87,183.00$                        

Integrated Security 
Solutions Inc. Kenton Brothers Inc. PC Surveillance

*Awarded as a total low

AWARD

Hackett Security * Halifax Security Inc 
dba North American Video
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Buyer:  Mary Lanning 3588 OF
Department of Corrections

Opening Date:  03/23/2011
Li

ne Description QTY UOM 

1 64 Channel 9TB Network Recorder
Panasonic WJ-ND400/9000 1 EA

2 Outdoor Pan/Tilt/Zoom Camera
Panasonic #WV-NW964 7 EA

3 Indoor Pan/Tilt/Zoom Camera
Panasonic #WV-NS954 3 EA

4 Vandal Resistant Dome Camera
Panasonic #WV-NW484S 8 EA

5 Indor IP/POE Pan/Tilt.Zoom
Panasonic #WV-NW202A 10 EA

6 Fixed IP/POE Dome Camera Smoke
Panasonic WV-NW502S 15 EA

7 Recessed Mount for 502
Panasonic #WV-Q169 15 EA

8 Fixed IP/POE Box Camera 
Panasonic WV-NP502 6 EA

9 Lens 5-50 MM 10X for NP502
Panasonic #PLamp0550 4 EA

10 Lens 2.8-12 MM 4X for NP502
Panasonic #PLamp2812 1 EA

11 Lens 2.8-6MM 2X Veri-Focal 502
Panasonic #WV-LZA52/2 1 EA

12 Management Software
Panasonic $WV-ASM970 1 EA

13 System Server
Panasonic #PMPU1000 1 EA

No Substitues on all Items

Totals:

Panasonic Security Equipment

Comments:

Delivery Days ARO:

Payment Terms:

Unit Price Extended
Price Unit Price Extended

Price Unit Price Extended
Price Unit Price Extended

Price Unit Price Extended
Price

9,760.00$   9,760.00$   11,028.40$ 11,028.40$ 10,440.00$ 10,440.00$ 10,375.39$ 10,375.39$ 9,900.00$   9,900.00$   

2,375.00$   16,625.00$ 2,659.65$   18,617.55$ 2,515.00$   17,605.00$ 2,502.17$   17,515.19$ 2,380.00$   16,660.00$ 

1,839.00$   5,517.00$   2,056.79$   6,170.37$   1,945.00$   5,835.00$   1,934.00$   5,802.00$   1,845.00$   5,535.00$   

724.00$      5,792.00$   807.73$      6,461.84$   762.00$      6,096.00$   759.91$      6,079.28$   725.00$      5,800.00$   

849.00$      8,490.00$   948.20$      9,482.00$   896.00$      8,960.00$   892.06$      8,920.60$   850.00$      8,500.00$   

898.00$      13,470.00$ 1,002.06$   15,030.90$ 945.00$      14,175.00$ 942.72$      14,140.80$ 900.00$      13,500.00$ 

179.00$      2,685.00$   199.01$      2,985.15$   186.00$      2,790.00$   190.30$      2,854.50$   177.00$      2,655.00$   

749.00$      4,494.00$   838.17$      5,029.02$   790.00$      4,740.00$   788.53$      4,731.18$   750.00$      4,500.00$   

126.00$      504.00$      140.47$      561.88$      133.00$      532.00$      134.33$      537.32$      125.00$      500.00$      

95.00$        95.00$        105.35$      105.35$      99.00$        99.00$        100.76$      100.76$      94.00$        94.00$        

180.00$      180.00$      202.40$      202.40$      201.00$      201.00$      193.66$      193.66$      181.00$      181.00$      

4,299.00$   4,299.00$   4,846.39$   4,846.39$   4,495.00$   4,495.00$   4,559.42$   4,559.42$   4,340.00$   4,340.00$   

4,299.00$   4,299.00$   4,846.39$   4,846.39$   4,495.00$   4,495.00$   4,559.42$   4,559.42$   4,340.00$   4,340.00$   

3  -  14 14 40 7 10

0%   30 .05%   10 N30 Net 30 0%   30  (Net 30)
76,210.00$                        85,367.64$                        80,463.00$                        80,369.52$                        76,505.00$                        

No Bid
VSA, Inc

Secure network Systems,  
LLC

Violeta, Inc
dba Tech CCTV

Perimutter Purchasing 
Power Ready Protect, LLC Royal Systems
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