
Buyer:  Rita Kucera 3547 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  02/15/2011
Li

ne Description  OTY UOM  Unit Price  Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price

1

12 Gauge Square Anchor
2 1/4" OD X 36";
NDOR Stock #85-89710
Please provide pricing per each; but are to be 
packaged and delivered 25 per bundle

  2,000 EA  $           6.34  $  12,680.00  $           7.17  $  14,340.00  $           6.48  $  12,960.00  $           8.75  $  17,500.00 No Bid  No Bid 

2

12 Gauge Square Sleeve
2 1/2" OD X 18";
NDOR Stock #85-89770
Please provide pricing per each; but are to be 
packaged and delivered 25 per bundle

  2,000 EA  $           3.68  $    7,360.00  $           4.22  $    8,440.00  $           3.60  $    7,200.00  $           4.99  $    9,980.00 No Bid  No Bid 

3

12 Gauge Square Post
1 3/4" OD X 24';
NDOR Stock #85-89790
Please provide pricing per each; but are to be 
packaged and delivered 25 per bundle

  1,000 EA  $         40.25  $  40,250.00  $         45.82  $  45,820.00  $         36.72  $  36,720.00  $         52.80  $  52,800.00 No Bid  No Bid 

4

12 Gauge Square Post
2 " OD X 24';
NDOR Stock #85-89795
Please provide pricing per each; but are to be 
packaged and delivered 25 per bundle

  2,000 EA  $         43.41  $  86,820.00  $         49.34  $  98,680.00  $         42.72  $  85,440.00  $         58.80  $117,600.00 No Bid  No Bid 

5

12 Gauge Square Post
2" OD X 10';
NDOR Stock #85-89796
Please provide pricing per each; but are to be 
packaged and delivered 25 per bundle

  2,000 EA  $         18.78  $  37,560.00  $         21.32  $  42,640.00  $         17.80  $  35,600.00  $         24.50  $  49,000.00 No Bid  No Bid 

6

12 Gauge Square Post
2" OD X 12';
NDOR Stock #85-89797
Please provide pricing per each; but are to be 
packaged and delivered 25 per bundle

  2,000 EA  $         22.53  $  45,060.00  $         25.61  $  51,220.00  $         21.36  $  42,720.00  $         29.40  $  58,800.00 No Bid  No Bid 

7

12 Gauge Square Omni Anchor
2 1/4" OD X 36";
Part #22F12ODA03
NDOR Stock #85-89715

  1,000 EA  $         15.25  $  15,250.00  $         15.65  $  15,650.00  $         18.84  $  18,840.00  $         34.99  $  34,990.00 No Bid  No Bid 

8

12 Gauge Square Omni Sleeve
2 1/2" OD X 18"
PART #24F12ODAPG;
NDOR Stock #85-89716

  1,000 EA  $         10.64  $  10,640.00  $         13.40  $  13,400.00  $         16.08  $  16,080.00  $         32.95  $  32,950.00 No Bid  No Bid 

9

10 Gauge Square Post
2 3/16" OD X 5';
NDOR Stock #85-89798
Please provide pricing per each; but are to be 
packaged and delivered 25 per bundle

     500 EA  $         15.09  $    7,545.00  $         18.36  $    9,180.00  No Bid  No Bid  $         40.95  $  20,475.00 No Bid  No Bid 
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10

10 Gauge Square Post
2 1/2" OD X 24';
NDOR Stock #85-89799
Please provide pricing per each; but are to be 
packaged and delivered 25 per bundle

     500 EA  $         79.09  $  39,545.00  $         83.87  $  41,935.00  $         72.72  $  36,360.00  $       141.59  $  70,795.00 No Bid  No Bid 

11
7 Gauge HD Anchor Perm Mount
2 1/2" X 36"; PART #HDA200-36-G;
NDOR Stock #85-89725

     300 EA  No Bid  No Bid  $         27.14  $    8,142.00  $         16.98  $    5,094.00  $         36.10  $  10,830.00  $         35.60  $  10,680.00 

12
7 Gauge HD Winged Anchor
3" X 36"; PART #TWA250-36-G;
NDOR Stock #85-89750

     300 EA  No Bid  No Bid  $         56.22  $  16,866.00  $         40.35  $  12,105.00  $         39.05  $  11,715.00  $         69.65  $  20,895.00 

13
7 Gauge HD Anchor Perm Mount
3" X 36"; PART # HDA250-36-G;
NDOR Stock #85-89735

     300 EA  No Bid  No Bid  $         31.84  $    9,552.00  $         20.61  $    6,183.00  $         21.29  $    6,387.00  $         42.43  $  12,729.00 

14
7 Gauge Unibase Bottom Anchor
3" OD X 48"; PART #SB8-CTA48-G;
NDOR Stock #85-89720

     300 EA  No Bid  No Bid  $         62.08  $  18,624.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $         83.05  $  24,915.00 

15
7 Gauge Unibase Winged Bottom Anchor
3" X 48"; PART #SB8-CTWA48-G;
NDOR Stock #85-89730

     300 EA  No Bid  No Bid  $         82.37  $  24,711.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $       117.15  $  35,145.00 

16
Top Redi-Torque Receiver for Unibase
2 1/2"; PART #SB8C-250A-G;
NDOR Stock #85-89740

     300 EA  No Bid  No Bid  $         41.93  $  12,579.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $         51.10  $  15,330.00 

17
Redi-Torque Hardware Kit
PART #RTSB-MPHDW
NDOR Stock #85-89745

     300 EA  No Bid  No Bid  $         14.72  $    4,416.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $         18.75  $    5,625.00 

 $302,710.00         436,195  $315,302.00  $493,822.00  $125,319.00 
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