Buyer: Michelle Kemper 3543 OF Opening Date: 02/08/2011
Nebraska Game Parks Commission

AWARD
Campground Envelopes Envelopes Plus, Inc. FAC, Inc. Forms Plus Services, Inc.
.% Description QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
1 [Yellow ENV REC. 50 - 74,999M 75 M $ - No Bid N/A $ - NA
2 |Yellow ENV REC. 75 - 99,999M 100 M $ - No Bid N/A $ - NA
3 |Yellow REC. 100,000 - 124,999M 125 M $ - No Bid N/A $ - NA
4 |Yellow REC. 125,000 - 149,999M 150 M $ - No Bid N/A $ - NA
5 |Yellow REC. 150,000 - 174,999M 175 M $ - No Bid N/A $ - NA
6 |Yellow REC. 175,000 - 199,999M 200 M $ - No Bid N/A $ - NA
7 |Yellow REC. 200,000 - 224,999M 225 M $ - No Bid N/A $ - NA
8 |Yellow REC. 225,000 - 250,000M 250 M $ - No Bid N/A $ - NA
9 |Yellow REC. 250,001M Plus 250 M $ - No Bid N/A $ - NA
10 |Yellow ENV VIRG. 50 - 74,999M 75 M $ 73.85 | $ 5,5638.75 | $ 58.10 | $ 435750 | $ 99.00 | $ 7,425.00
11 [Yellow ENV VIRG. 75 - 99,999M 100 M $ 6759 | $ 6,759.00 | $ 56.97 | $ 5,697.00 | $ 98.00 | $ 9,800.00
12 |Yellow VIRG. 100,000 - 124,999M 125 M $ 59.11 | $ 7,388.75 | $ 52.64 | $ 6,580.00 | $ 97.00 | $ 12,125.00
13 |Yellow VIRG. 125,000 - 149,999M 150 M $ 55.70 | $ 8,355.00 | $ 4955 | $ 7,43250 | $ 96.00 | $ 14,400.00
14 |Yellow VIRG. 150,000 - 174,999M 175 M $ 50.92 | $ 8,911.00 [ $ 47.06 | $ 8,235.50 | $ 95.00 | $ 16,625.00
15 |Yellow VIRG. 175,000 - 199,999M 200 M $ 49.65 | $ 9,930.00 | $ 4377 | $ 8,754.00 | $ 94.00 | $ 18,800.00
16 |Yellow VIRG. 200,000 - 224,999M 225 M $ 48.84 [ $ 10,989.00 | $ 45191 % 10,167.75| $ 93.00 | $ 20,925.00
17 |Yellow VIRG. 225,000 - 250,000M 250 M $ 4824 | $ 12,060.00 | $ 43.67 | $ 10,91750| $ 91.00$ 22,750.00
18 |Yellow VIRG. 250,001M Plus 250 M $ 4783 |$ 11,957.50 | $ 4367 [ $ 1091750 | $ 89.00 | $ 22,250.00
19 |White ENV REC. 50 - 74,999M 75 M $ 56.89 | $ 4,266.75 | $ 58.10 | $ 4,357.50 NA
20 |White ENV REC. 75 - 99,999M 100 M $ 48.36 | $ 4,836.00 | $ 56.97 | $ 5,697.00 NA
21 |White REC. 100,000 - 124,999M 125 M $ 45.64 | $ 5,705.00 | $ 52.64 | $ 6,580.00 NA
22 |White REC. 125,000 - 149,999M 150 M $ 44.67 | $ 6,700.50 | $ 4955 [ $ 7,432.50 NA
23 |White REC. 150,000 - 174,999M 175 M $ 38.55 | $ 6,746.25 | $ 47.06 | $ 8,235.50 NA
24 |White REC. 175,000 - 199,999M 200 M $ 37.23 | $ 7,446.00 | $ 43.77 | $ 8,754.00 NA
25 |White REC. 200,000 - 224,999M 225 M $ 36.14 | $ 8,131.50 | $ 45.19|$% 10,167.75| $ 93.00 [ $ 20,925.00
26 |White REC. 225,000 - 250,000M 250 M $ 35.48 | $ 8,870.00 | $ 4367 [ $ 1091750 | $ 91.00 | $ 22,750.00
27 |White REC. 250,001M Plus 250 M $ 35.02 | $ 8,755.00 | $ 4367 [ $ 1091750 | $ 89.00 | $ 22,250.00
28 |White ENV VIRG. 50 - 74,999M 75 M $ 55.79 | $ 418425 | $ 48.16 | $ 3,612.00 | $ 99.00 | $ 7,425.00
29 |White ENV VIRG. 75 - 99,999M 100 M $ 4758 | $ 4,758.00 | $ 47.23 | $ 472300 | $ 98.00 | $ 9,800.00
30 |White VIRG. 100,000 - 124,999M 125 M $ 4492 | $ 5,615.00 | $ 46.56 | $ 5,820.00 | $ 97.00 | $ 12,125.00
31 |White VIRG. 125,000 - 149,999M 150 M $ 43.92 | $ 6,588.00 | $ 43.67 | $ 6,550.50 | $ 96.00 | $ 14,400.00
32 |White VIRG. 150,000 - 174,999M 175 M $ 37.84 | $ 6,622.00 | $ 41.27 | $ 7,222.25 | $ 95.00 [ $ 16,625.00
33 |White VIRG. 200,000 - 224,999M 225 M $ 35.46 | $ 7,978.50 | $ 37.70 | $ 8,482.50 | $ 93.00 [ $ 20,925.00
34 |White VIRG. 225,000 - 250,000M 250 M $ 3477 | $ 8,692.50 | $ 3452 | $ 8,630.00 | $ 91.00 | $ 22,750.00
35 |White VIRG. 250,001M Plus 250 M $ 3422 | $ 8,555.00 | $ 33.92 | $ 8,480.00 | $ 89.00 | $ 22,250.00
Total: $ 196,339.25 $ 199,638.75 $ 337,325.00
Payment Terms: Net 30 0% 30
Delivery Days ARO: 60 60
Comments: Lines: 25, 26, 27 Note REC.
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3543 OF Opening Date: 02/08/2011

Nebraska Game Parks Commission

Campground Envelopes FAC, Inc. (See Bid)
% Description QTY uoM VIRG Only QTY uoMm Unit Price Extended Price
1 |Yellow ENV REC. 50 - 74,999M 75 M 75.000 White + 75.000 Yellow 150 M 42.34 $ 6,351.00
2 [Yellow ENV REC. 75 - 99,999M 100 M 100.000 White +100.000 Yellow 200 M 36.21 $ 7,242.00
3 |Yellow REC. 100,000 - 124,999M 125 M 125.000 White + 125.000 Yellow 250 M 36.08 $ 9,020.00
4 |Yellow REC. 125,000 - 149,999M 150 M 150.000 White + 150.000 Yellow 300 M 35.27 $ 10,581.00
5 [Yellow REC. 150,000 - 174,999M 175 M 175.000 White + 175.000 Yellow 350 M 33.06 $ 11,571.00
6 [Yellow REC. 175,000 - 199,999M 200 M 200.000 White + 200.000 Yellow 400 M 31.38 $ 12,552.00
7 |Yellow REC. 200,000 - 224,999M 225 M 225.000 White + 225.000 Yellow 450 M 31.25 $ 14,062.50
8 [Yellow REC. 225,000 - 250,000M 250 M 250.000 White + 250.000 Yellow 500 M 30.84 $ 15,420.00
9 [Yellow REC. 250,001M Plus 250 M
10 [Yellow ENV VIRG. 50 - 74,999M 75 M
11 |Yellow ENV VIRG. 75 - 99,999M 100 M
12 |Yellow VIRG. 100,000 - 124,999M 125 M
13 |Yellow VIRG. 125,000 - 149,999M 150 M
14 |Yellow VIRG. 150,000 - 174,999M 175 M
15 |Yellow VIRG. 175,000 - 199,999M 200 M
16 |Yellow VIRG. 200,000 - 224,999M 225 M
17 |Yellow VIRG. 225,000 - 250,000M 250 M
18 |Yellow VIRG. 250,001M Plus 250 M
19 |White ENV REC. 50 - 74,999M 75 M
20 [White ENV REC. 75 - 99,999M 100 M
21 |White REC. 100,000 - 124,999M 125 M
22 |White REC. 125,000 - 149,999M 150 M
23 |White REC. 150,000 - 174,999M 175 M
24 |White REC. 175,000 - 199,999M 200 M
25 |White REC. 200,000 - 224,999M 225 M
26 |White REC. 225,000 - 250,000M 250 M
27 |White REC. 250,001M Plus 250 M
28 |White ENV VIRG. 50 - 74,999M 75 M
29 |White ENV VIRG. 75 - 99,999M 100 M
30 [White VIRG. 100,000 - 124,999M 125 M
31 |White VIRG. 125,000 - 149,999M 150 M
32 |White VIRG. 150,000 - 174,999M 175 M
33 |White VIRG. 200,000 - 224,999M 225 M
34 |White VIRG. 225,000 - 250,000M 250 M
35 |White VIRG. 250,001M Plus 250 M
Total: $ 86,799.50
Payment Terms:
Delivery Days ARO:
Comments: VIRG ONLY
If the White Virg. & Yellow Virg. are ordered together in combo pricing would be as follows:
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