Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3533 OF

Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 02/02/11

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants

Alamar Uniforms

Aramark Uniform Services, a division of
Aramark Uniform & Career Apparel, LLC

Carolina Industrial Mat Co. Inc.

) . Brand and o Extended Brand and . Extended Brand and . Extended
c
5 Description QTY | UOM oivie Bidding | VMt Price Price Style Bidding | UMt Price Price Style Bidding | Mt Price Price
28" - 33" Men's Navy Trouser . L
1 |UNF 37" 60 | EA Dickies | ¢ 1630|s o7g00| ATk g 1500 900.00 Dickies | ¢ 1979 1,187.40
o 874NV 201 874NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
34" Men's Navy Trouser L L
2 |UNF 37" 40 | Ea Dickies | « 1630 65200 A@MaK ¢ 1500 600.00 Dickies | ¢ 1979 791.60
o 874NV 201 874NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
36" Men's Navy Trouser L L
3 |unF 37 120 | EA Dickies | ¢ 1630|s 195600 ATk g 1500 1,800.00 Dickies | ¢ 1979 2,374.80
o 874NV 201 874NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
38" Men's Navy Trouser S L
4 |UNF 37" 50 | EA Dickies | « 1630 81500 A@MaK ¢ 1500 750.00 Dickies | ¢ 1979 989.50
o 874NV 201 874NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
40" Men's Navy Trouser L L
5 |UNF 37" 50 | EA Dickies | ¢ 1630|s 81500 ATk g 1500 750.00 Dickies | ¢ 1979 989.50
o 874NV 201 874NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
42"Men's Navy Trouser S L
6 |UNF 37" 50 | EA Dickies | & 1630 81500 A@MaK ¢ 1500 750.00 Dickies | ¢ 1979 989.50
o 874NV 201 874NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
44" Men's Navy Trouser S S
7 |UNF 37" 10 | EA Dickies | ¢ 1795|s 17950| ATk g 1700 170.00 Dickies | ¢ 1979 197.90
o 874NV 201 874NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
46" Men's Navy Trouser S L
8 |UNF 37" 10 | EA Dickies | & 1705|¢ 17950 | A@mak ¢ 1700 170.00 Dickies | ¢ 1999 199.90
o 874NV 201 874NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
48" Men's Navy Trouser L .
9 |unF 37 10 | EA Dickies | ¢ 1795|s 17950| ATk g 1700 170.00 Dickies | ¢ 1999 199.90
o 874NV 201 874NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
50" Men's Navy Trouser L L
10 |UNF 37" 10 | EA Dickies | & 1705|¢ 17950 A@mak ¢ 1700 170.00 Dickies | ¢ 1999 199.90
o 874NV 201 874NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
52" Men's Navy Trouser . S
11 |UNF 37" 10 | EA Dickies | ¢ 1975|s 19750 ATk g 1500 180.00 Dickies | ¢ 1999 199.90
o 874NV 201 874NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
54" Men's Navy Trouser S L
12 |UNF 37" 10 | EA Dickies | & 1975|¢ 10750 | A@mak ¢ 1800 180.00 Dickies | ¢ 1999 199.90
o 874NV 201 874NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
56" Men's Navy Trouser L S
13 |UNF 37" 10 | EA Dickies | ¢ 1975|s 19750 AMAK g 1500 180.00 Dickies | ¢ 1999 199.90
o 874NV 201 874NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3533 OF

Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 02/02/11

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants

Alamar Uniforms

Aramark Uniform Services, a division of
Aramark Uniform & Career Apparel, LLC

Carolina Industrial Mat Co. Inc.

<} L Brand and o Extended Brand and s Extended Brand and o Extended
c
5 Description QTY | UOM oivie Bidding | VMt Price Price Style Bidding | UMt Price Price Style Bidding | Mt Price Price
58" Men's Navy Trouser . S
14 |UNF 37" 30 | EA Dickies | ¢ 1975|s 59250 A@MAK ¢ 1g800|s  540.00 Dickies | ¢ 1999|s 59970
- 874NV 201 874NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
28" - 33" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies
15 |UNF 37" 60 EA $ 16.30 | $ 978.00 $ 15.00 | $ 900.00 $ 19.79 | $ 1,187.40
o 874BK 201 874BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
34" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies
16 |UNF 37" 10 EA $ 16.30 | $ 163.00 $ 15.00 | $ 150.00 $ 19.79 | $ 197.90
- 874BK 201 874BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
36" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies
17 |UNF 37" 100 EA $ 16.30 | $ 1,630.00 $ 15.00 [ $ 1,500.00 $ 19.79 | $ 1,979.00
o 874BK 201 874BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
38" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies
18 |UNF 37" 40 EA $ 16.30 | $ 652.00 $ 15.00 | $ 600.00 $ 19.79 | $ 791.60
- 874BK 201 874BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
40" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies
19 |UNF 37" 60 EA $ 16.30 | $ 978.00 $ 15.00 | $ 900.00 $ 19.79 | $ 1,187.40
o 874BK 201 874BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
42"Men's Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies
20 |UNF 37" 30 EA $ 16.30 | $ 489.00 $ 15.00 | $ 450.00 $ 19.79 | $ 593.70
- 874BK 201 874BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
44" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies
21 |UNF 37" 10 EA $ 1795 | $ 179.50 $ 17.00 | $ 170.00 $ 1999 | $ 199.90
o 874BK 201 874BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
46" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies
22 |UNF 37" 10 EA $ 1795 | $ 179.50 $ 17.00 | $ 170.00 $ 1999 | $ 199.90
- 874BK 201 874BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
48" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies
23 |UNF 37" 10 EA $ 1795 | $ 179.50 $ 17.00 | $ 170.00 $ 1999 | $ 199.90
S 874BK 201 874BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
50" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies
24 |UNF 37" 10 EA $ 1795 | $ 179.50 $ 17.00 | $ 170.00 $ 1999 | $ 199.90
- 874BK 201 874BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
52" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies
25 |UNF 37" 40 EA $ 19.75 | $ 790.00 $ 18.00 | $ 720.00 $ 1999 | $ 799.60
o 874BK 201 874BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
54" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies
26 |UNF 37" 10 EA $ 19.75 | $ 197.50 $ 18.00 | $ 180.00 $ 1999 | $ 199.90
- 874BK 201 874BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
56" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies
27 |UNF 37" 30 EA $ 19.75 | $ 592.50 $ 18.00 | $ 540.00 $ 1999 | $ 599.70
S 874BK 201 874BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3533 OF

Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 02/02/11

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants

Alamar Uniforms

Aramark Uniform Services, a division of
Aramark Uniform & Career Apparel, LLC

Carolina Industrial Mat Co. Inc.

<} L Brand and o Extended Brand and s Extended Brand and o Extended

c

5 Description QTY | UOM oivie Bidding | VMt Price Price Style Bidding | UMt Price Price Style Bidding | Mt Price Price
58" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies

28 |UNF 37" 40 EA $ 19.75 | $ 790.00 $ 18.00 | $ 720.00 $ 1999 | $ 799.60

e 874BK 201 874BK

Brand and Style Bidding:
SZ 0 - 10 Female Black Trouser Aramark Dickies

29 |UNF 37" 70 EA FP 221 BK $ 1450 | $ 1,015.00 $ 15.00 | $ 1,050.00 $ 1799 | $ 1,259.30

- 249 FP221BK

Brand and Style Bidding:
Size 12 Female Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies

30 Brand and Style Bidding: 100 EA FP221BK $ 1450 | $ 1,450.00 249 $ 15.00 | $ 1,500.00 FP221BK $ 1799 | $ 1,799.00
Size 14 Female Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies

31 Brand and Style Bidding: 100 EA FP221BK $ 1450 | $ 1,450.00 249 $ 15.00 | $ 1,500.00 FP221BK $ 1799 | $ 1,799.00
Size 16 Female Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies

32 Brand and Style Bidding: 40 EA FP221BK $ 1450 | $ 580.00 249 $ 15.00 | $ 600.00 FP221BK $ 1799 | $ 719.60
Size 18 Female Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies

33 Brand and Style Bidding: 60 EA FP221BK $ 1450 | $ 870.00 249 $ 16.00 | $ 960.00 FP221BK $ 17.99 | $ 1,079.40
Size 20 Female Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies

34 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA FP221BK $ 1575 | $ 157.50 249 $ 16.00 | $ 160.00 FP221BK $ 1799 | $ 179.90
Size 22 Female Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies

35 Brand and Style Bidding: 30 EA FP221BK $ 1575 | $ 472.50 249 $ 17.00 | $ 510.00 FP221BK $ 1799 | $ 539.70
Size 24 Female Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies

36 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA FP221BK $ 1575 | $ 157.50 249 $ 17.00 | $ 170.00 FP221BK $ 1799 | $ 179.90
Size 26 Female Black Trouser Dickies Aramark Dickies

37 Brand and Style Bidding: 60 EA PT55BK $ 1575 | $ 945.00 249 $ 18.00 | $ 1,080.00 FP221BK $ 17.99 | $ 1,079.40
Size 28 Female Black Trouser Dickies . Dickies

38 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA PT55BK $ 1575 | $ 157.50 No Bid X FP221BK $ 1799 | $ 179.90
Size S - M Short Sleeve Shirt RedKap Aramark RedKap

39 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA SP20BW $ 959 $ 95.90 102 $ 16.00 | $ 160.00 SP20BW $ 1349 | $ 134.90
Size L Short Sleeve Shirt RedKap Aramark RedKap

40 Brand and Style Bidding: 40 EA SP20BW $ 959 $ 383.60 102 $ 16.00 | $ 640.00 SP20BW $ 1349 | $ 539.60
Size XL Short Sleeve Shirt RedKap Aramark RedKap

41 Brand and Style Bidding: 70 EA SP20BW $ 959 $ 671.30 102 $ 16.00 | $ 1,120.00 SP20BW $ 1349 | $ 944.30
Size 2XL Short Sleeve Shirt RedKap Aramark RedKap

42 Brand and Style Bidding: 40 EA SP20BW $ 11.05| $ 442.00 102 $ 17.00 | $ 680.00 SP20BW $ 1549 | $ 619.60
S - XL Short Sleeve Shirt - Long RedKap Aramark RedKap

43 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA SP20BW $ 11.05 | $ 110.50 102 $ 17.00 | $ 170.00 SP20BW $ 1599 | $ 159.90
Size 2XL Short Sleeve Shirt Long RedKap Aramark RedKap

44 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA SP20BW $ 11.05 | $ 110.50 102 $ 18.00 | $ 180.00 SP20BW $ 1599 | $ 159.90
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3533 OF

Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 02/02/11

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants

Alamar Uniforms

Aramark Uniform Services, a division of
Aramark Uniform & Career Apparel, LLC

Carolina Industrial Mat Co. Inc.

.% Description QTY | UOM SE’ lr:rgji d?j?r?g Unit Price E)gfizge{j SE’ Ir:réc: da:j?gg Unit Price E)S(rsir;ceied SE’ lr:rgji d?j?r?g Unit Price E)gfizge{j
45 :iéi?:r‘]jggltesé‘?g&’ﬁ] ;hirtjg 10 | EA SF;Z%';"’\‘/’\)/ $ 11.05|$ 11050 Arfg]zark $ 1800|$  180.00 SF;Z%';"’\‘/’\)/ $ 1599 |$  159.90
46 :iéig):r‘]jggltesé‘?g&’ﬁ] ;hirtjg 40 | EA SF;Z%';"’\‘/’\)/ $  11.05|$  442.00 No Bid X SF;Z%';"’\‘/’\)/ $ 1599 |$  639.60
47 :iéi?:r‘]dsggltesé‘?g&’ﬁ] ;hirtjg 40 | EA SF;Z%';"’\‘/’\)/ $  11.05|$  442.00 No Bid X SF;Z%';"’\‘/’\)/ $ 1599 |$  639.60
o [ i | o | 12 (s mw|s o] was | seace | oo

49 :r'anMdL:n”dg;lﬁszﬁj;:;:_ 40 | EA Sii%';"’\‘/’\)/ $ 1115|$  446.00 Ariglark $ 17.00|$  680.00 Sii%';a\‘/’\)/ $ 1499 |$  599.60
50 'ér;?‘régai'sg;esgg gng. 10 | EA Sii%';"’\‘/’\)/ $ 1115|$ 11150 Ariglark $ 17.00|$  170.00 Sii%';a\‘/’\)/ $ 1499 |$  149.90
51 gkahznsnilg@’lz Eihdiging:_ 10 | EA Sii%';"’\‘/’\)/ $ 1115|$ 11150 Arfglark $ 17.00|$  170.00 Sii%';a\‘/’\)/ $ 1499 |$  149.90
52 Ei(a"n'a";ng dssl’fj‘éeB%h;;g:_ 40 | EA Sii%';"’\‘/’\)/ $ 1300|$  520.00 Arfglark $ 1800|$  720.00 Sii%';a\‘/’\)/ $ 1699|$  679.60
53 :gﬁ;ﬁg%&?&’%ﬁ:gﬂ 40 | EA Sii%';"’\‘/’\)/ $ 1115|$  446.00 Arfglark $ 1800|$  720.00 sii%};a\l/l\)/ $ 1699|$  679.60
54 Ei(;n:c’:fdsslfj\e/eBiS;di:;;:ci 10 | EA Sii%';"’\‘/’\)/ $ 1300[$  130.00 Arig]lark $ 1900|$ 190.00| Redkap |$ 1699 |$  169.90
55 gf;nbogr?dss"f;‘ée%h(;%fi 10 | EA Sii%';"’\‘/’\)/ $ 1300[$  130.00 Ariglark $ 1800|$ 180.00| Redkap |$ 1699 |$  169.90
56 g:n:o:r?dss"fj‘éeB%h;;;& 30 | EA Sii%';"’\‘/’\)/ $ 1300|$  390.00 No Bid X Redkap |$  16.99 |$  509.70
57 :’(al_nlao;’?dsslfj\e/eBiSdhd“i’lt'\lg_:(l 10 | EA Sii%';"’\‘/’\)/ $ 2810|$  281.00 No Bid X RedKap No Bid

58 gf;nbogr?dss"fj‘éemsdh;;;& 10 | EA Sii%';"’\‘/’\)/ $ 2810|$  281.00 No Bid X RedKap No Bid

59 g;ﬂ:c’;ngdss"fj‘éemsdh;;;& 10 | EA Sii%';"’\‘/’\)/ $ 2810|$  281.00 No Bid X RedKap No Bid

60 :i;dsg\:jg;‘:m ading. 10 | EA ;es%ﬁtl/) $ 2450 |$  245.00 Arggg’“k $ 3000|$  300.00 ;escg?\ft’; $  27.99|$  279.90
61 :ir;g;?gkg:yle Bidding. 20 | EA ;escg?\ft’; $ 2450 |$  490.00 Arggg’“k $ 3000|$  600.00 ;escg?\ft’; $ 27.99|$  559.80
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3533 OF

Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 02/02/11

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants

Alamar Uniforms

Aramark Uniform Services, a division of
Aramark Uniform & Career Apparel, LLC

Carolina Industrial Mat Co. Inc.

o o Brand and Lo Extended Brand and oo Extended Brand and Lo Extended
c
5 Description QTY | UOM oivie Bidding | VMt Price Price Style Bidding | UMt Price Price Style Bidding | Mt Price Price
Size XL Jacket RedKap Aramark RedKap
62 Brand and Style Bidding: 80 EA JTSONV $ 2450 | $ 1,960.00 305 $ 30.00 [ $ 2,400.00 JTSONV $ 27.99 2,239.20
Size 2XL Jacket RedKap Aramark RedKap
63 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA JTSONV $ 29.00 | $ 290.00 305 $ 34.00 | $ 340.00 JTSONV $ 29.99 299.90
Size 3XL Jacket RedKap Aramark RedKap
64 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA JTSONV $ 29.00 | $ 290.00 305 $ 34.00 | $ 340.00 JTSONV $ 29.99 299.90
Size 4XL Jacket RedKap Aramark RedKap
65 Brand and Style Bidding: 20 EA JTSONV $ 29.00 | $ 580.00 305 $ 38.00 | $ 760.00 JTSONV $ 29.99 599.80
Size 5XL Jacket RedKap Aramark RedKap
66 Brand and Style Bidding: 20 EA JTSONV $ 29.00 | $ 580.00 311 $ 38.00 | $ 760.00 JTSONV $ 29.99 599.80
Size 6XL Jacket RedKap . RedKap
67 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA JTSONV $ 29.00 | $ 290.00 No Bid $ - ITSONV $ 29.99 299.90
Size 7XL Jacket RedKap . RedKap
®8 IBrand and Style Bidding: 10| BA L rsony | ® 5900 S 59000 NoBid $ ) IT50NV ]
Size M - XL Jacket Long RedKap Aramark RedKap
69 Brand and Style Bidding: 20 EA JTSONV $ 2450 | $ 490.00 300 $ 34.00 | $ 680.00 JTSONV $ 30.99 619.80
Size 2XL Jacket Long RedKap Aramark RedKap
70 Brand and Style Bidding: 20 EA JTSONV $ 29.00 | $ 580.00 300 $ 38.00 | $ 760.00 JTSONV $ 30.99 619.80
Size 3XL Jacket Long RedKap Aramark RedKap
71 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA JTSONV $ 29.00 | $ 290.00 300 $ 38.00 | $ 380.00 JTS0NV $ 30.99 309.90
Size 4XL Jacket Long RedKap . RedKap
72 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA JTSONV $ 29.00 | $ 290.00 No Bid X JTSONV $ 30.99 309.90
Size 5XL Jacket Long RedKap . RedKap
73 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA JTSONV $ 29.00 | $ 290.00 No Bid X JTSONV $ 30.99 309.90
Size 6XL Jacket Long RedKap . RedKap .
" IBrand and Style Bidding: 10| BA L yrsony | ® 5900 S 59000 NoBid X No Bid No Bid
Size 7XL Jacket Long RedKap . RedKap .
7> IBrand and Style Bidding: 10| BA L yrsony | & 5900 S 59000 NoBid X No Bid No Bid
Totals: $ 37,763.30 | $ 35,460.00 | $ 41,722.70
Payment Terms: Net 30 N/A% NA 0% 30
Delivery Days ARO: 14 30
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3533 OF

Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 02/02/11

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants

Alamar Uniforms

Aramark Uniform Services, a division of
Aramark Uniform & Career Apparel, LLC

Carolina Industrial Mat Co. Inc.

o - Brand and L Extended Brand and . Extended Brand and o Extended
c
5 Description QTY | UOM oivie Bidding | VMt Price Price Style Bidding | UMt Price Price Style Bidding | Mt Price Price
Line 55: SP10 BE Long - 2" longer Tail
Line 48: 6 - 8 Weeks delivery é':,lolr:)%e\;vsl_liivé 3?'{5:”;‘: 'II'JSiIt 04X
Comments: Line 58: 6 - 8 Weeks delivery X = No Bid g 9

Line 59: 6 - 8 Weeks delivery

1" Longer Sleeve 30% upcharge
Line 75: Redkap JTS50NV does not come in
6X - 7X in the Jacket - Long
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

Department of Correctional Services

3533 OF

Opening Date: 02/02/11

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants Comade, Inc Eagle Group Uniform NU Crisp Image Apparel
Brand and
o - Brand and Lo Extended - Extended Brand and Style L Extended
c
£ Description QTY | UOM Style Bidding Unit Price Price nij!e Unit Price Price Bidding Unit Price Price
28" - 33" Men's Navy Trouser
1 |uNFa7 60 | EA RedKap | ¢ 1403|s s9s80| PToonv |$ 1140 684.00 Red Kap $ 1348 808.80
o PT1ONV PT10NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
34" Men's Navy Trouser
2 |UNF 37" 40 | Ea RedKap | ¢ 1493|s s9720| PT2OoNv |$ 1140 456.00 Red Kap $ 1348 539.20
o PT1ONV PT10NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
36" Men's Navy Trouser
3 |UNF 37" 120 | EA RedKap | ¢ 1403|s 179160| PT2oNv |$ 1140 1,368.00 Red Kap $ 1348 1,617.60
o PT1ONV PT10NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
38" Men's Navy Trouser
4 |UNF 37" 50 | EA RedKap | ¢ 1493|s 74650 | PT2onv |$ 1140 570.00 Red Kap $ 1348 674.00
o PT1ONV PT10NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
40" Men's Navy Trouser
5 |UNF 37" 50 | EA RedKap | ¢ 1403|s 74650 | PT2oNv |$ 1140 570.00 Red Kap $ 1348 674.00
o PT1ONV PT1ONV
Brand and Style Bidding:
42"Men's Navy Trouser
6 |UNF 37" 50 | EA RedKap | ¢ 1493|s 74650 | PT2oNv |$ 1370 685.00 Red Kap $ 1348 674.00
o PT1ONV PT10NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
44" Men's Navy Trouser
7 |UNF 37" 10 | EA RedKap | ¢ 1703|s 17030 | PT2onv |$ 1370 137.00 Red Kap $  16.18 161.80
o PT1ONV PT1ONV
Brand and Style Bidding:
46" Men's Navy Trouser
8 |UNF 37" 10 | EA RedKap | ¢ 4793|s 17930 | PT2onv |$ 1370 137.00 Red Kap $  16.18 161.80
o PT1ONV PT10NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
48" Men's Navy Trouser
9 |UNF37" 10 | EA RedKap | ¢ 1703|s 17030 | pT2onv |$ 1370 137.00 Red Kap $  16.18 161.80
o PT1ONV PT10NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
50" Men's Navy Trouser
10 |UNF 37" 10 | EA RedKap | ¢ 4793|s 17930 | PT2onv |$ 1450 145.00 Red Kap $  16.18 161.80
o PT1ONV PT10NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
52" Men's Navy Trouser
11 |UNF 37" 10 | EA RedKap | ¢ 4703|s 17030 | PT2onv |$ 1450 145.00 Red Kap $  16.18 161.80
o PT10NV PT1ONV
Brand and Style Bidding:
54" Men's Navy Trouser
12 |UNF 37" 10 | EA RedKap | ¢ 4793|s 17930 | PT2onv |$ 1450 145.00 Red Kap $  16.18 161.80
o PT1ONV PT10NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
56" Men's Navy Trouser
N Red Kap Red Kap
13 |UNF 37 10 | EA Pty |$ 1793|$ 17930 | PT20NV [$  17.00 170.00 BT10NY $  16.18 161.80

Brand and Style Bidding:
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

Department of Correctional Services

3533 OF

Opening Date: 02/02/11

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants Comade, Inc Eagle Group Uniform NU Crisp Image Apparel
Brand and
o - Brand and o Extended - Extended Brand and Style L Extended
c
£ Description QTY | UOM Style Bidding Unit Price Price nij!e Unit Price Price Bidding Unit Price Price
58" Men's Navy Trouser
14 |UNF 37" 30 | EA RedKap | ¢ 1793|s s37.00| Pr2onv |$ 1700|$  510.00 Red Kap $ 1618 |$ 48540
N PT10NV PT10NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
28" - 33" Men's Black Trouser Red Ka Red Kai
15 |UNF 37" 60 EA p $ 1519 | $ 911.40 PT20BK $ 1140 (| $ 684.00 P $ 1369 | $ 821.40
o PT10BK PT10NV
Brand and Style Bidding:
34" Men's Black Trouser Red Ka Red Ka
16 |UNF 37" 10 EA P $ 1519 | $ 151.90 | PT20BK | $ 11.40 | $ 114.00 p $ 1369 ( $ 136.90
. PT10BK PT10BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
36" Men's Black Trouser Red Ka Red Ka
17 |UNF 37" 100 EA p $ 1519 | $ 1,519.00 PT20BK $ 11.40 | $ 1,140.00 p $ 13.69 | $ 1,369.00
o PT10BK PT10BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
38" Men's Black Trouser Red Ka Red Ka
18 [UNF 37" 40 EA P $ 1519 | $ 607.60 | PT20BK | $ 11.40 | $ 456.00 P $ 1369 | $ 547.60
. PT10BK PT10BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
40" Men's Black Trouser Red Ka Red Kai
19 |UNF 37" 60 EA p $ 1519 | $ 911.40 PT20BK $ 1140 (| $ 684.00 p $ 1369 | $ 821.40
o PT10BK PT10BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
42"Men's Black Trouser Red Ka Red Ka
20 |UNF 37" 30 EA P $ 1519 | $ 455.70 | PT20BK | $ 13.70 | $ 411.00 P $ 1369 | $ 410.70
. PT10BK PT10BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
44" Men's Black Trouser Red Ka Red Kai
21 |UNF 37" 10 EA p $ 1823 | $ 182.30 PT20BK $ 13.70 | $ 137.00 p $ 1643 | $ 164.30
o PT10BK PT10BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
46" Men's Black Trouser Red Ka Red Ka
22 |UNF 37" 10 EA P $ 1823 | $ 182.30 | PT20BK | $ 13.70 | $ 137.00 P $ 1643 ( $ 164.30
. PT10BK PT10BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
48" Men's Black Trouser Red Ka Red Ka
23 |UNF 37" 10 EA p $ 1823 | $ 182.30 PT20BK $ 13.70 | $ 137.00 p $ 1643 | $ 164.30
o PT10BK PT10BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
50" Men's Black Trouser Red Ka Red Ka
24 |UNF 37" 10 EA P $ 1823 | $ 182.30 | PT20BK | $ 13.70 | $ 137.00 p $ 1643 ( $ 164.30
N PT10BK PT10BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
52" Men's Black Trouser Red Ka Red Kai
25 |UNF 37" 40 EA p $ 1823 | $ 729.20 PT20BK $ 1450 | $ 580.00 p $ 1643 | $ 657.20
S PT10BK PT10BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
54" Men's Black Trouser Red Ka Red Ka
26 |UNF 37" 10 EA P $ 1823 | $ 18230 | PT20BK | $ 17.00 | $ 170.00 P $ 1643 ( $ 164.30
N PT10BK PT10BK
Brand and Style Bidding:
56" Men's Black Trouser Red Kap Red Kap
27 |UNF 37 30 EA PT10BK $ 1823 | $ 546.90 PT20BK $ 17.00 | $ 510.00 PT10BK $ 1643 | $ 492.90

Brand and Style Bidding:
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

Department of Correctional Services

3533 OF

Opening Date: 02/02/11

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants Comade, Inc Eagle Group Uniform NU Crisp Image Apparel
Brand and

o - Brand and o Extended - Extended Brand and Style L Extended

c

£ Description QTY | UOM Style Bidding Unit Price Price nij!e Unit Price Price Bidding Unit Price Price
58" Men's Black Trouser Red Ka Red Ka

28 |UNF 37" 40 EA P $ 1823 | $ 729.20 | PT20BK | $ 17.00 | $ 680.00 P $ 1643 | $ 657.20

- PT10BK PT10BK

Brand and Style Bidding:
SZ 0 - 10 Female Black Trouser Red Ka Red Ka

29 |UNF 37" 70 EA P $ 15.00 [ $ 1,050.00 P223 $ 1480 | $ 1,036.00 p $ 1204 | $ 842.80

- PT11BK PT21BK

Brand and Style Bidding:
Size 12 Female Black Trouser Red Kap Red Kap

30 Brand and Style Bidding: 100 | EA PT11BK $ 18.00 [ $ 1,800.00 P223 $ 1480 | $ 1,480.00 PT21BK $ 12.04 | $ 1,204.00
Size 14 Female Black Trouser Red Kap Red Kap

31 Brand and Style Bidding: 100 | EA PT11BK $ 18.00 [ $ 1,800.00 P223 $ 1480 | $ 1,480.00 PT21BK $ 12.04 | $ 1,204.00
Size 16 Female Black Trouser Red Kap Red Kap

32 Brand and Style Bidding: 40 EA PT11BK $ 18.00 | $ 720.00 P223 $ 1480 | $ 592.00 PT21BK $ 1204 | $ 481.60
Size 18 Female Black Trouser Red Kap Red Kap

33 Brand and Style Bidding: 60 EA PT11BK $ 18.00 [ $ 1,080.00 P223 $ 1480 | $ 888.00 PT21BK $ 1204 | $ 722.40
Size 20 Female Black Trouser Red Kap Red Kap

34 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA PT11BK $ 18.00 | $ 180.00 P223 $ 1480 | $ 148.00 PT21BK $ 1204 | $ 120.40
Size 22 Female Black Trouser Red Kap Red Kap

35 Brand and Style Bidding: 30 EA PT11BK $ 18.00 | $ 540.00 P223 $ 1750 | $ 525.00 PT21BK $ 1445 | $ 433.50
Size 24 Female Black Trouser Red Kap Red Kap

36 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA PT11BK $ 18.00 | $ 180.00 P223 $ 1750 | $ 175.00 PT21BK $ 1445 | $ 144.50
Size 26 Female Black Trouser Red Kap Red Kap

37 Brand and Style Bidding: 60 EA PT11BK $ 18.00 [ $ 1,080.00 P223 $ 20.00 [ $ 1,200.00 PT21BK $ 21.25($ 1,275.00
Size 28 Female Black Trouser Red Kap Red Kap

38 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA PT11BK $ 18.00 | $ 180.00 P223 $ 20.00 | $ 200.00 PT21BK $ 21251 % 212.50
Size S - M Short Sleeve Shirt Red Kap Red Kap

39 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA SP20BW $ 1025 | $ 102.50 | SP20BW | $ 950 | $ 95.00 SP20BW $ 925 | $ 92.50
Size L Short Sleeve Shirt Red Kap Red Kap

40 Brand and Style Bidding: 40 EA SP20BW $ 1025 | $ 410.00 $ 950 | $ 380.00 SP20BW $ 925 | $ 370.00
Size XL Short Sleeve Shirt Red Kap Red Kap

41 Brand and Style Bidding: 70 EA SP20BW $ 1025 | $ 717.50 $ 950 | $ 665.00 SP20BW $ 925 | $ 647.50
Size 2XL Short Sleeve Shirt Red Kap Red Kap

42 Brand and Style Bidding: 40 EA SP20BW $ 12.30 | $ 492.00 $ 1150 | $ 460.00 SP20BW $ 1110 | $ 444.00
S - XL Short Sleeve Shirt - Long Red Kap Red Kap

43 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA SP20BW $ 1230 | $ 123.00 $ 11.40 | $ 114.00 SP20BW $ 1110 | $ 111.00
Size 2XL Short Sleeve Shirt Long Red Kap Red Kap

44 1rand and Style Bidding: 101 BA L gppopw | ® 1476|S 14760 $ 14501$ 14500 SP20BW $ 11104$ 11100
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

Department of Correctional Services

3533 OF

Opening Date: 02/02/11

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants Comade, Inc Eagle Group Uniform NU Crisp Image Apparel

.% Description QTY | UOM SE’ lr:rgji d?j?r?g Unit Price E)gtl?ir;ged B;%?gia;d Unit Price E)S(;r;ied Brar;ji dfzf::gStWe Unit Price E)S(rsir;ceied

45 :i;i?:r‘]dsggltesé‘?g;’ﬁ] ;hirtjg 10 | EA sljbezdog?/\? $ 1476 |$  147.60 $ 1450 145.00 sRF?zdoE?/\’/) $ 1110 111.00
46 :i;ig):r‘]:ggltesé‘?g;ﬁ ;hirtjg 40 | EA 5;;0';35 $ 1476 |$  590.40 $ 1450 580.00 :;;0;?/:/) $ 1110 444.00
47 :i;i?:r‘]:ggltesé‘?ggi ;hirtjg 40 | EA S?;;Olé\a/\? $ 1476 |$  590.40 $  17.00 680.00 gsgog?/\’/) $ 1110 444.00
48 :i;ig);tjggltesé‘?ggi ;Mg 10 | EA 5;;0';35 $ 1476 |$  147.60 $  17.00 170.00 SledeE?/\’l) $  16.19 161.90
49 :r'anMdL:n”dg;ﬁ:VBﬁ;?:;:_ 40 | EA sl,qpefog?/\? $ 1250|$  500.00 $ 1150 460.00 SR;:?OE?/\’/) $  11.20 448.00
50 'ér;?‘régai'sg;:g; gng. 10 | EA sl?;fo;?/\? $ 1250|$  125.00 $ 1150 115.00 SSSOEW $  11.20 112.00
51 gkahz“:nilgf;’lz gihdiging:_ 10 | EA sl?;fog?/\? $ 1250 |$  125.00 $ 1150 115.00 sR:fo}é?/\’/) $  11.20 112.00
52 Ei(aLn:":ng dSSI,(t%;/el\e/eBiSdhdi:;g:_ 40 | EA sl?;fog?/\? $ 1500|$  600.00 $ 1350 540.00 SlefO}é?/\‘/) $ 1345 538.00
53 :r'a;(g ;sg%glzeé’%;:gfmi 40 | EA sl?;folé?/\? $ 1500|$  600.00 $ 1350 540.00 SSSOEW $  11.20 448.00
54 Ei(;n:":ng dSSI,(t%;/el\e/eBiSdhdi:;Ig_:(i 10 | EA sl,qpefog?/\? $ 1800|$  180.00 $  16.00 160.00 SSSOEW $ 1345 134.50
55 gi(aLn:c’:ng dSSI,(t%;/el\e/eBiSdhdi:;Ig_:(i 10 | EA sl,qpefog?/\? $ 1800|$  180.00 $  16.00 160.00 sRF?ldoE?/\’/) $ 1345 134.50
56 éi(:n:c’:ng dSSI,(t%;/el\e/eBiSdhdi:;Ig_:(i 30 | EA s?;fog?/\? $ 1800|$  540.00 $  17.00 510.00 SRISSOE?/\’/) $ 1345 403.50
57 gi(:n:c’:ng dSSI,(t%;/el\e/eBiSdhdi:;Ig_:(i 10 | EA sl,qpefog?/\? $ 1800|$  180.00 $  17.00 170.00 SR;:?OE?/\’/) $  19.60 196.00
58 gi(;n:":ng dSSI,(t%;/el\e/eBiSdhdi:;Ig_fl 10 | EA sl?;fog?/\? $ 1800|$  180.00 $  17.00 170.00 SSSOEW $  19.60 196.00
59 g(;n:o:ng dSSI,(t%;/el\e/eBiSdhdi:;Ig_:(i 10 | EA ;ffo'éf‘/\'[/’ N/A N/A $  19.00 190.00 sR:fo}é?/\’/) $  19.60 196.00
60 :i;dsg\:jg;‘:m ading. 10 | EA ?Tegoﬁe\‘f $ 2619|$  261.90 $  24.00 240.00 ?fgoﬁa\‘/p $ 2315 231.50
61 :Z;g ;f]‘gk;tyle Bidding. 20 | EA ?Tegoﬁe\‘f $ 2619|$  523.80 $  24.00 480.00 ?fgoﬁa\‘/p $ 2315 463.00
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3533 OF
Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 02/02/11

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants Comade, Inc Eagle Group Uniform NU Crisp Image Apparel
.% Description QTY | UOM SE’ lr:rgji d?j?r?g Unit Price E)S(;r;ied B;%?g;;d Unit Price E)S(;r;ied Brar;ji dfzf::gStWe Unit Price E)S(rsir;ceied
62 :irzaié(::s‘;k;}e Bidding. 80 | EA ?Tegoﬁf’ $ 2619 |$ 209520 $  24.00 1,920.00 ?fgoﬁa\‘/p $ 2315|$ 1,852.00
63 :'rzaij):r‘];%ct;g Bidding. 10 | EA ?Tegoﬁf’ $ 3143|$ 31430 $ 2850 285.00 ?Tegoﬁa\‘/p $ 27.78|$  277.80
64 :'rzaij):r‘];g;g Bidding. 10 | EA ?Tegoﬁf’ $ 3143|$ 31430 $ 2850 285.00 ?Tegoﬁa\‘/p $ 27.78|$  277.80
65 :irzaig);h;g;g Bidding. 20 | EA ?Tegoﬁf’ $ 3143|$  628.60 $ 2850 570.00 ?fgoﬁa\‘/p $ 27.78|$  555.60
66 :'rzai:):r‘];g;g Bidding. 20 | EA ?Tegoﬁf’ $ 3143|$  628.60 $ 2850 570.00 ?fgoﬁa\‘/p $ 27.78|$  555.60
67 :irzaig);h;g;g Bidding. 10 | EA ?Tegoﬁe\‘f’ $ 3143|$ 31430 $ 3200 320.00 ?fgoﬁa\‘/p $ 27.78|$  277.80
68 :'rzaig);t;g;g Bidding. 10 | EA N/A N/A N/A $ 3200 320.00 ?fgoﬁa\‘/p $ 4052 |$ 40520
69 giri\?\gﬂa;n)(;Lsf;CekBeit deci’:é’:_ 20 | EA ?Tegoﬁe\‘f $ 3143|$  628.60 $ 2850 570.00 ?fgoﬁa\‘/p $ 2315|$  463.00
70 :';?;t;g;g g%”d%ng:_ 20 | EA ?Tegoﬁe\‘f $ 3780|$  756.00 $ 3550 710.00 ?fgoﬁa\‘/p $ 27.78|$  555.60
71 :';\?;t;gct;g g%”d%ng:_ 10 | EA ?Tegoﬁf’ $ 3780|$  378.00 $ 3550 355.00 ?fgoﬁa\‘/p $ 27.78|$  277.80
72 :i;]g);t;zct;g g%”d%ng:_ 10 | EA ?Tegoﬁf’ $ 3780|$  378.00 $ 3550 355.00 ?Tegoﬁa\‘/p $ 27.78|$  277.80
73 :';:);t;g;g g%”d%ng:_ 10 | EA ?Tegoﬁf’ $ 3780 |$  378.00 $ 3650 365.00 ?Tegoﬁa\‘/p $ 27.78|$  277.80
74 :i;g);tizct;g g%”d%ng:_ 10 | EA ?Tegoﬁf’ $ 3780 |$  378.00 $ 37.50 375.00 ?fgoﬁa\‘/p $ 4052 |$  405.20
75 :';]Z);t;zc;g g%”d%ng:_ 10 | EA N/A N/A N/A $ 37.50 375.00 ?fgoﬁa\‘/p $ 4052 |$ 40520

Totals: $ 38,057.10 | $ 34,219.00 33,396.20

Payment Terms: 0.5% 10Net30

Delivery Days ARO: 30
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3533 OF

Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 02/02/11

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants Comade, Inc Eagle Group Uniform NU Crisp Image Apparel
Brand and
o - Brand and o Extended - Extended Brand and Style L Extended
c
£ Description QTY | UOM Style Bidding Unit Price Price nij!e Unit Price Price Bidding Unit Price Price
Line 43: M-XL
Comments: Line 53: M-XL
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3533 OF
Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 02/02/11

AWARD
Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants Phoenix Textile Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.

o - Brand and Style oo Extended Brand and Style - Extended

c

£ Description QTY | UOM Bidding Unit Price . Bidding Unit Price Price
28" - 33" Men's Navy Trouser L

1 |uNFa7 60 | EA #E;';:;\T\S} $ 17.35 1,041.00 Eﬁgzﬁa\f’ $ 1399 |$  839.40
Brand and Style Bidding:
34" Men's Navy Trouser L

2 |UNF 37" 40 | Ea #2'21(;\?3 $ 17.35 694.00 E?gzﬁf’ $ 1399 |$  559.60
Brand and Style Bidding:
36" Men's Navy Trouser L

3 |UNF37" 120 | EA #E;';:;\T\S} $ 17.35 2,082.00 Eﬁgzﬁa\f’ $ 1399 |$ 1,678.80
Brand and Style Bidding:
38" Men's Navy Trouser L

4 |UNF 37" 50 | EA #2'21(;\?3 $ 17.35 867.50 E?gzﬁf’ $ 1399 |$ 69950
Brand and Style Bidding:
40" Men's Navy Trouser L

5 |UNF 37" 50 | EA #E;';:;\T\S} $ 17.35 867.50 Eﬁgzﬁa\f’ $ 1399 |$  699.50
Brand and Style Bidding:
42"Men's Navy Trouser L

6 |UNF 37" 50 | EA #2'21(;\?3 $ 17.35 867.50 E?gzﬁf’ $ 1399 |$ 69950
Brand and Style Bidding:
44" Men's Navy Trouser L

7 |UNF 37" 10 | EA #E;';:;\T\S} $ 17.35 173.50 Eﬁgzﬁa\f’ $ 1679|$  167.90
Brand and Style Bidding:
46" Men's Navy Trouser L

8 |UNF 37" 10 | EA #2'21(;\?3 $ 17.35 173.50 E?gzﬁf’ $ 1679|$  167.90
Brand and Style Bidding:
48" Men's Navy Trouser L

9 |unFa7 10 | EA #E;';:;\T\S} $ 17.35 173.50 Eﬁgzﬁa\f’ $ 1679|$  167.90
Brand and Style Bidding:
50" Men's Navy Trouser L

10 |UNF 37" 10 | EA #2'21(;\?3 $ 17.35 173.50 E?gzﬁf’ $ 1679|$  167.90
Brand and Style Bidding:
52" Men's Navy Trouser L

11 |UNF 37" 10 | EA #E;';:;\T\S} $ 18.80 188.00 Eﬁgzﬁa\f’ $ 1679|$  167.90
Brand and Style Bidding:
54" Men's Navy Trouser L

12 |UNF 37" 10 | EA #2'21(;\?3 $ 18.80 188.00 E?gzlf\?/) $ 1679|$  167.90
Brand and Style Bidding:
56" Men's Navy Trouser L

13 |UNF 37" 10 | EA #E;';:;\T\S} $ 18.80 188.00 Eﬁgzﬁa\f’ $ 1679|$  167.90
Brand and Style Bidding:
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3533 OF
Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 02/02/11

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants Phoenix Textile Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.

o - Brand and Style oo Extended Brand and Style - Extended

.5 Description QTY | UOM Bidding Unit Price . Bidding Unit Price Price
58" Men's Navy Trouser L

14 |UNF 37" 30 | EA #E;';:;\T\S} $ 1880 |$%  564.00 Eﬁgzﬁa\f’ $ 3384[$ 1,015.20
Brand and Style Bidding:
28" - 33" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

15 |UNF 37" 60 EA #874BK $ 17.35|$ 1,041.00 PT62BK $ 13.99 | $ 839.40
Brand and Style Bidding:
34" Men's Black Trouser L

16 |UNF 37" 10 | EA #E;';Z:Bei $ 1735|$% 17350 E?gzléa}f $ 1399 [$  139.90
Brand and Style Bidding:
36" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

17 |UNF 37" 100 EA $ 1735|$% 1,735.00 $ 13.99 | $ 1,399.00

o #874BK PT62BK

Brand and Style Bidding:
38" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

18 |UNF 37" 40 EA #874BK $ 1735($ 694.00 PT62BK $ 1399 | $ 559.60
Brand and Style Bidding:
40" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

19 |UNF 37" 60 EA #874BK $ 17.35|$ 1,041.00 PT62BK $ 13.99 | $ 839.40
Brand and Style Bidding:
42"Men's Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

20 |UNF 37" 30 EA #874BK $ 1735($ 520.50 PT62BK $ 1399 | $ 419.70
Brand and Style Bidding:
44" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

21 |UNF 37" 10 EA #874BK $ 1735( $ 173.50 PT62BK $ 16.79 | $ 167.90
Brand and Style Bidding:
46" Men's Black Trouser L

22 |UNF 37" 10 | EA #E;';:;i $ 1735|$% 17350 E?gzléa}f $ 1679|$  167.90
Brand and Style Bidding:
48" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

23 |UNF 37" 10 EA #874BK $ 1735( $ 173.50 PT62BK $ 16.79 | $ 167.90
Brand and Style Bidding:
50" Men's Black Trouser L

24 |UNF 37" 10 | EA #E;';Z:Bei $ 1735|% 17350 E?gzléa}f $ 1679|$  167.90
Brand and Style Bidding:
52" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

25 |UNF 37" 40 EA #874BK $ 1880 $ 752.00 PT62BK $ 16.79 | $ 671.60
Brand and Style Bidding:
54" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

26 |UNF 37" 10 EA #874BK $ 1880 $ 188.00 PT62BK $ 16.79 | $ 167.90
Brand and Style Bidding:
56" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

27 |UNF 37" 30 EA #874BK $ 1880 $ 564.00 PT62BK $ 16.79 | $ 503.70
Brand and Style Bidding:
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3533 OF

Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 02/02/11

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants Phoenix Textile Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.

o - Brand and Style oo Extended Brand and Style - Extended

c

£ Description QTY | UOM Bidding Unit Price . Bidding Unit Price Price
58" Men's Black Trouser Dickies Red Ka

28 |UNF 37" 40 EA #874BK $ 1880 | % 752.00 PTGZBKp $ 3384 ($ 1,353.60
Brand and Style Bidding:
SZ 0 - 10 Female Black Trouser Dickies Red Ka

29 |UNF 37" 70 EA HEP221BX $ 1360 | $ 952.00 PT21BKp $ 12.02 | $ 841.40
Brand and Style Bidding:
Size 12 Female Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

30 Brand and Style Bidding: 1001 EA #FP221BX $ 13603 1,360.00 PT21BK $ 1202 1% 1,202.00
Size 14 Female Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

st Brand and Style Bidding: 1001 EA #FP221BX $ 13603 1,360.00 PT21BK $ 1202 1% 1,202.00
Size 16 Female Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

32 Brand and Style Bidding: 40 EA #FP221BX S 1360 (3 544.00 PT21BK $ 12023 480.80
Size 18 Female Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

33 Brand and Style Bidding: 60 EA #FP221BX S 1360 (3 816.00 PT21BK $ 120213 721.20
Size 20 Female Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

34 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA #FP221BX S 1555 (R 155.50 PT21BK $ 12023 120.20
Size 22 Female Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

35 Brand and Style Bidding: 30 EA #FP221BX S 1555 (R 466.50 PT21BK $ 144218 432.60
Size 24 Female Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

36 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA #FP221BX S 1555 (R 155.50 PT21BK $ 144213 144.20
Size 26 Female Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

37 Brand and Style Bidding: 60 EA #FP221BX $ 0103 1,806.00 PT21BK $ 2882 1% 1,729.20
Size 28 Female Black Trouser Dickies Red Kap

38 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA #FP221BX $ 0 S010/(ES 801.00 PT21BK $ 28823 288.20
Size S - M Short Sleeve Shirt RedKap Red Kap

39 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA SP20BW $ D098 90.90 SP20BW $ 879 |% 87.90
Size L Short Sleeve Shirt RedKap Red Kap

40 Brand and Style Bidding: 40 EA #SP20BW $ D098 363.60 SP20BW $ 879 |% 351.60
Size XL Short Sleeve Shirt RedKap Red Kap

a1 Brand and Style Bidding: 0 EA #SP20BW $ D098 636.30 SP20BW $ 879 |% 615.30
Size 2XL Short Sleeve Shirt RedKap Red Kap

42 Brand and Style Bidding: 40 EA #SP20BW $ D098 363.60 SP20BW $ 105513 422.00
S - XL Short Sleeve Shirt - Long RedKap Red Kap

43 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA #SP20BW $ 1050 (E3 105.00 SP20BW $ 105513 105.50
Size 2XL Short Sleeve Shirt Long RedKap Red Kap

a4 Brand and Style Bidding: 10 EA #SP20BW $ 1050 (E3 105.00 SP20BW $ 105513 105.50
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3533 OF
Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 02/02/11

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants Phoenix Textile Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.

_% Description QTY | UOM Brarll_:: d&:ﬂggswle Unit Price E);t(reir;(eied BranBc: da:jr;ggStyle Unit Price E)S(;r;ged
o e o o] S [ weols ww] S s ws[s e
e R - e I O
e R e T R
e R R O e I R
o Baieraom__ ||| S [ wels ew] S [s oonfs e
 [smamaomenaane__ | 0| | oiew | wes|s wese| IHE |5 wrls o
o b | 0o | S |s wels ws| g s wrls we
2 et |0 || Sl [ wels waw] S [s el sus
* fpnasmSyetuang 0| 9| | stop |® RE)S 0| smonw |0 w0n|s eo
ol e R G B e e I e
s [ | 0| | e | ws|s mew| S5 |s wer)s o
o [ | © = | S |8 wels sl g s werls o
T |0 o | S |s mels mw) [ s mwls e
[ | 0| | e |® mels mwm| I |s mw)s s
9 oo | 0| | e |® mels mwm| I |s mw)s s
60 3'@?5 :a'\:jgi:leetsidding:_ 10 EA #??goKS{)/ $ 1300 130.00 ?Tegoﬁa\l/p $ 2246 224.60
o [Smmaenoams___ | % | | Gy | mw|s e Sl s 2e|s
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3533 OF
Department of Correctional Services

Opening Date: 02/02/11

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants Phoenix Textile Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.

_% Description QTY | UOM Brarll_:: d&:ﬂggswle Unit Price E);t(reir;(eied BranBc: da:jr;ggStyle Unit Price E)S(;r;ged
A I T e I T
63 :irzi\?:r_];ascttfetsidding:_ 10 EA #??goKS{)/ $ 1300 {E38030.00 ?Tegoﬁa\f $  297|$ 26070
64 :irzi\j):r_];ascttfetsidding:_ 10 EA Aoty 9 AR\ E e eow |8 297|s 28070
65 :irza?\g);tjasct;zmdding:_ 20 | EA #??goKS{)/ 25,74 [E35 514 60 ?Tegoﬁa\f $  2697|$ 53040
66 :irzi\g)):r_];ascttfetsidding:_ 20 | EA #??goKS{)/ $ 25,74 [E35 514 60 ?Tegoﬁa\l/p $  2697|$ 53040
67 :irzi\g);t;ascttfetsidding:_ 10 EA Aty § ) B eow  |® 297|s 28070
68 :irzi\;);t;ascttfetsidding:_ 10 EA #??goKSS/ $ SZO0ESS 520,00 ?Tegolrfl&\l/p $ 5437 |$ 54370
o ooy | oo | SR |5 muls sew| S s wels s
o eianeit, | oo BER |5 muls se] fw s wels s
n b, ||| S [s muls ww] Sy s sl e
e R T A
e R T O
n e, oo ] S [s ew|s mw| Sme [oownfs sen
o b0 G [s wels mw] S [s sl sen
Totals: $ 36,619.90 35,837.20
Payment Terms: 1% 10 0% 30

Delivery Days ARO: 15
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper 3533 OF Opening Date: 02/02/11
Department of Correctional Services

Maintenance Shirts, Pants, Jackets, and Food Service Pants Phoenix Textile Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.
o - Brand and Style oo Extended Brand and Style - Extended
c
£ Description QTY | UOM Bidding Unit Price . Bidding Unit Price Price
Comments: 6-8 week lead time on lines 48, 68, 74 and 75
Invalid Bid

M. D. Brown Co.
Cintas Corporation

Award Explanation:
Total award was based on all sizes being available.

Nu Crisp and Eagle Group did not meet specification for all trousers. Aramark did not meet
specification for men's trousers, short and long sleeved shirts, and did not bid on all lines.
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