
Buyer: Michelle Kemper 3529 ZF
Department of Corrections

Opening Date: 01/28/2011

Li
ne Description OTY UOM Unit Price  Extended 

Price Unit Price  Extended 
Price Unit Price  Extended 

Price Unit Price  Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price

1

TWILL , KHAKI, 60", 5-1/4 OZ
65% Polyester/35% Cotton
5.25 Ounce per Square Yard Minimum
Weave 2 X 1
Vat Dyed-Color Fast
Width: 60"
Finish: Preshrunk 3% or Less, Residual Shrinkage in either direction
Colors: Khaki

30,000 YD 2.15$             64,500.00$    4.49$             134,700.00$  3.45$             103,500.00$  1.99$             59,700.00$    2.345$           $70,350.00

2

TWILL , KHAKI, 60", 7- 1/2 OZ
65% Polyester/35% Cotton
7.5 Ounce per Square Yard Minimum
Weave 3 X 1
Vat Dyed-Color Fast
Thread Count: 106 X 38
Width: 60"
Finish: Preshrunk 3% or Less, Residual Shrinkage in either direction
Colors: Khaki

30,000 YD 2.50$             75,000.00$    5.59$             167,700.00$  2.65$             79,500.00$    3.59$             107,700.00$  2.345$           $70,350.00

3

TWILL , WHITE, 60", 5-1/4 OZ
65% Polyester/35% Cotton
5.25 Ounce per Square Yard Minimum
Weave 2 X 1
Vat Dyed-Color Fast
Width: 60"
Finish: Preshrunk 3% or Less, Residual Shrinkage in either direction
Colors: White

4,000 YD 2.00$             8,000.00$      4.49$             17,960.00$    2.35$             9,400.00$      1.99$             7,960.00$      2.345$           $9,380.00

4

TWILL , WHITE, 60", 7 1/2 OZ
65% Polyester/35% Cotton
7.5 Ounce per Square Yard Minimum
Weave 3 X 1
Vat Dyed-Color Fast
Thread Count: 106 X 38
Width: 60"
Finish: Preshrunk 3% or Less, Residual Shrinkage in either direction
Colors: White

4,000 YD 2.50$             10,000.00$    5.59$             22,360.00$    2.25$             9,000.00$      3.59$             14,360.00$    2.345$           $9,380.00

5

TWILL , GRAY, 60", 5-1/4 OZ
65% Polyester/35% Cotton
5.25 Ounce per Square Yard Minimum
Weave 2 X 1
Vat Dyed-Color Fast
Width: 60"
Finish: Preshrunk 3% or Less, Residual Shrinkage in either direction
Colors: Gray

4,000 YD 2.30$             9,200.00$      4.49$             17,960.00$    2.65$             10,600.00$    1.99$             7,960.00$      2.345$           $9,380.00

6

TWILL , GRAY, 60", 7- 1/2 OZ
65% Polyester/35% Cotton
7.5 Ounce per Square Yard Minimum
Weave 3 X 1
Vat Dyed-Color Fast
Thread Count: 106 X 38
Width: 60"
Finish: Preshrunk 3% or Less, Residual Shrinkage in either direction
Colors: Gray

4,000 YD 2.50$             10,000.00$    5.59$             22,360.00$    2.85$             11,400.00$    3.59$             14,360.00$    2.345$           $9,380.00

176,700.00$  383,040.00$  223,400.00$  212,040.00$  $178,220.00

Shirt and Pant Fabric

Comments:
Delivery Days ARO:
Payment Terms:
Totals:

Club Tex Inc.

30

American Textile Systems Angielyns Collections Arthur R. Johnson & Co. Inc.  Canada Mostin Trading 
Corporation 

0%   30Net 30
30 - 40
1%   15

 AWARD
SEE EXPLANATION 
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50
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper 3529 ZF
Department of Corrections

Opening Date: 01/28/2011
Li

ne Description OTY UOM

1

TWILL , KHAKI, 60", 5-1/4 OZ
65% Polyester/35% Cotton
5.25 Ounce per Square Yard Minimum
Weave 2 X 1
Vat Dyed-Color Fast
Width: 60"
Finish: Preshrunk 3% or Less, Residual Shrinkage in either direction
Colors: Khaki

30,000 YD

2

TWILL , KHAKI, 60", 7- 1/2 OZ
65% Polyester/35% Cotton
7.5 Ounce per Square Yard Minimum
Weave 3 X 1
Vat Dyed-Color Fast
Thread Count: 106 X 38
Width: 60"
Finish: Preshrunk 3% or Less, Residual Shrinkage in either direction
Colors: Khaki

30,000 YD

3

TWILL , WHITE, 60", 5-1/4 OZ
65% Polyester/35% Cotton
5.25 Ounce per Square Yard Minimum
Weave 2 X 1
Vat Dyed-Color Fast
Width: 60"
Finish: Preshrunk 3% or Less, Residual Shrinkage in either direction
Colors: White

4,000 YD

4

TWILL , WHITE, 60", 7 1/2 OZ
65% Polyester/35% Cotton
7.5 Ounce per Square Yard Minimum
Weave 3 X 1
Vat Dyed-Color Fast
Thread Count: 106 X 38
Width: 60"
Finish: Preshrunk 3% or Less, Residual Shrinkage in either direction
Colors: White

4,000 YD

5

TWILL , GRAY, 60", 5-1/4 OZ
65% Polyester/35% Cotton
5.25 Ounce per Square Yard Minimum
Weave 2 X 1
Vat Dyed-Color Fast
Width: 60"
Finish: Preshrunk 3% or Less, Residual Shrinkage in either direction
Colors: Gray

4,000 YD

6

TWILL , GRAY, 60", 7- 1/2 OZ
65% Polyester/35% Cotton
7.5 Ounce per Square Yard Minimum
Weave 3 X 1
Vat Dyed-Color Fast
Thread Count: 106 X 38
Width: 60"
Finish: Preshrunk 3% or Less, Residual Shrinkage in either direction
Colors: Gray

4,000 YD

Shirt and Pant Fabric

Comments:
Delivery Days ARO:
Payment Terms:
Totals:

Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price

$3.29 $98,700.00 $1.85 $55,500.00 $2.13 $63,900.00 $2.31 $69,300.00 $2.47 $74,100.00 No Bid No Bid

$3.49 $104,700.00 $2.88 $86,400.00 $2.59 $77,700.00 $2.44 $73,200.00 $2.65 $79,500.00 $2.65 $79,500.00

$3.29 $13,160.00 $1.75 $7,000.00 $2.13 $8,520.00 $2.45 $9,800.00 $2.41 $9,640.00 No Bid No Bid

$3.49 $13,960.00 $2.59 $10,360.00 $2.59 $10,360.00 $2.58 $10,320.00 $2.45 $9,800.00 $2.45 $9,800.00

$3.29 $13,160.00 $1.85 $7,400.00 $2.13 $8,520.00 $2.58 $10,320.00 $2.47 $9,880.00 No Bid No Bid

$3.49 $13,960.00 $2.88 $11,520.00 $2.59 $10,360.00 $2.71 $10,840.00 $2.65 $10,600.00 $2.65 $10,600.00

$257,640.00 $178,180.00 $179,360.00 $183,780.00 $193,520.00 $99,900.00

Comade, Inc. Fox - Rich Textiles, Inc. Raytex Fabrics, Inc. The Restex Company, Inc. Tabb Textile Co., Inc.Lafayette Textiles Corp.

75 - 90
Net 30

45
1%   30

60
Net 30

15
Net 30

30
0.5%  10Net30

No Bid
Quester MFRS REP.

Award Explanation
American Textiles did not meet specifications 1 and 2.
Fox-Rich Textiles did not meet specifications 1 and 2.
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