Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

3518 OF
NDCS

Opening Date: 01/07/2011

Commando Sweaters
1 year usage - est

Alamar Uniforms

Bob Barker Company,

nc

Description Quantity Brand & Style Price Comments Brand & Style Price Comments
Commando Sweater, reg, XS 15 Cobmex #8081 | $ 31.75 No Bid No Bid
V-Neck, Navy
Tact Squad V-Neck
Commando Sweater, reg, S Command Sweater
V-Neck Na A 20 Cobmex #8081 | $ 31.75 Tact Squad 2003N 21.22 [Navy, 100% Acrylic
ey #72003N Small -
5-XL
Commando Sweater, reg, M 20 Cobmex #8081 | $ 31.75 Tact Squad 2003N 21.22
V-Neck, Navy
Commando Sweater, reg, L 80 Cobmex #8081 | $ 31.75 Tact Squad 2003N 21.22
V-Neck, Navy
Commando Sweater, reg, XL 110 Cobmex #8081 | $ 31.75 Tact Squad 2003N 21.22
V-Neck, Navy
Commando Sweater, reg, 2XL 25 Cobmex #8081 | $ 34.62 Tact Squad 2003N 21.22
V-Neck, Navy
Commando Sweater, reg, 3XL 10 Cobmex #8081 | $ 35.90 Tact Squad 2003N 21.22
V-Neck, Navy
Commando Sweater, reg, 4XL 40 Cobmex #8081 | $ 37.18 Tact Squad 2003N 21.22
V-Neck, Navy
Commando Sweater, reg, 5XL 40 Cobmex #8081 | $ 38.46 Tact Squad 2003N 21.22
V-Neck, Navy
Commando Sweater, reg, 6XL 20 Cobmex #8081 | $ 39.74 No Bid No Bid
V-Neck, Navy
Totals:
Payment Terms: Net 30 0% 30
Delivery Days ARO: 30 30-60

Comments:

Please add $1.75 per size for talls
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

3518 OF

NDCS

Opening Date: 01/07/2011

Commando Sweaters
1 year usage - est

Nemdigelt Corp. (F.R. Knitting)

NU Crisp Image Apparel

Description Quantity Brand & Style Price Comments Brand & Style Price Comments
\C/_Ol\'g:z”s;viweater' reg, XS 15 FR Knitting N315 31.75 A Caféffipparel 30.00
\C/_Ol\'g:znlggviweater‘ eg. S 20 FR Knitting N315 31.75 s Cafjgfipparel 30.00
\C/_Ol\'g:z”s;viweater' reg, M 20 FR Knitting N315 31.75 s Cafgfzpparel 30.00
S?&Tznsgviweater' reg, L 80 FR Knitting N315 31.75 A Cafgfzpparel 30.00
S?&Tznsgviweater' reg, XL 110 FR Knitting N315 31.75 A Cafjgf:pparel 30.00
S?&Tznsgviweater' reg, 2XL 25 FR Knitting N315 31.75 s Cafjgfjpparel 32.50
\C/_Ol\'g:z”s;;weater' reg, 3XL 10 FR Knitting N315 33.75 A Cafjgfjpparel 32.50
S?&Tznsgviweater' reg, 4XL 40 FR Knitting N315 35.75 s Cafjgfjpparel 35.00
\C/_Ol\'g:z”s;;weater' reg, SXL 40 FR Knitting N315 38.75 s Cafjgfjpparel 35.00
\C/_Ol\'g:z”s;;weater' reg, 6XL 20 FR Knitting N315 44.75 s Cafjgfjpparel 37.50
Totals:

Payment Terms:
Delivery Days ARO: 30 30

Comments:
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 3518 OF Opening Date: 01/07/2011

NDCS
AWARD
Commando Sweaters
1 year usage - est The Strong Group Zorgan Inc.
Description Quantity Brand & Style Price Comments Brand & Style Price Comments
Commando Sweater, reg, XS .
V-Neck, Navy 15 Miltons of NY $ 21.50 as specs MTL - 50A $ 17.50
Commando Sweater, reg, S .
V-Neck, Navy 20 Miltons of NY $ 21.50 as specs MTL - 50A $ 17.50
Commando Sweater, reg, M .
V-Neck, Navy 20 Miltons of NY $ 21.50 as specs MTL - 50A $ 17.50
Commando Sweater, reg, L .
V-Neck, Navy 80 Miltons of NY $ 21.50 as specs MTL - 50A $ 17.50
Commando Sweater, reg, XL .
V-Neck, Navy 110 Miltons of NY $ 21.50 as specs MTL - 50A $ 17.50
Commando Sweater, reg, 2XL .
V-Neck, Navy 25 Miltons of NY $ 22.75 as specs MTL - 50A $ 18.50
Commando Sweater, reg, 3XL .
V-Neck, Navy 10 Miltons of NY $ 22.75 as specs MTL - 50A $ 18.50
Commando Sweater, reg, 4XL .
V-Neck, Navy 40 Miltons of NY $ 24.00 as specs MTL - 50A $ 19.50
Commando Sweater, reg, 5XL .
V-Neck, Navy 40 Miltons of NY $ 25.00 as specs MTL - 50A $ 20.50
Commando Sweater, reg, 6XL .
V-Neck, Navy 20 Miltons of NY $ 25.00 as specs MTL - 50A $ 20.50
Totals:
Payment Terms: 0% 0
Delivery Days ARO:
Comments: Bidding Miltons of NY
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