Buyer: Mary Lanning

3489 OF

Department of Corrections

Opening Date: 11/19/10

ﬁ Video Teleconference Equipment AVI Systems B & H Photo Video Business Media Inc. Business Services
c
- Description QTY|UOM]| Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
Samsung 65" LED TV's
1 UN65C6500 4 EA
$ 3540.00( $ 14,160.00| $ 3,295.00| $ 13,180.00| $ 3,319.00| $ 13,276.00($ 3,699.98 [ $ 14,799.92
2 Peerless Universal Tilt 5 EA
Wallmount; ST670 $ 95.00| $ 190.00| $ 94.95| $ 189.90| $ 103.00| $ 206.00 | $ 99.98 | $ 199.96
Coax High Resolution VGA
3 [Monitor Extension Cable 2 EA
MTX101MMHQ75 $ 128.00| $ 256.00 No Bid No Bid $ 44.00| $ 88.00 | $ 48.98 | $ 97.96
4 Tripplite Video Splitter Cable 5 EA
P120-001-2 $ 25.00| $ 50.00 No Bid No Bid $ 21.10| $ 42.20 | $ 19.98 | $ 39.96
Tripplite VGA XVGA Y Splitter
5 |Cable 2 EA
P516-001 $ 25.00| $ 50.00 No Bid No Bid $ 9.35| $ 1870 | $ 19.98 | $ 39.96
Totals $ 14,706.00 $ 13,369.90 $ 13,630.90 $ 15,177.76
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 0%, 30 0%, 10
Delivery Days ARO 30 10

Comments
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3489 OF

Department of Corrections

Opening Date: 11/19/10

ﬁ Video Teleconference Equipment Conterence Technologies, Inc. DASCOM SLyLsCt:ems Group, Digital Video Midwest Focus Camera LLC
c
- Description QTY|UOM]| Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
Samsung 65" LED TV's
1 UN65C6500 4 EA
$ 3,350.00 | $ 13,400.00|$ 3,707.00$ 14,828.00|$ 3,499.00|$ 13,996.00 |$ 3,334.94|$ 13,339.76
2 Peerless Universal Tilt 5 EA
Wallmount; ST670 $ 88.00 | $ 176.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 220.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 96.00 | $ 192.00
Coax High Resolution VGA
3 [Monitor Extension Cable 2 EA
MTX101MMHQ75 $ 37.00 | $ 74.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 46.00 | $ 92.00
4 Tripplite Video Splitter Cable 5 EA
P120-001-2 $ 10.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 15.88 | $ 31.76
Tripplite VGA XVGA Y Splitter
5 |Cable 2 EA
P516-001 $ 7.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 1095 | $ 21.90
Totals $ 13,684.00 $ 15,228.00 $ 14,396.00 $ 13,677.42
Payment Terms 0%, Net 30 0%, Net 30 Net 30 0%
Delivery Days ARO 10-14 30 20 10 - 20

Comments
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3489 OF

Department of Corrections

Opening Date: 11/19/10

ﬁ Video Teleconference Equipment Globe Electronic Co. Inc Fox River Graphics Perlmutter Purchasing Power Pratt AV & Video Corp.
c
- Description QTY|UOM]| Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
Samsung 65" LED TV's
1 UN65C6500 4 EA
$ 3,390.00| $ 13,560.00|$ 3,399.00 (% 13,596.00|$ 3,269.00|$ 13,076.00|$ 3,775.00|$ 15,100.00
2 Peerless Universal Tilt 5 EA
Wallmount; ST670 $ 126.50 | $ 253.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 89.00 | $ 178.00 | $ 132.00 | $ 264.00
Coax High Resolution VGA
3 [Monitor Extension Cable 2 EA
MTX101MMHQ75 $ 2450 | $ 49.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 190.00
4 Tripplite Video Splitter Cable 5 EA
P120-001-2 $ 1790 | $ 35.80 | $ 11.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 8.50 | $ 17.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 50.00
Tripplite VGA XVGA Y Splitter
5 |Cable 2 EA
P516-001 $ 14.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 750 | $ 15.00 | $ 6.25 | $ 1250 | $ 20.00 | $ 40.00
Totals $ 13,925.80 $ 13,883.00 $ 13,343.50 $ 15,644.00
Payment Terms Net 30 0%, NA 0%, 30 Net 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 21 Estimated 30

Comments
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3489 OF

Department of Corrections

Opening Date: 11/19/10

AWARD
ﬁ Video Teleconference Equipment Siels Profe35|lcl)1rlal Sl Security Group One Inc. Sterling Computers VSA Inc.
2 .
- Description QTY|UOM]| Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
Samsung 65"
LED TV's
1 Samsung 65" LED TV's 4 EA UN65C6500
UN65C6500 VEF X ZA
$3,220.48| $ 12,881.92 |$ 4,080.00|$ 16,320.00|$ 3,375.00|$ 13,500.00|$ 3,408.00 | $ 13,632.00
2 Peerless Universal Tilt 5 EA
Wallmount; ST670 $ 85.23 | $ 170.46 | $ 127.00 | $ 254.00 | $ 103.00 | $ 206.00 | $ 94.00 | $ 188.00
Coax High Resolution VGA
3 [Monitor Extension Cable 2 EA
MTX101MMHQ75 $ 25.07 | $ 50.14 | $ 122.00 | $ 244.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 32.00 | $ 64.00
4 Tripplite Video Splitter Cable 5 EA
P120-001-2 $ 8.43 | $ 16.86 | $ 21.25 | $ 4250 | $ 11.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 22.00
Tripplite VGA XVGA Y Splitter
5 |Cable 2 EA
P516-001 $ 5.90 | $ 11.80 | $ 1445 | $ 28.90 | $ 9.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 22.00
Totals $ 13,131.18 $ 16,889.40 $ 13,876.00 $ 13,928.00
Payment Terms Net 30 N/A 0%, 30
Delivery Days ARO 7-10 14 7-14 15

Comments

Item 1 is highly allocated.
Delivery may be up to 30 days
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Buyer: Mary Lanning

3489 OF

Department of Corrections

ﬁ Video Teleconference Equipment Visions of Video WB Hunt Co, Inc.
c
- Description QTY|UOM]| Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
Samsung 65" LED TV's
1 UN65C6500 4 EA
$ 3,386.38|$% 1354552 |$% 3,231.79($ 12,927.16
2 Peerless Universal Tilt 5 EA
Wallmount; ST670 $ 9359 | $ 187.18 | $ 95.70 | $ 191.40
Coax High Resolution VGA
3 [Monitor Extension Cable 2 EA
MTX101MMHQ75 $ 45.20 | $ 90.40 | $ 28.98 | $ 57.96
4 Tripplite Video Splitter Cable 5 EA
P120-001-2 $ 11.37 | $ 22.74 | $ 10.02 | $ 20.04
Tripplite VGA XVGA Y Splitter
5 |Cable 2 EA
P516-001 $ 7971 $ 15.94 | $ 6.90 | $ 13.80
Totals $ 13,861.78 $ 13,210.36
Payment Terms Net 30 0%
Delivery Days ARO 30 14 -21

Comments
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Opening Date: 11/19/10



