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3 . Unit Ext Unit Ext
Description QTY |UOM Price Price Price Price

1 Embroidered Gree_n SS Shirt S 5 EA No Bid 3780 | $ 75 60
Bowhunter Education

2 Embroidered Gree_n SS Shirt M 3 EA No Bid 37.80 | $ 113.40
Bowhunter Education

3 Embroidered Gree_n SS Shirt L 4 EA No Bid 3780 | $ 151.20
Bowhunter Education

4 Embroidered Gree_n SS Shirt XL 5 EA No Bid 3780 | $ 189.00
Bowhunter Education

5 Embroidered Gree_n SS Shirt 2XL 5 EA No Bid 37.80 | $ 75 60
Bowhunter Education

6 Embroidered Gree_n SS Shirt 3XL 3 EA No Bid 3780 | $ 113.40
Bowhunter Education

7 Embroidered Gree_n SS Shirt 4XL 5 EA No Bid 3780 | $ 75 60
Bowhunter Education

8 Embroidered Gree_n SS Shirt 5XL 5 EA No Bid 4633 $ 92 66
Bowhunter Education

9 Embroidered Gree_n SS Shirt XLT 5 EA No Bid 3780 | $ 75 60
Bowhunter Education

10 Embroidered Gree_n SS Shirt 2XLT 5 EA No Bid 3780 | $ 75 60
Bowhunter Education

11 Embroidered Gree_n SS Shirt 3XLT 5 EA No Bid 3780 | $ 75 60
Bowhunter Education

12 Embroidered Gree_n SS Shirt 4XLT 2 EA No Bid 3780 | $ 75 60
Bowhunter Education

13 Embroidered Gree_n SS Shirt 5XLT 2 EA No Bid 4633 $ 92 66
Bowhunter Education

14 Embroidered Gree_n LS Shirt S 5 EA No Bid 39.95 | $ 79.90
Bowhunter Education

15 Embroidered Gree_n LS Shirt M 3 EA No Bid 39.95 | $ 119.85
Bowhunter Education

16 Embroidered Gree_n LS Shirt L 5 EA No Bid 39.95 | $ 19975
Bowhunter Education

17 Embroidered Gree_n LS Shirt XL 5 EA No Bid 39.95 | $ 19975
Bowhunter Education

18 Embroidered Gree_n LS Shirt 2XL 5 EA No Bid 39.95 | $ 79.90
Bowhunter Education

19 Embroidered Gree_n LS Shirt 3XL 3 EA No Bid 39.95 | $ 119.85
Bowhunter Education

20 Embroidered Gree_n LS Shirt 4XL 5 EA No Bid 39.95 | $ 79.90
Bowhunter Education

21 Embroidered Gree_n LS Shirt 5XL 5 EA No Bid 49.10 | $ 98.20
Bowhunter Education

29 Embroidered Gree_n LS Shirt XLT 5 EA No Bid 30.95 | $ 79.90
Bowhunter Education
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23 Embroidered Gree_n LS Shirt 2XLT > EA No Bid 39.95| $ 79.90
Bowhunter Education

24 Embroidered Gree_n LS Shirt 3XLT 2 EA No Bid 39.95 | $ 79.90
Bowhunter Education

o5 Embroidered Gree_n LS Shirt 4XLT 2 EA No Bid 39.95| $ 79.90
Bowhunter Education

26 Embroidered Gree_n LS Shirt 5XLT 2 EA No Bid 4910 | $ 98.20
Bowhunter Education

27 [Embroidered Tan SS Shirt S 2 |eEals 18.50 37.00 37.80 | $ 75.60
Hunter Education

2g [Embroidered Tan SS Shirt M 3 |EA|S 18.50 55.50 37.80| $  113.40
Hunter Education

29 [Embroidered Tan SS Shirt L 10 |EA| S 18.50 185.00 37.80| $  378.00
Hunter Education

30 [Embroidered Tan SS Shirt XL 10 |EA|S$ 18.50 185.00 37.80| $  378.00
Hunter Education

31 [Embroidered Tan SS Shirt 2XL 7 |eEals 21.50 150.50 37.80| $  264.60
Hunter Education

3p [Embroidered Tan SS Shirt 3XL 5 |EA|S 21.50 107.50 37.80| $  189.00
Hunter Education

33 [Embroidered Tan SS Shirt 4XL 2 |eEals 21.50 43.00 37.80 | $ 75.60
Hunter Education

34 [Embroidered Tan SS Shirt SXL 2 |Eal|s 25.50 51.00 4633 $ 92.66
Hunter Education

35 [Embroidered Tan SS Shirt XLT 2 |eEal|s 25.50 51.00 37.80 | $ 75.60
Hunter Education

36 [EMbroidered Tan SS Shirt 2XLT 2 |Eal|s 27.50 55.00 37.80 | $ 75.60
Hunter Education

37 |[Embroidered Tan SS Shirt SXLT 2 |eEals 27.50 55.00 37.80 | $ 75.60
Hunter Education

3g [Embroidered Tan SS Shirt 4XLT 2 |Eal|s 29.50 59.00 37.80 | $ 75.60
Hunter Education

39 [Embroidered Tan SS Shirt SXLT 2 |Eal|s 27.50 55.00 4633 $ 92.66
Hunter Education

40 |Embroidered Tan LS Shirt S 2 |Eals 23.90 47.80 39.95 | $ 79.90
Hunter Education

41 |Embroidered Tan LS Shirt M 3 |EA|S 23.90 71.70 3995 $  119.85
Hunter Education

42 |Embroidered Tan LS Shirt L 10 |EA|$ 23.90 239.00 3995 $  399.50
Hunter Education

43 |Embroidered Tan LS Shirt XL 13 |EA | S 23.90 310.70 3995 $ 51935
Hunter Education

44 |Embroidered Tan LS Shirt 2XL 8 |EA|S 26.50 212.00 3995 $  319.60
Hunter Education

45 |Embroidered Tan LS Shirt XL 2 |eEals 26.50 53.00 39.95 | $ 79.90
Hunter Education
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46 [Embroidered Tan LS Shirt 4XL 2 |EA|S$  2650|$  5300|%  3995|8%  79.90

Hunter Education

47 |Embroidered Tan LS Shirt 5XL 2 |Eal|s 2750 | $ 55.00 | $ 49.10 | $ 98.20
Hunter Education

4g |Embroidered Tan LS Shirt XLT 2 |Eals 2650 | $ 53.00 | $ 39.95 | $ 79.90
Hunter Education

49 |Embroidered Tan LS Shirt 2XLT 2 |Eals 2850 | $ 57.00 | $ 39.95 | $ 79.90
Hunter Education

50 [Embroidered Tan LS Shirt SXLT 2 |eEal|s 2850 | $ 57.00 | $ 39.95 | $ 79.90
Hunter Education

51 [Embroidered Tan LS Shirt AXLT 2 |eEals 3200 $ 64.00 | $ 39.95 | $ 79.90
Hunter Education

Embroidered Tan LS Shirt 5XLT

52 - 2 EA | $ 3400 $ 68.00 | $ 49.10 | $ 98.20
Hunter Education

Totals $ 653.60 | $ 2,092.22

Payment Terms 0%, O

Delivery Days ARO 30

Comments

Award Explanation:
Low bidder did not provide pricing for all items.
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