Buyer: Connie Heinrichs 3465 OF Opening Date:  10-27-10
Statewide
SECONDARY AWARLC PRIMARY AWARLC
3+ 2011 or Current Production Year Compact Extended Cab 4 Gene Steffy Sid Dillon Sid Dillon
'g Door 4X4 Pickup Truck Anderson Ford Chrysler Center Husker Auto Group Performance Dodge Chev Buick Pont Ford Lincoln Mercury
- Description QTY [ UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Compact Extended Cab 4 Door
4x4 Pickup Truck $ 18,302.00 | $ 20,022.00 | $ 18,845.00 | $ 20,454.00 | $ 20,173.00 | $ 18,773.00
Life Cycle Cost Calculation $ 30,595.33 | $ 32,315.33 | $ 28,465.8696 $ 29,793.8696
Make: Ford Dodge Chevrolet Dodge Chevrolet Ford
Model: Ranger Dakota Colorado Dakota Ext Cab Colorado Ranger
1 [GVWR: 1 EA 5,150 6,010 5,300 6,010 5,300 5,150
. . . R4F, 867A, XLT Bighorn - ND5M33  [Colorado-CT 15653-WT| ND 5M 33, Bighorn SUERICE IS sl Super Cab R4F-XLT
Series, Code, Trim Level: LT
Engine: 4.0L 3.7L V6 LLR -3.7L DOHC 5CYL 4.7L V8 3.7L 4.0L V6
EPA: 14 City - 18 Highway 14-18 17- 23 14-19 17 City - 23 Highway | 15 City - 19 Highway
Delivery time after receipt of order (#/days): 80 - 110 90-120 35-120 90 -120 40 - 90 40 - 120
E85 Compact Extended Cab
4x4 Pickup Truck N/A $ 20,022.00 N/A $ 20,454.00 N/A N/A
Engine: 4.7L V8 4.7L V-8 FFV
Make: Dodge Dodge
2 [Model: 1 EA Dakota EC Dakota Ext Cab
GVWR: 6010 6,100
Series, Code, Trim Level: ND5M33, Bighorn NS 5M33 Bighorn
EPA: 9-12 9-13
Delivery time after receipt of order (#/days): 90-120 90-120
OPTIONS BID LIST
. $399.00
Engine (other gas). N/A $ 1,400.00 LLV $ (659.00) | $ (650.00) N/A
3 3.7L V6
Specify Engine Size: 4.7L V8 2.9L DOHC 4CYL REQ'S Power Seat 2.9L 4CYL
4 |40-20-40 or 60-40 style seat w/vinyl support. N/A N/A NC N/A N/A N/A
5 |Bucket type seats - Vinyl covering. N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
6 [Bucket type seats - Cloth w/vinyl trim. N/A $ (450.00) $1255.00 NC $ 389.00 | $ 375.00
' Requires Pkg Upgrade ’ '
7 [No sliding rear-vision window (deduct). $ (104.00) | $ (125.00) | $ (109.00) | $ (125.00)| $ (98.00) ($95.00)
) i ) ) lose deep tint glass
8 [Second Power Oultlet. STD STD STD N/A STD STD
9 |Trailer towing package (deduct). N/A $ (134.00) | $ (197.00) STD $ (179.00) N/A
10 [Cargo light. STD STD $ 99.00 STD $ 95.00 N/A
11 |Electronic compass/temp display $ 300.00 STD $ 199.00 N/A $ 145.00 N/A
12 Standard Paint-Attach List and Identify as No Additional Cost STD N/C See Attached See Attached S AEEEE See Attached

Paints.
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Buyer: Connie Heinrichs 3465 OF Opening Date:  10-27-10
Statewide
$+ 2011 or Current Production Year Compact Extended Cab 4 Gene Steffy Sid Dillon Sid Dillon
_g Door 4X4 Pickup Truck Anderson Ford Chrysler Center Husker Auto Group Performance Dodge Chev Buick Pont Ford Lincoln Mercury
- Description [QTY [ uom Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
For Department of Roads Use: Yellow color of: Dodge
13 |#PY5269, Ford #84S53, Chevrolet/GMC #WA-253A code 125.00 N/A $ 239.00 N/A N/C N/C
(9OW3).
. . . . $269.00
14 |Extra Cost Paint-Attach List and Identify as Extra Cost Paints. N/A 225.00 See Attached See Attached See Attached See Attached
Snow plow attachment of pickup manufacturer's (Western
Boss E/Ieyer and Northma?] bra?lds with power ar(1gling 8-foot $4,199.00 . feE R Al 54.125.00 Boss STD
’ . ’ 3,985.00 5,270.00 Snow Dogg 7'6" No Bid $4,355.00 Boss Poly $4,355.00 Boss Poly
bolt on blade, plow head and turn lights, snow deflector, $3.930.00 S D $3.980.00 S D
15 [blade markers.) S now £ogg . now Dogg
7'6" Blade, Mount
i i i . o Blade, Mount, Controls ! :
Specify equipment included: Boss Meyer DP 7'6 Mounted and Installed Controls Mounted &
Installed
$110.00
16 [Additional remote fob from manufacturer. 110.00 150.00  $ 99.00 Extra $ 125.00 | $ 145.00
3 Inc. in Bid
. . ) . $525.00 N/A
17 |Equipment & engine service repair manual. 375.00 When Available $ 299.00 At this time $ 295.00 | $ 395.00
. . ) ) $200.00 $799.00 N/A
18 |Equipment & engine service repair manual on CD ROM. N/A When Available When Available At this time N/A N/A
. . $525.00 N/A
19 |Equipment & engine parts manual. 375.00 when Available $ 299.00 At this time N/A N/A
: ; $200. 00 $799.00 N/A
E t & rt CD ROM.
20 |Equipment & engine parts on NA When Available When Available At this time N/A N/A
21 |Two wheel drive (deduct). (1,772.00) (2,870.00) | $ (1,299.00) | $ (2,957.00) | $ (2,200.00) | $ (1,995.00)
Additional costs for warranties from manufacturer. 2,150.00 3,300.00 NC No Bid $ 2,995.00( $ 2,650.00
22 . . 6 yr 100K . 5 yr 100K GMPP 5 yr 100K
State Years:___ Miles Premium Care e 5 yr 100K PWR Train Major Guard 0-Ded Premium Care 0-Ded
) . . $399.00 $375.00 $375.00
23 |Reverse sensing system if available from factory. N/A Dealer N/A Beeler nselEs Dealer Installed
24 |Keyless remote entry lock system if not standard equipment. STD STD STD STD 145.00 | $ 145.00
25 |Bedliner install in pickup bed if not standard equipment. 275.00 250.00| $ 179.00( $ 218.00 225.00 275.00
Additional cost of charges for vehicle drop shipment outside
26 the Lincoln area. Drop shipment charges would be for 295.00 400.00| $ 400.00| $ 400.00 | $ 400.00| $ 200.00

vehicles bought by political entities and other Divisions of
Government.
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Buyer: Connie Heinrichs

3465 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:

10-27-10

Line #

2011 or Current Production Year Compact Extended Cab 4
Door 4X4 Pickup Truck

Anderson Ford

Gene Steffy
Chrysler Center

Husker Auto Group

Performance Dodge

Sid Dillon
Chev Buick Pont

Sid Dillon
Ford Lincoln Mercury

Description [ QTY] uoMm

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

LAW

ENFORCEMENT ONLY

Factory disconnect of daylight running lights.

85.00

40.00

199.00

$35.00
Dealer

$ 240.00

$ 240.00

28

Factory disconnect of factory dome light or courtesy lamps.

85.00

40.00

129.00

$35.00
Dealer

Driver Controlled

N/A

29

Courtesy/courtesy lamp: To be centered not nore than
approximately 4" to 8" from the top of the windshield to light
the driver's area and controlled by rotating headlamp switch
to maximum position or by a separate switch. This may
require adding an addional light. Dealer installation is
acceptable if not available from the factory.

200.00

STD

109.00

No Bid

$ 290.00

$ 290.00

30

Spotlight: Mounted on driver's side (left door post). Spotlight
shall be fused in accordance with manufacturers
specifications. Unity #250 (or equal) 5-inch diameter spotlight
with halogen lamp is preferred. Unity #225 (or equal) 6-inch
diameter spotlight with halogen lamp is an acceptable
substitute. All spotlights for one make and model of vehicle
must be the same size. Dealer installation is acceptable if not
available from the factory.

495.00

375.00

559.00

No Bid

$ 425.00

$ 425.00

Payment Terms

0%,30

0%,15

0%,15

0%,

0%,30

0%, 30

Delivery Days ARO

80-110

90-120

35-120

40-90

40-120

Comments
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Award Explanation:
Anderson Ford: Back seat is a jump seat not a
full seat

Husker Auto: Bid a WT work truck

Sid Dillon Ford: Not a full seat, bid a jump seat




