Buyer: Connie Heinrichs 3462 OF Opening Date: 10-27-10
Statewide
PRIMARY AWARD SECONDARY AWARD
# | 2011 or Current Production Year 1/2 Ton Regular Cab 4x4 Fremont Motors of Gene Steffy Chrysler Sid Dillon Ford Lincoln | Sid Dillon Chev Buick
,E Pickup Truck Anderson Ford Scottsbluff Center Husker Auto Group Performance Dodge Mercury Pont
- Description QTY |UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1/2 Ton Regular Cab 4x4
Pickup Truck $ 22,458.05 | $ 23,056.00 | $ 19,747.00 | $ 23,154.00 | $ 21,813.00 | $ 20,996.00
Sliding Rear Vision Window $ 399.00
Total of Tuck & Sliding Rear Vision Window $ 20,146.00
Make: Ford Ford Dodge Chevrolet Dodge Ford Chevrolet
1 [Model: 1 EA F- 150 F- 150 Reg Cab 1500 RC Silverado Ram F- 150 Silverado
GVWR: 7,200 7,200 6,600 6,800 6,600 7,200 6,800
Series, Code, Trim Level: F1E, 507A, XLT XLT DS6H61- SLT 1500- CK10903- LT 1500 'DS6H62' 'SLT Reg Cab- F1E- XLT [Reg Cab- CK10903- LT
Engine: 5.0L V8 5.0 V8 FFV 4.7L FRV L20 4.8L Vortec V8 4.7L V8 5.0L 4.8L
EPA: N/A 13-18 13C- 18H 12C- 18H N/A at this time 13city- 18highway
Delivery time after receipt of order (#/days): 80- 110 60- 120 90- 120 35-120 90- 120 40- 180 days 40- 90 days
E85 1/2 Ton Regular Cab 4x4 20,431.00 | $ 22,458.05 | $ 23,056.00 | § 19,747.00 | $ 23,154.00 | $ 2,183.00 | $ 20,996.00
Pickup Truck
L20 4.8L
Engine: 5.0L V8 5.0L V8 FFV 4.7L FRV Vortec V8 E85 4.7L V8 FFV 5.0L 4.8L
2 Make: 1 EA Ford Ford Dodge Chevrolet Dodge Ford Chevrolet
Model: F- 150 F- 150 Reg Cab 1500 RC Silverado Ram F- 150 Silverado
GVWR: 7,200 7200 6600 6800 6600 7200 6800
Series, Code, Trim Level: F1E, 507A, XLT XLT DS6H61- SLT 1500- CK10903- LT 1500 'DS6H62' 'SLT Reg Cab- F1E- XLT [Reg Cab- CK10903- LT
EPA: N/A 9to 12 13C- 18H 9C- 13H N/A at this time 13city- 18highway
Delivery time after receipt of order (#/days): 80-110 60- 120 90- 120 35- 120 90- 120 40- 180 days 40- 90 days
OPTIONS BID LIST
. $998.00
Engine (other gas). (800.00) N/A $1,350.00 LMG $1,114.00 N/A $980.00
3 5.3L V8
Specify Engine Size: 3.7L V6 5.7L Hemi V8 5.3L Vortec V8 5.7L V-8 Flex Fuel &
6 Speed Transmission
Englne_ (other diesel),including block heater, factory or N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
4 |dealer installed.
Specify Engine Size:
5 40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench seat w/lumbar N/A 0 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
support (deduct).
6 |Bucket type seats - Vinyl covering (deduct). N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
7 [Bucket type seats - Cloth w/vinyl trim. 300.00 N/A N/A N/A $ 744.00 N/A N/A
8 |Electronic compass/ temp display. 300.00 STD STD 3;‘::;;0 STD 145.00| $ 145.00
9 |No sliding rear-vision window (deduct). (120.00) $ (104.00)| $ (119.00) N/A $ (119.00)[ $ (74.00)[ $ (225.00)
10 |Second Power Outlet. STD STD STD STD $26.00 STD STD
Pickup box length of approximately 6 1/2 feet with
11 |corresponding wheelbase ($272.00) ($266.00) ($265.00) ($199.00) ($265.00) ($157.00) ($170.00)
Bidder state wheelbase: 126" 126" 120" 119" 126" 119"
) ) ($334.00) ($317.00)
12 |Trailer towing package (deduct). (300.00)| $ (311.00)| $ (481.00) (247.00) STD lose brake controller | lose brake controlier
13 [Cargo Light. STD STD STD $ 99.00 STD $ 99.00| $ 95.00
14 Standard_Pamt— Attach List and Indentify as No Additional STD see list N/C see attached see attached see attached see attached
Costs Paints.
For Department of Roads Use: Yellow Color of: Dodge
15 |#PY5269, Ford #84S53, Chevrolet/GMC #WA- 253A code 125.00 N/A 239.00 No Bid N/C N/C
(9W3).
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Buyer: Connie Heinrichs 3462 OF Opening Date: 10-27-10
Statewide
PRIMARY AWARD SECONDARY AWARD
ﬁ 2011 or Current Product_lon Year 1/2 Ton Regular Cab 4x4 Anderson Eord Fremont Motors of Gene Steffy Chrysler Husker Auto Group Performance Dodge Sid Dillon Ford Lincoln | Sid Dillon Chev Buick
2 Pickup Truck Scottsbluff Center Mercury Pont
- Description [QTY]uom Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
16 Extra Coe_;t Paint- Attach List and Identify as No Additional N/C $ 295,00 $269.00 see attached o el see attached
Costs Paints. see attached
17 |Additional remote fob from manufacturer. $ 110.00 79.00| $ 150.00| $ 99.00 $;:|Lr?coﬁ]i)fga $ 145.00| $ 125.00
On/Off road mud and snow all terrain tires and spare (can Qﬁ?fﬂ
be steel rim). Tire size must meet the minimum wheel size | $ 300.00 249.00| $ 250.00 $229 goy N/A $ 275.00| $ 275.00
bid on this specification. QXR 6ply
18 QJP= P265/
. - . LT275/ T0R17 70R-17 4ply
State size and ply rating: P235 17"BSW A/T LT 295 10-Ply QXR= LT245/ P265/ 70R17 P265/ 70R17
OWL LRC
70R-17 6ply
Load Range C
Non- standard gear ratio(s). $ 300.00 N/A $ 375.00 N/A Inc. in Bid N/A N/A
19
Indicate: 3.55 3.92 Included in Bid 3.92 w/ Anti-Spin Diff
Two wheel drive model (to include all seaseon tires) ($3,355.00)
20 (deduct). $ (2,279.00) (2,079.00) No Skid Plates (1,299.00) $ (1,822.00)| $ (1,880.00)
21 |Dealer installed integrated brake controller system. STD per spec. from N/A $ 375.00| $ 229.00 Inc. in Bid N/A N/A
factory (factory)
22 |Dealer or Factory installed rearview camera. $ 495.00 374.00| $ 1,250.00 699.00 No Bid N/A N/A
23 |Dealer or Factory installed tailgate step. $ 375.00 311.00| $ 344.00 129.00 No Bid $ 375.00 N/A
24 |Trailer sway control system if not standard. STD STD STD STD w/ Z82 STD N/A N/A
. $383.00 $300.00
25 |Factory bedliner for rear box of truck $ 200.00 374.00| $ 250.00| $ 398.00 - . $ 365.00
Spray in Dealer Drop-In Liner
: $399.00 $375.00 $375.00
26 [Reverse sensing system. $ 300.00 N/A $ 271.00 Dealer N/A Dealer Installed Dealer Installed
27 Keyless remqte locking system with two (2) fobs if not STD STD STD STD STD $ 145.00| $ 145.00
standard equipment
. . . . $525.00 .
28 |Equipment & engine service repair manual. $ 375.00 280.00 : $ 299.00 N/A at this time $ 395.00| $ 295.00
when available
29 |Equipment & engine service repair manual on CD ROM. N/A 280.00 $200'(.)O $7gg_90 N/A at this time N/A N/A
when available when available
30 |Equipment & engine parts manual. $ 375.00 280.00 $525.QO $ 299.00 N/A at this time N/A N/A
when available
31 |Equipment & engine parts on CD ROM. N/A 280.00 $200.QO $7gg_90 N/A at this time N/A N/A
when available when available
Additional costs for warranties from manufacturer. $ 2,260.00 N/A $ 3,300.00 N/C No Bid $ 2,650.00( $ 2,995.00
5 yr 100K
32 1State  YEARS MILES 6 yr 100K 7 yr 100K 5 yr 100K 5 yr 100K GMPP Major Guard
Premium Care Pwr Train Premium Care 0- Ded
Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop shipment
33 |outside the Lincoln area. Drop shipment charges would $ 295.00 350.00| $ 400.00 $ 400.00| $ 400.00| $ 400.00| $ 400.00
be for vehicles bought by political entities and other
Divisions of Government.
Payment Terms 0%, 30 0%, 15 0%, 15 0%, 0%, 30 0%, 30
Delivery Days ARO 80- 110 60- 120 90- 120 35-120 40- 180 40- 90

Comments
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