
Buyer:  Connie Heinrichs 3455 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:      10-22-10

SECONDARY 
AWARD E85 AWARD PRIMARY AWARD

Anderson Ford Fremont Motors of 
Scottsbluff

Gene Steffy 
Chrysler Center Husker Auto Group Performance 

Dodge
Sid Dillon Chev 

Buick Pont
Sid Dillon Ford 
Lincoln Mercury

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Midsize SUV, 5 Passenger 23,432.00$            24,993.05$            27,603.00$            23,391.00$            19,016.00$            23,283.00$            23,993.00$            
4x4 or AWD: 4x4 4wd 4x4 AWD 4x4 AWD 4x4
Make: Ford Ford Jeep Chevrolet Dodge Chevrolet Chevrolet
Model: Explorer Explorer 4 door Grand Cherokee Equinox Nitro 'SUV' Equinox Explorer

Series, Code, Trim Level: K8B, 100A, Base Base Laredo- WKIH74 Equinox- ILK26- 
AWD- LT KA5L74' AWD- ILK26- 1LT 100A, K8B, Base

Engine: 3.5L V6 3.5 V-6 TIVCT. 3.6L LFW 3.0L 
DOHC- V6 3.7L V-6 3.0L V6 3.5L V^

EPA: 17 city- 
23 highway 16- 22 17C- 24H 15- 21 17 city- 24 hwy 17 city- 24 hwy

Delivery time after receipt of order (#/days): 80- 110 60- 120 90- 120 35- 120 90- 120 40- 90 40- 180
E85 Midsize SUV, 5 Passenger N/A 24,993.05$            27,603.00$            23,391.00$            N/A 23,283.00$            N/A

Engine: 3.5L V-6 TIVCT. 3.6L LFW 3.0L 
DOHC- V6 3.0L V6

4x4 or AWD: 4wd 4x4 AWD AWD
Make: Ford Jeep Chevrolet Chevrolet

Model: Explorer Gr. Cherokee- 
Laredo Equinox Equinox

Series, Code, Trim Level: Base Laredo- WKIH74 Equinox- ILK26- 
AWD- LT AWD- ILK26- 1LT

EPA: 16-22 17C- 24H 17 city- 24 hwy
Delivery time after receipt of order (#/days): 60-120 90-120 35- 120 40- 90

N/A N/A 4,980.00$              998.00$                N/A (995.00)$               N/A

5.7L Hemi LAF2.4L DOHC 
4cyl 2.4L  4cyl

4 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

5 STD N/A N/A  $839.00
Drivers only  N/A  $845.00

Drivers side electric 
 $395.00

Driver side- power 

6 N/A $0.00 STD  N/A  STD  N/A  N/A 

7 110.00$                79.00$                  146.00$                 $169.00
Factory thru Dealer 

 $110.00 Extra
3 Inc. in Bid  $                145.00  $                145.00 

8 STD see attached N/C  see attached  see attached  see attached  see attached 

9 395.00$                225.00$                 N/A  see attached  see attached  see attached 

N/A N/A $650.00 
Dealer Install

 $695.00
Dealer  No Bid  N/A  N/A 

Luverne  Dee Zee 
11 STD STD STD  STD  Inc. in Bid  STD  STD 
12 (1,680.00)$            (1,840.00)$            (1,890.00)$             $              (875.00)  $            (1,637.00)  $            (1,591.00)  $            (1,195.00)

13 385.00$                N/A 880.00$                 $                799.00  N/A  $                675.00  $                675.00 

2011 or Current Production Year Midsize
Sport Utility Vehicle (5 Passenger)

Li
ne

 #

1 1 EA

2 1 EA

OPTIONS BID LIST

40-40 power bucket electric seats.

Factory Installed Console between front seats (deduct).

Additional remote fob from manufacturer.

Standard Paint-Attach List and Identify as No Additional
Cost Paints.

3
Engine (other).

Specify Engine Size:

Heavy duty split front seat W/lumbar support (deduct).

Two wheel drive model (deduct).

Protective safety cage behind driver's seat.

10

Extra Cost Paint-Attach List and Identify as Extra Cost
Paints.
Running Boards: Side step, mounted between front and
rear wheels at bottom of rocker panel; both sides. 
Factory installation if available.
If dealer installed, specify brand and model:
Second Power Outlet.
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Buyer:  Connie Heinrichs 3455 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:      10-22-10

SECONDARY 
AWARD E85 AWARD PRIMARY AWARD

Anderson Ford Fremont Motors of 
Scottsbluff

Gene Steffy 
Chrysler Center Husker Auto Group Performance 

Dodge
Sid Dillon Chev 

Buick Pont
Sid Dillon Ford 
Lincoln Mercury

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

2011 or Current Production Year Midsize
Sport Utility Vehicle (5 Passenger)

Li
ne

 #

2,260.00$              N/A 2,465.00$               N/C  No Bid  $             2,625.00  $             2,215.00 

 5 yr 100K
Premium Care 

 7 yr 100K
$100.00 Deductible 

 5 yr 100K
Pwr Train 

 5 yr 100K
GMPP Major Guard

0-Ded 

 5 yr 100K
Premium Care

0- Ded 

15 275.00$                234.00$                271.00$                 $399.00
Dealer  N/A  N/A  $                375.00 

16 STD STD STD  STD  STD  $                165.00  $                185.00 

17 295.00$                350.00$                400.00$                 $                400.00  $                400.00  $                400.00  $                400.00 

18 45.00$                  N/A 40.00$                  $199.00
Dealer 35.00$                  150.00$                190.00$                

19 45.00$                  N/A STD $149.00
Dealer No Bid N/A N/A

20 250.00$                N/A 375.00$                499.00$                No Bid 450.00$                450.00$                

21 STD STD STD STD STD STD STD
Advance Trak

0%, 30 0%, 15 0%, 15 0%, 0%, 30 0%, 30
80-110 60- 120 90- 120 35- 120 40- 90 40- 180

Comments

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

LAW ENFORCEMENT ONLY

14

Award Explanation:
Fremont Motors of Scottsbluff can not provide side moldings as required.
Husker Auto Group can not provide side moldings and class 4 hitch as required.
Sid Dillion Chev Buick Point can not provide class 4 hitch as required.

Courtesy signal or Internal light inoperable.

Spotlight: Mounted on driver's side (left door post). Spot-
light shall be fused in accordance with manufacturer's
specifications. Unity #250 (or equal) 5-inch diameter 
spotlight with halogen lamp is preferred. Unity #255 (or
equal) 6-inch diameter spotlight with halogen lamp is an 
acceptable substitute.
Stability traction control if not available from factory
standard.

Additional costs for warranties from manufacturer.

State:     YEARS: ________        MILES:  ________

Reverse sensing system if available from factory.

Keyless remote entry lock system if not standard
equipment
Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop shipment
outside the Lincoln area. Drop shipment charges would
be for vehicles bought by political entities and other
Divisions of Government.

Factory or dealer disconnect of Daylight Running Lights
(Law enforcement only).
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