Buyer: Connie Heinrichs 3438 OF Opening Date: 10-12-10
Statewide
PRIMARY AWARD SECONDARY AWARD E85 AWARD
* 2011 or Current Production year 3/4 Ton Diesel Py - Fremont Motors Gene Steffy Husker Auto performance Dodge Sid Dillon Chev Sid Dillon Ford
g Regular Cab 4x4 Pickup (Base Truck) of Scottsbluff Chrysler Center Group 9 Buick Pont Lincoln Merc
- Description QTY | UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
$ 26,760.00 | $ 28,591.80 | $ 30,485.00 | $ 27,315.00 | $ 29,364.00 | $ 27,863.00 | $ 26,513.00
3/ TB(? : SEISiscelluF:)e‘?ruLngr( cab $899.QO electric $850.QO electric
mirrors mirrors
$28,214.00 $27,363.00
1 Make: 1 EA Ford Ford Dodge Chevrolet Dodge Chevrolet Ford
Model: F-250 F250 Reg Cab 2500 ST Silverado Ram Silverado F-250
GVWR: 10,000 10,000 8,650 9,900 |b 8,650 9,900 10,000
Series, Code, Trim Level: F2B,600A,XL XL ST-DJ2L62 2500-CK20903-1WT 2500 'DJ7L62' 'ST' 2500HD-CK20903-WT Reg Cab-F2B-XL
Engine: 6.7L Diesel 6.7 V-8 Diesel 6.7L Cummins Diesel LML 6.6L Duramax 6.7L 16 Turbo Diesel 6.6L Duramax 6.7L_Power Stroke
EPA: N/A N/A N/A N/A @ this time N/A N/A N/A
Delivery time after receipt of order (#/days): 80-110 90 90-120 35/120 90-120 40-90 40-120
$ 23,630.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A $ 20,330.00
E85 3/4 Ton Regular Cab 7
Base Pickup Truck $850'90 sy
mirrors
$21,180.00
P Engine: 1 EA 6.2L SOHC V8 E85 6.2L Flex Fuel
Make: Ford Ford
Model: F-250 F-250
GVWR: 9,400 9,400
Series, Code, Trim Level: F2B,600A,XL Reg Cab-F2B-XL
EPA: N/A N/A
Delivery time after receipt of order (#/days): 80-110 40-120
OPTIONS BID LIST
3 Engine (other gas). $ (3,130.00)[ $ (6,503.00) $ 5,822.00 ($5,995.00) L96 $ (6,817.00)[ $ (6,200.00)[ $ (5,800.00)
Specify Engine Size: 6.2L V8 SOHC E85 6.2L V-8 5.7L Hemi V8 6.0L Vortec V8 Gas 5.7 L V-8 Hemi 6.0L 6.2L
Engine (other gas). N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
4 - - -
Specify Engine Size:
Engine (other diesel), including block heater, $77.00
factory or dealer installed. i NIA i W/Gas Engine N/A Mg
(including block
5 Model: Ford heater)
Inc. in Bid
Warranty: 5yrs or 100,000 miles
Specify Engine Size: 6.7L V-8
See #9 & #10
6 |Bench seat heavy duty w/cloth covering. $ 195.00 | $ 83.00 N/A No Lumbar N/A 40/20/40-Pop. N/A N/A
Equip. Pkg.
7 [#0-20-40 or 60-40 Bench Seat W/lumbar STD $ 295.00 |  N/A No Lumbar In Bid N/A $ 195.00 | $ 183.00
support wivinyl.
8 ‘c‘g\'/ze?i:‘g or 60-40 Bench seat w/lumbar support wicloth | ¢ 395.00 | $ 83.00|  N/ANo Lumbar N/C N/A $ 195.00 | $ 183.00
) ) $706.00 $899.00 $985.00 includes $850.00 includes
9 |Electic Power Windows. $ 995.00 ) $ 545.00 Requires Option Power Locks & Power Locks,
Part of Power Group $638.00 ) B
5B5 (SEQ) . Power Mirrors Power Mirrors
Popular Equip. -
; $706.00 Pkg. $445.00 $850.00 |_nc|udes
10 |Power door Locks. inc. #9 - N/C $ 545.00 | $ 399.00 . Power Windows,
Part of Power Group includes keyless .
Power Mirrors
11 |Automatic Speed (cruise) control, factory installed. $ 388.00 [ $ 195.00 Incl'd $ 249.00 $32.|1_g'c\j\2D\?gsGeTs $ 275.00 | $ 295.00
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Statewide

1+ 2011 or Current Production year 3/4 Ton Diesel Anderson Ford Fremont Motors Gene Steffy Husker Auto performance Dodge Sid Dillon Chev Sid Dillon Ford

g Regular Cab 4x4 Pickup (Base Truck) of Scottsbluff Chrysler Center Group 9 Buick Pont Lincoln Merc

- Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Snow plow attachment of pickup manufacturer's
(Western, Boss and Meyer brands with power angling, $4,595.00 . $4,485.00 $4,485.00

12 8-foot bolt on blade, plow head and turn lights, snow $ SOERLY 6,650.00| 3.985.00 or Snow Dogg Ex No Bid (Boss) (Boss)
deflector, blade markers).

13 [Sliding rear-vision window. 225.00 [ $ 105.00 140.00 $398.00 Dealer $ 119.00 375.00 275.00
Chassis with eight oot Utility Body for single $ 6,615.00 N/A 6,415.00 | $ 6,495.00 No Bid $ 6,230.00 | $ 6,230.00
wheel. See attachment.

14

. Omaha Standard 96V Omaha Std 96V Omaha Standard 96V | Omaha Standard 96V
State make and model: or Knapheide 696J Palfleet - 96V or Knaphiede or Knapheide 696J or Knapheide 696J
15 |Color of Utility Body to match manufacturer color charts. N/C N/A Incl'd $ 699.00 No Bid $596'OO. $596'00.
call for details call for details

16 |No lid on Utility Body (deduct). $ (650.00) N/A $ (735.00)| $ (499.00) No Bid $ (600.00)| $ (600.00)

17 [Glow plug package (diesel engine). STD STD N/A $ 599.00 STD N/A N/A

18 [Second Power Outlet. STD N/C N/A Std STD STD STD
Pickup box length of approximately 6 1/2 feet with N/A

19 [corresponding wheelbase (deduct). hI NIA NIA e 8' Box Bid NIA N/A
Bidder state wheelbase: 56CA 137

20 [Cargo light. $ 350.00 STD STD $ 99.00 STD $ 95.00 | $ 95.00

21 Standar_d_ Pa'm'AttaCh.L'St and Identify as STD See Attached N/C See attached See Attached see attached see attached
No Additional Cost Paints.

For Department of Roads Use: Yellow color of:

22 |Dodge #PY5269, Ford #84S53, Chevrolet/GMC N/C 0 $ 450.00 | $ 239.00 See Attached N/C N/C
#WA-253A code (9W3).

23 Extra Cost Pa!m—Attach Listand Identify as N/A $225.00 - $450.00 P00 See Attached see attached see attached
Extra Cost Paints. See attached

24 Zj";‘(’jl‘:‘g:;’e' drive model (to include all season tires) $ (1,501.00) $ (2,678.00)| $ (2,860.00) | $ (1,299.00)| $ (2,243.00)| $ (1,995.00) | $ (2,250.00)

$706.00 $899.00 $985.00 includes $850.00 includes

25 |Power remote controlled mirrors. incl. #9 - N/C Part of Powér Grou $ 180.00 Requires Option Inc. in Bid Power Windows & Power Windows &

P 5B5 (SEQ) Power Locks Power Locks
Two 12V batteries which deliver a total of at least ,

26 1000 CCA (Diesel). STD Incl'd Std STD Incl Incl

$706.00 $625.00 $445.00 includes gg?v?e? \(/)Vli:(c:jlct)l\?vzs

27 |Keyless remote entry system. incl. #9 - N/C ' $ 545.00 [ $ 399.00 [(Pkg. Inc. Power Wind., ) ’

Part of Power Group . Power Locks Power Locks, Power
Locks, Mirrors) A
Mirrors

28 |Electronic compass/temperature display system. N/A N/A N/A $399.00 Dealer N/A N/A N/A

29 [Dealer or Factory installed rearview camera. N/A $ 390.00 N/A $ 629.00 N/A N/A $ 490.00

30 [Dealer or Factory installed tailgate step. $ 424.00 [ $ 31100 $ 344.00 [ $ 119.00 No Bid N/A $ 375.00

31 |Equipment & engine service repair manual. $ 420.00 [ $ 260.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 299.00 N/A at this time $ 295.00 [ $ 395.00

32 |Equipment & engine service repair manual on CD ROM. N/A $ 260.00 | $ 200.00 $799'90 N/A at this time N/A N/A

when available
33 [Equipment & engine parts manual. N/A $ 260.00 [ $ 300.00 [ $ 299.00 N/A at this time N/A N/A
34 |Equipment & engine parts on CD ROM. N/A N/A $ 200.00 $799'QO N/A at this time N/A N/A
when available
Additional costs for warranties from manufacturer. $795.00 - $2,780.00 N/A $ 2,270.00 N/C No Bid $ 2,995.00 | $ 2,615.00
35 4yr-7yr Zr 5yr 5yr 5yr
State YEARS 75K - 100K 100 Oogmiles 100,000 100,000 100,000
see attached chart ' Pwr Train GMPP Major Guard Premium Care
Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop shipment
36 [Outside the Lincoln area. Drop shipment charges would | ¢ 295.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 400.00

be for vehicles bought by political entities and other

Divisions of Government.
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1+ 2011 or Current Production year 3/4 Ton Diesel Anderson Ford Fremont Motors Gene Steffy Husker Auto performance Dodge Sid Dillon Chev Sid Dillon Ford
g Regular Cab 4x4 Pickup (Base Truck) of Scottsbluff Chrysler Center Group 9 Buick Pont Lincoln Merc
- Description [ QTYJuom Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
LAW ENFORCEMENT ONLY
Factory or dealer disconnect of daylight running lights
37|, . 65.00 N/A 40.00 $199.00 Dealer 35.00 195.00 | $ 195.00
if factory equipped (Law enforcement only).
38 |Disconnect of factory dome light or courtesy lamps. 65.00 N/A 50.00 $129.00 Dealer 35.00 N/A N/A
Dome Light or Courtesy Lamp: To be centered not more
than approximately 4" to 8" from the top of the wind-
shield to light the driver's area. Controlled by rotating $109.00
39 |headlamp switch to maximum position or by a separate 125.00 N/A $ 75.00 ) 285.00 | $ 285.00
: : ) ; - : Dealer
switch. This may require adding an additional light.
Dealer installation is acceptable if not available from
the factory.
$79.00
20 Heaviest duty alternator available. 75.00 N/A $ 85.00 Requires L96 N/A N/A N/A
6.0L Gas
Indicate Amps: 180 amps 160 amp 160 amp STD
41 |Reverse sensing alarm system. Dealer installation is 295.00 NIA $ 271.00|  $399.00 Dealer N/A 295.00 | $ 245.00
acceptable if not available from the manufacturer.
Alternating headlight flasher wig-wag module with flasher
42 ovgrride for optional override at night} ins_tallgd with acti- 395.00 N/A N/A $199.00 N/A 195.00 | $ 195.00
vation lead tagged as such and terminating in or near from Dodge Dealer
the passenger compartment.
100 WATT siren speaker installed behind front grill with $329.00
43 |leads tagged as such that terminate in or near the pas- 320.00 N/A $ 297.00 Deal;er N/A 347.00 [ $ 347.00
senger compartment.
a4 ProTGard X Push bumper with installation on front of 515.00 N/A $5_42.00 $569.00 N/A 590.00 | $ 590.00
vehicle. setinaPB Dealer
Roof mounted antenna. Located ten (10) inches forward
from the rear of cab by twelve (12) inches left from roof $149.00
45 center line. NMO mount with RG58 cable ran into rear 91.00 NIA $ 65.00 Dealer NIA 13000 ( $ 130.00
seating area.
Roof mounted blue tree antenna. Centered on roof ten
(10) inches forward from the rear of cab. Cables ran into
center console area. Make: Antennaplus. Model: AP85 $229.00
46 |/18GPS-QS22. Tri-Mode Cellular/PCS/GPS Black 149.00 N/A $ 198.00 Deal;ar N/A 248.00 [ $ 248.00
Antenna. 824-896 MHz, 1885-1990 MHz. 1575 MHz.
Connectors SMA on Cell/PCS & SMA on GPS. Foam
Pad & Threaded Bolt. Web site www.antennaplus.com
47 |No rear seat (deduct). N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
add $99.00
48 |No center console (deduct). N/A N/A N/A Exposed Floor N/A N/A N/A
Untrimmed
Payment Terms 0%, 30 0%, 15 0%, 15 0 0%, 30 0%, 30
Delivery Days ARO 80-110 90 90-120 35/120 40-90 40-120
Comments
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