
Buyer:  Suzanne Siemer 3419 OF Rebid
Department of Roads
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PARTIAL
AWARD

PARTIAL
AWARD

PARTIAL
AWARD

PARTIAL
AWARD

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 Meltdown Apex Dist-1 66,667 GL  $                     1.09  No Bid 
2 Meltdown Apex Dist-2 6,500 GL  $                     1.09  No Bid 
3 Meltdown Apex Dist-3 37,125 GL  $                     1.09  No Bid 
4 Meltdown Apex Dist-4 25,417 GL  $                     1.09  No Bid 
5 Meltdown Apex Dist-5 45,000 GL  $                     1.09  No Bid 
6 Meltdown Apex Dist-6 13,958 GL  $                     1.09  No Bid 
7 Meltdown Apex Dist-7 5,750 GL  $                     1.09  No Bid 
8 Meltdown Apex Dist-8 3,000 GL  $                     1.09  No Bid 
9 Caliber M 1000 Dist-1 66,667 GL  $                     1.10  No Bid 

10 Caliber M 1000 Dist-2 6,500 GL  $                     1.10  No Bid 
11 Caliber M 1000 Dist-3 37,125 GL  $                     1.10  No Bid 
12 Caliber M 1000 Dist-4 25,417 GL  $                     1.10  No Bid 
13 Caliber M 1000 Dist-5 45,000 GL  $                     1.10  No Bid 
14 Caliber M 1000 Dist-6 13,958 GL  $                     1.23  No Bid 
15 Caliber M 1000 Dist-7 5,750 GL  $                     1.15  No Bid 
16 Caliber M 1000 Dist-8 3,000 GL  $                     1.12  No Bid 
17 Caliber M 2000 Dist-1 66,667 GL  $                     1.25  No Bid 
18 Caliber M 2000 Dist-2 6,500 GL  $                     1.25  No Bid 
19 Caliber M 2000 Dist-3 37,125 GL  $                     1.25  No Bid 
20 Caliber M 2000 Dist-4 25,417 GL  $                     1.25  No Bid 
21 Caliber M 2000 Dist-5 45,000 GL  $                     1.25  No Bid 
22 Caliber M 2000 Dist-6 13,958 GL  $                     1.37  No Bid 
23 Caliber M 2000 Dist-7 5,750 GL  $                     1.29  No Bid 
24 Caliber M 2000 Dist-8 3,000 GL  $                     1.27  No Bid 
25 Ice Ban M 10 Dist-1 66,667 GL  $                   0.927  No Bid 
26 Ice Ban M 10 Dist-2 6,500 GL  $                   0.950  No Bid 
27 Ice Ban M 10 Dist-3 37,125 GL  $                     1.01  No Bid 
28 Ice Ban M 10 Dist-4 25,417 GL  $                     1.00  No Bid 
29 Ice Ban M 10 Dist-5 45,000 GL  $                     1.02  No Bid 
30 Ice Ban M 10 Dist-6 13,958 GL  $                     1.07  No Bid 
31 Ice Ban M 10 Dist-7 5,750 GL  $                     1.02  No Bid 
32 Ice Ban M 10 Dist-8 3,000 GL  $                   1.046  No Bid 
33 Ice Ban M 20 Dist-1 66,667 GL  $                   0.981  No Bid 
34 Ice Ban M 20 Dist-2 6,500 GL  $                     1.00  No Bid 
35 Ice Ban M 20 Dist-3 37,125 GL  $                     1.13  No Bid 
36 Ice Ban M 20 Dist-4 25,417 GL  $                     1.06  No Bid 
37 Ice Ban M 20 Dist-5 45,000 GL  $                     1.22  No Bid 
38 Ice Ban M 20 Dist-6 13,958 GL  $                     1.17  No Bid 
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39 Ice Ban M 20 Dist-7 5,750 GL  $                     1.13  No Bid 
40 Ice Ban M 20 Dist-8 3,000 GL  $                     1.19  No Bid 
41 Geomelt M 10 Dist-1 66,667 GL  No Bid 
42 Geomelt M 10 Dist-2 6,500 GL  No Bid 
43 Geomelt M 10 Dist-3 37,125 GL  No Bid 
44 Geomelt M 10 Dist-4 25,417 GL  No Bid 
45 Geomelt M 10 Dist-5 45,000 GL  No Bid 
46 Geomelt M 10 Dist-6 13,958 GL  No Bid 
47 Geomelt M 10 Dist-7 5,750 GL  No Bid 
48 Geomelt M 10 Dist-8 3,000 GL  No Bid 
49 Geomelt M 20 Dist-1 66,667 GL  No Bid 
50 Geomelt M 20 Dist-2 6,500 GL  No Bid 
51 Geomelt M 20 Dist-3 37,125 GL  No Bid 
52 Geomelt M 20 Dist-4 25,417 GL  No Bid 
53 Geomelt M 20 Dist-5 45,000 GL  No Bid 
54 Geomelt M 20 Dist-6 13,958 GL  No Bid 
55 Geomelt M 20 Dist-7 5,750 GL  No Bid 
56 Geomelt M 20 Dist-8 3,000 GL  No Bid 
57 Geomelt 55 Dist-1 66,667 GL  $                     0.97 
58 Geomelt 55 Dist-2 6,500 GL  $                     0.88 
59 Geomelt 55 Dist-3 37,125 GL  $                     0.82 
60 Geomelt 55 Dist-4 25,417 GL  $                     0.98 
61 Geomelt 55 Dist-5 45,000 GL  $                     0.70 
62 Geomelt 55 Dist-6 13,958 GL  $                     0.97 
63 Geomelt 55 Dist-7 5,750 GL  $                     1.03 
64 Geomelt 55 Dist-8 3,000 GL  $                     1.06 
65 Fusion 55 Dist-1 66,667 GL  $                    1.95  No Bid 
66 Fusion 55 Dist-2 6,500 GL  $                    1.70  No Bid 
67 Fusion 55 Dist-3 37,125 GL  $                    1.95  No Bid 
68 Fusion 55 Dist-4 25,417 GL  No bid at this time  No Bid 
69 Fusion 55 Dist-5 45,000 GL  No bid at this time  No Bid 
70 Fusion 55 Dist-6 13,958 GL  No bid at this time  No Bid 
71 Fusion 55 Dist-7 5,750 GL No bid at this time No Bid 
72 Fusion 55 Dist-8 3,000 GL  No Bid 
73 Ice Bite 55 Dist-1 66,667 GL  $                   1.220  No Bid 
74 Ice Bite 55 Dist-2 6,500 GL  $                   1.220  No Bid 
75 Ice Bite 55 Dist-3 37,125 GL  $                   1.220  No Bid 
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76 Ice Bite 55 Dist-4 25,417 GL  $                   1.220  No Bid 
77 Ice Bite 55 Dist-5 45,000 GL  $                   0.689  No Bid 
78 Ice Bite 55 Dist-6 13,958 GL  $                     1.22  No Bid 
79 Ice Bite 55 Dist-7 5,750 GL  $                     1.22  No Bid 
80 Ice Bite 55 Dist-8 3,000 GL  $                     1.22  No Bid 
81 Freezgard Zero Dist-1 66,667 GL  $                   0.856  No Bid 
82 Freezgard Zero Dist-2 6,500 GL  $                   0.880  No Bid 
83 Freezgard Zero Dist-3 37,125 GL  $                   0.993  No Bid 
84 Freezgard Zero Dist-4 25,417 GL  $                   0.938  No Bid 
85 Freezgard Zero Dist-5 45,000 GL  $                     1.06  No Bid 
86 Freezgard Zero Dist-6 13,958 GL  $                   0.998  No Bid 
87 Freezgard Zero Dist-7 5,750 GL  $                   0.993  No Bid 
88 Freezgard Zero Dist-8 3,000 GL  $                     1.02  No Bid 
89 Freezgard Zero CI + Dist-1 66,667 GL  $                   0.935  No Bid 
90 Freezgard Zero CI + Dist-2 6,500 GL  $                   0.960  No Bid 
91 Freezgard Zero CI + Dist-3 37,125 GL 1.05$                      No Bid 
92 Freezgard Zero CI + Dist-4 25,417 GL 1.02$                      No Bid 
93 Freezgard Zero CI + Dist-5 45,000 GL 1.19$                      No Bid 
94 Freezgard Zero CI + Dist-6 13,958 GL 1.06$                      No Bid 
95 Freezgard Zero CI + Dist-7 5,750 GL 1.055$                    No Bid 
96 Freezgard Zero CI + Dist-8 3,000 GL 1.06$                      No Bid 

Delivery Days ARO 53-7
0%, 30

Comments

Payment Terms 0%, N/A 0%, 0
10

Net, 30
100

AWARD EXPLANATION:
Ossian, Inc. did not meet the specifications and did not provide the appropriate documentation for lines 
65 through 72.
Scotwood Industries, Inc. did not meet the specification for zinc on 10.0 ppm on lines 25 through 32 and 
also did not meet the specification rate for Freezgard Zero on lines 81-88.

Lines 41 though 56 will not be awarded.
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