
Buyer:  Michelle Kemper 3417 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:  09-17-10

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

7-10 19.17 7-10 19.2 7-10 19.12 7-10 9.6 LBS 10 10

500 Flat 1000 Flat 50/20 Roll 500 Flat
1000

(100 CS min.
order)

Flat
1000

(100 CS min. 
order)

Flat

1 7-10 GAL LLD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  24x24  .50 MIL 24 CS  $   20.44  $          490.56  $   28.12  $       674.88  $   30.04  $         720.96  $   27.40  $         657.60  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
2 7-10 GAL LLD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  24x24  .50 MIL 50 CS  $   18.44  $          922.00  $   27.19  $    1,359.50  $   30.04  $      1,502.00  $   26.40  $      1,320.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
3 7-10 GAL LLD Liner Clear 50+CS  24x24  .50 MIL 60 CS  $   17.44  $       1,046.40  $   25.90  $    1,554.00  $   30.04  $      1,802.40  $   27.10  $      1,626.00  $          22.77  $      1,366.20  $          22.77  $    1,366.20 
4 7-10 GAL LLD Liner BLK 1-24 CS  24x24  .50 MIL 24 CS  $   20.44  $          490.56  $   22.40  $       537.60  $   29.87  $         716.88  $   28.00  $         672.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
5 7-10 GAL LLD Liner BLK 25-49 CS  24x24  .50 MIL 60 CS  $   19.44  $       1,166.40  $   23.67  $    1,420.20  $   29.87  $      1,792.20  $   26.99  $      1,619.40  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
6 7-10 GAL LLD Liner BLK 50-99 CS  24x24  .50 MIL 60 CS  $   18.44  $       1,106.40  $   23.04  $    1,382.40  $   29.87  $      1,792.20  $   27.40  $      1,644.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
7 7-10 GAL LLD Liner BLK 100+CS  24x24  .50 MIL 350 CS  $   17.44  $       6,104.00  $   21.40  $    7,490.00  $   29.87  $    10,454.50  $   22.20  $      7,770.00  $          22.77  $      7,969.50  $          22.77  $    7,969.50 

12-16 19.00 12-16 26.4 7-10 21.04 12-16 52 LBS 16 26.4 16 26.4

250 250

Calico 9940286 (Clear)
9940214 (Black)

24x24  0.5 mil

24x33 24x33  2.0 Mil 24x33  2.0 MilDimensions and thickness: 24x33  2 MIL 24x33  2.0 mil 24"x33"  2.0 MIL

Weight Load: (lbs)

Waverly CLR243320KAll American Poly 
2433AAPLD

30/10%
15

95%
30

SR24332B Jadcore SR24332B Jadcore

40 40

SR24245C Pitt SR2424SC Pitt

0 0

24x24  .50 Mil 24x24  .50 Mil

Egan Supply Co Egan Supply Co
(Alternate Bid)

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

12-16 GALLON, 24"x33", 2.0 MIL., LINEAR LOW DENSITY -
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Black 1-24

Calico 9910900SP

Dimensions and thickness: 24x24   .50 MIL

Brand and Item #:

Waverly CLR242405C

N/ARecycled & Post Consumer Content:

7-10 GALLON, 24"x24", .50 MIL., LINEAR LOW DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 25-49 & Black 100+

24x24 - .50 MIL24"x24"  .50 MIL

Central Poly Corporation

Central Poly-#CP24LD

Recycled 10%-P.C. 10%
10-20

Central Poly-#CP2433LD

Li
ne

 # All American Poly Calico Industries Inc

19.17

All American Poly 
2424AAPLD

Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Description Cash-Wa Distributing Inc

AWARD
See Explanation

200 Flat 250 Flat 25/8 Roll 500 Flat
250

(76 CS min.
order)

Flat
250

(76 CS min. 
order)

Flat

8 12-16 GAL LLD Liner BLK 1-24 CS  24x33  2.0 MIL 50 CS  $   18.56  $          928.00  $   21.10  $    1,055.00  $   32.87  $      1,643.50  $   41.60  $      2,080.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
9 12-16 GAL LLD Liner BLK 25-49 CS  24x33  2.0 MIL 49 CS  $   17.56  $          860.44  $   20.84  $    1,021.16  $   32.87  $      1,610.63  $   38.00  $      1,862.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
10 12-16 GAL LLD Liner BLK 50-99 CS  24x33  2.0 MIL 99 CS  $   16.56  $       1,639.44  $   20.40  $    2,019.60  $   32.87  $      3,254.13  $   36.10  $      3,573.90  $          19.82  $      1,962.18  $          19.82  $    1,962.18 
11 12-16 GAL LLD Liner BLK 100+CS  24x33  2.0 MIL 105 CS  $   15.56  $       1,633.80  $   19.94  $    2,093.70  $   32.87  $      3,451.35  $   33.10  $      3,475.50  $          19.61  $      2,059.05  $          19.61  $    2,059.05 

20-30 19.95 20-30 37 20-30 14.74 20-30 37 LBS 30 14.8 30 14.8

150 Flat 250 Flat 10/10 Roll 250 Flat
100

(136 CS min.
order)

Flat
100

(136 CS min. 
order)

Flat

12 20-30 GAL LLD Liner BLK 1-24 CS  30x37  2.0 MIL 24 CS  $   16.16  $          387.84  $   28.00  $       672.00  $   22.54  $         540.96  $   29.20  $         700.80  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
13 20-30 GAL LLD Liner BLK 25-49 CS  30x37  2.0 MIL 49 CS  $   15.16  $          742.84  $   27.13  $    1,329.37  $   22.54  $      1,104.46  $   26.10  $      1,278.90  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
14 20-30 GAL LLD Liner BLK 50-99 CS  30x37  2.0 MIL  275 CS  $   14.16  $       3,894.00  $   26.40  $    7,260.00  $   22.54  $      6,198.50  $   25.80  $      7,095.00  $          11.11  $      3,055.25  $          11.11  $    3,055.25 
15 20-30 GAL LLD Liner BLK 100+CS  30x37  2.0 MIL 110 CS  $   13.16  $       1,447.60  $   24.44  $    2,688.40  $   22.54  $      2,479.40  $   23.90  $      2,629.00  $          10.99  $      1,208.90  $          10.99  $    1,208.90 

30x37  2 MIL

Unknown Unknown

SR30372B Jadcore SR30372B Jadcore

100% 100%

30x37  2.0 Mil 30x37  2.0 Mil

Unknown Unknown
100% 100%

20-30
30/10%

45
N/A95%

19.95 100
Recycled & Post Consumer Content:
Weight Load: (lbs)

Dimensions and thickness:
Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

All American Poly 
3037AAPLD

30x37  2.0 mil 30"x37"  2.0 MIL

Calico 9910226SP Waverly CLR303720K Central Poly-#CP3037LD

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

30x37-2.0 MIL

Brand and Item #:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:
45

95% N/A

20-30 GALLON, 30"x37", 2.0 MIL., LINEAR LOW DENSITY -
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Black 50-99

19.00Weight Load: (lbs)
30/10% Recycled 10%-P.C. 10%

10-20

Recycled 10%-P.C. 10%
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Buyer:  Michelle Kemper 3417 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:  09-17-10

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

Egan Supply Co Egan Supply Co
(Alternate Bid)Central Poly Corporation

Li
ne

 # All American Poly Calico Industries IncDescription Cash-Wa Distributing Inc

33 16.70 33 27.9 33 11.11 33 gal 27.80 LBS 33 11.2 33 11.2

150 Flat 250 Flat 10/10 Roll 250 Flat

100
(179 CS Min. 
order for clear 

& black)

Flat
100

(179 CS Min. 
order for clear 

& black)

Flat

16 33 GAL LLD Liner White 1-24 CS  33x39  1.3 MIL 24 CS  $   17.39  $          417.36 27.44$     $       658.56 $ NO BID  $ NO BID 16.20$     $         388.80  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
17 33 GAL LLD Liner White 25-49 CS  33x39  1.3 MIL 70 CS  $   16.39  $       1,147.30 26.47$     $    1,852.90 $ NO BID  $ NO BID 14.30$     $      1,001.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
18 33 GAL LLD Liner White 50-99 CS  33x39  1.3 MIL 120 CS  $   15.39  $       1,846.80 26.10$     $    3,132.00 $ NO BID  $ NO BID 14.20$     $      1,704.00 11.80$           $      1,416.00 11.80$           $    1,416.00 
19 33 GAL LLD Liner White 100+CS  33x39  1.3 MIL 100 CS  $   14.39  $       1,439.00 25.35$     $    2,535.00 $ NO BID  $ NO BID 14.00$     $      1,400.00 11.67$           $      1,167.00 11.67$           $    1,167.00 
20 33 GAL LLD Liner Black 1-24 CS  33x39  1.3 MIL 24 CS  $   14.01  $          336.24 22.57$     $       541.68 16.98$     $         407.52 24.10$     $         578.40  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
21 33 GAL LLD Liner Black 25-49 CS  33x39  1.3 MIL 49 CS  $   13.01  $          637.49 21.86$     $    1,071.14 16.98$     $         832.02 23.90$     $      1,171.10  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
22 33 GAL LLD Liner Black 50-99 CS  33x39  1.3 MIL 99 CS  $   12.01  $       1,188.99 20.87$     $    2,066.13 16.98$     $      1,681.02 21.40$     $      2,118.60  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
23 33 GAL LLD Liner Black 100+CS  33x39  1.3 MIL 110 CS  $   11.01  $       1,211.10 18.24$     $    2,006.40 16.98$     $      1,867.80 19.10$     $      2,101.00  $            8.31  $         914.10  $            8.31  $       914.10 

95%
16.70

All American Poly 
3339AAPLD

All American Poly
4048AAPLD

Calico 9910461SP 
(Clear)

9910718 (Black)

33x39  1.3 MIL

Waverly CLR404820K
(Black  50-99)

SR40482C, SR4048B
 Jadcore

33x39  1.3 mil 33"x39"  1.3 MIL 33x39-1.3 MIL 33x39  1.3 Mil

Central Poly-#CP4048LD SR40482C, SR4048B
Jadcore

33x39  1.3 Mil

SR333913W, SR333913B
Jadcore

SR333913W, SR333913B
Jadcore

Unknown Unknown
100% 100%

40-45 GALLON, 40"x48", 2.0 MIL., LINEAR LOW DENSITY -
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 100+ & Black 50-99

Brand and Item #:

70

Central Poly-#CP3339LD

Recycled 10%-P.C. 10%
40

30/10%

Calico 33395W (White)
9910749 (Black)

Waverly CLR333913K
(Black  1-24)

N/A
Weight Load: (lbs)

33 GALLON, 33"x39", 1.3 MIL., LINEAR LOW DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: White 50-99 & Black 1-24

40

Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:

Dimensions and thickness:

40-45 17.25 40-45 32 40-45 25.5 40-45 25.60 LBS 45 25.6 45 25.6

75 Flat 125 Flat 10/10 Roll 100 Flat

100
(79 CS Min. 

order for clear 
& black)

Flat

100
(79 CS Min. 

order for clear 
& black)

Flat

24 40-45 GAL LLD Liner CLR 1-24 CS  40x48  2.0 MIL 24 CS  $   17.83  $          427.92 29.75$     $       714.00 $ NO BID  $ NO BID 30.10$     $         722.40  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
25 40-45 GAL LLD Liner CLR 25-49 CS  40x48  2.0 MIL 49 CS  $   16.83  $          824.67 28.99$     $    1,420.51 $ NO BID  $ NO BID 23.80$     $      1,166.20  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
26 40-45 GAL LLD Liner CLR 50-99 CS 40x48  2.0 MIL 99 CS  $   15.83  $       1,567.17 27.14$     $    2,686.86 $ NO BID  $ NO BID 22.60$     $      2,237.40 24.95$           $      2,470.05 24.95$           $    2,470.05 
27 40-45 GAL LLD Liner CLR 100+CS  40x48  2.0 MIL 1,200 CS  $   14.83  $     17,796.00 24.54$     $  29,448.00 $ NO BID  $ NO BID 20.60$     $    24,720.00 24.68$           $    29,616.00 24.68$           $  29,616.00 
28 40-45 GAL LLD Liner BLK 1-24 CS  40x48  2.0 MIL 24 CS  $   14.37  $          344.88 25.09$     $       602.16 38.99$     $         935.76 27.20$     $         652.80  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
29 40-45 GAL LLD Liner BLK 25-49 CS  40x48  2.0 MIL 49 CS  $   13.37  $          655.13 24.12$     $    1,181.88 38.99$     $      1,910.51 24.20$     $      1,185.80  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
30 40-45 GAL LLD Liner BLK 50-99 CS  40x48  2.0 MIL 175 CS  $   12.37  $       2,164.75 23.40$     $    4,095.00 38.99$     $      6,823.25 21.60$     $      3,780.00 19.20$           $      3,360.00 19.20$           $    3,360.00 
31 40-45 GAL LLD Liner BLK 100+CS  40x48  2.0 MIL 105 CS  $   11.37  $       1,193.85 21.64$     $    2,272.20 38.99$     $      4,093.95 19.10$     $      2,005.50 19.00$           $      1,995.00 19.00$           $    1,995.00 

9910718 (Black)

40x48  2.0 mil

( )

40"x48"  2.0 MIL40x48  2 MIL 40x48  2 MilDimensions and thickness: 40x48-2.0 MIL 40x48  2 Mil

100% 100%
Unknown Unknown

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:
Weight Load: (lbs)

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

17.25 40
95% 30/10%

55
N/A Recycled 10%-P.C. 10%

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)
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Buyer:  Michelle Kemper 3417 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:  09-17-10

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

Egan Supply Co Egan Supply Co
(Alternate Bid)Central Poly Corporation

Li
ne

 # All American Poly Calico Industries IncDescription Cash-Wa Distributing Inc

55 19.45 55 20.9 55 20.80 55 44.08 LBS 55 20.9 55 20.9

50 Flat 50 Flat 50 Flat 100 Flat
50

(96 CS Min. 
order)

Flat
50

(96 CS Min. 
order)

Flat

32 55 GAL LLD Liner Black 1-24 CS  36x58  3.0 MIL 62 CS  $   15.83  $          981.46 17.95$     $    1,112.90 31.80$     $      1,971.60 23.90$     $      1,481.80  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
33 55 GAL LLD Liner Black 25-49 CS  36x58  3.0 MIL 49 CS  $   14.83  $          726.67 17.40$     $       852.60 31.80$     $      1,558.20 23.80$     $      1,166.20  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
34 55 GAL LLD Liner Black 50-99 CS  36x58  3.0 MIL 260 CS  $   13.83  $       3,595.80 15.02$     $    3,905.20 31.80$     $      8,268.00 22.00$     $      5,720.00 15.68$           $      4,076.80 15.68$           $    4,076.80 
35 55 GAL LLD Liner Black 100+CS  36x58  3.0 MIL 125 CS  $   12.83  $       1,603.75 14.20$     $    1,775.00 31.80$     $      3,975.00 21.40$     $      2,675.00 15.51$           $      1,938.75 15.51$           $    1,938.75 

56 17.28 56 17.3 56 17.24 56 17.3 LBS 56 gal 17.3 56 gal 17.3

100 Flat 100 Flat 10/10 Roll 100 Flat

100
(116 CS Min. 
order for clear 

& black)

Flat

100
(116 CS Min. 
order for clear 

& black)

Flat

All American Poly 
3658AAPLD

All American Poly 
42.547AAPLD

36x58  3.0 mil 36"x58"  2.0 MIL

30/10% N/A

42.5 x47  1.3 MIL

36x58  3 MIL 36x58-3.0 MIL 36x58  3.0 Mil 36x58  3.0 Mil

42.5x47  1.3 Mil 42.5x47  1.3 Mil

100% 100%

SR424713C, SR424713B 
Jadcore

SR424713C, SR424713B 
Jadcore

Unknown Unknown

SR36583B Jadcore SR36583B Jadcore

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Recycled & Post Consumer Content: 95%

Dimensions and thickness:

Recycled 10%-P.C. 10%
Weight Load: (lbs) 19.45 150 40-5075

Brand and Item #: Calico 9910559 Waverly CLF365830K Central Poly-#CP58LD

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

55 GALLON, 36"x58", 3.0 MIL., LINEAR LOW DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Black 50-99

56 GALLON, 42.5"x47", 1.3 MIL., LINEAR LOW DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 25-49 & Black 25-49

Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Dimensions and thickness:

 

42.5x47  1.3 mil 42.5"x47"  1.3 MIL 42.5x47-1.3 MIL

Calico 9910408SP 
(Clear)

9910411SP (Black)

Waverly CLR4254713K
(Black  25-49) Central Poly-#CP47LD

36 56 GAL LLD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  42.5x47  1.3 MIL 24 CS  $   17.86  $          428.64 18.47$     $       443.28 $ NO BID  $ NO BID 21.20$     $         508.80  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
37 56 GAL LLD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  42.5x47  1.3 MIL 30 CS  $   16.86  $          505.80 18.24$     $       547.20 $ NO BID  $ NO BID 21.00$     $         630.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
38 56 GAL LLD Liner Clear 50-99 CS  42.5x47  1.3 MIL 90 CS  $   15.86  $       1,427.40 17.40$     $    1,566.00 $ NO BID  $ NO BID 19.20$     $      1,728.00 16.86$           $      1,517.40 16.86$           $    1,517.40 
39 56 GAL LLD Liner Clear 100+CS  42.5x47  1.3 MIL 100 CS  $   14.86  $       1,486.00 15.10$     $    1,510.00 $ NO BID  $ NO BID 19.10$     $      1,910.00 16.68$           $      1,668.00 16.68$           $    1,668.00 
40 56 GAL LLD Liner Black 1-24 CS  42.5x47  1.3 MIL 35 CS  $   14.40  $          504.00 16.11$     $       563.85 26.36$     $         922.60 19.40$     $         679.00  No Bid  No Bid No Bid  No Bid 
41 56 GAL LLD Liner Black 25-49 CS  42.5x47  1.3 MIL 70 CS  $   13.40  $          938.00 15.84$     $    1,108.80 26.36$     $      1,845.20 16.90$     $      1,183.00  No Bid  No Bid No Bid  No Bid 
42 56 GAL LLD Liner Black 50-99 CS  42.5x47  1.3 MIL 90 CS  $   12.40  $       1,116.00 12.44$     $    1,119.60 26.36$     $      2,372.40 16.80$     $      1,512.00 12.99$           $      1,169.10 12.99$           $    1,169.10 
43 56 GAL LLD Liner Black 100 CS  42.5x47  1.3 MIL 100 CS  $   11.40  $       1,140.00 12.24$     $    1,224.00 26.36$     $      2,636.00 16.40$     $      1,640.00 12.84$           $      1,284.00 12.84$           $    1,284.00 

Unknown Unknown
100% 100%

Weight Load: (lbs)
95%Recycled & Post Consumer Content: 30/10%
17.28

N/A Recycled 10%-P.C. 10%
 10-2040
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Buyer:  Michelle Kemper 3417 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:  09-17-10

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

Egan Supply Co Egan Supply Co
(Alternate Bid)Central Poly Corporation

Li
ne

 # All American Poly Calico Industries IncDescription Cash-Wa Distributing Inc

7-10 8.0 7-10 9.2 7-10 9.1 7-10 9 LBS 10 10.04 10 10.04

1,000 Roll 1000 Roll 50/20 Roll 1000 Roll 1000 Roll 1000 Roll

44 7-10 GAL HD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  24x24  6 MIC 115 CS 16.86$     $       1,938.90 13.95$     $    1,604.25 14.52$     $      1,669.80 12.80$     $      1,472.00 11.40$           $      1,311.00 11.40$           $    1,311.00 
45 7-10 GAL HD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  24x24  6 MIC 130 CS 15.86$     $       2,061.80 13.60$     $    1,768.00 14.52$     $      1,887.60 12.60$     $      1,638.00 11.28$           $      1,466.40 11.28$           $    1,466.40 
46 7-10 GAL HD Liner Clear 50+CS  24x24  6 MIC 160 CS 14.86$     $       2,377.60 12.94$     $    2,070.40 14.52$     $      2,323.20 11.90$     $      1,904.00 11.28$           $      1,804.80 11.28$           $    1,804.80 

12-16 14.4 12-16 11.6 10-15 23.16 12-16 15 16 24.55 16 24.55

1,000 Roll 500 Roll 50/20 Roll 1000 Roll
1000

(100 CS min. 
order)

Roll
1000

(100 CS min. 
order)

Roll

47 12-16 GAL HD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  24x33  11 MIC 35 CS 25.02$     $          875.70 17.25$     $       603.75 36.94$     $      1,292.90 17.40$     $         609.00  No Bid  No Bid No Bid  No Bid 
48 12-16 GAL HD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  24x33  11MIC 49 CS 24.02$     $       1,176.98 17.00$     $       833.00 36.94$     $      1,810.06 17.20$     $         842.80  No Bid  No Bid No Bid  No Bid 
49 12-16 GAL HD Liner Clear 50+CS  24x33  11 MIC 200 CS 23.02$     $       4,604.00 16.44$     $    3,288.00 36.94$     $      7,388.00 16.80$     $      3,360.00 28.45$           $      5,690.00 28.45$           $    5,690.00 

All American Poly 
2433AAPHD

24x33  11 MIC

24"x24"  6 MIC24x24  6 MIC 24x24  6 Microns

 

14.4

All American Poly

Virgin

24x33  11 Mic 24x33  11 Mic24x33  11 Microns 24"x33"  11 MIC 24x33-11 MIC

MR30371MC Pitt MR30371MC Pitt

15-25

C li 9930054 W l HR303710C

24x24-6 MIC 24x24  6 Mic 24x24  6 Mic

40

SR243311C SR243311C

40

15 15

MR24249MC  Pitt MR24249MC  Pitt

0 0

7-10 GALLON, 24"x24", 6 MICRONS, HIGH DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 50+ 

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)
Recycled & Post Consumer Content:

Dimensions and thickness:

Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

All American Poly 
2424AAPHD

10% N/A

Calico 9970001 Waverly HR242406C Central Poly-#CP2424HD

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:
Weight Load: (lbs)

Weight Load: (lbs)

Dimensions and thickness:

Recycled 10%-P.C. 10%
8.0 10 15 10 LBS

Calico 9930289SP Waverly CHR243311C Central Poly-#CP33HD

12-16 GALLON, 24"x33", 11 MICRONS, HIGH DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 50+ 
Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Virgin 10% N/A Recycled 10%-P.C. 10% 0 0

20-30 GALLON, 30"x37", 10 MICRONS, HIGH DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 1-24 
B d d It #

 

30 45

C t l P l #CP3037

20-30 12.7 20-30 14.8 20-30 14.9 20-30 gal 14.56 LBS 20-30 16 20-30 16

500 Roll 500 Roll 25/20 Roll Roll 500 Roll 500 Roll

50 20-30 GAL HD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  30x37  10 MIC 24 CS 21.46$     $          515.04 21.45$     $       514.80 23.28$     $         558.72 19.40$     $         465.60 15.11$           $         362.64 15.11$           $       362.64 
51 20-30 GAL HD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  30x37  10 MIC 49 CS 20.46$     $       1,002.54 20.69$     $    1,013.81 23.28$     $      1,140.72 19.00$     $         931.00 15.11$           $         740.39 15.11$           $       740.39 
52 20-30 GAL HD Liner Clear 50+CS  30x37  10 MIC 60 CS 19.46$     $       1,167.60 19.79$     $    1,187.40 23.28$     $      1,396.80 17.30$     $      1,038.00 14.95$           $         897.00 14.95$           $       897.00 

30x37  10 MIC 30x37  10 Microns

All American Poly 
3037AAPHD

30"x37"  10 MIC 30x37  10 Mic

MR30371MC   Pitt MR30371MC   PittCalico 9930054 Waverly HR303710C

30x37  10 Mic

0 0

Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)
Recycled & Post Consumer Content:
Weight Load: (lbs)

30x37-10 MICDimensions and thickness:

Virgin 10% N/A Recycled 10%-P.C. 10%

Central Poly-#CP3037

30 3012.7 40 30 20-25
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Buyer:  Michelle Kemper 3417 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:  09-17-10

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

Egan Supply Co Egan Supply Co
(Alternate Bid)Central Poly Corporation

Li
ne

 # All American Poly Calico Industries IncDescription Cash-Wa Distributing Inc

33 19.6 33 24.6 31-33 24.68 33 24 LBS 33 13.49 33 11.71

500 Roll 500 Roll 25/20 Roll 500 Roll
250

(100 CS Min. 
order)

Roll 250 Roll

53 33 GAL HD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  33x40  14 MIC 120 CS 29.16$     $       3,499.20 28.23$     $    3,387.60 38.55$     $      4,626.00 29.40$     $      3,528.00 10.79$           $      1,294.80 10.79$           $    1,294.80 
54 33 GAL HD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  33x40  14 MIC 49 CS 28.16$     $       1,379.84 27.32$     $    1,338.68 38.55$     $      1,888.95 29.20$     $      1,430.80 10.79$           $         528.71 10.79$           $       528.71 
55 33 GAL HD Liner Clear 50+CS  33x40  14 MIC 55 CS 27.16$     $       1,493.80 26.04$     $    1,432.20 38.55$     $      2,120.25 29.00$     $      1,595.00 10.26$           $         564.30 10.26$           $       564.30 

33 12.8 33 14.9 31-33 14.81 40-45 14 LBS 33 16.17 33 15.27

250 Roll 250 Roll 25/10 Roll 200 Roll
250

(100 CS Min. 
order)

Roll 250 Roll

56 33 GAL HD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  33x40  17 MIC 13 CS 21.47$     $          279.11 17.40$     $       226.20 23.13$     $         300.69 19.20$     $         249.60 14.39$           $         187.07 14.39$           $       187.07 
57 33 GAL HD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  33x40  17 MIC 60 CS 20.47$     $       1,228.20 16.94$     $    1,016.40 23.13$     $      1,387.80 19.10$     $      1,146.00 14.39$           $         863.40 14.39$           $       863.40 
58 33 GAL HD Liner Clear 50-99 CS  33x40  17 MIC 60 CS 19.47$     $       1,168.20 16.40$     $       984.00 23.13$     $      1,387.80 19.00$     $      1,140.00 14.23$           $         853.80 14.23$           $       853.80 
59 33 GAL HD Liner Clear 100+CS 33x40 17 MIC 105 CS 18.47$ $       1,939.35 15.94$ $    1,673.70 23.13$ $      2,428.65 18.40$ $      1,932.00 15.13$ $      1,588.65 14.23$ $    1,494.15 

All American Poly 
3340AAPLD

33x40  14 MIC

33x40  17 MIC

33x40  12 Mic33x40  14 Microns 33"x40"  14 MIC 33x40-14 MIC

Calico 9930279 Waverly CHR334014C Central Poly-#CP40HD

33x40  14 Mic

75 75

SR334017C MR33403MC

45

SR3340 MR33402MC

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:
Weight Load: (lbs)

Dimensions and thickness:

All American Poly 
3340AAP

Recycled 10%-P.C. 10%

33 GALLON, 33"x40", 14 MICRONS, HIGH DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 1-24 
Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Dimensions and thickness:

19.6 50 55 20-30
Virgin 10% N/A

33 GALLON, 33"x40", 17 MICRONS, HIGH DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 25-49 
Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:

0
55

Virgin 10% N/A Recycled 10%-P.C. 10%

Calico 9930294 Waverly CHR334017C Central Poly-#CP4048HD

33x40  17 Microns 33"x40"  17 MIC

12.8 65 80 30-40Weight Load: (lbs)
0

40x48-17 MIC 33x40  17 Mic 33x40  16 M

59 33 GAL HD Liner Clear 100+CS  33x40  17 MIC 105 CS 18.47$   $       1,939.35 15.94$   $    1,673.70 23.13$   $      2,428.65 18.40$   $      1,932.00 15.13$         $      1,588.65 14.23$         $    1,494.15 

55 17.8 55 20.6 60 20.70 55 22 LBS 60 21.46 60 20.72

200 Roll 200 Roll 25/8 Roll 200 Roll
200

(100 CS min. 
order)

Roll 200 Roll

60 55 GAL HD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  38x60  17 MIC 30 CS 27.15$     $          814.50 24.13$     $       723.90 32.32$     $         969.60 23.40$     $         702.00 19.87$           $         596.10 19.87$           $       596.10 
61 55 GAL HD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  38x60  17 MIC 210 CS 26.15$     $       5,491.50 23.39$     $    4,911.90 32.32$     $      6,787.20 23.20$     $      4,872.00 19.87$           $      4,172.70 19.87$           $    4,172.70 
62 55 GAL HD Liner Clear 50-99 CS  38x60  17 MIC 99 CS 25.15$     $       2,489.85 20.85$     $    2,064.15 32.32$     $      3,199.68 21.10$     $      2,088.90 19.66$           $      1,946.34 19.66$           $    1,946.34 
63 55 GAL HD Liner Clear 100+CS  38x60  17 MIC 105 CS 24.15$     $       2,535.75 19.44$     $    2,041.20 32.32$     $      3,393.60 19.40$     $      2,037.00 20.90$           $      2,194.50 19.66$           $    2,064.30 

All American Poly 3860 
AAPHD

SR386017C MR38603MC

Weight Load: (lbs)

Dimensions and thickness: 38x60  17 MIC

55 GALLON, 38"x60", 17 MICRONS, HIGH DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 25-49 
Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:

Calico 9970040 Waverly HR386017C

17.8 70 80 40-65
Virgin 10% N/A Recycled 10%-P.C. 10%

Central Poly-#CP3860

38x60  17 Microns 38"x60"  17 MIC 38x60-17 MIC 38x60  17 Mic 38x60  16 Mic

0
75 75
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Buyer:  Michelle Kemper 3417 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:  09-17-10

Description QTY UOM Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

Egan Supply Co Egan Supply Co
(Alternate Bid)Central Poly Corporation

Li
ne

 # All American Poly Calico Industries IncDescription Cash-Wa Distributing Inc

55 17.3 55 20.0 60 20.20 55 20.2 LBS 60 21.34 60 21.34

150 Roll 150 Roll 25/6 Roll 150 Roll 150 Roll 150 Roll

64 55 GAL HD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  38x60  22 MIC 24 CS 26.60$     $          638.40 24.08$     $       577.92 31.55$     $         757.20 23.80$     $         571.20 20.49$           $         491.76 20.49$           $       491.76 
65 55 GAL HD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  38x60  22 MIC 50 CS 25.60$     $       1,280.00 23.44$     $    1,172.00 31.55$     $      1,577.50 23.60$     $      1,180.00 20.49$           $      1,024.50 20.49$           $    1,024.50 
66 55 GAL HD Liner Clear 50-99 CS  38x60  22 MIC 99 CS 24.60$     $       2,435.40 22.84$     $    2,261.16 31.55$     $      3,123.45 23.40$     $      2,316.60 20.28$           $      2,007.72 20.28$           $    2,007.72 
67 55 GAL HD Liner Clear 100+CS  38x60  22 MIC 1,125 CS 23.60$     $     26,550.00 20.19$     $  22,713.75 31.55$     $    35,493.75 21.20$     $    23,850.00 20.28$           $    22,815.00 20.28$           $  22,815.00 

56 16.0 56 18.7 56 18.53 56 15.6 LBS 56 19.97 56 18.66

200 Roll 200 Roll 25/8 Roll 200 Roll
250

(100 CS Min. 
order)

Roll 200 Roll

68 56 GAL HD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  43x48  17 MIC 55 CS 21.90$     $       1,204.50 22.41$     $    1,232.55 28.94$     $      1,591.70 23.80$     $      1,309.00 18.00$           $         990.00 18.00$           $       990.00 
69 56 GAL HD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  43x48  17 MIC 49 CS 20.90$     $       1,024.10 21.44$     $    1,050.56 28.94$     $      1,418.06 22.60$     $      1,107.40 18.00$           $         882.00 18.00$           $       882.00 
70 56 GAL HD Liner Clear 50-99 CS  43x48  17 MIC 99 CS 19.90$     $       1,970.10 19.30$     $    1,910.70 28.94$     $      2,865.06 21.99$     $      2,177.01 17.10$           $      1,692.90 17.10$           $    1,692.90 
71 56 GAL HD Liner Clear 100+CS  43x48  17 MIC 400 CS 18.90$     $       7,560.00 18.62$     $    7,448.00 28.94$     $    11,576.00 19.20$     $      7,680.00 18.92$           $      7,568.00 17.10$           $    6,840.00 

38x60  22 MIC

0%, 0 0%, 0

85

0
75 75

SR434817C MR43483MC

0 0
85

MR38604MC  Pitt MR38604MC  Pitt

0%, 0Payment Terms 1%, 10 (Net 30) Net 20

55 GALLON, 38"x60", 22 MICRONS, HIGH DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 100+

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)
Recycled & Post Consumer Content: Virgin 10%

Dimensions and thickness:

Brand and Item #: Calico 9970042 Waverly HR386022C Central Poly-#CP60HDAll American Poly 
3860AAPHD

Recycled 10%-P.C. 10%
Weight Load: (lbs) 17.3 75 85 40-70

N/A

56 GALLON, 43"x48", 17 MICRONS, HIGH DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 100+

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Recycled & Post Consumer Content: Virgin 10%

Dimensions and thickness:

Waverly CHR434817C Central Poly-#CP48HDAll American Poly 
4348AAPHD

43x48  17 MIC

Recycled 10%-P.C. 10%
Weight Load: (lbs) 16.0 70 80 30-50

N/A

Brand and Item #: Calico 9970057

38x60  22 Mic 38x60  22 Mic

43x48  17 Microns 43"x48"  17 MIC 43x48-17 Microns

38x60  22 Microns 38"x60"  22 MIC 38x60-22 Microns

43x48  17 43x48  16 Mic

Lines 24-31: 
(Alternate Liner)
RP404620K Pitt
100ks, Load 90#

[black only]

Lines 24-31: 
(Alternate Liner)
RP404620K Pitt
100ks, Load 90#

[black only]

15 15
0%, 0 0%, 00%, 0

7-10
Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

1%, 10 (Net 30)
5-20 15

Net 20
30

Comments
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Buyer:  Michelle Kemper 3417 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:  09-17-10

Description QTY UOM

1 7-10 GAL LLD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  24x24  .50 MIL 24 CS
2 7-10 GAL LLD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  24x24  .50 MIL 50 CS
3 7-10 GAL LLD Liner Clear 50+CS  24x24  .50 MIL 60 CS
4 7-10 GAL LLD Liner BLK 1-24 CS  24x24  .50 MIL 24 CS
5 7-10 GAL LLD Liner BLK 25-49 CS  24x24  .50 MIL 60 CS
6 7-10 GAL LLD Liner BLK 50-99 CS  24x24  .50 MIL 60 CS
7 7-10 GAL LLD Liner BLK 100+CS  24x24  .50 MIL 350 CS

Dimensions and thickness:

Weight Load: (lbs)

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

12-16 GALLON, 24"x33", 2.0 MIL., LINEAR LOW DENSITY -
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Black 1-24

Dimensions and thickness:

Brand and Item #:

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:

7-10 GALLON, 24"x24", .50 MIL., LINEAR LOW DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 25-49 & Black 100+

Li
ne

 #

Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Description

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

7-10 19.20 7-10 13.26 7-10 10.49 7-10 10.49 7-10 18

1,000 Flat or Roll 1,000 Flat or Roll 1,000 Flat or Roll 1,000 Flat or Roll 1000 Roll

 $   24.48  $         587.52  $   18.32  $         439.68  $   14.48  $         347.52  $   20.50  $           492.00 
 $   22.98  $      1,149.00  $   16.82  $         841.00  $   12.98  $         649.00  $   20.00  $        1,000.00 
 $   21.48  $      1,288.80  $   15.32  $         919.20  $   11.48  $         688.80  $   19.50  $        1,170.00 
 $   25.84  $         620.16  $   19.82  $         475.68  $   15.98  $         383.52  $   20.50  $           492.00 
 $   24.34  $      1,460.40  $   18.32  $      1,099.20  $   14.48  $         868.80  $   20.00  $        1,200.00 
 $   22.84  $      1,370.40  $   16.82  $      1,009.20  $   12.98  $         778.80  $      12.98  $         778.80  $   19.50  $        1,170.00 
 $   21.34  $      7,469.00  $   15.32  $      5,362.00  $   11.48  $      4,018.00  $      11.48  $      4,018.00  $   19.10  $        6,685.00 

10-15 52.80 10-15 53.80 10-15 22.12 10-15 7.53  12-16 16
24"x33" =2.0 Mil 24x32  1.25 Mil

INT-2433-R Roll Pak  PR32-125K

30% PCRC 0
20

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "D")

[Alternate for Select Lines]

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "E")

[Alternate for Select Lines]

Schwarz Paper
Company

24"x24" =.5 Mil 24x24  .47 Mil

INT-2424-R Roll Pak
RP223C, K

24"x33" =2.0 Mil

20

INT-2433-X-Hvy

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "C")

INT-2424-R

24"x24" =.5 Mil

30% PCRC

24"x24"  .5 Mil 24"x24" =.5 Mil

24"x33"  2.0 Mil 24"x33" =2.0 Mil

INT-2433-Super Ex-Hvy INT-2433-Exh

25 20

INT-2424-Med INT-2424-Reg

30% PCRC 30% PCRC

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "A")

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "B")

8 12-16 GAL LLD Liner BLK 1-24 CS  24x33  2.0 MIL 50 CS
9 12-16 GAL LLD Liner BLK 25-49 CS  24x33  2.0 MIL 49 CS
10 12-16 GAL LLD Liner BLK 50-99 CS  24x33  2.0 MIL 99 CS
11 12-16 GAL LLD Liner BLK 100+CS  24x33  2.0 MIL 105 CS

12 20-30 GAL LLD Liner BLK 1-24 CS  30x37  2.0 MIL 24 CS
13 20-30 GAL LLD Liner BLK 25-49 CS  30x37  2.0 MIL 49 CS
14 20-30 GAL LLD Liner BLK 50-99 CS  30x37  2.0 MIL  275 CS
15 20-30 GAL LLD Liner BLK 100+CS  30x37  2.0 MIL 110 CS

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:
Weight Load: (lbs)

Dimensions and thickness:
Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Brand and Item #:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:

20-30 GALLON, 30"x37", 2.0 MIL., LINEAR LOW DENSITY -
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Black 50-99

Weight Load: (lbs)

500 Flat or Roll 500 Flat or Roll 500 Flat or Roll 500 Flat or Roll 250 Roll

 $   45.98  $      2,299.00  $   33.48  $      1,674.00  $   23.32  $      1,166.00  $      15.34  $         767.00  $   17.50  $           875.00 
 $   44.48  $      2,179.52  $   31.98  $      1,567.02  $   21.82  $      1,069.18  $      13.84  $         678.16  $   17.25  $           845.25 
 $   42.98  $      4,255.02  $   30.48  $      3,017.52  $   20.32  $      2,011.68  $      12.34  $      1,221.66  $   17.00  $        1,683.00 
 $   41.48  $      4,355.40  $   28.98  $      3,042.90  $   28.98  $      3,042.90  $      10.84  $      1,138.20  $   16.60  $        1,743.00 

20-30 37.00 20-30 28.75 20-30 19.50 20-30 10.72 20-30

250 Flat  250 Flat  250 Flat  250 Flat  100 Roll

 $   33.82  $         811.68  $   33.82  $         811.68  $   21.48  $         515.52  $      17.84  $         428.16  $   17.00  $           408.00 
 $   32.32  $      1,583.68  $   32.32  $      1,583.68  $   19.98  $         979.02  $      16.34  $         800.66  $   16.75  $           820.75 
 $   30.82  $      8,475.50  $   30.82  $      8,475.50  $   18.48  $      5,082.00  $      14.84  $      4,081.00  $   16.50  $        4,537.50 
 $   29.32  $      3,225.20  $   29.32  $      3,225.20  $   16.97  $      1,866.70  $      13.34  $      1,467.40  $   16.20  $        1,782.00 

30% PCRC Up to 70%
110

INT-3037-Hvy Roll Pak  SPECIAL 36-200

30"x37" =2.0 Mil 30x37  2 Mil

20
30% PCRC Up to 70%

20

30"x37" =2.0 Mil

30% PCRC
110

30% PCRC

INT-3037-XXH

30"x37"  2.0 Mil 30"x37" =2.0 Mil

115 110

INT-3037-Super Ex-Hvy INT-3037-Super Exh

30% PCRC 30% PCRC

25 20
30% PCRC 30% PCRC
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Buyer:  Michelle Kemper 3417 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:  09-17-10

Description QTY UOM

Li
ne

 # Description

16 33 GAL LLD Liner White 1-24 CS  33x39  1.3 MIL 24 CS
17 33 GAL LLD Liner White 25-49 CS  33x39  1.3 MIL 70 CS
18 33 GAL LLD Liner White 50-99 CS  33x39  1.3 MIL 120 CS
19 33 GAL LLD Liner White 100+CS  33x39  1.3 MIL 100 CS
20 33 GAL LLD Liner Black 1-24 CS  33x39  1.3 MIL 24 CS
21 33 GAL LLD Liner Black 25-49 CS  33x39  1.3 MIL 49 CS
22 33 GAL LLD Liner Black 50-99 CS  33x39  1.3 MIL 99 CS
23 33 GAL LLD Liner Black 100+CS  33x39  1.3 MIL 110 CS

40-45 GALLON, 40"x48", 2.0 MIL., LINEAR LOW DENSITY -
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 100+ & Black 50-99

Brand and Item #:

Weight Load: (lbs)

33 GALLON, 33"x39", 1.3 MIL., LINEAR LOW DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: White 50-99 & Black 1-24

Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:

Dimensions and thickness:

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "D")

[Alternate for Select Lines]

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "E")

[Alternate for Select Lines]

Schwarz Paper
Company

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "C")

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "A")

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "B")

33 27.89 33 18.16 33 13.66 33 9.84 33 11.4

250
Flat or Roll

16-19
20-23 (Flat)

250
Flat or Roll

16-19
20-23 (Flat)

250
Flat or Roll

16-19
20-23 (Flat)

250
Flat or Roll

16-19
20-23 (Flat)

100 Roll

34.48$     $         827.52 26.84$     $         644.16 22.34$     $         536.16 17.82$       $         427.68 13.25$     $           318.00 
32.98$     $      2,308.60 25.34$     $      1,773.80 20.84$     $      1,458.80 16.32$       $      1,142.40 13.00$     $           910.00 
31.48$     $      3,777.60 23.84$     $      2,860.80 19.34$     $      2,320.80 14.82$       $      1,778.40 12.75$     $        1,530.00 
29.98$     $      2,998.00 22.34$     $      2,234.00 17.84$     $      1,784.00 13.32$       $      1,332.00 12.00$     $        1,200.00 
26.84$     $         644.16 22.24$     $         533.76 20.32$     $         487.68 15.98$       $         383.52 13.25$     $           318.00 
25.34$     $      1,241.66 20.74$     $      1,016.26 18.82$     $         922.18 14.48$       $         709.52 13.00$     $           637.00 
23.84$     $      2,360.16 19.24$     $      1,904.76 17.32$     $      1,714.68 12.98$       $      1,285.02 12.98$       $      1,285.02 12.75$     $        1,262.25 
22.34$     $      2,457.40 17.74$     $      1,951.40 15.82$     $      1,740.20 11.48$       $      1,262.80 11.48$       $      1,262.80 12.00$     $        1,320.00 

INT-4048-X-Hvy INT-4048-XH Roll Pak
PR46200K (Black)

40

33"x39" =1.3 Mil 33x40  1.3 Mil

30% PCRC 0

INT-3339-Med
Roll Pak

RP3340-130C, K
(Clear; not white)

INT-4048-Super Ex-Hvy

INT-3339-Hvy

33"x39" =1.3 Mil

30% PCRC
40

INT-4048-ExhINT-4048-Super Exh

33"x39"  1.3 Mil 33"x39" =1.3 Mil

INT-3339-Super Exh

70 40

INT-3339-X-Hvy

30% PCRC 30% PCRC

24 40-45 GAL LLD Liner CLR 1-24 CS  40x48  2.0 MIL 24 CS
25 40-45 GAL LLD Liner CLR 25-49 CS  40x48  2.0 MIL 49 CS
26 40-45 GAL LLD Liner CLR 50-99 CS 40x48  2.0 MIL 99 CS
27 40-45 GAL LLD Liner CLR 100+CS  40x48  2.0 MIL 1,200 CS
28 40-45 GAL LLD Liner BLK 1-24 CS  40x48  2.0 MIL 24 CS
29 40-45 GAL LLD Liner BLK 25-49 CS  40x48  2.0 MIL 49 CS
30 40-45 GAL LLD Liner BLK 50-99 CS  40x48  2.0 MIL 175 CS
31 40-45 GAL LLD Liner BLK 100+CS  40x48  2.0 MIL 105 CS

Dimensions and thickness:

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:
Weight Load: (lbs)

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

40-45 25.60 40-45 20.20 40-45 16.36 40-45 11.24 40-45 8.78 40-45 25.6

100 Flat 100 Flat 100 Flat 100 Flat 100 Flat 100 Roll

30.48$     $         731.52 25.34$     $         608.16 22.32$     $         535.68 19.32$       $         463.68 15.48$       $         371.52 N/A
28.98$     $      1,420.02 23.84$     $      1,168.16 20.82$     $      1,020.18 17.82$       $         873.18 13.98$       $         685.02 N/A
27.48$     $      2,720.52 22.34$     $      2,211.66 19.32$     $      1,912.68 16.32$       $      1,615.68 12.48$       $      1,235.52 N/A
25.98$     $    31,176.00 20.84$     $    25,008.00 17.82$     $    21,384.00 14.82$       $    17,784.00 10.98$       $    13,176.00 N/A
26.48$     $         635.52 21.84$     $         524.16 18.82$     $         451.68 15.84$       $         380.16 14.82$       $         355.68 25.40$     $           609.60 
24.98$     $      1,224.02 20.34$     $         996.66 17.32$     $         848.68 14.34$       $         702.66 13.32$       $         652.68 25.15$     $        1,232.35 
23.48$     $      4,109.00 18.84$     $      3,297.00 15.82$     $      2,768.50 12.84$       $      2,247.00 11.82$       $      2,068.50 24.80$     $        4,340.00 
21.98$     $      2,307.90 17.34$     $      1,820.70 14.32$     $      1,503.60 11.34$       $      1,190.70 10.32$       $      1,083.60 24.00$     $        2,520.00 

30% PCRC 30% PCRC Up to 70%
50 50

( )

40"x48" = 2.0 Mil 40"x48" = 2.0 Mil 40x48  2 Mil40"x48"  2.0 Mil 40"x48" = 2.0 Mil40"x48" = 2.0 Mil

30% PCRC
5065

30% PCRC 30% PCRC
90
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Buyer:  Michelle Kemper 3417 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:  09-17-10

Description QTY UOM

Li
ne

 # Description

32 55 GAL LLD Liner Black 1-24 CS  36x58  3.0 MIL 62 CS
33 55 GAL LLD Liner Black 25-49 CS  36x58  3.0 MIL 49 CS
34 55 GAL LLD Liner Black 50-99 CS  36x58  3.0 MIL 260 CS
35 55 GAL LLD Liner Black 100+CS  36x58  3.0 MIL 125 CS

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:

Dimensions and thickness:

Weight Load: (lbs)

Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

55 GALLON, 36"x58", 3.0 MIL., LINEAR LOW DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Black 50-99

56 GALLON, 42.5"x47", 1.3 MIL., LINEAR LOW DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 25-49 & Black 25-49

Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Dimensions and thickness:

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "D")

[Alternate for Select Lines]

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "E")

[Alternate for Select Lines]

Schwarz Paper
Company

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "C")

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "A")

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "B")

55-60 41.76 55-60 33.02 55-60 23.27 55-60 17.70 55-60 10.34 55

100 Flat 100 Flat 100 Flat 100 Flat 100 Flat 50 Roll

20.48$     $      1,269.76 30.82$     $      1,910.84 25.98$     $      1,610.76 21.84$       $      1,354.08 18.98$       $      1,176.76 24.50$     $        1,519.00 
35.34$     $      1,731.66 29.32$     $      1,436.68 24.48$     $      1,199.52 20.34$       $         996.66 17.48$       $         856.52 24.25$     $        1,188.25 
33.84$     $      8,798.40 27.82$     $      7,233.20 22.98$     $      5,974.80 18.84$       $      4,898.40 15.98$       $      4,154.80 24.00$     $        6,240.00 
32.34$     $      4,042.50 26.32$     $      3,290.00 21.48$     $      2,685.00 17.34$       $      2,167.50 14.48$       $      1,810.00 23.00$     $        2,875.00 

56 17.31 56 17.31 56 8.86 56 8.86 56 8.86 56 17.9

100
Flat or Roll

36-39
40-43 (Flat)

100
Flat or Roll

36-39
40-43 (Flat)

100
Flat or Roll

36-39
40-43 (Flat)

100
Flat or Roll

36-39
40-43 (Flat)

100
Flat or Roll

36-39
40-43 (Flat)

100 Roll

INT-42547-X-Hvy INT-42547-X-Hvy Roll Pak
RP4348-130C,K

4.25"x47" =1.3 Mil 4.25"x47" =1.3 Mil 43x48  1.3 Mil

110 100

36"x58"  3.0 Mil 36"x58"  3.0 Mil 36x58  3 Mil

30% PCRC 30% PCRC Up to 70%

INT-3658-Exh INT-3658-Exh Roll Pak  Special 658-300

INT-42547-Super Exh INT-42547-Super Exh

125 120

36"x58"  3.0 Mil36"x58"  3.0 Mil

4.25"x47"  1.3 Mil 4.25"x47"  1.3 Mil

INT-3658-Super XH

36"x58"  3.0 Mil

30% PCRC
115

INT-42547-Hvy

30% PCRC 30% PCRC

INT-3658-Super Tuff INT-3658-Super-Ex-Ex-
Hvy

4.25"x47" =1.3 Mil

36 56 GAL LLD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  42.5x47  1.3 MIL 24 CS
37 56 GAL LLD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  42.5x47  1.3 MIL 30 CS
38 56 GAL LLD Liner Clear 50-99 CS  42.5x47  1.3 MIL 90 CS
39 56 GAL LLD Liner Clear 100+CS  42.5x47  1.3 MIL 100 CS
40 56 GAL LLD Liner Black 1-24 CS  42.5x47  1.3 MIL 35 CS
41 56 GAL LLD Liner Black 25-49 CS  42.5x47  1.3 MIL 70 CS
42 56 GAL LLD Liner Black 50-99 CS  42.5x47  1.3 MIL 90 CS
43 56 GAL LLD Liner Black 100 CS  42.5x47  1.3 MIL 100 CS

Weight Load: (lbs)
Recycled & Post Consumer Content:

20.32$     $         487.68 19.48$     $         467.52 16.84$     $         404.16 14.48$       $         347.52 14.48$       $         347.52 19.00$     $           456.00 
18.82$     $         564.60 17.98$     $         539.40 15.34$     $         460.20 12.98$       $         389.40 18.75$     $           562.50 
17.32$     $      1,558.80 16.48$     $      1,483.20 13.84$     $      1,245.60 11.48$       $      1,033.20 18.50$     $        1,665.00 
19.98$     $      1,998.00 14.98$     $      1,498.00 12.34$     $      1,234.00 9.98$         $         998.00 18.00$     $        1,800.00 
18.48$     $         646.80 15.98$     $         559.30 14.84$     $         519.40 13.98$       $         489.30 19.00$     $           665.00 
16.98$     $      1,188.60 14.48$     $      1,013.60 13.34$     $         933.80 12.48$       $         873.60 18.75$     $        1,312.50 
15.48$     $      1,393.20 12.98$     $      1,168.20 11.84$     $      1,065.60 10.98$       $         988.20 18.50$     $        1,665.00 
13.98$     $      1,398.00 11.48$     $      1,148.00 10.34$     $      1,034.00 9.48$         $         948.00 18.00$     $        1,800.00 

30% PCRC 30% PCRC 0
50 5085 75

30% PCRC 30% PCRC
50

30% PCRC
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Statewide

Opening Date:  09-17-10

Description QTY UOM

Li
ne

 # Description

44 7-10 GAL HD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  24x24  6 MIC 115 CS
45 7-10 GAL HD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  24x24  6 MIC 130 CS
46 7-10 GAL HD Liner Clear 50+CS  24x24  6 MIC 160 CS

47 12-16 GAL HD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  24x33  11 MIC 35 CS
48 12-16 GAL HD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  24x33  11MIC 49 CS
49 12-16 GAL HD Liner Clear 50+CS  24x33  11 MIC 200 CS

7-10 GALLON, 24"x24", 6 MICRONS, HIGH DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 50+ 

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)
Recycled & Post Consumer Content:

Dimensions and thickness:

Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:
Weight Load: (lbs)

Weight Load: (lbs)

Dimensions and thickness:

12-16 GALLON, 24"x33", 11 MICRONS, HIGH DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 50+ 
Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

20-30 GALLON, 30"x37", 10 MICRONS, HIGH DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 1-24 
B d d It #

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "D")

[Alternate for Select Lines]

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "E")

[Alternate for Select Lines]

Schwarz Paper
Company

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "C")

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "A")

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "B")

7-10 23.98 7-10 23.98 7-10 23.98 7-10 23.98 7-10 23.98 7-10 9.1

1,000 Flat or Roll 1,000 Flat or Roll 1,000 Flat or Roll 1,000 Flat or Roll 1,000 Flat or Roll 1000 Roll

12.98$     $      1,492.70 12.98$     $      1,492.70 12.98$     $      1,492.70 12.98$       $      1,492.70 11.00$     $        1,265.00 
11.48$     $      1,492.40 11.48$     $      1,492.40 11.48$     $      1,492.40 11.48$       $      1,492.40 10.75$     $        1,397.50 
6.24$       $         998.40 6.24$       $         998.40 6.24$       $         998.40 6.24$         $         998.40 10.50$     $        1,680.00 

10-15 23.98 10-15 17.86 10-15 14.05 10-15 14.05 12-16 21

500 Flat or Roll 500 Flat or Roll 500 Flat or Roll 500 Flat or Roll 1000 Roll

26.98$     $         944.30 20.84$     $         729.40 17.48$     $         611.80 17.48$       $         611.80 28.50$     $           997.50 
25.48$     $      1,248.52 19.34$     $         947.66 15.98$     $         783.02 15.98$       $         783.02 28.25$     $        1,384.25 
23.98$     $      4,796.00 17.84$     $      3,568.00 14.48$     $      2,896.00 14.48$       $      2,896.00 28.00$     $        5,600.00 

INT 3037 R R ll P k RH1037N

30% PCRC 0
20

INT-2433-R Roll Pak  Special RH1133N

24"x33  =11 Micron 24x33  11 Micron

20 20

24"x24"  6 Microns 24"x24"  6 Microns 24x24  6 Micron

30% PCRC 30% PCRC 0

INT-2424-R INT-2424-R Roll Pak  RH624N

24"x24"  6 Microns

 

INT 3037 M d

25

24"x24"  6 Microns

24"x33  11 Micron

INT 3037 R

INT-2433-H INT-2433-Reg

20

24"x33  =11 Micron

20 20

INT-2424-R INT-2424-R

30% PCRC 30% PCRC 30% PCRC
20

INT-2424-R

24"x24"  6 Microns

INT-2433-R

24"x33  =11 Micron

30% PCRC30% PCRC 30% PCRC
20

INT 3037 R

50 20-30 GAL HD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  30x37  10 MIC 24 CS
51 20-30 GAL HD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  30x37  10 MIC 49 CS
52 20-30 GAL HD Liner Clear 50+CS  30x37  10 MIC 60 CS

Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)
Recycled & Post Consumer Content:
Weight Load: (lbs)

Dimensions and thickness:
20-30 14.86 20-30 12.82 20-30 12.82 20-30 12.82 20-30 14.8

500 Flat or Roll 500 Flat or Roll 500 Flat or Roll 500 Flat or Roll 500

16.24$     $         389.76 16.24$     $         389.76 16.24$     $         389.76 16.24$       $         389.76 15.50$     $           372.00 
14.74$     $         722.26 14.74$     $         722.26 14.74$     $         722.26 14.74$       $         722.26 15.25$     $           747.25 
13.24$     $         794.40 13.24$     $         794.40 13.24$     $         794.40 13.24$       $         794.40 15.00$     $           900.00 

30

30"x37" =10 Micron 30x37  10 Micron

30% PCRC 0

INT-3037-Reg Roll Pak  RH1037N

30"x37"  10 Micron 30"x37" =10 Micron

INT-3037-Med

30% PCRC 30% PCRC

INT-3037-Reg INT-3037-Reg

30"x37" =10 Micron

3040 30
30% PCRC
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Buyer:  Michelle Kemper 3417 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:  09-17-10

Description QTY UOM

Li
ne

 # Description

53 33 GAL HD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  33x40  14 MIC 120 CS
54 33 GAL HD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  33x40  14 MIC 49 CS
55 33 GAL HD Liner Clear 50+CS  33x40  14 MIC 55 CS

56 33 GAL HD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  33x40  17 MIC 13 CS
57 33 GAL HD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  33x40  17 MIC 60 CS
58 33 GAL HD Liner Clear 50-99 CS  33x40  17 MIC 60 CS
59 33 GAL HD Liner Clear 100+CS 33x40 17 MIC 105 CS

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:
Weight Load: (lbs)

Dimensions and thickness:

33 GALLON, 33"x40", 14 MICRONS, HIGH DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 1-24 
Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Dimensions and thickness:

33 GALLON, 33"x40", 17 MICRONS, HIGH DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 25-49 
Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:
Weight Load: (lbs)

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "D")

[Alternate for Select Lines]

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "E")

[Alternate for Select Lines]

Schwarz Paper
Company

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "C")

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "A")

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "B")

33 24.93 33 20.49 33 16.86 33 16.86 33 12.4

200 Flat or Roll 200 Flat or Roll 200 Flat or Roll 200 Flat or Roll 250 Roll

28.48$     $      3,417.60 23.84$     $      2,860.80 20.84$     $      2,500.80 20.84$       $      2,500.80 13.25$     $        1,590.00 
26.98$     $      1,322.02 22.34$     $      1,094.66 19.34$     $         947.66 19.34$       $         947.66 13.00$     $           637.00 
25.48$     $      1,401.40 20.84$     $      1,146.20 17.84$     $         981.20 17.84$       $         981.20 12.75$     $           701.25 

33 30.36 33 24.11 33 20.49 33 16.86 33 14.2

500 Flat or Roll 500 Flat or Roll 500 Flat or Roll 500 Flat or Roll 250 Roll

35.24$     $         458.12 28.98$     $         376.74 25.98$     $         337.74 22.34$       $         290.42 15.25$     $           198.25 
33.74$     $      2,024.40 27.48$     $      1,648.80 24.48$     $      1,468.80 20.84$       $      1,250.40 15.00$     $           900.00 
32.24$     $      1,934.40 25.98$     $      1,558.80 22.98$     $      1,378.80 19.34$       $      1,160.40 14.75$     $           885.00 
30.74$ $      3,227.70 24.48$ $      2,570.40 21.48$ $      2,255.40 17.84$ $      1,873.20 14.50$ $        1,522.50 

40

33"x40 =17 Micron 33x40  16 Micron

30% PCRC 0

 

INT-3340-Med Roll Pak  RH1640N

30% PCRC 0
40

INT-3340-Med Roll Pak  RH1440N

33"x40" =14 Micron 33x40  14 Micron33"x40"  14 Micron 33"x40" =14 Micron

50 40

INT-3340-XXH INT-3340-Hvy

INT-3340-X-Hvy INT-3340-H INT-3340-Med

33"x40" =14 Micron

30% PCRC
40

INT-3340-H

30% PCRC 30% PCRC

60 50
30% PCRC 30% PCRC

33"x40  17 Micron 33"x40 =17 Micron 33"x40 =17 Micron

30% PCRC
40

59 33 GAL HD Liner Clear 100+CS  33x40  17 MIC 105 CS

60 55 GAL HD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  38x60  17 MIC 30 CS
61 55 GAL HD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  38x60  17 MIC 210 CS
62 55 GAL HD Liner Clear 50-99 CS  38x60  17 MIC 99 CS
63 55 GAL HD Liner Clear 100+CS  38x60  17 MIC 105 CS

Weight Load: (lbs)

Dimensions and thickness:

55 GALLON, 38"x60", 17 MICRONS, HIGH DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 25-49 
Brand and Item #:

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:

30.74$   $      3,227.70 24.48$   $      2,570.40 21.48$   $      2,255.40 17.84$     $      1,873.20 14.50$   $        1,522.50 

55-60 20.98 55-60 18.22 55-60 14.46 55-60 14.46 55 20.9

200 Flat or Roll 200 Flat or Roll 200 Flat or Roll 200 Flat or Roll 200 Roll

25.82$     $         774.60 23.22$     $         696.60 20.84$     $         625.20 20.84$       $         625.20 21.50$     $           645.00 
24.32$     $      5,107.20 21.72$     $      4,561.20 17.84$     $      3,746.40 17.84$       $      3,746.40 21.25$     $        4,462.50 
22.82$     $      2,259.18 20.22$     $      2,001.78 16.34$     $      1,617.66 16.34$       $      1,617.66 21.00$     $        2,079.00 
21.32$     $      2,238.60 18.72$     $      1,965.60 14.84$     $      1,558.20 14.84$       $      1,558.20 20.75$     $        2,178.75 

30% PCRC 0
50

INT-3860-H Roll Pak  RH17860N

38"x60" =17 Micron 38x60  17 Micron

60
30% PCRC 30% PCRC

INT-3860-HINT-3860-XXH INT-3860-X-Hvy

38"x60"  17 Micron 38"x60" =17 Micron

30% PCRC

38"x60" =17 Micron

5075
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Buyer:  Michelle Kemper 3417 OF
Statewide

Opening Date:  09-17-10

Description QTY UOM

Li
ne

 # Description

64 55 GAL HD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  38x60  22 MIC 24 CS
65 55 GAL HD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  38x60  22 MIC 50 CS
66 55 GAL HD Liner Clear 50-99 CS  38x60  22 MIC 99 CS
67 55 GAL HD Liner Clear 100+CS  38x60  22 MIC 1,125 CS

68 56 GAL HD Liner Clear 1-24 CS  43x48  17 MIC 55 CS
69 56 GAL HD Liner Clear 25-49 CS  43x48  17 MIC 49 CS
70 56 GAL HD Liner Clear 50-99 CS  43x48  17 MIC 99 CS
71 56 GAL HD Liner Clear 100+CS  43x48  17 MIC 400 CS
Payment Terms

55 GALLON, 38"x60", 22 MICRONS, HIGH DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 100+

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)
Recycled & Post Consumer Content:

Dimensions and thickness:

Brand and Item #:

Weight Load: (lbs)

56 GALLON, 43"x48", 17 MICRONS, HIGH DENSITY - 
Polethylene Can liner Average Order: Clear 100+

Capacity in gallons:                   Net Case Weight:

Case Quantity:                          Pack: (Flat or Roll)

Recycled & Post Consumer Content:

Dimensions and thickness:

Weight Load: (lbs)

Brand and Item #:

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "D")

[Alternate for Select Lines]

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "E")

[Alternate for Select Lines]

Schwarz Paper
Company

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "C")

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "A")

Interboro Packaging Corp
(Bid "B")

55-60 27.24 55-60 21.98 55-60 18.22 55-60 15.72 60 20.1

200 Flat or Roll 200 Flat or Roll 200 Flat or Roll 200 Flat or Roll 150 Roll

32.22$     $         773.28 27.24$     $         653.76 23.48$     $         563.52 21.34$       $         512.16 20.75$     $           498.00 
30.72$     $      1,536.00 25.74$     $      1,287.00 21.98$     $      1,099.00 19.84$       $         992.00 20.50$     $        1,025.00 
29.22$     $      2,892.78 24.24$     $      2,399.76 20.48$     $      2,027.52 18.34$       $      1,815.66 20.25$     $        2,004.75 
27.72$     $    31,185.00 22.74$     $    25,582.50 18.98$     $    21,352.50 16.84$       $    18,945.00 20.00$     $      22,500.00 

56 18.99 56 16.59 56 14.32 56 12.05 56 17.8

200 Flat or Roll 200 Flat or Roll 200 Flat or Roll 200 Flat or Roll 200 Roll

23.84$     $      1,311.20 21.32$     $      1,172.60 19.34$     $      1,063.70 17.84$       $         981.20 18.50$     $        1,017.50 
22.34$     $      1,094.66 19.82$     $         971.18 17.84$     $         874.16 16.34$       $         800.66 18.25$     $           894.25 
20.84$     $      2,063.16 18.32$     $      1,813.68 16.34$     $      1,617.66 14.84$       $      1,469.16 18.00$     $        1,782.00 
19.34$     $      7,736.00 16.82$     $      6,728.00 14.84$     $      5,936.00 13.34$       $      5,336.00 17.75$     $        7,100.00 

0%, 30 0%, 30  

30% PCRC 0
60

INT-4348-Med Roll Pak  RH1649N

43"x48" =17 Micron 43x48  16 Micron

50

38"x60 =22 Micron 38x60  22 Micron

30% PCRC 0

INT-3860-H Roll Pak  RH22860N

30% PCRC
60

0%, 30

60

0%, 30 0%, 30

INT-4348-X-Hvy

30% PCRC 30% PCRC
75

INT-3860-XXH

INT-4348-XXH

30% PCRC 30% PCRC
100

INT-3860-Super Ex-Ex 
Hvy

38"x60  22 Micron

INT-3860-X-Hvy

38"x60 =22 Micron

INT-4348-H

75

38"x60 =22 Micron

43"x48" =17 Micron43"x48"  17 Micron 43"x48" =17 Micron

30% PCRC
60

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

Comments

0%, 30 0%, 30  
10-14 10-14 14

0%, 30
10-14

0%, 30 0%, 30
10-14 10-14

Invalid Bid
Battle & Battle Distributors-Bid Not Signed.

Award Explanation:
All American Poly took exception to substituion section.

Awarded overall to low bidder.

Page 12 of 12


