Buyer: Michelle Kemper

Recycled - No. 1 Bond/Xerographic
Paper, Multipurpose, 20#, Colors.
Must contain PC recycled content

Colors Bidding:

Listed on separate
reference sheet (lines
10,11,12,13)

Goldenrod, Gray, Green,
Ivory, Lilac, Orchid
Peach, Pink, Salmon,
Tan Turquoise

3389 OF Opening Date: 11/01/10
REBID
AWARD
Business Paper Field Paper Company Omaha Paper Co. Xerox Corporation XpedX XpedX
ETS EST
Description 2 Sizes QTY
= PER M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 8.5"x 11" 128,000 | $ 575|% 530 % 7.530|$ 5.73
2 8.5" x 11" 3HP 1,700 [$ 6.27|$ 575|$% 7.930|$ 6.21
3 8.5" x 11" Xprs Pac 7,300 [$ 585|% 575| % 9.436 N/A
4 8.5" x 11" 3HP Xprs Pac 2,400 [$ 6.37|%$ 6.15| $ 9.912 N/A
Virgin - 20# Copier Paper, White 5 8.5" x 14" 1,800 [$ 7.98|% 731(%$ 10.230 | $ 8.10
Brightness 92 (minimum) Laser, & 6 11" x 17" 1,500 [$ 1254 | $ 11.50 | $ 15.860 | $ 12.52
High Speed Copier Guaranteed, Ink[ Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2002) for Permanence: .
Jet Compatible. Yes/No/Certifie(d/Othe)r Yes ves Yes/Certified Yes
Comments: Only sell by the carton
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Boise X-9 Boise X-9 Xerox Business 4200 Vector
Brightness: 92 92 92
Opacity: 87.5 88 88
7 8.5"x 11" 650 $ 18.50 | $ 10.19 No Bid $ 12.48
8 8.5" x 14" 1 No Bid $ 13.47 No Bid mill 20.00
9 11"x 17" 1 No Bid $ 21.20 No Bid mill 30.00
Recycled - No. 1 bond paper, 20# Comments: Only sell by the carton 8.5x14 and 11x17 Mil
White watermarked (smooth or order, carton quan. Only
wove finish) Recycled, 87. pright . Neenah Capitol Bond ’ Capitol Bond light cockle
(minimum) Opacity 86 (minimum) Brand/Sheet Bidding: 25% Cotton Hammermill Bond finish
% PC Content: 30% 30% 0%
Brightness: 96 92 91
Opacity: 91 91 87
10 8.5" x 11" 6,300 [$ 8.00 ($ 6.60 No Bid $ 725| % 7.49
11 8.5" x 11" 3HP 1 $ 845($ 7.05 No Bid $ 825 $ 8.45
12 8.5" x 14" 240 $ 10.75| $ 8.97 No Bid $ 1025| $ 10.45
13 11"x 17" 72 $ 16.90 | $ 14.10 No Bid $ 16.19| $ 16.49
Blue, Buff, Canary,
Cherry Cream,

(30% minimum) Brightness 92 (mini
mum) Opacity 90 (minimum)

13 Colors in 8.5x11 &
11x17

Send swatch if needed

Comments: 8 Colors in 8.5x14 Only sell by the carton
6 colors in 8.5x11 3 HD
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Domtar Colors Hammermill Fore Colors Exact Multipurpose Hammermill Fore MP
% PC Content: 30% 30%
Brightness: N/A N/A
Opacity: N/A N/A
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

Opening Date: 11/01/10

3389 OF
REBID
Business Paper Field Paper Company Omaha Paper Co. Xerox Corporation XpedX XpedX
E'S EST
Description e Sizes QTY
= PER M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
14 8.5" x 11" 9 $ 12.75| $ 1261 | $ 1352|$ 9.96| $ 9.84
15 8.5" x 14" 2 No Bid $ 16.87 No Bid N/A N/A
- . 16 11" x 17" 46 $ 25.44($ 26.52 | $ 28.38| $ 2029 $ 19.88
Virgin - 28# Color Copier Paper 17 12" x 18" 12_[s 2938 | $ 30.63| $ 3276 $ 24.48] $ 23.89
Super Premium No. 1 Ultra -
Smooth White. Comment§. i Only sell by the carton
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Finch Fine Color Copy Wausua Exact Color [ Xerox Color Expressions| Accent Opaque Digital Navigator Platinum
Brightness: 98 98 100 Bright 96 99
Opacity: 94 93 94.5 97
18 8.5" x 11" 10 $ 6.58|$ 6.00 | No Bid $ 645| $ 6.69
19 11"x 17" 1 $ 14.01|$ 13.00 | No Bid $ 15.00| $ 14.90
20 23" x 35" 30 $ 54.75 | $ 51.00 | No Bid $ 5225 $ 50.92
21 25" x 38" 5 $ 6441 ($ 60.00 | No Bid $ 65.00| $ 63.00
Virgin - Text, 50# Uncoated Offset, Comments:
White Soprocet 23x35, 23x38
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Husky Opaque Offset Williamsburg Offset Williamsburg Navigator Multipurpose
8.5x11, 11x17
Brightness: 94 90
Opacity: 91 94
22 8.5"x 11" 2,400 [$ 7.68|% 7.02 No Bid $ 7.05
23 8.5" x 11" 3HP 2 $ 8.21($ 7.62 No Bid N/A
24 8.5" x 14" 30 $ 10.45|$ 9.69 No Bid $ 10.47
25 11" x 17" 570 $ 1642 | $ 15.23 No Bid $ 15.74
- 26 17.5"x 22.5" 1 $ 31.38($ 29.25 No Bid $ 32.00
wﬂz - Text, 607 Uncoated Offset, =57 23"x 35" 20 |3 64.00 [ $ 59.67 No Bid $ 61.15
28 25" x 38" 84 $ 7530 [ $ 70.20 No Bid $ 71.97
Comments:
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Husky Opague Offset Williamsburg Offset Williamsburg
Brightness: 94 94
Opacity: 93 91
29 8.5" x 11" 1 $ 8.95(% 8.20 No Bid $ 9.00| $ 9.68
30 11"x 17" 1 $ 19.15|$ 17.78 No Bid $ 18.00| $ 19.82
31 17.5" x 22.5" 1 $ 36.40($ 33.93 No Bid N/A $ 37.00
- 32 23" x 35" 22 $ 7467 $ 69.61 No Bid $ 68.00| $ 72.49
wﬂz - Text, 70% Uncoated Offset, = 25" x 38" 5|3 87.85|$ 81.90 No Bid $ 80.00] $ 584.83
Comments: 67.5#
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Husky Opaque Offset Williamsburg Offset Soprpcet Williamsburg
Brightness: 94 94
Opacity: 95 94
34 8.5"x 11" 335 $ 18.49 | $ 16.41 No Bid $ 17.38
35 11" x 17" 50 $ 39.09 [ $ 34.58 No Bid $ 35.87
- 36 23" x 35" 33 $ 154.45|$ 139.19 No Bid $ 145.23
ggz{@;xzr’ 65# Uncoated Comments: _ 11x17 is 17x11
’ Brand/Sheet Bidding: Lynx Opaque Ultra Accent Opaque Cover Accent Digital Opaque
Brightness: 96 96
Opacity: 98 99
37 8.5" x 11" 3,200 [$ 9.43($ 10.21 No Bid $ 9.38
38 8.5" x 11" 3HP 1 $ 11.76 | $ 10.96 No Bid $ 11.97 mill
39 8.5" x 14" 1 $ 12.75| $ 13.31 No Bid $ 14.30 mill
Recycled - 24# Premium or Super 40 11" x 17" 1 $ 2352 ($ 20.93 No Bid $ 23.00 mill
Premium No. 1, Laser Print, Comments: Exact Digital
Smooth, White Brand/Sheet Bidding: Rolland HiTech 50 Wausua Exact Laser Hammermill Laser Print
% PC Content: 50% 30%
Brightness: 96 96
Opacity: 94 92
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3389 OF

Opening Date: 11/01/10

REBID
Business Paper Field Paper Company Omaha Paper Co. Xerox Corporation XpedX XpedX
E'S EST
Description e Sizes QTY
= PER M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
41 23" x 35" 1 $ 68.68 [ $ 69.70 No Bid $ 71.95
42 25" x 38" 1 No Bid $ 82.01 No Bid $ 84.68
Blue, Canary, Cream, Blue, Canary, Cream,
Colors Bidding: Goldenrod, Green, Goldenrod, Gray,Green,
Recycled - Text, 50# Offset Ivory, Pink Ivory, Pink, Tan
Opaque, Colors Comments: No Recycled Content
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Domtar Opaque Colors Springhill Opaque Exact Opaque
% PC Content: 0% 30%
Brightness: N/A N/A
Opacity: 90 N/A
43 8.5"x 11" 150 $ 9.27($ 9.26 No Bid $ 9.47
44 11" x 17" 25 $ 19.62 | $ 18.96 No Bid $ 20.19
45 23" x 35" 44 $ 80.68 [ $ 81.87 No Bid $ 81.84
Blue, Canary, Cream, EIle, CEWE, Cleeiil
Goldenrod, Gray, Green,
Colors Bidding: Goldenrqd, Ivory, Orchard, Peach
Recycled - Text, 60# Offset Green, Ivory, Pink, Gray, . Pink :
Opagque, Colors Tan T
Comments: No Recycled Content
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Domtar Opague Colors Springhill Opaque Exact Opaque
% PC Content: 0% 30%
Brightness: N/A N/A
Opacity: 93 N/A
46 8.5"x 11" 1 $ 10.82 | $ 11.06 No Bid $ 12.00
47 11" x 17" 8 $ 22.89($ 22.12 No Bid $ 23.70
48 23" x 35" 28 $ 94.13($ 95.52 No Bid $ 95.48
Blue, Canary, Cream, Blue, Canary, Cream,
Recycled Text, 70# Offset Opaque, Colors Bidding: Gray, Green, Goldenrod, Qray, Green,
Ivory Ivory, Orchid, Pink, Tan
Colors
Comments: No Recycled Content
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Domtar Opaque Colors Springhill Opaque Exact Opaque
% PC Content: 0% 30%
Brightness: N/A N/A
Opacity: 95 N/A
49 8.5"x 11" 360 $ 16.97 | $ 19.00 No Bid $ 19.37
50 11" x 17" 43 $ 35.73[$ 41.79 No Bid $ 49.00
51 23" x 35" 85 $ 138.14 | $ 165.22 No Bid $ 155.48
Aqua, Blue, Cream,
Blue, Canary, Gray (?rgI:rI\ Ivory,
Colors Bidding: Goldenrod, Green . ¢ .
Ivory, Pink Naturf’sll
Recycled - Cover, 65# Offset ’ Orange, Orchid, Peach,
Opagque, Colors Pink, Tan

11x17 not stocked

Comments: No Recycled Content .
specify colors
Brand/Sheet Bidding: 67# Vellum Bristol W (E:E?I(:rOpaque Exact Opaque
% PC Content: 0% 30%
Brightness: N/A N/A
Opacity: N/A N/A
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3389 OF

Opening Date: 11/01/10

REBID
Business Paper Field Paper Company Omaha Paper Co. Xerox Corporation XpedX XpedX
E'S EST
Description e Sizes QTY
= PER M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
52 8.5" x 11" 320 $ 13.10| $ 12.45 No Bid $ 13271 $ 14.61
53 8.5" x 14" 7 No Bid $ 16.32 No Bid N/A $ 19.25
54 11" x 17" 52 $ 26.20 [ $ 25.64 No Bid $ 2756 | $ 29.29
55 23" x 35" 9 $ 113171 $ 110.74 No Bid N/A $ 131.00
Blue, Cherry, Daffodil,
Emerald,
o FUShSIa’Gi(:g: Grape, _AII Colors except
Recycled - Text, 60# Offset Colors Bidding: Lemon, Lime, Lipstick, Ecllp§e Eltké Sl
! White see attachment
Bright Colors Orange,
Periwinkle, Red,
Turquoise, Yellow
. No Bid on 8.5x14, Not
Comments: .
available
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Domtar Hots Wausau Astrobrights Exact Brighta Astrobrights
% PC Content: 0% virgin
Brightness: N/A N/A
Opacity: N/A N/A
56 8.5" x 11" 100 $ 27.02($ 25.38 No Bid $ 28.98
57 11"x 17" 4 $ 54.03[$ 50.75 No Bid $ 62.00
58 23" x 35" 20 $ 227.69($ 218.22 No Bid $ 249.78
Blue, Daffodile, Emerald,
Fushia All Colors except
Recycled - Cover, 65# Offset Colors Bidding: Lemon, Lime, Lipstick, Eclip§e Black & Stardust
Bright Colors B Orange, White see attachment
Periwinkle, Red, Yellow
Comments:
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Lynx Opaque Cover Wausau Astobrights Astrobrights
% PC Content: 0%
Brightness: 96 N/A
Opacity: 99 N/A
59 8.5"x 11" 285 $ 2316 [ $ 19.71 No Bid $ 3281 $ 21.66
60 11" x 17" 18 $ 48.97 [ $ 42.87 No Bid $ 46.92
61 23" x 35" 19 $ 193.94|$ 171.86 No Bid $ 185.66
Virgin - Cover, 80# Uncoated Comments: 100% PCW More items | Cut Size Digital Cover
Offset, White i stocked see attached 11x17is 17x11
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Lynx Opaque Cover Accent Opaque Cover Conservation Accent Digital
Brightness: 96 96
Opacity: 99 99
62 8.5"x 11" 9 $ 18.29|$ 16.36 No Bid $ 17.35
63 11" x 17" 19 $ 38.58 [ $ 33.95 No Bid $ 37.75
64 22.5"x 35" 12 $ 145471 $ 141.41 No Bid $ 149.92
65 24" x 36" 1 No Bid $ 155.40 No Bid $ 163.72
Recycled - Index, 90#, White Comments: No Recycled Content
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Domtar Index Britewhite Springhill Index Exact
% PC Content: 0% 10%
Brightness: 96 92
Opacity: 98 05
66 8.5" x 11" 35 $ 22.36($ 19.02 No Bid $ 20.92
67 11"x 17" 1 $ 53.39[$ 41.50 No Bid $ 46.00
68 22.5" x 35" 7 $ 178.24 | $ 167.42 No Bid $ 179.00
69 24" x 36" 5 No Bid $ 183.18 No Bid $ 198.00
Recycled - Index, 110#, White Comments: No Recycled Content
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Domtar Index Britewhite Springhill Index Exact
% PC Content: 0% 10%
Brightness: 96 92
Opacity: 98 98
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

Opening Date: 11/01/10

3389 OF
REBID
Business Paper Field Paper Company Omaha Paper Co. Xerox Corporation XpedX XpedX
E'S EST
Description e Sizes QTY
= PER M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
70 8.5" x 11" 5 $ 19.29 | $ 17.44 No Bid $ 17.90
71 11"x 17" 1 $ 41.25($ 36.67 No Bid $ 46.00
72 22.5" x 35" 5 $ 153.84 | $ 149.06 No Bid $ 149.00
73 24" x 36" 12 No Bid N/Q No Bid $ 168.00
Blue, Buff, Canary, FEitee, (i, Gy,
Colors Bidding: Cherry, Green, Clisiyy
Ivory, Salmon Gray, Green, Ivory,
Recycled - Index, 90#, Colors ! Salmon,
Comments: No Recycled Content 11x17 and 24x36 mill
order, no broken cartons
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Domtar Color Index Springhill Index Springhill
% PC Content: 0% 10%
Brightness: N/A N/A
Opacity: 98 N/A
74 8.5"x 11" 75 $ 2357($ 20.48 No Bid $ 20.37
75 11" x 17" 1 $ 48.75 | $ 43.18 No Bid $ 48.00
76 22.5"x 35" 13 $ 188.50 | $ 169.75 No Bid $ 173.84
77 24" x 36" 1 No Bid N/Q $ 190.00
Blue, Buff, Canary, Blue, Buff, Canary,
Colors Bidding: Cherry, Green Chreiiyy
Recycled - Index, 110#, Colors i ! Gray, Green, Ivory,
Ivory, Salmon
Salmon,
Comments: No Recycled Content
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Domtar Color Index Springhill Index Springhill
% PC Content: 0% 10%
Brightness: N/A N/A
Opacity: 98 N/A
78 23" x 35" 10 $ 66.64 | $ 68.43 No Bid $ 69.00
79 24" x 36" 1 $ 7112 $ 68.43 No Bid $ 73.00
80 25" x 38" 1 $ 7840 % 74.84 No Bid $ 79.00
81 28" x 40" 1 $ 92.40($ 88.74 No Bid $ 94.00
OPC Gloss is 10% PC
Virgin - #2 Gloss TEXT, 70#, White Comments: 10% Recycled content and FSC
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Gloss OPC Gloss Endurance
Brightness: 90 91
Opacity: 92.5 94
82 23" x 35" 9 $ 66.64 [ $ 68.43 No Bid N/A
83 24" x 36" 1 $ 7112 $ 68.43 No Bid N/A
84 25" x 38" 1 $ 78.40($ 74.84 No Bid N/A
85 28" x 40" 1 $ 92.40 [ $ 88.74 No Bid N/A
Recycled - #2 Gloss TEXT, X OPC Gloss is 10% PC
70#, White Comments: content and FSC Not Stocked
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Gloss OPC Gloss
% PC Content: 10% 10%
Brightness: 90 91
Opacity: 92.5 94
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3389 OF
REBID

Opening Date: 11/01/10

Business Paper Field Paper Company Omaha Paper Co. Xerox Corporation XpedX XpedX
B EST
Description e Sizes QTY
= PER M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
86 8.5"x 11" 108 $ 12921 $ 9.18 17.60 $ 13.49
87 11"x 17" 13 $ 2584 (% 18.36 34.10 $ 22.79
88 23" x 35" 50 $ 76.16 [ $ 78.05 No Bid $ 75.98
89 24" x 36" 93 $ 8176 $ 78.05 No Bid $ 83.90
90 25" x 38" 205 $ 89.60 [ $ 85.54 No Bid $ 96.96
91 28" x 40" 6 $ 10584 | $ 100.50 No Bid $ 109.00
- ) OPC Gloss is 10% PC .
Virgin - #2 Gloss TEXT, 80#, White Comments: 10% Recycled content and FSC Xerox DC Elite Gloss Endyrance - More sizes
- available see attached
certified
Endurance (except
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Gloss OPC Gloss 8.5x11 is Sterling Ultra)
25x38 skid pack 9500
Brightness: 90 91 94
Opacity: 95 96
92 8.5"x 11" 2 $ 12921 $ 9.18 No Bid $ 13.49
93 11"x 17" 1 $ 2584 $ 18.36 No Bid $ 28.00
94 23" x 35" 1 $ 76.16 [ $ 78.05 No Bid $ 138.00
95 24" x 36" 1 $ 81.76 [ $ 78.05 No Bid $ 117.00
96 25" x 38" 1 $ 89.60 [ $ 85.54 No Bid 138.00 | $ 129.00
97 28" x 40" 1 $ 105.84 | $ 100.50 No Bid $ 152.00
Recycled - #2 Gloss TEXT, 80#, OPC Gloss is 10% PC
White Comments: content and FSC
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Gloss OPC Gloss Utoplg;vggNXTRA Sterling Ultra
% PC Content: 10% 10% 30%
Brightness: 90 91
Opacity: 95 96
98 23" x 35" 1 $ 94.64 | $ 97.30 No Bid $ 96.00
99 24" x 36" 3 $ 101.92 | $ 97.30 No Bid skid $105.00
100 25" x 38" 14 $ 112.00 | $ 106.92 No Bid $ 115.00
101 28" x 40" 1 $ 132.16 | $ 126.17 No Bid $ 135.00
OPC Gloss is 10% PC More sizes available
Virgin - #2 Gloss TEXT, 100#, White Comments: 10 % Recycled content and FSC
o see attached
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Gloss OPC Gloss Xerox DC Elite Gloss Endurance
Brightness: 90 91 94
Opacity: 96 98
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3389 OF

Opening Date: 11/01/10

REBID
Business Paper Field Paper Company Omaha Paper Co. Xerox Corporation XpedX XpedX
B EST
Description e Sizes QTY
= PER M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
102 23" x 35" 2 $ 94.64 | $ 97.30 No Bid $ 136.00
103 24" x 36" 1 $ 101.92 | $ 97.30 No Bid $ 147.00
104 25" x 38" 1 $ 112.00 | $ 106.92 No Bid $ 160.00
105 28" x 40" 1 $ 132.16 | $ 126.17 No Bid $ 190.00
OPC Gloss is 10% PC
Re(?ycled - #2 Gloss TEXT, 100#, Comments: content and FSC
White o
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Gloss OPC Gloss Sterling Ultra
% PC Content: 10% 10%
Brightness: 90 91
Opacity: 96 98
106 23" x 35" 1 $ 66.64 | $ 68.43 No Bid $ 68.00
107 24" x 36" 8 $ 78.40($ 68.43 No Bid $ 74.00
108 25" x 38" 4 $ 7840 $ 74.84 No Bid $ 80.00
109 28" x 40" 1 $ 92.40($ 88.74 No Bid $ 96.00
_ . OPC Silk is 10% PC
Virgin - #2 Matte TEXT, 70#, White Comments: 10% Recycled content and FSC
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Satin OPC Slik Endurance Silk
Brightness: 90 91
Opacity: 93.5 95
110 23" x 35" 3 $ 76.16 [ $ 78.05 No Bid $ 77.00
111 24" x 36" 162 $ 89.60 [ $ 78.05 No Bid $ 89.76
112 25" x 38" 40 $ 89.60 [ $ 85.54 No Bid $ 89.00
113 28" x 40" 5 $ 105.84 | $ 100.50 No Bid $ 109.00
_ . OPC Slik is 10% PC
Virgin - #2 Matte TEXT, 80, White Comments: 10 % Recycled content and FSC
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Satin OPC Slik Endurance Silk
Brightness: 90 91
Opacity: 94 96
114 23" x 35" 3 $ 76.16 [ $ 78.05 No Bid $ 109.00
115 24" x 36" 1 $ 89.60 [ $ 78.05 No Bid $ 118.00
116 25" x 38" 4 $ 89.60 [ $ 85.54 No Bid $ 128.00
117 28" x 40" 1 $ 105.84 | $ 100.50 No Bid $ 152.00
OPC Silk is 10% PC
Regycled - #2 Matte TEXT, 80#, Comments: Appleton's Altima Satin content and FSC
White o
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: 10% OPC Silk Sterling Ultra
% PC Content: 90 10%
Brightness: 94 91
Opacity: 94.64 96
118 23" x 35" 4 $ 94.64 | $ 97.30 No Bid $ 96.00
119 24" x 36" 13 $ 112.00| $ 97.30 No Bid $ 104.00
120 25" x 38" 10 $ 112.00 | $ 106.92 No Bid $ 117.00
121 28" x 40" 2 $ 132.16 | $ 126.17 No Bid $ 136.00
Virgin - #2 Matte TEXT, 100#, OPC Silk is 10% PC
White Comments: 10% Recycled content and FSC
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Satin OPC Silk Endurance Silk
Brightness: 90 91%
Opacity: 95 98
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3389 OF

Opening Date: 11/01/10

REBID
Business Paper Field Paper Company Omaha Paper Co. Xerox Corporation XpedX XpedX
B EST
Description e Sizes QTY
= PER M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
122 23" x 35" 3 $ 76.16 [ $ 97.30 No Bid $ 136.00
123 24" x 36" 1 $ 112.00| $ 97.30 No Bid N/A
124 25" x 38" 2 $ 112.00 | $ 106.92 No Bid $ 167.00
125 28" x 40" 1 $ 132.16 | $ 126.17 No Bid $ 190.00
OPC Silk is 10% PC
Re(?ycled - #2 Matte TEXT, 1004, Comments: content and FSC
White o
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Satin OPC Silk Sterling Ultra
% PC Content: 10% Recycled 10%
Brightness: 90 91
Opacity: 95 98
126 8.5"x 11" 40 $ 23.63|$ 17391 $ 33.26 N/A
127 11" x 17" 5 $ 47.25($ 34.78 | $ 64.14 $ 41.95
128 23" x 35" 10 $ 143841 % 149.61 No Bid $ 144.50
129 24" x 36" 35 $ 169.36 | $ 149.61 No Bid N/A
130 25" x 38" 35 $ 169.36 | $ 162.41 No Bid $ 167.75
- 131 26" x 40" 3 $ 185.60 | $ 194.12 No Bid $ 191.00
://\;E:Z - #2 Gloss COVER, 80#, 132 28" x 40" 3 |3 200.10[ $ 194.12 No Bid $ 207.00
OPC Gloss cover is 10%
Comments: 10% Recycled PC content and FSC Only sell by the carton
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Gloss OPC Gloss cover DC Elite Gloss Endurance
Brightness: 90 91 94
Opacity: 97 98
133 8.5"x 11" 3 $ 23.63[$ 17.39 No Bid $ 26.00
134 11"x 17" 1 $ 47.25($ 34.78 No Bid $ 53.00
135 23" x 35" 1 $ 14384 | $ 149.61 No Bid $ 205.00
136 24" x 36" 1 $ 169.36 | $ 149.61 No Bid N/A
137 25" x 38" 2 $ 169.36 | $ 162.41 No Bid $ 242.00
138 26" x 40" 1 $ 185.60 | $ 194.12 No Bid $ 265.00
Recycled - #2 Gloss COVER, 80#, | 139 28" x 40" 1 $ 200.10 [ $ 194.12 No Bid $ 290.00
White OPC Gloss cover is 10%
Comments: 10% Recycled PC content and FSC
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Gloss OPC Gloss cover Sterling Ultra
% PC Content: 10% 10%
Brightness: 90 91
Opacity: 97 98
140 23" x 35" 14 $ 179.80 | $ 184.66 No Bid $ 179.00
141 24" x 36" 13 $ 211.70 [ $ 184.66 No Bid N/A
142 25" x 38" 18 $ 21170 $ 203.02 No Bid $ 213.00
143 26" x 40" 1 $ 232.00 [ $ 239.72 No Bid $ 240.00
Virgin - #2 Gloss COVER, 100#, 144 28" x 40" 3 $ 249.98 [ $ 239.72 No Bid $ 260.00
White OPC Gloss cover is 10%
Comments: 10 % Recycled PC content and FSC
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Gloss OPC Gloss cover Endurance
Brightness: 90 91
Opacity: 98 98
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3389 OF

Opening Date: 11/01/10

REBID
Business Paper Field Paper Company Omaha Paper Co. Xerox Corporation XpedX XpedX
B EST
Description e Sizes QTY
= PER M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
145 23" x 35" 1 $ 179.80 | $ 184.66 No Bid $ 256.00
146 24" x 36" 1 $ 211.70 [ $ 184.66 No Bid N/A
147 25" x 38" 1 $ 211.70($ 203.02 No Bid $ 303.00
148 26" x 40" 1 $ 232.00($ 239.72 No Bid N/A
149 28" x 40" 1 $ 249.98 [ $ 239.72 No Bid $ 355.00
Recycled - #2 Gloss COVER, 100#, OPC Gloss cover is 10%
White Comments: PC content and FSC
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Gloss OPC Gloss cover Sterling Ultra
% PC Content: 10% 10%
Brightness: 90 91
Opacity: 98 98
150 23" x 35" 9 $ 143.84 | $ 149.61 No Bid $ 147.00
151 24" x 36" 9 $ 169.36 | $ 149.61 No Bid N/A
152 25" x 38" 8 $ 169.36 | $ 162.41 No Bid $ 174.00
153 26" x 40" 2 $ 185.60 | $ 194.12 No Bid $ 193.00
Virgin - #2 Matte COVER, 80#, 154 28" x 40" 5 $ 199.52 | $ i .194'12 No Bid $ 212.00
White OPC Silk cover is 10%
Comments: 10 % Recycled PC content and FSC
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Satin OPC Silk cover Endurance
Brightness: 90 91
Opacity: 97 98
155 23" x 35" 1 $ 143.84 | $ 149.61 No Bid $ 205.00
156 24" x 36" 3 $ 169.36 | $ 149.61 No Bid N/A
157 25" x 38" 1 $ 169.36 | $ 162.41 No Bid $ 242.00
158 26" x 40" 1 $ 185.60 | $ 194.12 No Bid $ 265.00
159 28" x 40" 1 $ 199.52 | $ 194.12 No Bid $ 285.00
Recycled - #2 Matte COVER, 80#, OPC Silk cover is 10%
White Comments: PC content and FSC
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: 10% OPC Silk cover Sterling Ultra
% PC Content: Appleton's Altima Satin 10%
Brightness: 90 91
Opacity: 97 98
160 23" x 35" 1 $ 179.80 | $ 184.66 No Bid $ 185.00
161 24" x 36" 1 $ 21170 $ 184.66 No Bid N/A
162 25" x 38" 3 $ 211.70($ 203.02 No Bid $ 219.00
163 26" x 40" 1 $ 232.00( $ 239.72 No Bid N/A
Virgin - #2 Matte COVER, 1004, 164 28" x 40" 1 $ 249.98 [ $ i .239.72 No Bid $ 260.00
White OPC Silk cover is 10%
Comments: 10% Recycled PC content and FSC
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Satin OPC Silk cover Endurance
Brightness: 90 91
Opacity: 97 98
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Buyer: Michelle Kemper

3389 OF

Opening Date: 11/01/10

REBID
Business Paper Field Paper Company Omaha Paper Co. Xerox Corporation XpedX XpedX
E'S EST
Description e Sizes QTY
= PER M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
165 23" x 35" 1 $ 179.80 | $ 184.66 No Bid $ 193.00
166 24" x 36" 1 $ 211.70 [ $ 184.66 No Bid N/A
167 25" x 38" 1 $ 211.70($ 203.02 No Bid $ 227.00
168 26" x 40" 1 $ 232.00($ 239.72 No Bid $ 248.00
169 28" x 40" 1 $ 249.98 [ $ 239.72 No Bid $ 266.00
Recycled - #2 Matte COVER, 100#, OPC Silk cover is 10%
White Comments: PC content and FSC
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Satin OPC Silk cover Fortune
% PC Content: 10% 10%
Brightness: 90 91
Opacity: 98 98
170 23 x 35" .022 thickness 10 $ 171.00 | $ 171.89 No Bid $ 17.90
171 8.5 x 11" .026 thickness 35 $ 2550 [ $ 60.90 No Bid $ 19.49
172 11 x 17" .026 thickness 18 $ 49.50 [ $ 121.80 No Bid $ 18.90
#170 - 111 sheets per
Chipboard, Must contain PC re- Comments: bundle / #171 #172 - 500 100% Recycled Paper
cycled content. sheets per bundle
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Boxboard Beloit Advantage America
% PC Content: 90% 30%
Brightness: N/A N/A
Opacity: N/A N/A
173 | packed in cartons 3 $ 260.00 [ $ 250.00 No Bid $ 225.00
Comments: No Recycled Content
Manilla Tags, 24"x36", 150#, Brand/Sheet Bidding: Domtar Tag Springhill Tag Springhill
Must contain PC recycled. % PC Content: 0% 30% 0%
Brightness: 96 N/A
Opacity: 98 N/A
174 23" x 35" 4 $ 66.64 [ $ 68.43 No Bid $ 95.00
175 24" x 36" 1 $ 78.40($ 68.43 No Bid $ 104.00
176 25" x 38" 6 $ 78.40 [ $ 74.84 No Bid $ 112.00
177 28" x 40" 1 $ 92.40($ 88.74 No Bid $ 135.00
OPC Silk is 10% PC
Regycled - #2 Matte TEXT, 70#, Comments: content and FSC
White o
certified
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Appleton's Altima Satin OPC Silk Sterling Ultra
% PC Content: 10% 10%
Brightness: 90 91
Opacity: 93.5 05
178 8.5" x 11" 100 $ 6.60|$ 6.15| $ 8.46 $ 7.24
179 8.5" x 11" 3HP 1 $ 720 $ 6.60 | $ 8.86 $ 8.24
180 8.5" x 11" Xprs Pac 1 No Bid $ 6.60 No Bid $ 7.64
181 8.5" x 14" 10 $ 9.15($ 840|$ 11.43 $ 9.50
. 182 11" x 17" 50 $ 1435|$ 13.20 | $ 17.72 $ 14.93
Recycled - Premium No. 4 Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2002) for Permanence: -
Xerographic 20# Copier Paper, o Yes Yes Yes/Certified Yes
Smooth, White Yes/No/Cert|f|ed{Other
Comments: Only sell by the carton
Brand/Sheet Bidding: Boise Aspen 30 Great White Xerox Great White
% PC Content: 30% 30% 0 30%
Brightness: 92 92 92
Opacity: 87 86 88
Payment Terms 2% 30 Days 2% 30 Days 0% 30 Days 0% 0%
Delivery Days ARO 5 to 8 Days 1to 7 Days 3 to 7 Days 3 to 15 Days 3 to 15 Days
Comments

Award Explanation:
Contract awarded to overall low bidder

Page 10 of 10



