Buyer: Robert Thompson

3358 OF
Air Filters

AWARD

Opening Date: 07-16-10

AAF McQuay Inc

ﬁ Filters for Air Handling Units dba Air Cleaners Inc The Filter Shop Inc | Glasfloss Industries La_lmpe S .Cl.ean Neb_raska Alr Interline Brands Inc

e ) Air Specialists Filter Inc dba Sexauer

5 AAF International
Description [ Q1Y JuOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

HIGH CAPACITY PLEATED FILTERS (13-15 PLEATS)

1 7-1/2x29-1/2x1/2, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea No Bid %) $ 325($ 383|$ 3.07($ 2.55 No Bid
Part number: No Quote DP40 HVPSP7H29H1 SP7.529.5X5PL | same as description Not Available

2 7-3/4x33-1/2x1/2, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea No Bid (%) $ 325($% 4223 455 $ 2.55 No Bid
Part number: No Quote DP40 HVPSP7M33H1 SP7.75X33.5X5PL | same as description Not Available

3 7-3/4x43-3/4x1/2, Pleated Filter 21 | EA No Bid (%) $ 355($% 6.78 | $ 455 $ 3.05 No Bid
Part number: No Quote DP40 HVPSP7M43M1 | SP7.75X43.75X5PL | same as description Not Available

4 8-1/2x30-1/2x1/2, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea No Bid %) $ 3.75($ 422 % 3.07($%$ 2.55 No Bid
Part number: No Quote DP40 HVPSP8H30H1 SP8.5X30.5X.5PL | same as description Not Available

5 9-3/3x23-3/4x1/2, Pleated Filter 21 | EA No Bid %] $ 355 (% 383 (3% 3.07($%$ 2.55 No Bid
Part number: No Quote DP40 HVPSP9M23M1 | SP9.75X23.75X.5PL | same as description Not Available

6 10-1/2x22-1/2x1/2 Pleated Filter 12 | Ea No Bid %) $ 325($% 383 (3% 3.07($%$ 2.55 No Bid
Part number: No Quote DP40 HVPSP10H22H1 | SP10.5X22.5X.5PL | same as description Not Available

7 7-3/4x21-3/4x1, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 2.60 4.60 | $ 325($% 339 (3% 256 | $ 205| % 3.47
Part number: 173-11-07G21G 102-031-199 DP40 HVPSP7M21M1 | SP7.75X21.75X1PL | same as description 80255.01199

s 7-3/4x41-3/4x1, Pleated Filter oa | EA $ 6.99 1049 | $ 355 (% 6.78 | $ 500 )| $ 325($% 7.09
Part number: 173-11-07G41G 102-031-1992 DP40 HVPSP7M41M1 | SP7.75X41.75X1PL | same as description 80255D01399

9 7-3/4x43-3/4x1, Pleated Filter oa | EA $ 6.99 1049 | $ 355 (% 6.78 | $ 514 | $ 325($% 7.09
Part number: 173-11-07G43G 102-031-1992 DP40 HVPSP7M43M1 | SP7.75X43.75X1PL | same as description 80255D01399

10 8x32x1, Pleated Filter 12 | EA $ 3.66 5.06 | $ 3.65 (% 422 % 3.07($%$ 2551 % 7.09
Part number: 173-11-08A32A 102-031-299 DP40 HVPSP8321 SP8X32X1PL same as description 80255D01399

1 10x16x1, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 2.50 4.60 [ $ 325($% 339($% 3.00($ 1771 $ 3.47
Part number: 173-11-10A16A 102-031-199 DP40 HVPSP10161 SP10X16X1PL same as description 80255.01199

12 10x20x1, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 2.26 2871 % 280 | $ 226 | $ 2271 $ 2571 % 2.25
Part number: 173-200-011 102-701-001 DP40 HVP10201 10436 same as description 80255.011020

13 10x32x1, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 3.62 6421 $ 3.65 (% 474 | $ 380 (3% 3.05($% 7.09
Part number: 173-11-10A32A 102-031-399 DP40 HVPSP10321 SP10X32X1PL same as description 80255D01399

14 11x17x1, Pleated Filter 2a | EA $ 3.01 460 [ $ 325($ 301($ 256 | $ 205| % 3.47
Part number: 173-11-11A17A 102-031-199 DP40 HVPSP11171 SP11X17X1PL same as description 80255.01199

15 12x25x1, Pleated Filter 2a | Ea $ 4.28 353($ 355($ 231 | % 235| % 255| % 2.41
Part number: 173-11-12A25A 102-031-003 DP40 HVP12251 10440 same as description 80255.011225

16 14x14x1, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 2.84 4.60 | $ 327 ($ 256 | $ 2401 $ 205| % 2.06
Part number: 173-11-14A14A 102-031-199 DP40 HVP14141 SP10441C1414 | same as description 80255.011414

17 14x17x1, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 2.88 506 | $ 327 ($ 383 (3% 2411 $ 2551 % 3.49
Part number: 173-11-14A17A 102-031-299 DP40 HVPSP14171 SP14X17X1PL same as description 80255.01299

18 14x25x1, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 2.69 322 (3% 3.08[$ 269 | $ 2701 $ 3.06 [ $ 2.78
Part number: 173-375-011 102-701-004 DP40 HVP14251 10442 same as description 80255.11425

19 14x27x1, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 4.28 6421 $ 6.64|9$ 4.74 | $ 380 (3% 3.05($% 3.92
Part number: 173-11-14A27A 102-031-399 DP40 HVPSP14271 SP14X27X1PL same as description 80255.01399

20 16x16x1, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 2.57 380 (3% 346 [ $ 318 | $ 2701 $ 3.06 [ $ 2.49
Part number: 173-448-011 102-031-007 DP40 HVP16161 10483 same as description 80255.011616

21 16x20x1, Pleated Filter 250 | EA $ 1.97 2701 $ 2391 $ 197 | $ 198 | $ 2471 $ 2.39
Part number: 173-500-011 102-701-006 DP40 HVP16201 10444 same as description 80255.011620
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22 16x22x1, Pleated Filter 108 | EA $ 376 | $ 642 | $ 355|$ 3.76 | $ 370 | $ 3.05|$ 3.92
Part number: 173-11-16A22A 102-031-399 DP40 HVPSP16221 SP16X22X1PL same as description 80255.01399

HIGH CAPACITY PLEATED FILTERS (13-15 PLEATS) (continued)

23 16x22-1/2x1, Pleated Filter 12 | EA $ 420 $ 642 | $ 355|$ 474 | $ 370 $ 3.05|$ 3.92
Part number: 173-11-16A22E 102-031-399 DP40 HVPSP1622H1 SP16X22.5X1PL | same as description 80255.01399

24 16x23x1, Pleated Filter 6 | Ea $ 420 $ 642 $ 355|$ 474 | $ 370 [ $ 3.05(% 3.92
Part number: 173-11-16A23A 102-031-399 DP40 HVPSP16231 SP16X23X1PL same as description 80255.01399

25 16x25x1, Pleated Filter 508 | EA $ 216 [ $ 288 $ 269 | $ 216 | $ 217 $ 276 [ $ 2.66
Part number: 173-600-011 102-701-007 DP40 HVP16251 10445 same as description 80255.011625

26 18x24x1, Pleated Filter 6 | Ea $ 277 $ 345 $ 358 (% 277 | $ 278 $ 358 (% 2.77
Part number: 173-635-011 102-031-016 DP40 HVP18241 10488 same as description 80255.011824

27 19x27x1, Pleated Filter 6 | Ea $ 4111 $ 713 $ 583 (% 5.66 | $ 435 $ 420 $ 4.40
Part number: 173-665-011 102-031-599 DP40 HVPSP19271 SP19X27X1PL same as description 80255.01599

28 19-1/2x20x1, Pleated Filter 24 | EA $ 420 $ 6.79 [ $ 269 $ 474 | $ 325($ 3.05(% 3.92
Part number: 173-11-19E20A 102-031-499 DP40 HVPSP19H201 SP19.5X20X1PL | same as description 80255.01399

29 20x20x1, Pleated Filter 336 | EA $ 218 $ 290 $ 269 $ 218 | $ 219 $ 2771 $ 2.64
Part number: 173-700-011 102-701-008 DP40 HVP20201 10447 same as description 80255.012020

30 20x22x1, Pleated Filter 12 | EA $ 4391 $ 6.79 [ $ 336 ([ $ 358 | $ 350($ 358 (% 4.13
Part number: 173-11-20A22A 102-031-499 DP40 HVP20221 SP20X22X1PL same as description 80255.01499

31 20x24x1, Pleated Filter 24 | EA $ 313 [ $ 347 $ 336 (% 434 | $ 341 (| $ 3.06 (% 2.83
Part number: 173-782-011 102-031-017 DP40 HVP20241 10489 same as description 80255.012024

32 20x25x1, Pleated Filter 208 | EA $ 236 $ 316 [ $ 311 ( $ 236 | $ 238 [ $ 299 $ 2.95
Part number: 173-800-011 102-701-009 DP40 HVP20251 10448 same as description 80255.012025

23 22x22x1, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 4391 $ 6.79 [ $ 324 $ 398 | % 435 $ 358 (% 4.13
Part number: 173-11-22A22A 102-031-499 DP40 HVP22221 10490 same as description 80255.01499

34 22x26-3/4x1, Pleated Filter 28 | EA $ 453 | $ 713 $ 625 $ 5.66 | $ 488 | $ 420 $ 4.40
Part number: 173-11-22A26G 102-031-599 DP40 HVPSP2226M1 SP22X26.75X1PL | same as description 80255.01599

35 24x24x1, Pleated Filter 9% | Ea $ 237 $ 341 (| $ 3241 $ 237 $ 238 [ $ 3.26 | $ 3.16
Part number: 173-863-011 102-701-010 DP40 HVP24241 10449 same as description 80255.012424

36 24x28x1, Pleated Filter 60 | EA $ 521($ 736 $ 799 | $ 6.08 | $ 545 $ 420 $ 4.41
Part number: 173-11-24A28A 102-031-699 DP40 HVPSP24281 SP24X28X1PL same as description 80255.01699

37 11-3/4x24-3/4x2, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 5441 $ 588 | $ 298 | $ 494 | $ 3.00($ 3.05(% 5.35
Part number: 170-12-11G24G 102-032-299 DP40 HVPSP11M24M2 |[SP11.75X24.75X2PL| same as description 80255.02299

38 12x20x2, Pleated Filter 12 | EA $ 288 $ 4111 $ 327 $ 288 | $ 289 $ 3.05(% 2.15
Part number: 170-112-314 102-032-002 DP40 HVP12202 10492 same as description 80255.021220

39 12x24x2, Pleated Filter 122 | EA $ 263 $ 353($ 298 ([ $ 263 $ 264 $ 2771 $ 241
Part number: 170-112-319 102-701-011 DP40 HVP12242 10452 same as description 80255.021224

0 16x18x2, Pleated Filter 28 | EA $ 485 $ 588 | $ 310 [ $ 485 | $ 350($ 255($ 5.35
Part number: 170-12-16A18A 102-032-299 DP40 HVPSP16182 SP10456C16X18X12| same as description 80255.02299

7 16x20x2, Pleated Filter 858 | EA $ 251 ($ 362 (% 287 $ 251 $ 252 $ 263 $ 2.74
Part number: 170-112-500 102-701-016 DP40 HVP16202 10456 same as description 80255.021620

42 16x24x2, Pleated Filter 12 | EA $ 296 [ $ 4241 $ 394 $ 296 | $ 297 $ 362 (% 3.02
Part number: 170-112-524 102-701-053 DP40 HVP16242 10457 same as description 80255.021624

1o |16x25x2, Pleated Filter a7anl =a LS 275 $ 394 $ 290 [ $ 275 $ 276 [ $ 299 $ 3.18
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 [Part number: i el 170-112-600 102-701-017 DP40 HVP16252 10458 same as description 80255.021625
a4 18x20x2, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 542 | $ 7201 $ 438 $ 337 (3% 449 (% 417 $ 3.07
Part number: 170-12-18A20A 102-032-399 DP40 HVP18202 35532 same as description 80255.021820
HIGH CAPACITY PLEATED FILTERS (13-15 PLEATS) (continued)
a5 18x24x2, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 330 (% 428 | $ 431($ 330 (3% 331($ 3.65 (% 3.14
Part number: 170-112-635 102-701-018 DP40 HVP18242 10459 same as description 80255.021824
16 18x25x2, Pleated Filter 18 | EA $ 387 $ 558 | $ 438 [ $ 352|$ 449 [ $ 417 [ $ 3.51
Part number: 170-112-631 102-032-009 DP40 HVP18252 10495 same as description 80255.021825
a7 20x20x2, Pleated Filter 1476 | EA $ 285| % 3.93($% 2951 $ 285| % 286 | $ 3.01($%$ 3.16
Part number: 170-112-700 102-701-019 DP40 HVP20202 10460 same as description 80255.022020
48 20x22x2, Pleated Filter 60 | EA $ 569 | $ 7781 $ 385 (% 5.69 | $ 410($ 4.08 | $ 6.39
Part number: 170-12-20A22A 102-032-499 DP40 HVPSP20222 SP20X22X2PL same as description 80255.02499
49 20x24x2, Pleated Filter 108 | EA $ 331 (8% 436 $ 3.65 (% 331($% 331($ 372 $ 3.34
Part number: 170-112-782 102-701-020 DP40 HVP20242 10461 same as description 80255.022024
50 20x25x2, Pleated Filter 2136 | EA $ 316 [ $ 436 $ 340 ($ 316 | $ 316 [ $ 345($ 3.65
Part number: 170-112-800 102-701-021 DP40 HVP20252 10462 same as description 80255.022025
51 24x24x2, Pleated Filter 960 | EA $ 362 (% 470 $ 3.79($ 3.62 | $ 3.62 % 391 (8% 3.68
Part number: 170-112-863 102-701-022 DP40 HVP24242 10463 same as description 80255.022424
52 24x25x2, Pleated Filter 36 | ea $ 6.10 | $ 9.33| % 550 | $ 712 | $ 510 | $ 470 $ 7.40
Part number: 170-12-24A25A 102-032-699 DP40 HVPSP24252 SP24X25X2PL same as description 80255.02699
53 25x25x2, Pleated Filter oa | EA $ 415($ 598 | $ 450 ($ 415 $ 415($ 484 % 4.37
Part number: 170-112-870 102-701-050 DP40 HVP25252 10464 same as description 80255.022525
54 27-1/2x29-1/4x2, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 13421 $ 17151 $ 1025 | $ 8.28 | $ 6.95| % 836 | $ 10.52
Part number: 170-12-27E29C 102-032-4992 DP40 HVPSP27H29D2 | SP27.5X29.25X2PL | same as description 80255D02999
55 12x24x4, Pleated Filter oa | EA $ 439 (% 6.35| % 3.90($ 439 $ 440 (3% 432 % 5.10
Part number: 179-411-319 102-701-023 DP40 HVP12244 10465 same as description 80255.041224
56 16x20x4, Pleated Filter 60 | EA $ 464 % 6.53 | $ 444 $ 4.64 | $ 464 % 5541 % 5.82
Part number: 179-411-500 102-701-025 DP40 HVP16204 10466 same as description 80255.041620
57 16x25x4, Pleated Filter 6 |Ea $ 5.05($% 7211 $ 494 [ $ 5.05 | $ 505| % 5171 $ 6.54
Part number: 179-411-600 102-701-026 DP40 HVP16254 10467 same as description 80255.041625
58 16x29x4, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 2254 $ 8.03[$ 11251 $ 1173 | $ 1050 | $ 815 $ 11.69
Part number: 179-43-16A29A 102-032-499 DP40 HVPSP16294 SP16294 same as description 80255.04499
59 20x20x4, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 597 $ 7211 % 533| % 503 | $ 510 | $ 517 | $ 6.57
Part number: 179-411-700 102-701-028 DP40 HVP20204 10469 same as description 80255.042020
60 20x24x4, Pleated Filter 30 | Ea $ 563 % 7941 % 6.00 | $ 5.63 | $ 563 | % 5971 % 6.84
Part number: 179-411-859 102-701-029 DP40 HVP20244 10470 same as description 80255.042024
61 24x24x4, Pleated Filter 108 | EA $ 594 $ 8.64 | $ 6.00 | $ 594 | $ 594 | % 6.54 | $ 7.33
Part number: 179-411-863 102-701-031 DP40 HVP24244 10472 same as description 80255.042424
62 20x25x5, Pleated Filter 20 | EA $ 16.98 %) $ 1280 | $ 1698 | $ 13.00 | $ 14.35 No Bid
Part number: 142-305-800 No Quote DP40 ABP20255M11 12428 same as description Not Available
STANDARD CAPACITY PLEATED FILTERS (10-12 PLEATS)
63 8x20x1, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 2531 % 433 (% 238 | $ 289 | $ 268 | $ 205| % 3.47
Part number: 174-01-08A20A 102-041-199 MX40 ZLPSP8201 SP8X20X1PL same as description 80055.01199
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64 8-1/4x19-7/8x1, Pleated Filter 12 | EA $ 2531 $ 4331 $ 265| % 333 $ 256 [ $ 205 $ 3.47
Part number: 174-01-08C19H 102-041-199 MX40 ZLPSP8D19P1 |SP8.25X19.875X1PL| same as description 80055.01199

65 8-1/4x27-3/4x1, Pleated Filter 28 | EA $ 3141 $ 4771 $ 265|$ 375 $ 3.07($ 255($ 3.72
Part number: 174-01-08C27G 102-041-299 MX40 ZLPSP8D27M1 SP8.25X27.75X1PL | same as description 80055.01299

STANDARD CAPACITY PLEATED FILTERS (10-12 PLEATS) (continued)

66 8-1/4x31-3/4x1, Pleated Filter 20 | Ea $ 314 (3% 4771 $ 270 | $ 414 | $ 3.07($ 255($ 7.10
Part number: 174-01-08C31G 102-041-299 MX40 ZLPSP8D31M1 SP8.25X31.75X1PL | same as description 80055D01399

67 8-1/4x43-3/4x1, Pleated Filter 12 | EA $ 819 $ 981 | $ 270 | $ 6.67 | $ 5.00 [ $ 3.05(% 7.10
Part number: 174-01-08C43G 102-041-1992 MX40 ZLPSP8D43M1 SP8.2543.75X1PL | same as description 80055D01399

68 8-1/2x19-3/4x1, Pleated Filter 72 | ea $ 282 $ 4331 $ 265($ 333 3% 256 $ 205 $ 3.47
Part number: 174-01-08E19G 102-041-199 MX40 ZLPSP8H19M1 SP8.5X19.75X1PL | same as description 80055.01199

69 8-1/2x20x1, Pleated Filter 24 | EA $ 283 $ 4331 $ 265($ 333 3% 268 $ 205 $ 3.47
Part number: 174-01-08E20A 102-041-199 MX40 ZLPSP8H201 SP8.5X20X1PL same as description 80055.01199

70 8-1/2x23-3/4x1, Pleated Filter 12 | EA $ 297 $ 4771 $ 265($ 375 $ 3.07($ 255 $ 3.72
Part number: 174-01-08E23G 102-041-299 MX40 ZLPSP8H23M1 SP8.5X23.75X1PL | same as description 80055.01299

7 8-1/2x27-3/4x1, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 3.13[$ 4771 $ 265($ 375 $ 307 ($ 255($ 3.72
Part number: 174-01-08E27G 102-041-299 MX40 ZLPSP8H27M1 SP8.5X27.75X1PL | same as description 80055.01299

72 8-1/2x32x1, Pleated Filter 24 | EA $ 3.28|$ 4771 $ 265($ 414 | $ 3.07($ 255 $ 7.10
Part number: 174-01-08E32A 102-041-299 MX40 ZLPSP8H321 SP8.5X32X1PL same as description 80055D01399

73 8-1/2x35-3/4x1, Pleated Filter 24 | EA $ 540 $ 6.03[$ 265($ 6.67 | $ 5.00 [ $ 3.05(% 7.10
Part number: 174-01-08E35G 102-041-399 MX40 ZLPSP8H35M1 SP8.5X35.75X1PL | same as description 80055D01399

74 8-1/2x36x1, Pleated Filter 24 | EA $ 540 $ 6.03$ 265($ 6.67 | $ 5.00 [ $ 3.05(% 7.10
Part number: 174-01-08E36A 102-041-399 MX40 ZLPSP8H361 SP8.5X36X1PL same as description 80055D01399

75 8-1/2x43-3/4x1, Pleated Filter 12 | EA $ 570 $ 981 | $ 270 [ $ 6.67 | $ 515 $ 325($ 7.10
Part number: 174-01-08E43G 102-041-1992 MX40 ZLPSP8H43M1 SP8.5X43.75X1PL | same as description 80055D01399

76 8-1/2x47-1/4x1, Pleated Filter 24 | EA $ 583 $% 10.24 | $ 270 | $ 750 | $ 550 $ 3781 $ 7.52
Part number: 174-01-08E47C 102-041-2992 MX40 ZLPSP8H47D1 SP8.5X47.25X1PL | same as description 80055D01599

77 9x21x1, Pleated Filter 12 | EA $ 4231 $ 4331 $ 265|$ 333 $ 256 $ 205 $ 3.47
Part number: 174-01-09A21A 102-041-199 MX40 ZLPSP9211 SP9X21X1PL same as description 80055.01199

78 10x28x1, Pleated Filter 24 | EA $ 331 [ $ 4771 $ 265|$ 414 | $ 3.07($ 255($ 3.72
Part number: 174-01-10A28A 102-041-299 MX40 ZLPSP10281 SP10X28X1PL same as description 80055.01299

79 11-3/8x11-3/8x1, Pleated Filter 24 | EA $ 385 % 4331 $ 260 $ 282 | $ 229 $ 177 $ 3.47
Part number: 174-01-11D11D 102-041-199 MX40 ZLPSP11F11F1 PpP11.375X11.375X1P| same as description 80055.01199

80 11x45-3/4x1, Pleated Filter 6 | Ea $ 7.02($ 10.24 | $ 3.65|$ 827 | $ 550 $ 3.78 | $ 7.52
Part number: 174-01-11A45G 102-041-2992 MX40 ZLPSP1145M1 SP11X45.75X1PL | same as description 80055D01599

81 14x21x1, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 294 [ $ 4771 $ 260 | $ 414 | $ 270 [ $ 255($ 3.72
Part number: 174-01-14A21A 102-041-299 MX40 ZLPSP14211 SP14X21X1PL same as description 80055.01299

82 15x20x1, Pleated Filter 12 | EA $ 178 [ $ 3.00($ 230 | $ 179 | $ 180 $ 288 $ 2.37
Part number: 174-400-001 102-700-005 MX40 ZLP15201 10371 same as description 80055.011520

83 16x25x1, Pleated Filter 120 | EA $ 181 ($ 278 $ 235 $ 181 $ 181 $ 276 [ $ 2.45
Part number: 174-600-001 102-700-007 MX40 ZLP16251 10373 same as description 80055.011625

84 16-3/4x20x1, Pleated Filter 24 | EA $ 4331 $ 6.03$ 247 $ 465 | $ 3.00($ 3.05(% 3.51
Part number: 174-01-16G20A 102-041-399 MX40 ZLPSP16M201 SP16.75X20X1PL | same as description 80055.01399

o= |17x20x1, Pleated Filter aa | ea LS 4111 $ 6.03[$ 247 $ 465 | $ 3.00 (% 3.05(% 3.51
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”~ [Part number: 7 1T 174-01-17A20A 102-041-399 MX40 ZLPSP17201 SP17X20X1PL [ same as description 80055.01399

86 20x20x1, Pleated Filter 108 | EA $ 183|$ 2791 % 228 | $ 183 | $ 183|$ 2771 $ 2.58
Part number: 174-700-001 102-700-008 MX40 ZLP20201 10375 same as description 80055.012020

87 20x25x1, Pleated Filter a8 | Ea $ 198 | $ 3.05($% 270 $ 199 | $ 200 | $ 299 | % 2.84
Part number: 174-800-001 102-700-009 MX40 ZLP20251 10376 same as description 80055.012025

STANDARD CAPACITY PLEATED FILTERS (10-12 PLEATS) (continued)

a8 20-1/4x21x1, Pleated Filter oa | EA $ 425($% 6.38 | % 298| $ 518 | $ 4.00 [ $ 358 | $ 3.83
Part number: 174-01-20C21A 102-041-499 MX40 ZLPSP20D211 SP20.25X21X1PL | same as description 80055.01499

89 21x21-1/4x1, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 425($% 6.38 | % 298| $ 518 | $ 4.00 [ $ 358 (% 3.83
Part number: 174-01-21A21C 102-041-499 MX40 ZLPSP2121D1 SP21X21.25X1PL | same as description 80055.01499

90 24x28x1, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 5.06 [ $ 698 | % 7391 % 599 | $ 5451 $ 420 $ 4.32
Part number: 174-01-24A28A 102-041-699 MX40 ZLPSP24281 SP24X28X1PL same as description 80055.01699

o1 12x24x2, Pleated Filter 60 | EA $ 1.84 | % 321 $ 260 | $ 1.84 | $ 1.84 | % 2771 % 2.15
Part number: 172-102-319 102-700-012 MX40 ZLP12242 10380 same as description 80055.021224

92 14x25x2, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 2191 % 3.79($ 325($ 209 | $ 2781 $ 391 (8% 2.75
Part number: 172-102-375 102-700-014 MX40 ZLP14252 10382 same as description 80055.021425

93 16x16x2, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 254 | % 476 [ $ 254 | % 242 | $ 335($ 318 $ 4.85
Part number: 172-102-448 102-042-005 MX40 ZLP16162 10420 same as description 80055.021616

94 16x20x2, Pleated Filter 14 | EA $ 1791 $ 322($ 2201 $ 180 | $ 181 $ 263|$ 2.11
Part number: 172-102-500 102-700-016 MX40 ZLP16202 10384 same as description 8005.021620

95 16x24x2, Pleated Filter 168 | EA $ 2131 % 3.90($ 311 ($ 213 | $ 2781 $ 362 % 2.64
Part number: 172-102-524 102-700-053 MX40 ZLP16242 10385 same as description 80055.021624

96 16x25x2, Pleated Filter 280 | EA $ 2041 % 349 (3% 260 | $ 2041 % 205| % 299 | % 2.71
Part number: 172-102-600 102-700-017 MX40 ZLP16252 10386 same as description 80055.021625

97 18x24x2, Pleated Filter 72 | Ea $ 2381 $ 378 $ 340 ($ 238 | $ 2391 % 3.65($% 2.77
Part number: 172-102-635 102-700-018 MX40 ZL.P18242 10387 same as description 80055.021824

08 19-1/2x22x2, Pleated Filter 12 | Ea $ 3.68 | $ 7181 $ 333 (% 5.67 | $ 359 (% 358 $ 3.83
Part number: 172-02-19E22A 102-041-499 MX40 ZLPSP19H222 SP19.5X22X2PL | same as description 80055.01499

99 20x20x2, Pleated Filter 384 | EA $ 205| % 348 $ 270 $ 205| % 205| % 3.01($% 2.75
Part number: 172-102-700 102-700-019 MX40 ZL.P20202 10388 same as description 80055.022020

100 20x22x2, Pleated Filter 102 | EA $ 448 | $ 7181 $ 333 (% 448 | $ 329 (8% 358 | $ 5.00
Part number: 172-02-20A22A 102-042-499 MX40 ZLPSP20222 SP20X22X2PL same as description 80055.022022

101 20x24x2, Pleated Filter 384 | EA $ 2381 $ 382 (8% 345($ 238 | $ 2391 % 372 $ 2.91
Part number: 172-102-782 102-700-020 MX40 ZLP20242 10389 same as description 80055.022024

102 20x25x2, Pleated Filter 6a8 | EA $ 2341 % 382 (3% 3.08 (% 2341 % 235| % 345($ 2.78
Part number: 172-108-800 102-700-021 MX40 ZLP20252 10390 same as description 80055.022025

103 24x24x2, Pleated Filter 336 | EA $ 260 | $ 4.09 [ $ 345($ 260 | $ 261 $ 391 (8% 3.14
Part number: 172-102-863 102-700-022 MX40 ZL.P24242 10391 same as description 80055.022424

104 16x20x4, Pleated Filter 102 | EA $ 515 $ 5871 % 425($ 445 | $ 445 $ 454 | $ 5.24
Part number: 179-400-500 102-700-025 MX40 ZLP16204 10394 same as description 80055.041620

105 18x24x4, Pleated Filter 96 | Ea $ 480 $ 6.77 | $ 545 | $ 480 | $ 480 $ 559 | $ 5.61
Part number: 179-400-635 102-700-027 MX40 ZL.P18244 10396 same as description 80055.041824

106 20x25x4, Pleated Filter a8 | Ea $ 491 $ 7.05| % 515| % 492 | $ 492 $ 584 | % 6.07
Part number: 179-400-800 102-700-030 MX40 ZLP20254 10399 same as description 80055.042025
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Buyer: Robert Thompson

3358 OF

Opening Date: 07-16-10

Air Filters
AAF McQuay Inc , . .
ﬁ Filters for Air Handling Units dba Air Cleaners Inc The Filter Shop Inc | Glasfloss Industries Le_lmpe S _CIgan Neb_raska Alr Interline Brands Inc
e . Air Specialists Filter Inc dba Sexauer
5 AAF International
Description | QTY luOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
DISPOSABLE CARDBOARD FILTERS
107 7x22x1, Heavy Duty Filter aa | Ea $ 277 $ 3.00|$ 150 | $ 278 | $ 150 $ 125 $ 2.00
Part number: 223-21-07A22A 260-001-802 DC & Size of Filter GTASP7221 SP7X22X1DC same as description 11255.01199
108 7x27x1, Heavy Duty Filter 36 | Ea $ 225 $ 3.00 (% 203 | $ 290 | $ 1.60 [ $ 134 $ 2.00
Part number: 223-21-07A27A 260-001-802 DC & Size of Filter GTASP7271 SP7X27X1DC same as description 11255.01199
DISPOSABLE CARDBOARD FILTERS (continued)
109 7-1/2x22-7/8x1, Heavy Duty Filter 12 | Ea $ 3421 $ 3.00 (% 150 | $ 290 | $ 1.60 [ $ 134 $ 2.00
Part number: 223-21-07E22H 260-001-802 DC & Size of Filter GTASP7H22P1 SP7.5X22.875X1DC | same as description 11255.01199
110 7-1/2x28-7/8x1, Heavy Duty Filter 24 | EA $ 542 | $ 3.09($ 203 | $ 3.01|$ 171 $ 153 $ 2.17
Part number: 223-21-07E28H 260-001-803 DC & Size of Filter GTASP7H28P1 SP7.5X28.875X1DC | same as description 11255.01249
111 7-1/2x34x1, Heavy Duty Filter 12 | EA $ 542 | $ 3.09($ 220 $ 3.18 | $ 250 $ 153|$% 2.12
Part number: 223-21-07E34A 260-001-803 DC & Size of Filter GTASP7H341 SP7.5X34X1DC same as description 11255.01299
112 7-1/2x34-7/8x1, Heavy Duty Filter 12 | EA $ 542 | $ 3.09($ 220 $ 3.18 | $ 250 $ 153|9% 2.12
Part number: 223-21-07E34H 260-001-803 DC & Size of Filter GTASP7H34P1 SP7.5X34.875X1DC| same as description 11255.01299
113 7-1/2x46x1, Heavy Duty Filter 12 | Ea $ 591 $% 6.01($ 225 $ 448 | $ 359 (% 1731 % 4.04
Part number: 223-21-07E46A 260-001-822 DC & Size of Filter GTASP7H461 SP7.546X1DC same as description 11255D01399
114 7-1/2x46-7/8x1, Heavy Duty Filter 24 | EA $ 591 (% 6.01($ 225 $ 448 | $ 359($ 1731 % 4.04
Part number: 223-21-07E46H 260-001-822 DC & Size of Filter GTASP7H46P1 SP7.5X46.875X1DC | same as description 11255D01399
115 8x20x1, Heavy Duty Filter 12 | EA $ 157 $ 3.00 (% 140 | $ 290 | $ 150 | $ 125| % 2.00
Part number: 223-036-251 260-001-802 DC & Size of Filter GTASP8201 SP8X20X1DC same as description 11255.01199
116 8x28x1, Heavy Duty Filter 100 | EA $ 173 $ 3.09($ 203 $ 3.01|$% 1791 % 153|$% 2.17
Part number: 223-072-251 260-001-803 DC & Size of Filter GTASP8281 SP8X28X1DC same as description 11255.01249
117 8x32x1, Heavy Duty Filter 20 | Ea $ 356 | $ 3.09($ 212 [ $ 3.18 | $ 1791 % 153|$% 2.12
Part number: 223-21-08A32A 260-001-803 DC & Size of Filter GTASP8321 SP8X32X1DC same as description 11255.01299
118 8x44x1, Heavy Duty Filter 20 | Ea $ 590 | $ 6.01($ 220 $ 3.36 | $ 359($ 185| % 4.04
Part number: 223-21-08A44A 260-001-822 DC & Size of Filter GTASP8441 SP8X44X1DC same as description 11255D01399
119 8x48x1, Heavy Duty Filter 20 | Ea $ 590 | $ 6.01 (% 220 $ 448 | $ 359 (% 185( $ 4.04
Part number: 223-21-08A48A 260-001-822 DC & Size of Filter GTASP8481 SP8X48X1DC same as description 11255D01399
120 10x45x1, Heavy Duty Filter 12 | EA $ 197 $ 622 $ 230 | $ 472 | $ 359 (% 194 $ 4.15
Part number: 223-251-251 260-001-823 DC & Size of Filter GTASP10451 SP10X45X1DC same as description 11255D01499
121 11x46x1, Heavy Duty Filter 20 | Ea $ 6.17 [ $ 622 $ 235 | $ 5.00 | $ 359 (% 194 $ 4.25
Part number: 223-21-11A46A 260-001-823 DC & Size of Filter GTASP11461 SP11X46X1DC same as description 11255D01599
122 11x58x1, Heavy Duty Filter 20 | Ea $ 6.65 | $ 642 | $ 250 $ 528 | $ 359 (% 209 $ 4.65
Part number: 223-21-11A58A 260-001-824 DC & Size of Filter GTASP11581 SP11X58X1DC same as description 11255D01799
123 12x25x1, Heavy Duty Filter 336 | EA $ 168 $ 159 $ 113 ([ $ 168 | $ 125 $ 153 $ 1.04
Part number: 223-321-251 260-001-006 DC & Size of Filter GDS12251 261-001-006 same as description 11255.011225
124 16x20x1, Heavy Duty Filter 12 | EA $ 156 $ 142 $ 101]|$ 156 | $ 125| % 165| % 0.99
Part number: 223-500-251 260-001-011 DC & Size of Filter GDS16201 261-001-011 same as description 11255.011620
125 16x25x1, Heavy Duty Filter 12 | EA $ 156 [ $ 1451 % 101|$ 146 | $ 125]| % 165| % 1.04
Part number: 223-600-251 260-001-013 DC & Size of Filter GDS16251 261-001-013 same as description 11255.011625
126 20x20x1, Heavy Duty Filter 12 | Ea $ 147 [ $ 1421 % 101]|$ 148 | $ 125| % 165| % 1.03
Part number: 223-700-251 260-001-016 DC & Size of Filter GDS20201 261-001-016 same as description 11255.012020
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Buyer: Robert Thompson 3358 OF Opening Date: 07-16-10
Air Filters
AAF McQuay Inc , . .
ﬁ Filters for Air Handling Units dba Air Cleaners Inc The Filter Shop Inc | Glasfloss Industries Le_lmpe S _CIgan Neb_raska Alr Interline Brands Inc
e . Air Specialists Filter Inc dba Sexauer
5 AAF International
Description | QTY luOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
POCKET FILTERS 90-95% EFFICIENCY, 4-6 POCKETS
127 12x24x12, Pocket Filter 16 | EA $ 12.26 | $ 2528 | $ 18,50 | $ 12.26 1095 | $ 11.25 | $ 14.41
Part number: 709-124-120 209-104-918 MG SBG12241294 16869 same as description PAP69552412
POCKET FILTERS 80-85% EFFICIENCY, 4-6 POCKETS
128 12x24x12, Pocket Filter 12 | Ea $ 11.03 | $ 2356 | $ 1520 | $ 11.03 10.50 | $ 11.25| $ 14.11
Part number: 708-124-120 208-104-918 CP15 SBG12241284 16870 same as description PAP68552412
POCKET FILTERS 80-85% EFFICIENCY, 4-6 POCKETS (continued)
129 24x24x12, Pocket Filter 24 | EA $ 1417 | $ 2356 | $ 17.84 | $ 14.18 1750 | $ 2250 | $ 22.47
Part number: 708-116-120 208-104-918 CP14 SBG24241286 16872 same as description PAP8-68552412
RIGID BOX FILTERS 80-85% EFFICIENCY
130 24x24x12, Rigid Box Filter 180 | EA $ 4401 | $ 67.07 | $ 50.00 | $ 35.47 48.00 | $ 50.06 | $ 43.23
Part number: 3011087-005 110-712-001 Varipak Syn. ZPS24241285B0 14929 same as description PRP85S4412
Payment Terms Net 30 0%, 30 0%, 0 0%, 0 Net 30 1%, 10 (Net 30)
Delivery Days ARO 14 20 7-10 10 10 7 7-10
All Filters must be
ordered & shipped in
required case (c/s)
Comments quantity - See
attached
spreadsheet w/bid
behind pg. 5 of 5.
o No Bid
Invalid Bid Koch Filter
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