Buyer: Suzanne Siemer

3350 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date: 06/28/10

PARTIAL AWARD

PARTIAL AWARD

PARTIAL AWARD

PR1 Concrete

Beatrice Concrete Co

Binder Bros Inc

Concrete Industries

=+
()
£
- Description Qty [UOM| Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
D-1 PR1 Concrete, No. Beatrice
1 Hwy 77 MP 26 Thru 36 25| CY [ $ 109.00( $ 2,725.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, So. Beatrice
2 Hwy 77 MP 13 Thru 20 751 CY [$ 109.00( $ 8,175.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, W. Barneston
3 Hwy 8 MP 82 Thru 86 50 CY |[$ 109.00] $ 5,450.00| $ 105.00f $ 5,250.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, W. Pickrell
4 Hwy S-34D MP 0 10| CY | $ 109.00|] $ 1,090.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, No. Princeton
5 Hwy 77 MP 45 Thru 51 25| CY | $ 104.00] $ 2,600.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, Jct Hwy 77/33
6 Hwy 33 MP 23 Thru 25 30| CY |$ 104.00] $ 3,120.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, Milford
7 Hwy 6 MP 292 Thru 293 201 CY [ $ 106.00( $ 2,120.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, So. Fairbury
8 Hwy 15 MP 2 Thru 5 30| CY|[$ 112.00( $ 3,360.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, Friend
9 Hwy 6 MP 272 12| CY | $ 104.00( $ 1,248.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, Peru .
10 Hwy 67 MP 25.83 Thru 33.37 50 | CY No Bid -0- $ 102.75( $ 5,137.50( $ 106.00( $ 5,300.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, Auburn to Brownville .
11 Hwy 136 MP 230 Thru 240 225| CY No Bid -0- $ 102.00( $22,950.00( $ 106.00( $23,850.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, Tecumseh N/S
12 Hwy 50 MP 20 Thru 48 100 CY | $ 104.00| $10,400.00| $ 102.00| $10,200.001 $ 102.00( $10,200.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, Table Rock .
13 Hwy 4 MP 196.4 Thru 197.7 15 | CY No Bid -0- $ 102.00( $ 1,530.00( $ 103.00( $ 1,545.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, No. Falls City .
14 Hwy 73 MP 5 Thru 22 150| CY No Bid -0- $ 104.00( $15,600.00( $ 112.00( $16,800.00
Totals $ 40,288.00 $ 60,667.50 $ 57,695.00 $ 5,500.00
Payment Terms 100%, 45 Net 30 Net 30
Delivery Days ARO 1 1 1 1

Bid tie determined by Coin Toss. Line 12 Awarded to Concrete Industries.
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