
Buyer:  Suzanne Siemer 3345 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  06/22/10

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 D-1  3/4" x #8 Expanded Shale
Palmyra Maint Yard   510 F Road (Hwy 2) 1,600 CY  $               47.53  $        76,048.00  / No Bid

2 D-1  3/4" x #8 Expanded Shale
Greenwood Maint Yard   12909 238 St 600 CY  $               48.67  $        29,202.00  /  No Bid 

3 D-1  3/4" x #8 Expanded Shale
West of Brownville   Hwy 136 MP 235 1,404 CY  $               45.60  $        64,022.40  / No Bid

4 D-6  3/4" x #8 Expanded Shale
Mullen Maint Yard   N Side of E N-2, 402 SE 1st St 1,000 CY  $               64.60  $        64,600.00  $               43.41  $        43,410.00 

5 D-6  3/4" x #8 Expanded Shale
Broken Bow Maint Yard   515 East S "E" St 1,000 CY  $               57.60  $        57,600.00  $               43.41  $        43,410.00 

6 D-6  3/4" x #8 Expanded Shale
North Platte Yard   Jct I-80 & US-83, 500 W River Road 1,000 CY  $               60.60  $        60,600.00  $               40.71  $        40,710.00 

7 D-1  3/4" x 3/8" Expanded Shale
Seward Maint Yard   1400 280th St 825 CY  $               50.27  $        41,472.75  /  No Bid 

8 D-6  3/4" x 3/8" Expanded Shale
Mullen Maint Yard   N Side of E N-2, 402 SE 1st St 1,000 CY  $               55.85  $        55,850.00  /  No Bid 

9 D-6  3/4" x 3/8" Expanded Shale
Broken Bow Maint Yard   515 East S "E" St 1,000 CY  $               52.85  $        52,850.00  /  No Bid 

10 D-6  3/4" x 3/8" Expanded Shale
North Platte Yard   Jct I-80 & US-83, 500 W River Rd 1,000 CY  $               53.10  $        53,100.00  /  No Bid 

11 D-1  1/4" x 1/8" Expanded Shale
Jct S 12D & Hwy 66 (Dwight) 625 CY  $               52.50  $        32,812.50  /  No Bid 

12 D-1  1/4" x 1/8" Expanded Shale
Emerald   Hwy 6 MP 307.3 158 CY  $               50.15  $          7,923.70  /  No Bid 

13 D-1  1/4" x 1/8" Expanded Shale
5 Miles East of Endicott   Hwy 8 MP 62.5 425 CY  $               48.46  $        20,595.50  /  No Bid 

14 D-6  1/4" x 1/8" Expanded Shale
Mullen Maint Yard   N Side of E N-2, 402 SE 1st St 1,000 CY  $               71.00  $        71,000.00  $               43.41  $        43,410.00 

15 D-6  1/4" x 1/8" Expanded Shale
Broken Bow Maint Yard   515 East S "E" St 1,000 CY  $               61.50  $        61,500.00  $               43.41  $        43,410.00 

16 D-6  1/4" x 1/8" Expanded Shale
North Platte Yard   Jct I-80 & US-83, 500 W River Rd 1,000 CY  $               65.50  $        65,500.00  $               40.71  $        40,710.00 

   $      814,676.85   $      255,060.00 
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