
Buyer:  Suzanne Siemer 3331 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  06/14/10

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-3 Area 321 1,000 EA  $         27.60  $  27,600.00     No Bid  No Bid  $         33.24  $  33,240.00 

2 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-3 Area 352 1,500 EA  $         25.00  $  37,500.00     No Bid  No Bid  $         32.75  $  49,125.00 

3 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-3 Area 352 1,750 EA  $         24.75  $  43,312.50     No Bid  No Bid  $         35.44  $  62,020.00 

4 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-5 Area 511 1,000 EA  $         55.75  $  55,750.00  $         27.10  $  27,100.00  $         26.05  $  26,050.00  $         71.71  $  71,710.00 

5 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-5 Area 511 1,000 EA  $         51.25  $  51,250.00  $         26.52  $  26,520.00  $         25.90  $  25,900.00  $         69.87  $  69,870.00 

6 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-5 Area 512 1,000 EA  $         55.00  $  55,000.00     $         26.00  $  26,000.00  $         71.71  $  71,710.00 

7 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-5 Area 512 1,000 EA  -O-  -O-     $         27.70  $  27,700.00  $         68.75  $  68,750.00 

8 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-5 Area 513 2,000 EA  $         48.50  $  97,000.00  $         27.46  $  54,920.00  $         26.96  $  53,920.00  $         63.75  $127,500.00 

9 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-5 Area 514 2,000 EA  -O-  -O-  $         28.73  $  57,460.00  $         28.26  $  56,520.00  $         65.96  $131,920.00 

10 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-5 Area 524 2,000 EA  -O-  -O-     $         34.95  $  69,900.00  $         65.27  $130,540.00 

11 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-6 Area 620 1,000 EA  -O-  -O-  $         41.63  $  41,630.00  $         47.37  $  47,370.00  $         43.74  $  43,740.00 

12 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-6 Area 651 1,000 EA  $         48.60  $  48,600.00  $         37.43  $  37,430.00  $         36.93  $  36,930.00  $         55.35  $  55,350.00 

  $416,012.50 $245,060.00 $370,290.00 $915,475.00 

PARTIAL AWARD

Danielski Farms Inc
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Wessels Trucking
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Buyer:  Suzanne Siemer 3331 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  06/14/10

Description Qty UOM

1 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-3 Area 321 1,000 EA

2 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-3 Area 352 1,500 EA

3 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-3 Area 352 1,750 EA

4 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-5 Area 511 1,000 EA

5 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-5 Area 511 1,000 EA

6 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-5 Area 512 1,000 EA

7 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-5 Area 512 1,000 EA

8 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-5 Area 513 2,000 EA

9 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-5 Area 514 2,000 EA

10 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-5 Area 524 2,000 EA

11 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-6 Area 620 1,000 EA

12 Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggreg
D-6 Area 651 1,000 EA

Li
ne

 # Chip Seal Ledge Rock Aggregate

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
Totals

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

    $         23.95  $  23,950.00  $         32.55  $  32,550.00 

    $         20.00  $  30,000.00  $         32.55  $  48,825.00 

    $         20.00  $  35,000.00  $         34.85  $  60,987.50 

 $         33.92  $  33,920.00       

 $         37.90  $  37,900.00          

 $         33.02  $  33,020.00       

 $         29.65  $  29,650.00       

 $         41.52  $  83,040.00  $         37.25  $  74,500.00    

 $         30.95  $  61,900.00       

 $         28.57  $  57,140.00       

 $         49.00  $  49,000.00  $         42.00  $  42,000.00    

 $         45.75  $  45,750.00  $         37.25  $  37,250.00    

$431,320.00 $242,700.00 $142,362.50 

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Award Explanation
Due to funding restrictions, District 6 is declining to accept the chip seal bids for their 
area, Lines 11 and 12.  No contract award for this area.
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Westover Rock & Sand Inc

100% 30
as ordered

K4 Trucking LLC
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Spencer Quarries Inc

100% 30

Page 2 of 2


