
Buyer:  Suzanne Siemer 3316 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  06/01/10

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 D-1 1 1/2" Crusher Run 
Rock 50 TN  $    18.64  $     932.00  $    17.66  $      883.00  $    17.38  $     869.00  $    22.70  $   1,135.00  $    19.60  $      980.00 

2 D-1 1 1/2" Crusher Run 
Rock 750 TN  $    21.00  $15,750.00  $    19.69  $ 14,767.50  $    19.19  $14,392.50  $    20.73  $ 15,547.50  $    21.75  $ 16,312.50 

3 D-1 1 1/2" Crusher Run 
Rock 500 TN  $    18.72  $  9,360.00  $    18.53  $   9,265.00  $    18.59  $  9,295.00  $    19.23  $   9,615.00  $    21.50  $ 10,750.00 

4 D-1 1 1/2" Crusher Run 
Rock 250 TN  $    21.99  $  5,497.50  $    21.39  $   5,347.50  $    19.77  $  4,942.50  No Bid  No Bid  $    24.89  $   6,222.50 

5 D-1 1 1/2" Crusher Run 
Rock 1,000 TN  $    18.99  $18,990.00     $    14.55  $14,550.00  No Bid  No Bid  $    19.00  $ 19,000.00 

6 D-1 1 1/2" Crusher Run 
Rock 100 TN  $    16.04  $  1,604.00     $    14.99  $  1,499.00  $    15.50  $   1,550.00  $    17.75  $   1,775.00 

7 D-1 1 1/2" Crusher Run 
Rock 200 TN  $    20.66  $  4,132.00     $    17.55  $  3,510.00  No Bid  No Bid  $    23.09  $   4,618.00 

   $56,265.50 $ 30,263.00  $49,058.00 $ 27,847.50 $ 59,658.00 

PARTIAL AWARD

7
100%, 30

Gana Trucking & 
Excavating Inc

As Needed

Li
ne

 # Crusher Run Rock

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
Totals

Jacobsen Rock & 
Gravel

Jeffres Sand and Gravel 
Inc.

14-21
0%, 0

as needed

James B. Wessels dba 
Wessels Trucking Koch Excavating Co.

0%, 30
per ITB
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Buyer:  Suzanne Siemer 3316 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date:  06/01/10

Description Qty UOM

1 D-1 1 1/2" Crusher Run 
Rock 50 TN

2 D-1 1 1/2" Crusher Run 
Rock 750 TN

3 D-1 1 1/2" Crusher Run 
Rock 500 TN

4 D-1 1 1/2" Crusher Run 
Rock 250 TN

5 D-1 1 1/2" Crusher Run 
Rock 1,000 TN

6 D-1 1 1/2" Crusher Run 
Rock 100 TN

7 D-1 1 1/2" Crusher Run 
Rock 200 TN

Li
ne

 # Crusher Run Rock

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
Totals

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

 $    19.30  $      965.00        NB     $    18.70  $      935.00 

 $    21.16  $ 15,870.00  $    20.25  $ 15,187.50  NB     $    19.49  $ 14,617.50 

 $    18.40  $   9,200.00        $    20.58  $ 10,290.00  $    20.20  $ 10,100.00 

 $    22.70  $   5,675.00     $    24.40  $   6,100.00  $    23.30  $   5,825.00 

 $    17.18  $ 17,180.00     $    15.70  $ 15,700.00  $    13.45  $ 13,450.00 

 $    14.80  $   1,480.00     $    16.87  $   1,687.00  $    15.20  $   1,520.00 

 $    20.48  $   4,096.00     $    16.55  $   3,310.00  $    15.55  $   3,110.00 

$ 54,466.00 $ 15,187.50 $ 37,087.00 $ 49,557.50 

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

14

L P Stewart & Sons Inc.

100%, 30
as ordered

Westover Rock & Sand 
Inc.

100%, 30
as requested

Marxsen Sand & Gravel

Per ITB
Per ITB

South Side Sales and 
Service Inc.

100%, 30
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