
Buyer:  Rita Kucera 3249 OF
Game and Parks

Opening Date:  04/14/10

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
Milestone Herbicide 1 quart 
containers
Please provide price per quart

30 EA  No Bid  No Bid  $    75.50  $   2,265.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Habitat Herbicide
2.5 gallon containers
Please provide price per gallon

5 EA  $    62.95  $      314.75  $    60.50  $      302.50  No Bid  No Bid 

Garlon 4 Herbicide
2.5 gallon containers
Please provide price per gallon

20 EA  $    54.15  $   1,083.00  $    74.50  $   1,490.00  $    85.00  $   1,700.00 

90% Non-ionic Surfactant
2.5 gallon containers
Please provide price per gallon

5 EA  $      8.69  $        43.45  $      6.09  $       30.45  $    14.00  $        70.00  $      8.50  $        42.50 

Pathway Herbicide
2.5 gallon containers
Please provide price per gallon

15 EA  No Bid  No Bid  $    27.50  $      412.50  No Bid  No Bid 

Alligare LLC
Li

ne
 # Chemicals

Container size

Brand bidding
1

3

4
Brand bidding
Container size

5

Brand bidding

Carso, Inc. CWC Chemical, Inc. DeAngelo Brothers, Inc. 
T/A Alenza

 Milestone VM 
 Quart 

 2.5 gallon 

 Alligare 90 
 2.5 gallon 

Container size

Container size

Brand bidding

Container size

 Triclopyr 4 

Brand bidding
2

 Ecomazapyr 2SL 

 2.5 gallon 

 Habitat 

 2.5 gallon 

 2.5 gallon 

Garlon 4 Ultra

 CWC 90 
 2.5 gallon 

 Pathway 
 2.5 gallon 

 Dow Chem-Galen 4 
Ultra 

 2.5 gallon 

 Drexel-Surf AC 910 
 2.5 gallon 
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Buyer:  Rita Kucera 3249 OF
Game and Parks

Opening Date:  04/14/10

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Alligare LLC
Li

ne
 # Chemicals Carso, Inc. CWC Chemical, Inc. DeAngelo Brothers, Inc. 

T/A Alenza

Glyphosate Herbicide
2.5 gallon containers
Please provide price per gallon

100 EA  $    11.78  $   1,178.00  $    12.50  $  1,250.00  $    14.50  $   1,450.00  $    13.00  $   1,300.00 

Liquid AMC Activator
2.5 gallon containers
Please provide price per gallon

97.5 EA  No Bid  No Bid  $      6.00  $      585.00  No Bid  No Bid 

85% Non-ionic Activator
2.5 gallon containers
Please provide prive per gallon

50 EA  No Bid  No Bid  $    25.00  $   1,250.00  No Bid  No Bid 

4-5

6
Brand bidding

Container size

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

8

 Glyphosate 4 Plus 

 2.5 gallon 

7
Net 30

7
Brand bidding

Container size

Brand bidding
Container size

 Accord XRT 11 

2.5

 AMS Xtra-Drexel 

2 1/2

 Spray Activator 85 
2.5 

 Glyphosate 4-Plus 
Alligare 

 2.5 gallon 
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Buyer:  Rita Kucera 3249 OF
Game and Parks

Opening Date:  04/14/10

Description Qty UOM
Milestone Herbicide 1 quart 
containers
Please provide price per quart

30 EA

Habitat Herbicide
2.5 gallon containers
Please provide price per gallon

5 EA

Garlon 4 Herbicide
2.5 gallon containers
Please provide price per gallon

20 EA

90% Non-ionic Surfactant
2.5 gallon containers
Please provide price per gallon

5 EA

Pathway Herbicide
2.5 gallon containers
Please provide price per gallon

15 EA

Li
ne

 # Chemicals

Container size

Brand bidding
1

3

4
Brand bidding
Container size

5

Brand bidding

Container size

Container size

Brand bidding

Container size

Brand bidding
2

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

 N/B  N/B  $    77.00  $   2,310.00  $    69.77  $ 2,093.10 

 $  182.50  $      912.50  $    65.00  $      325.00  $  297.50  $   1,487.50  $    75.97  $    379.85 

 $  134.50  $   2,690.00  $    52.00  $   1,040.00  $  165.00  $   3,300.00  $    48.47  $    969.40 

 $    31.95  $      159.75  $      9.00  $        45.00  $      8.97  $      44.85 

 N/B  N/B  $    29.00  $      435.00  $    26.97  $    404.55 

Grass Pad Inc.

 Nu Form (Polaris) 

 2.5 gallon 

Nu Form (Tahoe 4E)

 2.5 gallon 

 Exacto 
 2.5 gallon 

Red River Specialties, 
Inc.

 Milestone VM 
 Quarts 

 Habitat 

 2.5 gal 

Element 4E

 2.5 gal 

 Red Rive 90 
 2.5 gal 

 Pathway 
 2.5 gal 

Snyder Sales & Services

 Ecolmazapyr 2SL
By Alligare

Note * 6 Each
2 per case $1,785.00 

2.5 

Triclopyr 4
By Alligare

 2.5 g 

 Kalo-Pure and Simple 

2.5 

Van Diest Supply 
Company

 Dow 
 Qt 

 BASF 

 2.5 g 

Dow-Element 4

2.5 

AWARD

2.5 

 Dow 
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Buyer:  Rita Kucera 3249 OF
Game and Parks

Opening Date:  04/14/10

Description Qty UOMLi
ne

 # Chemicals

Glyphosate Herbicide
2.5 gallon containers
Please provide price per gallon

100 EA

Liquid AMC Activator
2.5 gallon containers
Please provide price per gallon

97.5 EA

85% Non-ionic Activator
2.5 gallon containers
Please provide prive per gallon

50 EA

6
Brand bidding

Container size

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

8

7
Brand bidding

Container size

Brand bidding
Container size

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Grass Pad Inc. Red River Specialties, 
Inc. Snyder Sales & Services Van Diest Supply 

Company

 $    31.25  $   3,125.00  $    11.95  $   1,195.00  $    10.59  $ 1,059.00 

 N/B  N/B  $      5.75  $      560.63  $      4.99  $    486.53 

 N/B  N/B  $      9.00  $      450.00  $    13.11  $    655.50 

 Drexel (Imitator Plus) 

2.5

0
10

 Glyfos Xtra 

2.5 gal

 Red River Liquid AMS 
& Defoamer 
2.5 gallon

 Red River 90 
2.5 gal

3-5

 Buccaneer 

2.5 

 Gardian Plus 

30
0% 30

Award Explanation:   Award was made to the overall low bid.

2.5

 Spray Activation 85 
2.5 

Net 30
15
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