
Buyer: Suzanne Siemer 3227 OF Opening Date: 03/31/10

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Ashpalt & Fuel 
Supply, LLC

Dark Water 
Asphalt

Ergon Asphalt & 
Emalsions, Inc

Hills Materials 
Company

Description Est Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 CRS-2P DIST1 2035 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
2 CRS-2VHL DIST 1 935 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
3 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 1 500 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
4 HFE-300 DIST 1 150 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
5 CRS-2L DIST 2 21 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
6 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 2 12 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
7 CRS-2P DIST 3 3180 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
8 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 3 1020 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
9 HFE-150 DIST 3 98 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
10 HFE-300 DIST 3 75 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
11 CRS-2L DIST 4 430 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
12 CRS-2P DIST 4 4435 TN  No Bid  $               523.60  No Bid 
13 HFE-300 DIST 4 865 TN  No Bid  $               528.00  No Bid 
14 HFE-1000 DIST 4 1055 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
15 MC-250 DIST 4 50 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
16 CRS-2VHL DIST 5 1700 TN  No Bid  $               530.00  N/B  $               618.25 
17 HFE-500 DIST 5 100 TN  No Bid  N/B  $               593.66 
18 HFE-1000 DIST 5 100 TN  No Bid  N/B  $               609.96 
19 MC-250 DIST 5 25 TN  $               788.69  N/B  No Bid 
20 SS-1H DIST 5 300 TN  No Bid  $               478.00  N/B  $               550.55 
21 CRS-2P DIST 6 2550 TN  No Bid  $               531.20  No Bid 
22 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 6 965 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
23 HFE-300 DIST 6 2090 TN  No Bid  $               535.20  No Bid 
24 HFE-1000 DIST 6 75 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
25 MC-250 DIST 6 70 TN  $               760.02  N/B  No Bid 
26 CRS-2VHL DIST 7 1270 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
27 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 7 110 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
28 HFE-150 DIST 7 45 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
29 HFE-300 DIST 7 600 TN  No Bid  $               516.00  No Bid 
30 HFMS-2P DIST 7 230 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 

Li
ne

 # Liquid Asphaltic Material
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Buyer: Suzanne Siemer 3227 OF Opening Date: 03/31/10

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Ashpalt & Fuel 
Supply, LLC

Dark Water 
Asphalt

Ergon Asphalt & 
Emalsions, Inc

Hills Materials 
Company

Description Est Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Li
ne

 # Liquid Asphaltic Material

31 CRS-2P DIST 8 1190 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
32 CRS-2VHL DIST 8 1330 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
33 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 8 545 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
34 HFE-150 DIST 8 50 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
35 HFE-300 DIST 8 825 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
36 HFE-1000 DIST 8 345 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
37 MC-250 DIST 8 125 TN  $               786.64  N/B  No Bid 
38 SS-1H DIST 8 255 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
39 CRS-2L PLANT FOB 1 TN  No Bid  $               480.00  N/B  No Bid 
40 CRS-2P PLANT FOB 1 TN  No Bid  $               510.00  No Bid 
41 CRS-2VHL PLANT FOB 1 TN  No Bid  $               501.00  N/B  No Bid 
42 CSS-1H 50/50 PLANT FOB 1 TN  No Bid  $               255.00  N/B  No Bid 
43 HFE-150 PLANT FOB 1 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
44 HFE-300 PLANT FOB 1 TN  No Bid  $               504.00  No Bid 
45 HFE-500 PLANT FOB 1 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
46 HFE-1000 PLANT FOB 1 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
47 HFMS-2P PLANT FOB 1 TN  No Bid  N/B  No Bid 
48 MC-250 PLANT FOB 1 TN  $               716.00  N/B  No Bid 
49 SS-1H PLANT FOB 1 TN  No Bid  $               464.00  N/B  No Bid 

50 DEMURRAGE CHARGE 
PER DELIVERY 1 EA  $80.00/hour  $60.00/HR  $70.00/hour after 

2 hrs.  $45.00 Per HR 

Net % 30 Days 100% 30 Days N/A

1-2 2 Per Specifications

w/2 Free 
Hours/Load

Plant Locations: 
Dodge City, KS

Salina, KS

Lines 30, 38, 45, and 47 have been cancelled.

Comments

Delivery Days ARO

Payment Terms
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Buyer: Suzanne Siemer 3227 OF Opening Date: 03/31/10

Description Est Qty UOM
1 CRS-2P DIST1 2035 TN
2 CRS-2VHL DIST 1 935 TN
3 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 1 500 TN
4 HFE-300 DIST 1 150 TN
5 CRS-2L DIST 2 21 TN
6 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 2 12 TN
7 CRS-2P DIST 3 3180 TN
8 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 3 1020 TN
9 HFE-150 DIST 3 98 TN
10 HFE-300 DIST 3 75 TN
11 CRS-2L DIST 4 430 TN
12 CRS-2P DIST 4 4435 TN
13 HFE-300 DIST 4 865 TN
14 HFE-1000 DIST 4 1055 TN
15 MC-250 DIST 4 50 TN
16 CRS-2VHL DIST 5 1700 TN
17 HFE-500 DIST 5 100 TN
18 HFE-1000 DIST 5 100 TN
19 MC-250 DIST 5 25 TN
20 SS-1H DIST 5 300 TN
21 CRS-2P DIST 6 2550 TN
22 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 6 965 TN
23 HFE-300 DIST 6 2090 TN
24 HFE-1000 DIST 6 75 TN
25 MC-250 DIST 6 70 TN
26 CRS-2VHL DIST 7 1270 TN
27 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 7 110 TN
28 HFE-150 DIST 7 45 TN
29 HFE-300 DIST 7 600 TN
30 HFMS-2P DIST 7 230 TN

Li
ne

 # Liquid Asphaltic Material

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Jebro 
Incorporated

Martin Resource 
Management DBA 
Monarch Oil Co.

Murphy Oil USA, 
Inc

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
 $               537.62  $               550.20  $               550.23 
 $               512.51  $               564.06 
 $               257.86  $               259.00 
 $               479.40  No Bid 

 No Bid  $               560.00 
 No Bid  $               270.00 

 $               527.95  No Bid  $               558.64 
 $               243.37  $               262.00 
 $               438.20  No Bid 
 $               463.00  No Bid 
 $               525.60  $               580.48 
 $               541.87  No Bid  $               513.42 
 $               469.48  No Bid 
 $               500.81  No Bid 
 $               683.30  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  No Bid 

 $               556.60  No Bid  $               532.75 
 $               277.51  $               396.67 
 $               485.69  No Bid 
 $               542.33  No Bid 
 $               694.09  No Bid 
 $               529.40  $               634.11 
 $               298.80  $               409.20 
 $               477.80  No Bid 
 $               490.48  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 
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Buyer: Suzanne Siemer 3227 OF Opening Date: 03/31/10

Description Est Qty UOM
Li

ne
 # Liquid Asphaltic Material

31 CRS-2P DIST 8 1190 TN
32 CRS-2VHL DIST 8 1330 TN
33 CSS-1H 50/50 DIST 8 545 TN
34 HFE-150 DIST 8 50 TN
35 HFE-300 DIST 8 825 TN
36 HFE-1000 DIST 8 345 TN
37 MC-250 DIST 8 125 TN
38 SS-1H DIST 8 255 TN
39 CRS-2L PLANT FOB 1 TN
40 CRS-2P PLANT FOB 1 TN
41 CRS-2VHL PLANT FOB 1 TN
42 CSS-1H 50/50 PLANT FOB 1 TN
43 HFE-150 PLANT FOB 1 TN
44 HFE-300 PLANT FOB 1 TN
45 HFE-500 PLANT FOB 1 TN
46 HFE-1000 PLANT FOB 1 TN
47 HFMS-2P PLANT FOB 1 TN
48 MC-250 PLANT FOB 1 TN
49 SS-1H PLANT FOB 1 TN

50 DEMURRAGE CHARGE 
PER DELIVERY 1 EA

Lines 30, 38, 45, and 47 have been cancelled.

Comments

Delivery Days ARO

Payment Terms

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Jebro 
Incorporated

Martin Resource 
Management DBA 
Monarch Oil Co.

Murphy Oil USA, 
Inc

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
 $               538.91  No Bid  $               553.55 
 $               530.20  No Bid 
 $               268.14  $               419.30 
 $               457.20  No Bid 
 $               489.78  No Bid 
 $               532.36  No Bid 
 $               675.08  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 
 $               535.00  No Bid 
 $               560.00  No Bid 
 $               540.00  No Bid 
 $               240.00  $               500.00 
 $               450.00  No Bid 
 $               475.00  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 
 $               490.00  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 
 $               675.00  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 
$75.00/Hour after 

2 hours  $                 75.00 

Net % 30 Days

per spec

Vance Brothers, Inc
No Bid
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