
Buyer: Rita Kucera 3211 OF Opening Date: 03/10/10

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1

Bushmaster or Commando Select
Fire Rifles Only
Bushmaster 11.5 Entry Model MCWA3F 11.5 or Colt 
Commando R0933 with 2-30 Round Magazines each

16 EA  $  1,038.79  $   16,620.64  $    992.88  $   15,886.08  $  1,101.39  $   17,622.24 

2
Trade-In of Submachine Gun 9 mm
Heckler & Koch MP5N40 Smith & Wesson Select Fire 
Rifles with three (3) magazines each

12 EA  $    (700.00)  $    (8,400.00)  $   (705.00)  $    (8,460.00)  $    (500.00)  $    (6,000.00)

3 Trade-In of Heckler & Koch HK33KA3 .223 Caliber 
Select Fire Rifles with three (3) magazines each 12 EA  $    (500.00)  $    (6,000.00)  $   (605.00)  $    (7,260.00)  $    (500.00)  $    (6,000.00)

4 Trade-In of Knight Armament
Suppressors for the H & K MP5N40's 6 EA  $    (100.00)  $       (600.00)  $   (225.00)  $    (1,350.00)  $    (400.00)  $    (2,400.00)

5 Glock 18C Pistol with 3 30 - Round Magazines 12 EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  Unable to 
Supply  No Bid 

6 Trade-In of 9 mm Glock 18
Pistols with 3 30 - Round Magazines 12 EA  $    (600.00)  $    (7,200.00)  $   (511.00)  $    (6,132.00)  No Bid 

Colt Commando R0933

60
30 Days0% 30 Days

Firearms

Net % 30 Days

Lawmen's & Shooters 
Supply, Inc

AWARD

Comments

Colt Commando R0933

Clyde Armory Inc is a 
Licensed Class III Dealer

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

Clyde Armory Inc GT Distributors, Inc
Li

ne
 #
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Buyer: Rita Kucera 3211 OF Opening Date: 03/10/10

Description Qty UOM

1

Bushmaster or Commando Select
Fire Rifles Only
Bushmaster 11.5 Entry Model MCWA3F 11.5 or Colt 
Commando R0933 with 2-30 Round Magazines each

16 EA

2
Trade-In of Submachine Gun 9 mm
Heckler & Koch MP5N40 Smith & Wesson Select Fire 
Rifles with three (3) magazines each

12 EA

3 Trade-In of Heckler & Koch HK33KA3 .223 Caliber 
Select Fire Rifles with three (3) magazines each 12 EA

4 Trade-In of Knight Armament
Suppressors for the H & K MP5N40's 6 EA

5 Glock 18C Pistol with 3 30 - Round Magazines 12 EA

6 Trade-In of 9 mm Glock 18
Pistols with 3 30 - Round Magazines 12 EA

Firearms

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

Li
ne

 #
Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 $  1,055.00  $   16,880.00 

 
$1,132.25

  or
$1,155.40 

 
$18,116.00

 or
$18,486.40 

 $  1,106.33  $ 17,701.28 

 $    (750.00)  $    (9,000.00)  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $              -   

 $    (650.00)  $    (7,800.00)  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $              -   

 $    (175.00)  $    (1,050.00)  No Bid  No Bid  $   (127.50)  $     (765.00)

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $              -   

 $    (300.00)  $    (3,600.00)  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid $              -   

ProForce Law 
Enforcement

N/A
15-20

Line 1 - Colt Commando 
Select - Item# R0933 w/2-

30 round mags
No Bid on Class III 

weapons - weapons are 
not transferable

No Bid on Glock items - 
out of our assigned 
territory for glock

Personal Protection 
Group, LLC

Net % 30 Days
60

Bushmaster 11.5
or

Colt Commando 
R0933

Colt Commando R0933

Line 2, 3 & 6 - Parts Only

RBA Inc DBA Phoenix 
Distributors

N/A
60
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Buyer: Rita Kucera 3211 OF Opening Date: 03/10/10

Description Qty UOM

1

Bushmaster or Commando Select
Fire Rifles Only
Bushmaster 11.5 Entry Model MCWA3F 11.5 or Colt 
Commando R0933 with 2-30 Round Magazines each

16 EA

2
Trade-In of Submachine Gun 9 mm
Heckler & Koch MP5N40 Smith & Wesson Select Fire 
Rifles with three (3) magazines each

12 EA

3 Trade-In of Heckler & Koch HK33KA3 .223 Caliber 
Select Fire Rifles with three (3) magazines each 12 EA

4 Trade-In of Knight Armament
Suppressors for the H & K MP5N40's 6 EA

5 Glock 18C Pistol with 3 30 - Round Magazines 12 EA

6 Trade-In of 9 mm Glock 18
Pistols with 3 30 - Round Magazines 12 EA

Firearms

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

Li
ne

 #

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 $ 1,025.57  $  16,409.12  $     910.00  $   14,560.00 

 No Bid  $              -    $   (400.00)  $    (4,800.00)

 No Bid  $              -    $   (400.00)  $    (4,800.00)

 $   (127.50)  $     (765.00)  $     200.00  $    (1,200.00)

 No Bid  $              -    $     501.00  $     6,012.00 

 No Bid  $              -    $   (250.00)  $     3,000.00 

Award Explanation: Award was made to the vendor that 
submitted the bid that equated to the lowest cost to the State of 
Nebraska to purchase the rifles on line one (1) with the trade prices 
offered/considered for the rifles and suppressons on line two (2), 
three (3), and four (4). Lines five (5) and six (6) were not awarded.

SRT Supply

30 Days

Class 3 Dealer (SRT Supply 
& All Others) Cannot be in 
possession of more than 2 

models of any type of 
automatic weapon at the 

same time
These traded in weapons 

will need to be 1. Traded or 
2. Cutup (Destroyed)

ProForce Law 
Enforcement

N/A
15-20

Line 1 - Bushmaster - 
Item# MCWA3F-11.5 w/2 

mags
No Bid on Class III 

weapons - weapons are 
not transferable

No Bid on Glock items - 
Out of our assigned 

territory for glock
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