Buyer: Rita Kucera

3183 OF

Opening Date: 02/16/10

** Chemicals Alligare LLC Crop Prqductlon CWC Chemical, Inc Deangelo Brothers
@ Services
= i
- Description Qty [UOM [Unit Price| Ext Price FEJ”r!; Ext Price | Unit Price| ExtPrice [UnitPrice| ExtPrice
Sahara DG 40-bbags — 13450| B | § 7.95| $27,030.00| $ 0.8| $31,212.00 | $ 9.29 $31,586.00 | $ 11.40| $38,760.00
Please provide price per GL
1 Brand bidding: Alligare Mojave 70 eg BASF - Sahara Sahara DG BASF
Container Size: 25 Ib. bag 40 Ib. bag 401b 40 Ib bag
Amine 2-4-D 2.5 Gal Containers .
Please provide price per Gl 40 | GL No Bid $ 11051 $ 44200($ 1738]$ 69520(% 16.00/ $ 640.00
2
Brand bidding: Platoon 2-4-D Amine WGEdeASr:i?éAM 40 Dow - DMA 4
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Crossbow 2.5 Gallon Containers . .
Please provide price per GL 50 | GL | $ 39.75| $ 1,987.50( $ 46.45| $ 2,32250 | $ 42.95| $ 2,148.00 | No Bid No Bid
3
Brand bidding: Alligare Everett Loveland Products - Candor (NuFarm)
Crosshow
Container Size: 2.5 gallon container 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Razor 2.5 Gallon Containers | | o | ¢ 1210| §  484.00| $ 13.65| $ 546.00 | $ 1596 $ 63840 |$ 14.40|$ 576.00
Please provide price per GL
4 Brand bidding: Alligare (sllalshosate 4 NuFarm - Razor Pro Razor Pro NuFarm
Container Size: 2.5 gallon container 2.5 gal 21/2 2.5 gal
Premier 90 2.5 Gal Containers |, | & NoBid |$ 10.60| $ 106.00|$ 1250/ $ 125.00| NoBid | No Bid
5 Please provide price per GL
Brand bidding: Loveland Products - CWC 90
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Payment Terms 0% 30 Days 0% 0 Days Net % 30 Days
Delivery Days ARO 4-5 (business) 7 5 7
Comments
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Buyer: Rita Kucera 3183 OF Opening Date: 02/16/10

. John Deere Progressive Solutions
ﬁ Chemicals Fry Brothers Grass Pad, Inc Landscapes LLC
£
- Description Qty [UOM| Unit Price| ExtPrice [Unit Price| ExtPrice [ Unit Price | Ext Price [ Unit Price| Ext Price
Sahara DG 40dbbags |50 15 | g 7.08| $27,13200| N/B N/B NoBid | $ 9.55| $32,470.00
Please provide price per GL
1 Brand bidding: Mojave 70 EG N/B Sahara DG
Container Size: 25 |b bag N/B 40# Bag
Amine 2-4-D 2.5 Gal Containers
Please provide price per Gl 40 [ GL |$ 11.84| $ 47360 $ 1390| $ 556.00 | $ 17.93| $717.20( $ 13.25| $ 530.00
2 m - -
e PBI Gordon Amine | Riverdale Weedestroy
Brand bidding: NuFarm Weedestroy AM40 400 2. 4-D AM-40
Container Size: 2X25 2 X 2.5qgal 2 X 2.5 gal case 2.5 gal
Crossbow 2.5 Gallon Containers .
Please provide price per GL 50 | GL | $ 43.00( $ 2,150.00 [ $ 36.87| $1,843.50 NoBid [ $ 56.25| $ 2,812.50
3
Brand bidding: Everett Candor Crossbow
Container Size: 2X25 2 X 2.5qgal 2.5 gal
Razor 2.5 Gallon Containers | | o | ¢ 1450|$ 580.00|$ 1369|$ 54760 | $ 15.72| $628.80 | $ 12.75| $ 510.00
Please provide price per GL
4 Brand bidding: Credit Extra Razor “Lesco ;’rr;)secutor Cheminova Glyfos X-tra
Container Size: 2X2.5 2 X 2.5qgal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Premier 90 2.5 Gal Containers
! . 10 | GL | $ 6.00| $ 60.00 [ $ 12.78| $ 127.80| $ 19.30| $193.00 ($ 9.95| $ 99.50
5 Please provide price per GL
Brand bidding: Ultra Surf 80 Grass Pad, Inc *Lesco Spreader Alligare Alligare 90
Container Size: 2X25* 2 X 2.5gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Payment Terms 0% 0 Days 0% 0 Days
Delivery Days ARO 10 71010
c *Note: This is a 80/20 *Specifications
omments
surfactant Enclosed
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Buyer: Rita Kucera

3183 OF

Opening Date: 02/16/10

AWARD
“ Chemicals Progressive Solutions | Red River Specialties, Van Diest Supply Co
o LLC Inc
£
- Description Qty [UOM| Unit Price| ExtPrice [Unit Price| ExtPrice [UnitPrice| EXxt Price
Sahara DG 40-Ib bags 3400| LB |$ 9.15| $31,110.00 | $ 9.28| $31,552.00 | $  7.87| $26,758.00
Please provide price per GL
1 Brand bidding: Alligare Mojave 70 EG Sahara Mojave DG
Container Size: 25# bag 40lboraXx 1.0 Ib (both 10 X5#
same price)
Amine 2-4-D 2.5 Gal Containers
Please provide price per Gl 40 [ GL | $ 13.25|$ 530.00($ 1350 $ 540.00($ 11.27| $ 450.80
2 -
Brand bidding: R'VerdanV_\foedesmy DMA 4 IUM, Dow Agro 2 -4 -D Amine
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Crossbow 2.5 Gallon Containers
Please provide price per GL 50 | GL | $ 56.25( $ 2,81250| $ 56.00( $ 2,800.00 | $ 47.27| $ 2,363.50
3
Brand bidding: Crossbow Crossbow Crossbow
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Razor 2.5 Gallon Containers |y | o) | 1275|$ 51000|$ 1400 $ 560.00 |$ 11.97| $ 478.80
Please provide price per GL
4 Brand bidding: Cheminova Glyfos X-tra Razor Pro Glyphosate Pro4
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Premier 90 2.5 Gal Containers |, | ) ¢ g9o5|$ o9950|$ 900[$ 9000|$ 917|$ 9170
5 Please provide price per GL
Brand bidding: Alligare Alligare 90 Red River 90 Pure & Simple 90%
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Payment Terms 0% 0 Days N/A Net % 30 Days
Delivery Days ARO 71010 3to5
Comments

Explanation: Awarded to the overall low bid.
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