
Buyer: Suzanne Siemer 3182 OF Opening Date: 02/12/10

Aggregate, Industries Constructors, Inc Dobson Brothers Construction Flinn Paving Co., Inc.

Description Est Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 Patching D-1 302 Superior Lincoln 310 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          113.36  No Bid 
2 Patching D-1 Auburn 320 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          117.03  No Bid 
3 Patching D-1 Beatrice 310 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          116.51  No Bid 
4 Patching D-1 David City 310 TN  $                   223.00  No Bid  $                                          116.51  No Bid 
5 Patching D-1 Dorchester 315 TN  $                   223.00  No Bid  $                                          115.19  No Bid 
6 Patching D-1 Fairbury 315 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          117.29  No Bid 
7 Patching D-1 Falls City 307 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          120.55  No Bid 
8 Patching D-1 Greenwood 308 TN  $                   223.00  No Bid  $                                          113.36  No Bid 
9 Patching D-1 Nebraska City 318 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          115.98  No Bid 
10 Patching D-1 Palmyra 326 TN  $                   223.00  No Bid  $                                          114.66  No Bid 
11 Patching D-1 Pawnee City 307 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          117.03  No Bid 
12 Patching D-1 Salt Valley Lincoln 316 TN  NB  No Bid  $                                          113.88  No Bid 
13 Patching D-1 Seward 308 TN  $                   223.00  No Bid  $                                          115.19  No Bid 
14 Patching D-1 Tecumseh 315 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          116.51  No Bid 
15 Patching D-1 Wahoo 308 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          114.41  No Bid 
16 Patching D-2 Blair 311 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          117.56  No Bid 
17 Patching D-2 Elkhorn 314 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          116.51  No Bid 
18 Patching D-2 Fremont 342 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          116.51  No Bid 
19 Patching D-2 Omaha 310 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          117.03  No Bid 
20 Patching D-2 Gretna 310 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          114.66  No Bid 
21 Patching D-2 Plattsmouth 315 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          115.72  No Bid 
22 Patching D-3 Albion 244 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          123.33  No Bid 
23 Patching D-3 Bloomfield 320 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          128.06  No Bid 
24 Patching D-3 Columbus 315 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          118.61  No Bid 
25 Patching D-3 Hartington 335 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          128.58  No Bid 
26 Patching D-3 Humphrey 268 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          120.71  No Bid 
27 Patching D-3 Laurel 304 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          127.53  No Bid 
28 Patching D-3 Lyons 300 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          119.91  No Bid 
29 Patching D-3 Neligh 297 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          126.48  No Bid 
30 Patching D-3 Niobrara 320 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          129.63  No Bid 
31 Patching D-3 Norfolk 30 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          123.07  No Bid 
32 Patching D-3 So Sioux City 330 TN  NB  No Bid  $                                          124.38  No Bid 
33 Patching D-3 Wayne 335 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          123.86  No Bid 

Bulk & Bagged Bituminous Cold Patch Material
Li

ne
 #

Page 1 of 4
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Aggregate, Industries Constructors, Inc Dobson Brothers Construction Flinn Paving Co., Inc.

Description Est Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Bulk & Bagged Bituminous Cold Patch Material
Li

ne
 #

34 Patching D-3 West Point 291 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  $                                          119.91  No Bid 
35 Patching D-4 Aurora 314 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          119.66  No Bid 
36 Patching D-4 Central City 315 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          121.23  No Bid 
37 Patching D-4 Fullerton 315 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          121.23  No Bid 
38 Patching D-4 Geneva 315 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          119.66  No Bid 
39 Patching D-4 Grand Island 231 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          120.71  No Bid 
40 Patching D-4 Greeley 315 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          126.48  No Bid 
41 Patching D-4 Hastings 180 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          121.23  No Bid 
42 Patching D-4 Hebron 364 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          120.71  No Bid 
43 Patching D-4 Kearney 30 TN  $                   201.00  No Bid  $                                          124.12  No Bid 
44 Patching D-4 Loup City 299 TN  $                   201.00  No Bid  $                                          126.48  No Bid 
45 Patching D-4 Ord 321 TN  $                   201.00  No Bid  $                                          127.53  No Bid 
46 Patching D-4 Osceola 184 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          119.13  No Bid 
47 Patching D-4 Ravenna 30 TN  $                   201.00  No Bid  $                                          123.86  No Bid 
48 Patching D-4 Red Cloud 271 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          127.53  No Bid 
49 Patching D-4 St Paul 30 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          123.33  No Bid 
50 Patching D-4 Superior 298 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          124.90  No Bid 
51 Patching D-4 York 251 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          117.56  No Bid 
52 Patching D-5 Chadron 10 TN  $                   192.00  No Bid  $                                          149.58  No Bid 
53 Patching D-5 Gering 10 TN  $                   184.00  No Bid  $                                          149.06  No Bid 
54 Patching D-5 Sidney 10 TN  $                   184.00  No Bid  $                                          149.06  No Bid 
55 Patching D-7 McCook 30 TN  $                   192.00  No Bid  $                                          135.41  No Bid 
56 Patching D-7 Minden 30 TN  $                   201.00  No Bid  $                                          124.38  No Bid 
57 Patching D-8 Ainsworth 30 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          137.51  No Bid 
58 Patching D-8 O'Neill 30 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  $                                          130.38  No Bid 
59 Lincoln Per Ton FOB Plant 1 TN  $                   213.00  $              110.00  $                                          109.68  No Bid 
60 Omaha Per Ton FOB Plant 1 TN  $                   227.00  No Bid  No Bid  $                   110.00 
61 Sioux City Per Ton FOB Plant 1 TN  $                   213.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
62 North Platte Per Ton FOB Plant 1 TN  $                   192.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
63 Bagged Cold Patch Material 18000 BG  NB  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

UPM QPR Omega Mix UPM

NB No Bid

0% 0 Days Net % 30 Days
1 Required

Brand Name of Material Bidding:
Bulk Brand:

Bagged Brand:

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO
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Buyer: Suzanne Siemer 3182 OF Opening Date: 02/12/10

Description Est Qty UOM
1 Patching D-1 302 Superior Lincoln 310 TN
2 Patching D-1 Auburn 320 TN
3 Patching D-1 Beatrice 310 TN
4 Patching D-1 David City 310 TN
5 Patching D-1 Dorchester 315 TN
6 Patching D-1 Fairbury 315 TN
7 Patching D-1 Falls City 307 TN
8 Patching D-1 Greenwood 308 TN
9 Patching D-1 Nebraska City 318 TN
10 Patching D-1 Palmyra 326 TN
11 Patching D-1 Pawnee City 307 TN
12 Patching D-1 Salt Valley Lincoln 316 TN
13 Patching D-1 Seward 308 TN
14 Patching D-1 Tecumseh 315 TN
15 Patching D-1 Wahoo 308 TN
16 Patching D-2 Blair 311 TN
17 Patching D-2 Elkhorn 314 TN
18 Patching D-2 Fremont 342 TN
19 Patching D-2 Omaha 310 TN
20 Patching D-2 Gretna 310 TN
21 Patching D-2 Plattsmouth 315 TN
22 Patching D-3 Albion 244 TN
23 Patching D-3 Bloomfield 320 TN
24 Patching D-3 Columbus 315 TN
25 Patching D-3 Hartington 335 TN
26 Patching D-3 Humphrey 268 TN
27 Patching D-3 Laurel 304 TN
28 Patching D-3 Lyons 300 TN
29 Patching D-3 Neligh 297 TN
30 Patching D-3 Niobrara 320 TN
31 Patching D-3 Norfolk 30 TN
32 Patching D-3 So Sioux City 330 TN
33 Patching D-3 Wayne 335 TN

Bulk & Bagged Bituminous Cold Patch Material

Li
ne

 #
PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Logan Contractors 
Supply, Inc

Minneapolis Asphalt 
Systems Inc

Pavement Repair & 
Supplies, Inc Seaboard Asphalt U.S. Asphalt Co

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
 No Bid  $                     78.00  No Bid  $                   132.75 
 No Bid  $                     81.50  No Bid  $                   109.75 
 No Bid  $                     81.30  No Bid  $                   115.75 
 No Bid  $                     81.10  No Bid  $                   109.75 
 No Bid  $                     80.80  No Bid  $                   113.75 
 No Bid  $                     83.00  No Bid  $                   120.75 
 No Bid  $                     86.00  No Bid  $                   116.75 
 No Bid  $                     80.00  No Bid  $                   102.75 
 No Bid  $                     82.40  No Bid  $                   105.75 
 No Bid  $                     82.48  No Bid  $                   109.75 
 No Bid  $                     82.95  No Bid  $                   116.75 
 No Bid  $                     78.00  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  $                     81.00  No Bid  $                   110.75 
 No Bid  $                     82.50  No Bid  $                   113.75 
 No Bid  $                     82.15  No Bid  $                   103.75 
 No Bid  $                     88.00  No Bid  $                   103.75 
 No Bid  $                     83.25  No Bid  $                   100.75 
 No Bid  $                     83.38  No Bid  $                   103.75 
 No Bid  $                     82.80  No Bid  $                   103.75 
 No Bid  $                     82.98  No Bid  $                     99.75 
 No Bid  $                     84.00  No Bid  $                     99.75 
 No Bid  $                     89.95  No Bid  $                   123.75 
 No Bid  $                     93.00  No Bid  $                   132.75 
 No Bid  $                     88.95  No Bid  $                   113.75 
 No Bid  $                     97.50  No Bid  $                   126.75 
 No Bid  $                     95.00  No Bid  $                   118.75 
 No Bid  $                     96.95  No Bid  $                   123.75 
 No Bid  $                     96.00  No Bid  $                   110.95 
 No Bid  $                     98.20  No Bid  $                   125.75 
 No Bid  $                     99.40  No Bid  $                   133.75 
 No Bid  $                     97.00  No Bid  $                   119.15 
 No Bid  $                     91.00  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  $                     91.95  No Bid  $                   117.75 
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Buyer: Suzanne Siemer 3182 OF Opening Date: 02/12/10

Description Est Qty UOM

Bulk & Bagged Bituminous Cold Patch Material

Li
ne

 #

34 Patching D-3 West Point 291 TN
35 Patching D-4 Aurora 314 TN
36 Patching D-4 Central City 315 TN
37 Patching D-4 Fullerton 315 TN
38 Patching D-4 Geneva 315 TN
39 Patching D-4 Grand Island 231 TN
40 Patching D-4 Greeley 315 TN
41 Patching D-4 Hastings 180 TN
42 Patching D-4 Hebron 364 TN
43 Patching D-4 Kearney 30 TN
44 Patching D-4 Loup City 299 TN
45 Patching D-4 Ord 321 TN
46 Patching D-4 Osceola 184 TN
47 Patching D-4 Ravenna 30 TN
48 Patching D-4 Red Cloud 271 TN
49 Patching D-4 St Paul 30 TN
50 Patching D-4 Superior 298 TN
51 Patching D-4 York 251 TN
52 Patching D-5 Chadron 10 TN
53 Patching D-5 Gering 10 TN
54 Patching D-5 Sidney 10 TN
55 Patching D-7 McCook 30 TN
56 Patching D-7 Minden 30 TN
57 Patching D-8 Ainsworth 30 TN
58 Patching D-8 O'Neill 30 TN
59 Lincoln Per Ton FOB Plant 1 TN
60 Omaha Per Ton FOB Plant 1 TN
61 Sioux City Per Ton FOB Plant 1 TN
62 North Platte Per Ton FOB Plant 1 TN
63 Bagged Cold Patch Material 18000 BG

Brand Name of Material Bidding:
Bulk Brand:

Bagged Brand:

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD
Logan Contractors 

Supply, Inc
Minneapolis Asphalt 

Systems Inc
Pavement Repair & 

Supplies, Inc Seaboard Asphalt U.S. Asphalt Co

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
 No Bid  $                     94.85  No Bid  $                   110.75 
 No Bid  $                     93.90  No Bid  $                   120.75 
 No Bid  $                     94.50  No Bid  $                   124.75 
 No Bid  $                     94.10  No Bid  $                   122.75 
 No Bid  $                     93.98  No Bid  $                   120.75 
 No Bid  $                     89.90  No Bid  $                   125.75 
 No Bid  $                     93.50  No Bid  $                   135.75 
 No Bid  $                     92.00  No Bid  $                   127.75 
 No Bid  $                     91.85  No Bid  $                   125.75 
 No Bid  $                     95.50  No Bid  $                   132.75 
 No Bid  $                     95.00  No Bid  $                   135.75 
 No Bid  $                     95.00  No Bid  $                   139.75 
 No Bid  $                     92.00  No Bid  $                   113.75 
 No Bid  $                     93.00  No Bid  $                   131.75 
 No Bid  $                     95.15  No Bid  $                   136.75 
 No Bid  $                     92.70  No Bid  $                   130.75 
 No Bid  $                     90.10  No Bid  $                   132.75 
 No Bid  $                     89.90  No Bid  $                   116.75 
 No Bid  $                   110.00  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  $                   109.00  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  $                   108.70  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  $                   102.00  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  $                     89.98  No Bid  $                   133.75 
 No Bid  $                   105.00  No Bid  $                   147.75 
 No Bid  $                   101.00  No Bid  $                   133.75 
 No Bid  $                     75.00  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  $                     79.00  No Bid  $                     99.65 
 No Bid  $                     87.00  No Bid  No Bid 
 No Bid  $                     85.00  No Bid  No Bid 

 $                       8.80  $                     12.55  $                     12.75  $                     10.85  $                     12.75 

Omega Mix QPR

UPM Omega Mix Perma - Patch
Bond-X High 

Performance Cold 
Mix

QPR

Net % 30 Days 2% 10 Days 0% Net 30 Days Net % 30 Days
15 5 20

Comment: Minneapolis Asphalt Systems Inc and US Asphalt did not meet specifications on the bagged 
Cold Patch Material sample for line 63.
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