
Buyer: Rita Kucera 3176 OF Opening Date: 02/17/10

CTS and/or Def Tech Model Numbers
Est. Annual 

Usage
UOM Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

1 CTS 3581 ONLY 45 EA  NO   BID  $           20.40  $         918.00 

2 CTS 3555 OR Def-Tec 1178 ONLY 38 EA 17.50$            665.00$          19.72$            749.36$          

3 CTS 3559 OR Def-Tec 1199 ONLY 20 EA 15.63$            312.60$          19.04$            380.80$          

4 CTS 3556 OR Def-Tec 1197 ONLY 35 EA 14.69$            514.15$          17.81$            623.26$          

5 CTS 3555R OR Def-Tec 1177 ONLY 10 EA 18.25$            182.50$          19.93$            199.30$          

6 CTS 3530 OR Def-Tec 1152 ONLY 20 EA 41.25$            825.00$          40.55$            811.00$          

7 CTS 3510 OR Def-Tec 1153 ONLY 10 EA 38.75$            387.50$          39.10$            391.00$          

8 CTS 3600 OR Def-Tec 1270 ONLY 20 EA 6.69$              133.80$          5.91$              118.20$          

9 Def-Tec 1192 ONLY 45 EA 20.63$            928.35$          

10 Def-Tec 1191 ONLY 45 EA 22.19$            998.55$          

11 Def-Tec 1190 ONLY 45 EA 21.88$            984.60$          

12 Def-Tec 1193 ONLY 60 EA 18.75$            1,125.00$       

13 Def-Tec 1160 ONLY 30 EA 20.75$            622.50$          

14 Def-Tec 1161 ONLY 30 EA 21.31$            639.30$          

15 Def-Tec 1162 ONLY 30 EA 19.38$            581.40$          

16 Def-Tec 1163 ONLY 30 EA 17.19$            515.70$          

17 CTS 3440 OR Def-Tec 1140 ONLY 15 EA 20.75$            311.25$          21.85$            983.25$          

18 CTS 3430 OR Def-Tec 1142 ONLY 15 EA 19.38$            290.70$          19.17$            287.55$          

19 CTS 3420 OR Def-Tec 1141 ONLY 15 EA 21.31$            319.65$          21.85$            327.75$          

20 CTS 3400 OR Def-Tec 1143 ONLY 10 EA 17.19$            171.90$          17.17$            171.70$          

21 CTS 3220 OR Def Tec 2001 ONLY 10 EA 20.88$            208.80$          21.51$            215.10$          

22 CTS 3230 OR Def Tec 2002 ONLY 10 EA 18.44$            184.40$          20.53$            205.30$          

23 CTS 3210 3210 OR Def Tec 2003 ONLY 10 EA 16.25$            162.50$          20.96$            209.60$          

24 CTS 3231 OR Def Tec 1182 ONLY 15 EA 17.50$            262.50$          20.53$            307.95$          

25 CTS 3221 OR Def Tec 1181 ONLY 15 EA 20.13$            301.95$          20.96$            314.40$          

26 CTS 3211 OR Def Tec 1183 ONLY 10 EA 16.25$            162.50$          20.96$            209.60$          

27 CTS 3215 OR Dec Tec 1173 ONLY 30 EA 25.00$            750.00$          27.37$            821.10$          

28 CTS 3235 OR Def Tec 1172 ONLY 15 EA 26.25$            393.75$          25.97$            389.55$          

29 CTS 3225 OR Def Tec 1171 ONLY 15 EA 29.38$            440.70$          29.28$            439.20$          

30 CTS 2570 OR Def Tec 3105 ONLY 40 EA 5.94$              237.60$          4.93$              197.20$          

37 mm CN - Multiple Projectile

12 Ga. TKO

37 mm Practice (SR) Single Projectile

37 mm Bean Bag

37 mm CS (LR) Single Projectile

37 mm Ferret - Practice - Liquid

37 mm Muzzle Blast - OC

37 mm Muzzle Blast - CS

37 mm CN (SR) Single Projectile

Equipment/Products

37 mm Ferret - CN - Liquid

37 mm Ferret - CS - Liquid

37 mm Heavy Barricade Practice

37 mm Launch Cups

37 mm Ferret - CS - Powder

37 mm Ferret - CN - Powder

37 mm Foam Baton Rounds

37 mm Stinger Ball - 60 cal

37 mm Stinger - 32 cal

37 mm Ferret - Practice - Powder

37 mm Muzzle Blast - CN

37 mm Practice (LR) Single Projectile

37 mm CS (SR) Single Projectile

37 mm Rubber Baton

37 mm CN (LR) Single Projectile

37 mm Ferret - OC - Liquid

Global Guns & Hunting Inc

dba OMB Guns

Brand Bidding

(CTS)

Tear Gas & Less Lethal Devices

37 mm Muzzle Blast - Practice

PARTIAL AWARD

Express Police Supply

Brand Bidding

(Def-Tec)

37 mm CS - Multiple Projectile

PARTIAL AWARD

37 mm Practice - Multiple Projectile

37 mm Heavy Barricade CS

37 mm Ferret - OC - Powder
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Buyer: Rita Kucera 3176 OF Opening Date: 02/17/10

CTS and/or Def Tech Model Numbers
Est. Annual 

Usage
UOM Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext PriceEquipment/Products

Global Guns & Hunting Inc

dba OMB Guns

Brand Bidding

(CTS)

Tear Gas & Less Lethal Devices

PARTIAL AWARD

Express Police Supply

Brand Bidding

(Def-Tec)

PARTIAL AWARD

31 CTS 2581 OR Def Tec 3027 ONLY 800 EA 4.69$              3,752.00$       5.23$              4,184.00$       

32 Def -Tec 3019 ONLY 15 EA 5.53$              82.95$            

33 CTS 2440 OR Def Tec 3090 ONLY 45 EA 5.31$              238.95$          5.40$              243.00$          

34 CTS 2430 OR Def Tec 3092 ONLY 35 EA 5.31$              185.85$          5.40$              189.00$          

35 CTS 2400 OR Def Tec 3093 ONLY 30 EA 5.31$              159.30$          4.93$              147.90$          

36 CTS 2340 OR Def Tec 3010 ONLY 30 EA 5.31$              159.30$          5.40$              162.00$          

37 CTS 2320 OR Def Tec 3011 ONLY 30 EA 5.31$              159.30$          5.40$              162.00$          

38 CTS 2330 OR Def Tec 3012 ONLY 30 EA 5.31$              159.30$          5.40$              162.00$          

39 CTS 2300 OR Def Tec 3013 ONLY 30 EA 5.00$              150.00$          4.93$              147.90$          

40 Def -Tec 1050 ONLY 10 EA 45.03$            450.30$          

41 CTS 5231 OR Def Tec 1026 ONLY 35 EA 38.85$            1,359.75$       38.17$            1,335.95$       

42 CTS 5221 OR Def Tec 1025 ONLY 25 EA 40.33$            1,008.25$       39.27$            981.75$          

43 CTS 5211 OR Def Tec 1027 ONLY 10 EA 38.13$            381.30$          37.15$            371.50$          

44 CTS 5220 OR Def Tec 1071 ONLY 20 EA 30.63$            612.60$          29.50$            590.00$          

45 CTS 5230 OR Def Tec 1072 ONLY 30 EA 28.75$            862.50$          28.01$            840.30$          

46 CTS 5210 OR Def Tec 1073 ONLY 20 EA 30.00$            600.00$          28.73$            574.60$          

47 CTS 5220-B or Def Tec 1031 ONLY 28 EA 34.50$            966.00$          34.77$            973.56$          

48 CTS 5230-B or Def Tec 1032 ONLY 35 EA 34.50$            1,207.50$       35.36$            1,237.60$       

49 CTS 5210-B or Def Tec 1033 ONLY 30 EA 32.25$            967.50$          32.98$            989.40$          

50 CTS 5440 OR Def Tec 2040 ONLY 18 EA 37.00$            666.00$          36.55$            657.90$          

51 CTS 5420 OR Def Tec 2041 ONLY 18 EA 38.13$            686.34$          36.55$            657.90$          

52 CTS 5430 OR Def Tec 2042 ONLY 18 EA 37.00$            666.00$          35.15$            632.70$          

53 CTS 5400 OR Def Tec 2043 ONLY 20 EA 34.50$            690.00$          33.66$            673.20$          

54 CTS 6220 OR Def Tec 1081 ONLY 10 EA 27.81$            278.10$          27.46$            274.60$          

55 CTS 6230 OR Def Tec 1082 ONLY 10 EA 27.19$            271.90$          26.01$            260.10$          

56 CTS 8220 OR Def Tec 1015 ONLY 10 EA 22.50$            225.00$          22.87$            228.70$          

57 CTS 8230 OR Def Tec 1016 ONLY 10 EA 20.94$            209.40$          21.12$            211.20$          

58 CTS 8210 OR Def Tec 1017 ONLY 15 EA 19.38$            290.70$          20.61$            309.15$          

59 CTS 9593 OR Def Tec 1088 ONLY 10 EA 40.00$            400.00$          39.40$            394.00$          

60 CTS 9594 OR Def Tec 1089 ONLY 30 EA 40.00$            1,200.00$       39.40$            1,182.00$       

61 CTS 9590 OR Def Tec 1090 ONLY 20 EA 37.50$            750.00$          37.23$            744.60$          

62 CTS 9230 OR Def Tec 1092 ONLY 10 EA 28.75$            287.50$          27.41$            274.10$          

63 CTS 9210 OR Def Tec 1093 ONLY 10 EA 27.50$            275.00$          27.41$            274.10$          

Grenade - Riot Control CS

Grenade - CN - Pocket Tactical

Grenade - Rubber ball - CS -

Grenade - Flameless Expulsion - Inert

Grenade - Flameless Tri Chamber or 

12 ga. Bean Bag Rounds

Aerial Flashbangs

12 Ga. Ferret - OC - Powder

Grenade - Flameless Tri Chamber or 

12 Ga. Ferret - CS - Liquid

12 Ga. Ferret - Practice - Liquid

OC/CS Aersol Grenade

Grenade - CS 

Grenade - Rubber ball - OC

Grenade - CS - Pocket Tactical

Grenade - Pocket Tactical

Grenade Smoke

Grenade - Rubber ball

Grenade - Ball - CS

Grenade - Ball Smoke

Grenade - Riot Control CN

Grenade - Flameless Expulsion - CS

12 Ga. Ferret - CS - Powder

12 Ga. Ferret - Practice - Powder

12 Ga. Ferret - OC - Liquid

12 Ga. Ferret - CN - Liquid

Grenade - CN

Grenade - Triple Chaser - CS

Grenade - Flameless Tri Chamber or 

Grenade - Triple Chaser - CN

Grenade - Triple Chaser - Smoke

Grenade - Flameless Expulsion - CN

Grenade - Flameless Expulsion - OC
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Buyer: Rita Kucera 3176 OF Opening Date: 02/17/10

CTS and/or Def Tech Model Numbers
Est. Annual 

Usage
UOM Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext PriceEquipment/Products

Global Guns & Hunting Inc

dba OMB Guns

Brand Bidding

(CTS)

Tear Gas & Less Lethal Devices

PARTIAL AWARD

Express Police Supply

Brand Bidding

(Def-Tec)

PARTIAL AWARD

64 CTS 9440 OR Def Tec 1095 ONLY 10 EA 38.75$            387.50$          40.42$            404.20$          

65 CTS 6210-V OR Def Tec 1068 ONLY 1 EA 41.05$            41.05$            44.07$            44.07$            

66 CTS 6210-R OR Def Tec 1067 ONLY 2 EA 41.05$            82.10$            44.07$            88.14$            

67 CTS 6210-O OR Def Tec 1066 ONLY 2 EA 41.05$            82.10$            44.07$            88.14$            

68 CTS 6210-Y OR Def Tec 1069 ONLY 2 EA 41.05$            82.10$            44.07$            88.14$            

69 CTS 6210-G OR Def Tec 1065 ONLY 2 EA 41.05$            82.10$            44.07$            88.14$            

70 CTS 6210-B OR Def Tech 1064 ONLY 2 EA 41.05$            82.10$            44.07$            88.14$            

71 CTS 7290M ONLY 204 EA NO BID 32.18$            6,564.72$       

72 CTS 7290 ONLY 12 EA NO BID 32.18$            386.16$          

73 CTS 201FB ONLY 1 EA NO BID 12.92$            12.92$            

74 CTS 7290T ONLY 5 EA NO BID 40.21$            201.05$          

75 CTS 7290MT ONLY 6 EA NO BID 40.21$            241.26$          

Explanation:  Award was made to the low for each line item except for those items that needed to be grouped together by type for both practice and live rounds, as

practice and live agent rounds must perform the same during use.  Manufacturer differences between practice rounds and live agent rounds in a grouping could 

lead to different characteristics in flight paths, distances traveled, and effects.  Therefore, for items that are grouped (boxed) together (lines 6-7, 17-20, 21-23, 27-29,

 31-39,and  47-49) award was made to the overall low in these groupings.

Kiesler's Police Supply Inc

Cont. Discharge Grenade Red Smoke

Cont. Discharge Grenade Orange Smoke

Cont. Discharge Grenade Yellow Smoke

CTS Flashbang Training Kit

Cont. Discharge Grenade Violet Smoke

CTS Flashbang Trn Body Mini

CTS Mini Flashbangs

CTS Flashbang Standard Size

Cont. Discharge Grenade Green Smoke

Grenade - Rubber Ball - Ditraction - OC

Cont. Discharge Grenade Blue Smoke

No Bid

CTS Flashbang Trn Body Std Siz

60

Comments

Payment Terms

Delivery Days ARO

0% 0 DaysNet 30

30
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