Buyer: Michelle Kemper

Trail Tales Magazine

3146 OF

Opening Date: 12/29/09

Game Parks
AWARD

E Plrri]::i;sgt]aé%. Jacob North Omabha Print
- Description Description 2 Qty | UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

1 |Trail Tales 60# #2 Virgin 80M-120M 120 M $ 205.00] $ 130.00( $ 132.89
2 |Trail Tales 60# #2 Virgin 120,001-140M 140 M $ 188.84( $ 127.00( $ 127.28
3 |Trail Tales 60# #2 Virgin 140,001-160M 160 M $ 184.40| $ 124.00( $ 122.63
4 |[Trail Tales 60# #2 Virgin 160,001-180M 180 M $ 180.94( $ 122.00( $ 118.70
5 [Trail Tales Virg add'l 1-10M printed later 10 M $ 256.96 | $ 210.00( $ 279.10
6 |Trail Tales Virg add'l 11-20M printed later 20 M $ 205.18| $ 153.00| $ 177.80
7 |Trail Tales Virg add'l 21-30M printed later 30 M $ 187.95( $ 131.00( $ 149.66
8 [Trail Tales Virg add'l 31-40M printed later 40 M $ 180.20( $ 125.00( $ 135.67
9 |Trail Tales 60# #2 Recycled 80M-120M 120 M $ 240.13] $ 144.00( $ 142.13
10 |Trail Tales 60# #2 Recycled 120,001-140M 140 M $ 223.61] $ 140.00( $ 135.82
11 |Trail Tales 60# #2 Recycled 140,001-160M 160 M $ 219.08] $ 137.00( $ 131.08
12 |Trail Tales 60# #2 Recycled 160,001-180M 180 M $ 21556 | $ 135.00( $ 126.92
13 |Trail Tales Recy add'l 1-10M printed later 10 M $ 292.131 % 227.00( $ 290.00
14 |Trail Tales Recy add'l 11-20M printed later 20 M $ 239.29( $ 167.00( $ 187.15
15 |Trail Tales Recy add'l 21-30M printed later 30 M $ 221.68] $ 144.00( $ 158.50
16 |Trail Tales Recy add'l 31-40M printed later 40 M $ 213.741 $ 138.00( $ 144.22
17 |4 pg option Virg 1M-20M 8 3/8x10 7/8 trim on 60# #2 vi 20 M $ 83971 $ 79.00| $ 123.00
18 |4 pg option Virg 20M-40M 8 3/8x10 7/8 trim on 60# #2 vi 40 M $ 60.96| $ 52.00] $ 72.02
19 |4 pg option Virg 40,001-60M 8 3/8x10 7/8 trim on 60# #2 vi 60 M $ 53.09| $ 43.00( $ 55.05
20 |4 pg option Recy 1M-20M 8 3/8x10 7/8 trim on 60# #2 re 20 M $ 93.29] $ 85.00| $ 126.50
21 |4 pg option Recy 20M-40M 8 3/8x10 7/8 trim on 60# #2 re 40 M $ 69.771 $ 57.00| $ 74.75
22 |4 pg option recyc 40,001-60M 8 3/8x10 7/8 trim on 60# #2 re 60 M $ 61.72| $ 47.00( $ 57.51
23 |Insert Card virgin 10 pt. #3 gloss CIS, qty. 1-10 10 M $ 162.61( $ 174.00( $ 176.60
24 |Insert Card virgin 10 pt. #3 gloss CIS, gty 11-20 20 M $ 11055( $ 125.00( $ 126.95
25 [Insert Card virgin 10 pt. #3 gloss CIS, gty 21-30 30 M $ 91.92( $ 110.00| $ 111.26
26 |Insert Card virgin 10 pt. #3 gloss CIS, gty 31-40 40 M $ 82.73| $ 102.00| $ 101.62
27 |Insert Card recycled 10 pt. #3 gloss CIS, qty. 1-10 10 M $ 175.28 no bid $ 298.90
28 |Insert Card recycled 10 pt. #3 gloss CIS, qty 11-20 20 M $ 121.87 no bid $ 226.20
29 |Insert Card recycled 10 pt. #3 gloss CIS, gty 21-30 30 M $ 102.75 no bid $ 203.00
30 [Insert Card recycled 10 pt. #3 gloss CIS, gty 31-40 40 M $ 93.34 no bid $ 196.95
Payment Terms 2% 10 days net 30
Delivery Days ARO 14 days 10 - 15 working
Comments
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No Bid
Sioux Printing



