
Buyer: Connie Heinrichs 3108 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date:12/02/09 

PRIMARY 
AWARD

SECONDARY 
AWARD GAS 

ONLY

Li
ne

 # 1 Ton Crew Cab 4x4 Dual Rear 
Wheel Diesel Pickup Truck Anderson Ford Fremont Motors 

of Scottsbluff
Gene Steffy 

Chrysler Center
Husker Auto 

Group
Performance 

Dodge
Sid Dillon Chev 

Buick Pont
Tekamah Ford 
Lincoln Mercury

Base Price $36,999.00 $39,314.01 $43,656.00 $27,398.00 $37,230.00 $28,133.00 $37,972.00 
Make:  Ford 2011 Ford Dodge Chevrolet Dodge Chevrolet Ford

Model:  F350 CrewCab 
4x4 (W3D) F350 D28H92 Silverado Ram Silverado F350

GVWR:  13,000# GVWR 13,000 11400 12200 11400 12,600

Series, Code, Trim Level:  W3D XLT 623A 
spec  XLT  SLT  3500-CK30943-

LT  SLT  3500,CK30943
LT XLT

Engine            6.7L 4V Diesel 
V8  6.7L Diesel  6.7L 24V 

Cummins 
 6.0L Vortec V8-

Gas 
6.7L I6 Cummins 

Diesel  6.0L V8 6.7L V8

EPA  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A @ this time  N/A @ this time N/A

Delivery Time ARO  90-110 180 90-120 35-120 90-120 40-120 45-120

E85 model price
 ($3,130.00)

Deduct from line 
#1 price 

 N/A  N/A   N/A  N/A  N/A

Engine  6.2L 2V SOHC 
V8 E85  N/A  N/A  N/A N/A

Engine (other gas).  ($3,130.00) ($6,213.00) N/A N/A N/A N/A ($3,200.00)

Specify Engine Size:  6.2L 2V SOHC 
V8 E85  6.2 V8 6.8L V10

Engine (other gas).   N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A N/A

Specify Engine Size:

Engine (other diesel), including 
block heater, factory or dealer 
installed

 N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A N/A

Model:
Warranty:

Specify Engine Size: 6.7L  I6 Diesel
In Bid

6 Air-Conditioning (deduct) N/A STD N/A N/A STD N/A STD

7 From Automatic to Manual Four-
Speed Transmission (deduct) N/A N/A $1,200.00 N/A No Bid N/A ($1,200.00)
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8 40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench seat 
W/ lumbar support (deduct) STD ($593.00) N/A N/A (765.00) STD N/A

9 Bucket type seats - Vinyl 
covering (deduct) N/A ($295.00) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

10 Bucket type seats - Cloth w/vinyl 
trim 373.00 $510.00 N/A $995.00 786.00 995.00 N/A

11
2 electric remote controlled 
outside mirrors, swing away type, 
6" X 9" (deduct)

N/A STD STD 7x10 N/A STD Add $195.00 N/A

12 Right and left telescopic mirrors, 
minimum 6x8 STD STD STD  $240.00 STD-Trailer Tow $345.00 power & 

heated $165.00 

13 No Radio (deduct) N/A N/A N/A N/A STD N/A NA
Heavy duty alternator, optional, 
minimum 105 amp alternator. $102.00 $62.00 STD $75.00 STD 185.00 $190.00 

Bidder state amps: 200 155 160 160 160 160 200
Heavy duty battery optional. STD N/A STD $57.00 STD 164.00 NA

Bidder state CCA:
Diesel 750 
CCA78 AH 

Dual/Gas  650 
800 CCA x 2 730 730 Aux.600cca 

Battery

16 Deduct for no sliding rear-vision 
window (deduct) N/A ($104.00) STD ($119.00) STD ($174.00) N/A

17 Deduction for no lid on Utility 
Body (deduct) ($650.00) ($770.00) ($400.00) N/A ($500.00)

18 Air bag, Dual (if not standard) STD STD STD STD STD $95.00 STD
19 Carpeted floor $150.00 STD N/C $75.00 STD $245.00 $185.00 
20 Second Power Outlet STD STD $50.00 STD STD STD STD

Decreased pickup box length of 
approximately 6 ½ feet with 
corresponding wheelbase.

N/A N/A N/A N/A ($175.00) N/A N/A

Bidder state wheelbase:  N/A  149" 
22 Single rear wheels (deduct) ($342.00) ($2,087.00) ($980.00) ($799.00) ($1,101.00) ($1,225.00) ($1,500.00)

23

GVWR  (NOTE: Five wheels and 
tires will be required meeting 
same requirements as defined in 
the Specifications)

11,500 11,000 10,100# 9900 LB 10100 LB 9900 LB

21
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Chassis with eight foot Utility 
Body (see ATTACHMENT) 
Single wheel  (Color of Utility 
Body to match manufacturer 
color charts)

$6,243.00 $8,493.00 $42,051.00 6,495.00 See Attached 
Sheet 6,295.00

State make and model  Knapheide Knapheide 
696D54J1 OMA STD 96V Omaha Std 96V & 

Knapheide 696J

Omaha Standard-
96V or Knapheide-

696J
Chassis with eight foot Utility 
Body (see ATTACHMENT) Dual 
wheel (Color of Utility Body to 
match manufacturer color charts)

$7,050.00 $8,493.00 $43,656.00 6,995.00 N/A 6,995.00

State make and model  Knapheide  Knapheide 
696D54J1 

 OMA STD 
96D54V 

 Omaha STD 
96D54V & 
Knapheide 

Omaha Standard 
96D54V or 
Knapheide 

26 Chassis Cab with no Utility Box 
(With single wheels.) N/A $35,818.00 N/A N/A Box Delete,56CA 

$27373.00 N/A

27 Chassis Cab with no Utility Box 
(With dual wheels.) N/A $36,789.00 N/A N/A Box Delete,56CA 

$27773.00 N/A

28 Trailer towing package (deduct)  N/A STD N/A ($169.00) STD ($259.00) STD

29 Cargo light

 $350.00
STD w/pickup 

add for chassis 
utility body 

 STD STD $99.00 STD $95.00 STD

30 Standard Paint - Attach List and 
Identify as No Additional Cost  STD  N/C  N/C  N/C-See 

Attached 
 See Attached 

Sheet NC-See Attached STD

31

For Department of Roads Use: 
Yellow color of: Dodge #PY5269, 
Ford #84S53, Chevrolet/GMC 
#WA-253A code (9W3)

 N/C  N/C  N/A  $299.00 See 
Attaached  No Bid  NC NC

32 Extra Cost Paint- Attach List and 
Identify as Extra Cost Paints N/A $200.00 $299.00 See 

Attaached
See Attached 

Sheet See Attached N/A

33 Anti-lock Braking System (ABS) STD STD STD STD STD $195.00

34 Additional remote fob from 
manufacturer $168.00 $89.00 $158.00 $99.00 $110.00 $95.00 $100.00 

35  Dealer or Factory installed 
rearview camera 

$2,285.00
opt 76V requires 

opt 96C
N/A N/A $1,699.00 $170.00 $685.00 $2,085.00 

24
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36  Dealer or Factory installed 
tailgate step. 424.00 311.00 N/A N/A No Bid N/A $375.00 

37 Equipment & engine service 
repair manual. 420.00 300.00 See 38 $299.00 $515.00 $295.00 when 

available $400.00 

38 Equipment & engine service 
repair manual on CD ROM N/A 300.00 120.00 $899.00 when 

available 125.00 $595.00 when 
available $750.00 

39 Equipment & engine parts 
manual N/A 300.00 See 38 299.00 N/A $250.00 when 

available $400.00 

40 Equipment & engine parts on CD 
ROM N/A 300.00 See 38 $899.00 when 

available $395.00 $250.00 when 
available N/A

Addional costs for warranties 
from manufacturer.  State

$745.00 - 
$2,580.00 See attached NC-pwr train No Bid

$2315.00-Call for 
other terms & 
deductibles

Years 4yr - 7yr 5 5

Miles 75k - 100k
see attached 100000 100000

42

Discount for Electronic Fund 
Transfer payment within 10 days 
after receipt of vehicle.   Indicate 
percentage of discount that will 
be allowed.

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

43 Deduction for delivery with only 
two (2) sets of keys per vehicle ($168.00) ($89.00) $158.00 ($10.00) ($110.00)  $                (5.00) ($100.00)

44

Additional costs of charges for 
vehicle drop shipment outside 
the Lincoln area. Drop shipment 
charges would be for vehicles 
bought by political entities and 
other Divisions of Government.

$495.00 $385.00 $350.00 $500.00 $500.00  $              400.00 $500.00 

0/30 0/30 0% 15 0% 15
90-110 180 90-120 35-120 90-120 40-120 45

2 WD option      
-w/all season tire 

($1399.00)

Addition Options 
see bid

Payment Terms
Delivery Time ARO

Comments

41
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