Buyer: Connie Heinrichs

3103 OF

Opening Date:11/25/09

All Agencies
SECONDARY
PRIMARY AWARD AWARD
H*
2 11/2 Ton, Regular Cab, 2WD Base Truck Fremont Motors of Gene Steffy Husker Auto Group Performance Sid Dillon Wahoo Tekamah Ford
= Scottsbluff Chrysler Center Dodge, Inc
Base Price $15,940.20 $17,775.00 $15,599.00 $17,294.00 $15,593.00 $15,754.00
Make: Ford Dodge Chevrolet Dodge Chevrolet Ford
Model: F150 1500 Ram Silverado Ram Silverado F150
1 [GVYWR: 6750 6700 6400 6600 6400 6750
Series, Code, Trim level; XL DS1262 1500'3\%10903' ST 1500,CC10903,WT XL
Engine 4.6L V8 4.7L V8 FFV 4.8L Vortec 4.7L V8 FFV 4.8L V8 4.6L V8
EPA 15/19 13/18 14C/19H 14/17 14/19 15/19
. 1. NC 4.8L
E85 model price $17,160.20 $17,775.00 5 $799.00 5.3L $17,294.00 $15,593.00 $17,554.00
2 . 1.4.8L Vortec V8
Engine 5.4L FFV 4.7L V8 FFV 5 5 3L VortecVs 4.7L V8 FFV 4.8L V8 5.4L V8
Alternate Engine Sizes:
Engine (other gas). 4.6L V8 3V LU3 4.3K Vortec
. $743.00 $17,212.00 V6 -($399.00) $1,114.00 ($603.00) $1,800.00
Specify Engine Size: 5.4L 5.3L Vortec V8
$1266.00 3.7L V6 $799.00 5.7L V8 HEMI 4.3L V6 5.4L V8
Engine (other diesel), including block
4 |heater, factory or dealer installed. NA NA NA NA NA
Specify Engine Size:
40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench seat W/ lumbar (425.00) See
3 support vinyl (deduct) STD NA NC Exception NA NC
Bucket type seats - Vinyl covering No Console-
6 NA NA Exposed area- NA NA NA
untrimed $49.00
Bucket type seats - Cloth w/vinyl trim No Console-
7 NA NA Exposed area- NA NA NA
untrimed $49.00
2 electric remote controlled outside $985.00-includes
mirrors, swing away type, 6" X 9" $999.00 Pwr Pk- See item #10 & pwr. windows &
8 $660.00 $85.00 Pwr mirrors & locks #11 locks uplevels door NA
panels
9 |Electronic compass/temp display NA NA DI $359.00 NA $339.00 NA
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Power door Locks $985.00-includes
10 $660.00 $735.00 w/keyless $445.00 pwr. windows & $800.00
Package 625.00 mirrors
Electric power windows pwrlocks and 7 oe8 00-includes $800.00
$999.00 Pwr Pk- windows - :
11 $660.00 ; pwr. windows & Includes w/pwr
Pwr mirrors & locks :
mirrors locks
Automiatic Speed (cruise) control and tilt $213.00 i
12 steering wheel, factory installed $187.00 Cruise/Tilt-STD $250.00 Inc. In bid $275.00 $225.00
Hequ duty alternator, highest output STD STD STD STD NA NA
13 |available
Bidder state amperage: 155 Amp 160 145 $160.00
14 [Sliding rear-vision window $187.00 NA $399.00 $119.00 $375.00 NA
15 |Second power outlet STD STD STD $26.00 STD NA
Deduction for pickup box length of
16 |@PProx. 6 1/2 feet with corresponding ($272.00) ($290.00) ($179.00) ($442.00) ($195.00) NA
wheelbase.
Bidder state wheelbase: 126" 120" 119" 120" 119"
17 |Cargo light STD STD $99.00 STD $95.00 STD
Standard Paint - Attach List and Identify
18 | as No Additional Cost Paints NC NC-See Attached |See attached sheet| NC-see attached STD
For Department of Roads Use: Yellow
19 |color of: Dodge #PY5269, Ford #84S53, NC NA $299.00 See No Bid NC NC
Chevrolet/GMC #WA-2253A code (9W3) Attached
20 Z t&i)i\%séig (?rllr:l ét;ztc g;ﬁttsand \dentiy $191.00 $2:t?£:?];ee See attached sheet| See Attached Attached
21 Keyless remote entry locking system (if $660.00 $250.00 $445.00 w/ pwr. | Package See #10 | $445.00 power NA
not standard) locks &11 locks
22 |Additional remote fob from manufacturer $89.00 $108.00 $99.00 w/ #21-$110.00 $95.00 NA
Non-standard gear ratio(s). NA GT4-$100.00 NA $200.00 NA
23 Indicate: 3.92 Axle ratio
3.73 required w/ anti- $3.73
spin-Inc. w/bid
24 |14 wheel drive model $3,688.00 $3,456.00 $3,995.00 $2,607.00 $3,300.00
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On/Off road mud and snow all terrain
tires and spare (can be steel rim), 8-10 $279.00
25 |ply, size LT255/70R17 or LT245/75R17 $249.00 NA QXR+Load Range LT2752/I;)I?)(1)7CAT $275.00 NA
or LT265/75R17, such as Goodyear C ’
Wrangler AT/S steel-belted tires.
Dealer installed integrated brake $270.00 factory
26 controller system. STD $140.00 $259.00 NA installed NA
27 Dealer or Factory installed rearview NA NA NA NA No Bid $685.00 NA
camera.
2g |Dealer or Factory installed tailgate step. $291.00 NA NA NA No Bid NA $350.00
Equipment & engine service repair
29 |Z9UP g P see 30 $299.00 $575.00 SRR $450.00
manual. available
Equipment & engine service repair $899.00 When $595.00 when
30 [manual on CD ROM $120.00 available $125.00 available $750.00
31 Equipment & engine parts manual see 30 $299.00 NA $22(\J/£gl\:l)\|/2en $400.00
32 Equipment & engine parts on CD ROM see 30 $82153/.E(i)itl)a\t/)\|/2en $395.00 $22(\)/£|21;\|12en
Addional costs for warranties from STD See Attached NC No Bid 1840-GmPP Major
33 manufacturer. Guard
Years 3 5 5
Miles 36000 100000 100000
Additional costs of charges for vehicle
drop shipment outside the Lincoln area.
34 |Drop shipment charges would be for $385.00 $350.00 $500.00 $400.00 $400.00 $500.00
vehicles bought by political entities and
other Divisions of Government.
35 |Payment Terms 0% 30 0% 15 0% 15
36 [Delivery Days ARO 90 90-120 35-120 90-120 40-120 45
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