
Buyer: Connie Heinrichs 3102 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date:11/25/09

PRIMARY 
AWARD

SECONDARY 
AWARD

Li
ne

 #

1/2 Ton, Regular Cab, 4X4 Pickup Truck Fremont Motors of 
Scottsbluff

Gene Steffy 
Chrysler Center Husker Auto Group Performance 

Dodge Inc. Sid Dillon Tekamah Ford 
Linclon Mercury

Base Price $19,923.20 $19,918.00 $20,999.00 $20,346.00 $21,373.00 $20,533.00 
Make: Ford Dodge Chevrolet Dodge Chevrolet Ford
Model: F150 1500 RamSLT Silverado Ram Silverado F150
GVWR: 6950 6600 6800 6600 6800 7200
Series, Code, Trim Level: XL SLT-DS61-162 1500-CK-10903-LT SLT 1500,CK10903,LT XLT Super Cab
Engine 4.6L V8 4.7L V8 4.8L Vortec 4.7L V8 FFV 4.8L V8 4.6L V8
EPA  14/19  13/18 13C/18H  14/17 13C/18H 14-/18

E85 model price $22,309.20 $19,918.00 1. NC 4.8L        
2.  $799.00 5.3L $20,396.00 $21,373.00 $22,333.00 

Engine 5.4 4.7L V8 FFV 1. 4.8L Vortec V8   
2. 5.3L Vortec V8 4.7L V8 FFV 4.8L V8 5.4L V8

Engine (other gas).  $1,266.00 $24,990.00 LMG $799.00 $1,114.00 $800.00 $1,800.00 

Specify Engine Size: 5.4FFV $2386.00 5.7L V8 HEMI 5.3L Vortec V8 5.7L V8 HEMI
5.3L V8, Flex Fuel, 

Active Fuel 
Management

5.4L V8

 Engine (other diesel), including block 
heater, factory or dealer installed.   NA NA NA NA

Specify Engine Size:

5 40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench seat W/ lumbar 
support (vinyl) (deduct) $0.00 NA NC NA NA NA

6 Bucket type seats - Vinyl covering NA NA NA NA NA NA
7 Bucket type seats - Cloth w/vinyl trim NA NA NA $2,100.00 NA NA
8 Electronic compass / temp display system NA STD $359.00 DI NA $339.00 NA
9 Deduct for no sliding rear-vision window ($187.00) ($100.00) NA on Model Bid ($119.00) ($174.00) NA
10 Second Power Outlet STD STD STD STD STD

Deduction for pickup box length of 
approximately 6 1/2 feet with corresponding 
wheelbase.

($262.00) STD ($139.00) ($262.00) ($179.00) NA

Bidder state wheelbase: 126" 120" 119" 120" 119"
12 Trailer towing package (deduct) ($291.00) ($200.00) ($169.00) STD ($250.00) STD
13 Cargo light STD STD $99.00 STD $95.00 STD
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14 Standard Paint - Attach List and Identify as 
No Additional Cost Paints NC NC-See Attached See Attached 

Sheet NC-See Attached STD

15
For Department of Roads Use: Yellow color 
of: Dodge #PY5269, Ford #84S53, 
Chevrolet/GMC #WA-253A code (9W3)

NC 299.00 See 
Attached No Bid NC NC

16 Extra Cost Paint- Attach List and Identify as 
Extra Cost Paints $191.00 299.00 See 

Attached
See Attached 

Sheet See Attached See Attached

17 Additional remote fob from manufacturer $89.00 $108.00 $99.00-See 
Attached

INC. In Bid      
(Dealer Item) $95.00 $100.00 

18

On/Off road mud and snow all terrain tires 
and spare (can be steel rim), 8-10 ply, size  
LT255/70R17 or LT245/75R17 or 
LT265/75R17, such as Goodyear Wrangler 
AT/S steel-belted tires. 

$249.00 150W/OWL 279 QXR= Load 
Range

LT275/70R17CA
T              

$213.00
$275.00 NA

Non-standard gear ratio(s).  NC NA GU4-$100.00 NA NA

Indicate: 3.08
3.92 Axle ration 
required w/Anti-
spin-Inc. IN Bid

20 Deduction for two wheel drive model (to 
include all season tires) (deduct)

($3959.00) w/out 
skid plates ($3,750.00) ($1,199.00) ($386.00) ($1,965.00)

21 Dealer installed integrated brake controller 
system. STD $280.00 $259.00 No Bid Factory installed 

$270.00 NA

22 Dealer or Factory installed rearview NA NA NA No Bid $685.00 $700.00 
23 Dealer or Factory installed tailgate step. $291.00 NA NA No Bid NA $350.00 

24 Equipment & engine service repair manual. $300.00 See 23 $299.00 $515.00 $295.00 when 
available $450.00 

25 Equipment & engine service repair manual 
on CD ROM $300.00 $120.00 899.00 when 

available $125.00 $595.00 when 
available $750.00 

26 Equipment & engine parts manual $300.00 See 23 $299.00 NA $250.00 when 
available $400.00 
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27 Equipment & engine parts on CD ROM $300.00 See 23 $899.00 when 
available $395.00 $250.00 when 

available
Additonalcosts for warranties from 
manufacture. State STD See Attached NC No Bid $2315.00 GMPD 

major Guard
Years: 3 5
Miles: 36000 100000

29

Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop 
shipment outside the Lincoln area. Drop 
shipment charges would be for vehicles 
bought by political entities and other 
Divisions of Government.

$385.00 $350.00 $500.00 $400.00 $400.00 $500.00 

30 Payment Terms 0% 30 0% 15 0% 15
31 Delivery Days ARO 90 90-120 35-120 90-120 40-120 45

Award Explanation
Gene Steffy: bid no lumbar, spec says required. 
Fremont Motors: bid XL; acceptable model XLT
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