Buyer: Connie Heinrichs

3098 OF

Opening Date:11/25/09

All Agencies
SECONDARY
PRIMARY AWARD
AWARD E85
H*
2 Compact Crew Cab 4-Door, 4x4 Pickup Gene Steffy Husker Auto Group HELSIIEIES Sid Dillon
5 Chrysler Center Dodge
Base Price $ 19,020.00| $ 20,916.00 [ $ 19,954.00( $ 20,990.00
Make: Dodge Chevrolet Dodge Chevrolet
Model: Dakota Colorado Dakota Colorado
1 GVWR: 6010 5300 6010 5300
. . . Colorado-CT . Colorado, CT15643,
Series, Code, Trim Level: ND5L84 15643-LT Big Horn LT
Engine 3.7L V6 3.7L DOHC 5 ¢yl 3.7L V6 3.7L 15
EPA 16C / 21H 14-18 16 City, 21 Hwy
2 E85 $ 19,964.00 N/A $ 20,898.00 N/A
Engine 4.7L V8 FFV N/A 4.7L V8 FFV N/A
3 Engine (other gas). $ 19,964.00| $ 1,395.00 [ $ 944.00| $ 1,305.00
Specify Engine Size: 4.7L V8 FFV 4.7L V8 FFV 5.3L V8
4 140-20-40 or 60-40 style seat w/ lumbar (vinyl) support N/A N/A N/A N/A
5 [Bucket type seats - Vinyl covering N/A N/A N/A N/A
6 |Bucket type seats - Cloth w/vinyl trim N/A $ 349.00 | $ (498.00)| $ 389.00
7 |Deduct for no sliding rear-vision window (deduct) $ (1,057.00)| $ (79.00)| $ (125.00)| $ (118.00)
8 |Second Power Outlet STD STD STD STD
9 |Trailer towing package (deduct) $ (109.00)| $ (147.00)| $ (169.00) | $ (179.00)
10|Cargo light STD $ 99.00 STD $ 95.00
11|Electronic compass/temp display Temp Only $ 199.00 N/A $ 95.00
12|Standard Paint - Attach List and Identify as No Additional Cost Paints N/C N/C See Attached Seesﬁt;z:\;hed NC see attached
13 For Department of Roads Use: Yellow color of: Dodge #PY5269, Ford #84S53, N/A $299.00 No Bid NC
Chevrolet/GMC #WA-253A code (9W3) See Attached
. , . . $299.00 See Attached
14|Extra Cost Paint- Attach List and Identify as Extra Cost Paints $ 200.00 See Attached Sheet See attached
Snow plow attachment of pickup manufacturer's (Western, Boss, Meyer, and $3995.00-See
Northman brands with power angling, 8-foot bolt on blade, plow head and turn $ 4949.00( $ 3,995.00 N/A ) .
. Comments on Bid
lights, snow deflector, blade markers.)
15 6'8" Meyers or 6'8"
Specify equipment included: Buyers- As Boss 7' Straight Poly
Sport Blade
Reguested
16|Additional remote fob from manufacturer $ 108.00 $ 99.00 Inc In Iigithealer $ 95.00
$6,010
17|GVW RATING PLATE of not less than 4,600 pounds $ 6,010.00 N/A STD N/A
18|Equipment & engine service repair manual. See 19 $ 299.00 | $ 515.00 | $295, when available
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19|Equipment & engine service repair manual on CD ROM $ 120.00 $§?,gi.;vbr;§n 125.00 | $595, when available
20|Equipment & engine parts manual See 19 $ 299.00 N/A $250, when available
21|Equipment & engine parts on CD ROM See 19 $8991 when 395.00 | $250, when available
22|Two wheel drive (deduct) $ 1,200.00 | $ (1,199.00) $ (2,655.00) $ (1,500.00)
Additonal cost for warranties from Manufacturer. See Attached N/C No Bid $ 2,315.00
23 Years 5 5
Miles 100,000, pwr train 100’.0.00' see bid for
additional coments
Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop shipment outside the Lincoln area.
24 (Drop shipment charges would be for vehicles bought by political entities and other | $ 350.00| $ 500.00 400.00| $ 400.00
Divisions of Government.
LAW ENFORCEMENT ONLY
25|Factory disconnect of daylight running lights N/A- Dealer $ 299.00 35.00] $ 175.00
26|Factory disconnect of factory dome light or courtesy lamps N/A $ 199.00 35.00 N/A
Courtesy/courtesy lamp: To be centered not more than approximately 4” to 8”
27 From the top pf the Wlnd;hleld to I!ght the driver’s area and .controllled by rotatlng sSTD $ 299.00 No Bid $ 295 00
headlamp switch to maximum position or by a separate switch. This may require
adding an additional light. Dealer installation is acceptable if not available from the
Spotlight: Mounted on driver’s side (left door post). Spotlight shall be fused in
accordance with manufacturers specifications. Unity #250 (or equal) 5-inch $595.00 Door
28|diameter spotlight with halogen lamp is preferred. Unity #225 (or equal) 6-inch Mbunt $ 499.00 No Bid $ 495.00
diameter spotlight with halogen lamp is an acceptable substitute. All spotlights for
one make and model of vehicle must be the same size. Dealer installation is
Payment Terms 0% 30 0%15 0% 0% 15
Delivery Days ARO 90-120 35-120 90-120 40-120
Comments see bid _for additional
options and

Award Explanation

Dodge Dakota does not meet the required lumbar seats. Awarded E85 only
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