Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

30730F

Opening Date: 11/12/09

AWARD
1# | Mens and Womens Oxfords in Smooth Leather . Galls-An Aramark . . . .
o . - Alamar Uniforms company Pioneer Uniforms Pioneer Uniforms
2 and High-Gloss Finish Company
- Description Qty | UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
1 Shoe Laces for all oxfords 100 PR $2.00 $200.00] $3.59 $359.00 $0.60 $60.00 $0.60 $60.00
Brand & Style Mitchlace Inc Mp688 5.11 Thorogood Thorogood
High-gloss oxfords, men's,
standard sizes $68.00 $6,800.00 $31.49 $3,149.00 $28.95 $2,895.00 $56.50 $5,650.50
2 100 PR
Brand & Style Bates 941 DutyPro Rothco 5055 Bates 941
High-gloss oxfords, men's, $120.00 |  $360.00 $31.49 $94.47 $28.95 $86.85 $56.50 $169.50
3 |non-standard sizes 3 PR
Brand & Style Bates 941 DutyPro Rothco 5055 Bates 941
Black leather oxfords, men's,
standard sizes $73.00 $2,920.00 $31.49 $1,259.60 $34.00 $1,360.00 $61.50 $2,460.00
4 40 PR
Brand & Style Bates 968 Bates Rothco 5085 Bates 968
Black leather oxfords, men's,
. $120.00 $360.00 $62.99 $188.97 $34.00 $102.00 $61.50 $184.50
5 |non-standard sizes 3 PR
Brand & Style Bates 968 Bates Rotch 5085 Bates 968
High-gloss oxfords, women's
standard sizes $71.75 $1,435.00 $62.99 $1,259.80 N/A $0.00 $60.95 $1,219.00
6 20 PR
Brand & Style Bates 742 N/A N/A Bates 742
Black leather oxfords, women's
. $82.00 $1,640.00 na $0.00 N/A $0.00 $68.50 $1,370.00
standard sizes
7 20 PR
Brand & Style Bates 752 N/A N/A Bates 752
Totals [ $13,715.00 |  $6,310.84 [ $4,503.85 | $11,113.50
Payment Terms net 30 10% 3-5
Delivery Days ARO 30 10 10
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

30730F

Opening Date: 11/12/09

E Mens and W;J:;egisgﬁ_)g?égz ll:ninSiST]OOth Leather Pioneer Uniforms Ii?é?;iso:;?llj_rfé Southern Police Equipment
- Description Qty | UOM [ Unit Price| Ext. Price | Unit Price| Ext. Price [ Unit Price Ext. Price
1 Shoe Laces for all oxfords 100 PR $0.60 $60.00 $1.71 $171.00 $1.83 $183.00
Brand & Style Thorogood Bates 36" Long ED8009 Bates #E80009
High-gloss oxfords, men's,
standard sizes $65.50 $6,550.00 $61.00 $6,100.00 $62.34 $6,234.00
2 100 PR Bates 941
Brand & Style Thorogood 831-6803 C/D/E 3-12,13,14,15, Bates #941
EEE 5-12,13,14,15
High-gloss oxfords, men's, $65.50 | $196.50 | No Bid $0.00 $62.34 $187.02
3 |non-standard sizes 3 PR
Brand & Style Thorogood 831-6803 No Bid Bates #941
Black leather oxfords, men's,
standard sizes $74.00 $2,960.00 $68.00 $2,720.00 $69.30 $2,772.00
4 40 PR Bates 968
Brand & Style Thorogood 834-63454 | C/D/E 3-12,13,14,15, 16 Bates #968
EEE 6-12,13,14,15
Black leather oxfords, men's, .
. $74.00 $222.00 No Bid $0.00 $69.30 $207.90
5 |non-standard sizes 3 PR
Brand & Style Thorogood 834-63454 No Bid Bates #968
High-gloss oxfords, women's
standard sizes $64.50 $1,290.00 $67.00 $1,340.00 $68.03 $1,360.60
6 20 PR Bates 742
Brand & Style Thorogood 531-6103 | N 6-11,12 M/W 4-11, 12, Bates #742
EW 6-11
Black leather oxfords, women's
. $73.75 $1,475.00 $76.50 $1,530.00 $72.64 $1,452.80
standard sizes
7 20 PR Bates 752
Brand & Style Thorogood 834-6145 N 6-11,12 M/W 4-11,12 Bates #752
EW 6-11
Totals [ $12,753.50 | $11,861.00 [ $12,397.32
Payment Terms 0%30 1% 20
Delivery Days ARO 10 30 30

Award Explanation

Pioneer Uniforms - Rothco Brand did not meet specifications regarding nonglued downsoles

Galls - did not submit sample when requested
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