
Buyer: Mary Lanning 2924 OF
NE State Patrol

Opening Date: 05/18/09

Ite
m Product # Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

$258.24 $2,324.16 $302.43 $2,721.87 $258.25 $2,324.25 $321.00 $2,889.00
Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge

Select Grommet Finish .B Brushed Brass
Select Laminate Color .HH LAM: Bourbon Cherry

$197.55 $1,777.95 $231.35 $2,082.15 $197.55 $1,777.95 $245.00 $2,205.00
Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge

Select Grommet Finish .B Brushed Brass
Select Laminate Color .HH LAM: Bourbon Cherry

$375.11 $3,375.99 $439.29 $3,953.61 $375.12 $3,376.08 $466.00 $4,194.00
Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge

Select Drawer/Door Pull Detail .B Bar/Brushed Brass
Select Laminate Color .HH LAM: Bourbon Cherry

$422.99 $3,806.91 $495.37 $4,458.33 $422.99 $3,806.91 $525.00 $4,725.00
Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge

Edge and/or Drawer/Door Option .X No Edge or Drawer/Door Pull
Select Laminate Color .HH LAM: Bourbon Cherry

$300.47 $2,704.23 $351.88 $3,166.92 $300.47 $2,704.23 $373.00 $3,357.00
Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge

Edge and/or Drawer/Door Option .X No Edge or Drawer/Door Pull
Select Laminate Color .HH LAM: Bourbon Cherry

$127.80 $1,150.20 $149.67 $1,347.03 $127.80 $1,150.20 $159.00 $1,431.00
Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge

Select Grommet Finish .B Brushed Brass
Select Laminate Color .HH LAM: Bourbon Cherry

$593.40 $5,340.60 $694.93 $6,254.37 $593.40 $5,340.60 $737.00 $6,633.00
Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge

Select Drawer/Door Pull Detail .B Bar/Brushed Brass
Select Laminate Color .HH LAM: Bourbon Cherry

$38.76 $348.84 $60.05 $540.45 $51.27 $461.43 $64.00 $576.00
Select Laminate Color .H LAM: Bourbon Cherry

$67.86 $610.74 $79.47 $715.23 $67.86 $610.74 $84.00 $756.00
Fabric Selection II Grade: Fabric Grade II

Select Grade 2 Fabric .DB Fabric: Daybreak
Select Daybreak Fabric Color 30 Color: Ecru

$52.40 $471.60 $61.37 $552.33 $52.40 $471.60 $65.00 $585.00
Fabric Selection II Grade: Fabric Grade II

Select Grade 2 Fabric .DB Fabric: Daybreak
Select Daybreak Fabric Color 30 Color: Ecru

$274.83 $1,099.32 $321.86 $1,287.44 $274.83 $1,099.32 $341.00 $1,364.00
Wood Finish Selection .H Finish: Bourbon Cherry

Select Upholstery for 5001 III Grade: III Upholstery
Upholstery Selection .NT UPH: Tectonic
Select Tectonic Color 10 Color: Black 10

Wood Center Drawer 22W x 15-3/8D

9

Tackboard for 60"W Stack on Storage Back Enclosure

Tackboard for 36"W Stack on Storage Back Enclosure

5000 Series Park Avenue Exec High-back Loop Arms

72Wx36Dx29H SP Desk, Bow Top, Right P/M/F

3 PC634X

4 PC503K

5 PC507K

6

24x36x24x39 Corner Unit

Return Top/Back Panel Components- 60x 24

36x24x29 1/2 Lateral File, 2 Drawer

60Wx37H Stack-On Storage, 4 Door, Lock, Enclosed Back

36Wx37H Stack-On Storage, 2 Door, Lock, Enclosed Back

36W24Dx29H Bridge For Corner Units, ETA
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Equipment Co.PRIVATE OFFICES
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Furniture by William 
Webb

AWARD

Eakes Office PlusCommercial Concepts 
& Furniture



Buyer: Mary Lanning 2924 OF
NE State Patrol

Opening Date: 05/18/09

Ite
m Product # Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

All Makes Office 
Equipment Co.PRIVATE OFFICES

Product Description

Furniture by William 
Webb

Eakes Office PlusCommercial Concepts 
& Furniture

$188.12 $3,009.92 $220.31 $3,524.96 $188.12 $3,009.92 $234.00 $3,744.00
Wood Finish Selection .H Finish: Bourbon Cherry

Select Upholstery for 5003 III Grade: III Upholstery
Upholstery Selection .NT UPH: Tectonic
Select Tectonic Color 10 Color: Black 10

$296.70 $593.40 $347.47 $694.94 $296.70 $593.40 $368.00 $736.00
Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge

Edge and/or Drawer/Door Option .X No Edge or Drawer/Door Pull
Select Laminate Color .HH LAM: Bourbon Cherry

$551.17 $551.17 $645.48 $645.48 $551.17 $551.17 $684.00 $684.00
Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge

Select Drawer/Door Pull Detail .B Bar/Brushed Brass
2 PC324R $359.28 $359.28 $420.75 $420.75 $359.28 $359.28 $446.00 $446.00

Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge
Select Drawer/Door Pull Detail .B Bar/Brushed Brass

3 PC553X $278.60 $278.60 $326.27 $326.27 $278.60 $278.60 $346.00 $346.00
Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge

Edge and/or Drawer/Door Option .X No Edge or Drawer/Door Pull
4 1522 1 $38.76 $38.76 $60.05 $60.05 $51.27 $51.27 $64.00 $64.00
5 4022 1 $43.89 $43.89 $67.99 $67.99 $58.06 $58.06 $72.00 $72.00

$188.12 $188.12 $220.31 $220.31 $188.12 $188.12 $234.00 $234.00
Grade: III Upholstery Selection .NT UPH: Tectonic

$267.29 $267.29 $313.03 $313.03 $267.29 $267.29 $332.00 $332.00
Grade: III Upholstery Selection .NT UPH: Tectonic

$200.94 $803.76 $222.08 $888.32 $200.94 $803.76 $235.00 $940.00
Base Finish Selection .T Finish: Black
Arm Finish Selection .H Finish: Bourbon Cherry
Upholstery Selection CC CC10 Carbon

$122.52 $122.52 $143.49 $143.49 $122.53 $122.53 $152.00 $152.00
Wood Finish Selection .H Bourbon Cherry

$188.50 $377.00 $220.75 $441.50 $188.50 $377.00 $234.00 $468.00
Select Shell Color 0.29 Color: Taupe 29

$89.35 $178.70 $104.64 $209.28 $89.35 $178.70 $111.00 $222.00
Select High Pressure Laminate .H Lam: Bourbon Cherry
Select Standard T-Mold Color .P T-Mold: Black

$119.89 $239.78 $140.40 $280.80 $119.89 $239.78 $149.00 $298.00
Select Base Color .P Color: Black

Furniture by William 
Webb

All Makes Office 
Equipment Co.

Commercial Concepts 
& Furniture Eakes Office Plus

Laminate End Table

Slide-Away Keyboard Platform 1 21-1/2W x 10D

72x84x14 5/8 Recept Station for L-Shape Wrkst-ETA

Wood Center Drawer 22W x 15-3/8D

16

5000 Series Park Avenue Guest Leg Base Wood Arms

5000 Series Park Avenue Guest Leg Base Wood Arms

36x13x66 Bookcase, 5-Shelf, (3 Adj Shelf)

72Wx36Dx29H SP Desk, Rectangle 1 Top, Left P/M/F

48Wx24Dx29H Return, Right, F/F Pedestal

RECEPTION AREA

5000 Series Park Avenue Managerial Midback Open Loop Arms

5060 Series Park Ave Guest, Leg Base, Arms

3" Dia. Single Column Base 40" x40"

12 5003

3 BBX40

1

BREAK ROOM

2

4041

1112

2

1 PC027L 1

1

2

2

4

1

HCT020 1

8 5065

1

1

13 PC673X

7 5002

6

4041 Polymer Seat & Back 4 Chairs Per Carton

Sqr Hosp Top w/T-Mid Edg, 42D x 42W

2

9

5003



Buyer: Mary Lanning 2924 OF
NE State Patrol

Opening Date: 05/18/09

Ite
m Product # Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

All Makes Office 
Equipment Co.PRIVATE OFFICES

Product Description

Furniture by William 
Webb

Eakes Office PlusCommercial Concepts 
& Furniture

1 LA48144E $306.88 $306.88 $421.19 $421.19 $306.88 $306.88 $381.00 $381.00
Select Laminate Color .H LAM: Bourbon Cherry
Select T-Mold Color .P T-Mold: Black

BLCY02 $166.63 $499.89 $195.15 $585.45 $166.63 $499.89 $207.00 $621.00
Select Laminate Color .H LAM: Bourbon Cherry

2191 $252.21 $3,026.52 $295.37 $3,544.44 $252.21 $3,026.52 $313.00 $3,756.00
Wood Finish Selection .H Finish: Bourbon Cherry
UPH: Fabric Options III Grade: III Upholstery
Upholstery Selection .EB UPH: Vinyl
2093 Fabric Options 11 Color: Black 11

10650 $511.59 $511.59 $599.12 $599.12 $511.59 $511.59 $635.00 $635.00
Laminate Selection .MM Lam: Medium Oak

LLR44307 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid * * No Bid No Bid

SC1842 $202.32 $1,820.88 $248.13 $2,233.17 $211.87 $1,906.83 $263.00 $2,367.00
Store Paint Options .L Paint: Putty

4 RUB452088BG 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid * * No Bid No Bid

3

123

RTA Cart, Service, 2 Shelf, Bg (Rubbermaid)

10600 Series Full Height Ped Credenza w/Doors 24D 72W

RTA Workstation, Computer, Folding (Rubbermaid)

SUPPLY ROOM

Storage Cabinet 18D x 36W x 42H

4

5

1

1

1

9

CONFERENCE ROOM

144"L x 48"W Racetrack Shaped Laminate Top

Cylinder Base for 144"L, 120"L, 96"L, 48", 42" Top

Exec., High-Back, Swivel, Tilt Pneumatic, Arms

2

1

Total $36,628.49 $42,700.27 $37,750.90 $45,213.00

Line 6-Wood finish is 
Bourbon Cherry, Line 

7-Fabric color is 
Grade III, Tectonic 
Color 10, Black 10

30*See comments

As of this date (May 11) 
if PO placed by 5p.m. 
5/18, Del. Would be 

6/10-6/12

*See comments
*See comments

Net 10th of month 
following purchase. 

Furniture will be del. by 
6/10/09. *Total inc. 

instal. labor - $1,300. 
Items del. from total to 
make fair comparison.

Net 30
Delivery Days ARO

Comments

Net 30
21

1 AML Labor Charge - 
$400.00 added into the 

total.  All or none.

Payment Terms



Buyer: Mary Lanning 2924 OF
NE State Patrol

Opening Date: 05/18/09
Ite

m Product # Qty

Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge
Select Grommet Finish .B Brushed Brass
Select Laminate Color .HH LAM: Bourbon Cherry

Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge
Select Grommet Finish .B Brushed Brass
Select Laminate Color .HH LAM: Bourbon Cherry

Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge
Select Drawer/Door Pull Detail .B Bar/Brushed Brass

Select Laminate Color .HH LAM: Bourbon Cherry

Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge
Edge and/or Drawer/Door Option .X No Edge or Drawer/Door Pull

Select Laminate Color .HH LAM: Bourbon Cherry

Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge
Edge and/or Drawer/Door Option .X No Edge or Drawer/Door Pull

Select Laminate Color .HH LAM: Bourbon Cherry

Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge
Select Grommet Finish .B Brushed Brass
Select Laminate Color .HH LAM: Bourbon Cherry

Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge
Select Drawer/Door Pull Detail .B Bar/Brushed Brass

Select Laminate Color .HH LAM: Bourbon Cherry

Select Laminate Color .H LAM: Bourbon Cherry

Fabric Selection II Grade: Fabric Grade II
Select Grade 2 Fabric .DB Fabric: Daybreak

Select Daybreak Fabric Color 30 Color: Ecru

Fabric Selection II Grade: Fabric Grade II
Select Grade 2 Fabric .DB Fabric: Daybreak

Select Daybreak Fabric Color 30 Color: Ecru

Wood Finish Selection .H Finish: Bourbon Cherry
Select Upholstery for 5001 III Grade: III Upholstery

Upholstery Selection .NT UPH: Tectonic
Select Tectonic Color 10 Color: Black 10

Wood Center Drawer 22W x 15-3/8D

9

Tackboard for 60"W Stack on Storage Back Enclosure

Tackboard for 36"W Stack on Storage Back Enclosure

5000 Series Park Avenue Exec High-back Loop Arms

72Wx36Dx29H SP Desk, Bow Top, Right P/M/F

3 PC634X

4 PC503K

5 PC507K

6

24x36x24x39 Corner Unit

Return Top/Back Panel Components- 60x 24

36x24x29 1/2 Lateral File, 2 Drawer

60Wx37H Stack-On Storage, 4 Door, Lock, Enclosed Back

36Wx37H Stack-On Storage, 2 Door, Lock, Enclosed Back

36W24Dx29H Bridge For Corner Units, ETA

PRIVATE OFFICES

92 PM704X

PC153X

Product Description

90054

90051

11 5001

10

PC404X

7 PC023R

8 1522

9

9

9

9

9

9

4

9

9

1 9

Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

$2,706.39 $301.40 $2,712.60 $258.25 $2,324.25 $355.25 $3,197.25 $335.65 $3,020.85 $274.00 $2,466.00

$2,070.27 $230.56 $2,075.04 $197.55 $1,777.95 $271.76 $2,445.84 $256.76 $2,310.84 $209.50 $1,885.50

$3,931.20 $437.80 $3,940.20 $375.12 $3,376.08 $516.02 $4,644.18 $487.55 $4,387.95 $398.00 $3,582.00

$4,116.87 $493.68 $4,443.12 $422.99 $3,806.91 $581.89 $5,237.01 $549.78 $4,948.02 $449.00 $4,041.00

$2,990.88 $350.68 $3,156.12 $300.47 $2,704.23 $413.34 $3,720.06 $390.53 $3,514.77 $319.00 $2,871.00

$1,339.38 $149.16 $1,342.44 $127.80 $1,150.20 $175.81 $1,582.29 $166.11 $1,494.99 $135.50 $1,219.50

$6,218.82 $692.56 $6,233.04 $593.40 $5,340.60 $816.30 $7,346.70 $771.26 $6,941.34 $629.50 $5,665.50

$537.30 $59.84 $538.56 $51.27 $461.43 $81.38 $732.42 $66.64 $599.76 $54.50 $490.50

$711.18 $79.20 $712.80 $67.86 $610.74 $93.35 $840.15 $88.20 $793.80 $72.00 $648.00

$549.18 $61.16 $550.44 $52.40 $471.60 $72.09 $648.81 $68.11 $612.99 $55.50 $499.50

$1,280.12 $359.48 $1,437.92 $274.83 $1,099.32 $378.07 $1,512.28 $357.21 $1,428.84 $293.00 $1,172.00

Office Net Inc. Sahler Office Interiors Sheppards Business 
Interiors

Spaces, Inc. Western Office PlusLatsch's



Buyer: Mary Lanning 2924 OF
NE State Patrol

Opening Date: 05/18/09
Ite

m Product # Qty

PRIVATE OFFICES

Product Description

Wood Finish Selection .H Finish: Bourbon Cherry
Select Upholstery for 5003 III Grade: III Upholstery

Upholstery Selection .NT UPH: Tectonic
Select Tectonic Color 10 Color: Black 10

Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge
Edge and/or Drawer/Door Option .X No Edge or Drawer/Door Pull

Select Laminate Color .HH LAM: Bourbon Cherry

Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge
Select Drawer/Door Pull Detail .B Bar/Brushed Brass

2 PC324R
Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge

Select Drawer/Door Pull Detail .B Bar/Brushed Brass
3 PC553X

Select Edge Detail .B Beaded Edge
Edge and/or Drawer/Door Option .X No Edge or Drawer/Door Pull

4 1522 1
5 4022 1

Grade: III Upholstery Selection .NT UPH: Tectonic

Grade: III Upholstery Selection .NT UPH: Tectonic

Base Finish Selection .T Finish: Black
Arm Finish Selection .H Finish: Bourbon Cherry
Upholstery Selection CC CC10 Carbon

Wood Finish Selection .H Bourbon Cherry

Select Shell Color 0.29 Color: Taupe 29

Select High Pressure Laminate .H Lam: Bourbon Cherry
Select Standard T-Mold Color .P T-Mold: Black

Select Base Color .P Color: Black

Laminate End Table

Slide-Away Keyboard Platform 1 21-1/2W x 10D

72x84x14 5/8 Recept Station for L-Shape Wrkst-ETA

Wood Center Drawer 22W x 15-3/8D

16

5000 Series Park Avenue Guest Leg Base Wood Arms

5000 Series Park Avenue Guest Leg Base Wood Arms

36x13x66 Bookcase, 5-Shelf, (3 Adj Shelf)

72Wx36Dx29H SP Desk, Rectangle 1 Top, Left P/M/F

48Wx24Dx29H Return, Right, F/F Pedestal

RECEPTION AREA

5000 Series Park Avenue Managerial Midback Open Loop Arms

5060 Series Park Ave Guest, Leg Base, Arms

3" Dia. Single Column Base 40" x40"

12 5003

3 BBX40

1

BREAK ROOM

2

4041

1112

2

1 PC027L 1

1

2

2

4

1

HCT020 1

8 5065

1

1

13 PC673X

7 5002

6

4041 Polymer Seat & Back 4 Chairs Per Carton

Sqr Hosp Top w/T-Mid Edg, 42D x 42W

2

9

5003

Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Office Net Inc. Sahler Office Interiors Sheppards Business 
Interiors

Spaces, Inc. Western Office PlusLatsch's

$3,504.96 $245.96 $3,935.36 $188.12 $3,009.92 $258.79 $4,140.64 $244.51 $3,912.16 $199.50 $3,192.00

$690.98 $346.28 $692.56 $296.70 $593.40 $408.15 $816.30 $385.63 $771.26 $315.00 $630.00

$641.81 $643.28 $643.28 $551.17 $551.17 $758.22 $758.22 $716.38 $716.38 $585.00 $585.00

$418.36 $419.32 $419.32 $359.28 $359.28 $494.24 $494.24 $466.97 $466.97 $381.00 $381.00

$324.42 $325.16 $325.16 $278.60 $278.60 $383.26 $383.26 $362.11 $362.11 $295.50 $295.50

$59.70 $59.84 $59.84 $51.27 $51.27 $82.71 $82.71 $66.64 $66.64 $54.50 $54.50
$67.60 $67.76 $67.76 $58.06 $58.06 $79.87 $79.87 $75.46 $75.46 $61.50 $61.50
$219.06 $235.64 $235.64 $188.12 $188.12 $258.79 $258.79 $244.51 $244.51 $199.50 $199.50

$311.25 $334.65 $334.65 $267.29 $267.29 $367.70 $367.70 $347.41 $347.41 $283.50 $283.50

$883.24 $183.92 $735.68 $180.56 $722.24 $248.42 $993.68 $234.71 $938.84 $213.50 $854.00

$142.67 $143.00 $143.00 $122.53 $122.53 $168.55 $168.55 $159.25 $159.25 $135.00 $135.00

$439.00 $220.00 $440.00 $188.50 $377.00 $259.31 $518.62 $245.00 $490.00 $200.00 $400.00

$208.08 $104.28 $208.56 $89.35 $178.70 $122.91 $245.82 $116.13 $232.26 $95.00 $190.00

$279.20 $139.92 $279.84 $119.89 $239.78 $164.92 $329.84 $155.82 $311.64 $127.50 $255.00

Latsch's Office Net Inc. Sahler Office Interiors Sheppards Business 
Interiors Spaces, Inc. Western Office Plus



Buyer: Mary Lanning 2924 OF
NE State Patrol

Opening Date: 05/18/09
Ite

m Product # Qty

PRIVATE OFFICES

Product Description

1 LA48144E
Select Laminate Color .H LAM: Bourbon Cherry
Select T-Mold Color .P T-Mold: Black

BLCY02
Select Laminate Color .H LAM: Bourbon Cherry

2191
Wood Finish Selection .H Finish: Bourbon Cherry
UPH: Fabric Options III Grade: III Upholstery
Upholstery Selection .EB UPH: Vinyl
2093 Fabric Options 11 Color: Black 11

10650
Laminate Selection .MM Lam: Medium Oak

LLR44307

SC1842
Store Paint Options .L Paint: Putty

4 RUB452088BG 2

3

123

RTA Cart, Service, 2 Shelf, Bg (Rubbermaid)

10600 Series Full Height Ped Credenza w/Doors 24D 72W

RTA Workstation, Computer, Folding (Rubbermaid)

SUPPLY ROOM

Storage Cabinet 18D x 36W x 42H

4

5

1

1

1

9

CONFERENCE ROOM

144"L x 48"W Racetrack Shaped Laminate Top

Cylinder Base for 144"L, 120"L, 96"L, 48", 42" Top

Exec., High-Back, Swivel, Tilt Pneumatic, Arms

2

1

Total

Delivery Days ARO

Comments

Payment Terms

Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Office Net Inc. Sahler Office Interiors Sheppards Business 
Interiors

Spaces, Inc. Western Office PlusLatsch's

$357.34 $358.16 $358.16 $306.88 $306.88 $422.15 $422.15 $398.86 $398.86 $330.00 $330.00

$582.09 $194.48 $583.44 $166.63 $499.89 $229.23 $687.69 $216.58 $649.74 $177.00 $531.00

$3,524.28 $274.12 $3,289.44 $252.21 $3,026.52 $346.95 $4,163.40 $327.81 $3,933.72 $267.50 $3,210.00

$595.72 $400.00 $400.00 $511.59 $511.59 $703.76 $703.76 $664.93 $664.93 $550.00 $550.00

* * * * * * * No Bid No Bid * *

$2,220.39 $247.28 $2,225.52 $211.87 $1,906.83 $291.46 $2,623.14 $275.38 $2,478.42 $225.00 $2,025.00

* * * * * * * No Bid No Bid * *

No Bid

*Items deleted from 
total to make fair 

comparison.

Installation charge of 
$2,001.00 included in 

the total

*Items deleted from 
total to make fair 

comparison.

Office Interiors & Design

$49,275.71
0% 30 Net 10

$41,921.74

22

$42,519.49 $39,372.38 $50,145.37

HON items 
bid all or 
nothing. 
*Items 
deleted 

from total to 
make fair 

*Items deleted from 
total to make fair 

comparison.

Total Price includes 
installation cost of 
$3,000.00. *Items 

deleted from total to 
make fair comparison.

Net 30
15 45 17-20 (by June 10) 40

0% 30 100% 30 Net 15
$38,703.00


