Buyer: Suzanne Siemer

2920 OF

Dept of Roads

PARTIAL PARTIAL
AWARD AWARD
ﬁ Class PR1 Portland Cement Concrete BesiilEs Concrgte
= Concrete Co. Industries
- Description Qty |UOM Unit Price Unit Price
D-1 PR1 Concrete, 4 W. Barneston .
1 [3CT Fiwy 77 & 8 MP 83 to MP 87 75| CY | $109.00 No Bid
D-1 PR1 Concrete, No. Beatrice .
2 Hwy 77. MP 25 thru MP 36 25 | CY $109.00 No Bid
D-1 PR1 Concrete, So. Beatrice .
3 Hwy 77 MP 0 thru MP 25 275 | CY $109.00 No Bid
D-1 PR1 Concrete, 1.5 E. Crete .
4 Hwy 33 MP 25 30 | CY $106.00 No Bid
D-1 PR1 Concrete, E. of Crete .
S [JCT Fwy 103/33, MP 46 thru 58 30| Cy | $106.00 No Bid
D-1 PR1 Concrete, 5 So. Fairbury .
6 Hwy 15 MP 4 5 CcYy $112.00 No Bid
D-1 PR1 Concrete, West Fairbury .
" Hwy 136 MP 149 West Edge Fairbury 8 | cv | $112.00 No Bid
D-1 PR1 Concrete, West of Peru .
8 Hwy 67, MP 25 thru 33 30 | CY No Bid $98.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, Tecumseh
9 Jct 136/50 No. & So. MP 20 thru 48 80 | CY $103.00 B
D-1 PR1 Concrete, in Table Rock . .
10 Hwy 44, MP 196 to 197 15 | CY No Bid No Bid
D-1 PR1 Concrete, Falls City .
11 13ct73/8, MP 5 to MP 13, No Edge 188 ] CY No Bid $100.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, Dubois Area .
12 > Mi. East of JoL 8/50 15 | CY No Bid $100.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, Milford Area .
13 Hwy 6. MP 292, W. Edge Miford 165 | CY $106.00 No Bid
D-1 PR1 Concrete, at Brownville .
14 Hwy 136 MP 238 to 239 80 | CY No Bid $98.00
D-1 PR1 Concrete, So. Humboldt .
15 135 Hwy 105/8, MP 0 to 8.21 15 €Y No Bid $100.00
Payment Terms 100% 45 Net 30
Delivery Days ARO 1

Line 10 has been cancelled
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