Buyer: Rita Kucera

2866 OF Rebid
Game Parks

Opening Date: 04/21/09

AWARD AWARD AWARD
Chemicals Alligare Benes Service Creston Fertilizer Co Inc | Crop Production Services
Description Qty| UOM | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
MEDICINE CREEK
Milestone Herbicide - Price No Bid NoBid |$ 71.82|$ 287280 |$ 71.25 |$ 2,850.00
per 1 Quart Bottle 40 1Qt
Brand Bidding: bottles Milestone Milestone by Dow Agro
Container Size: 1qt Quarts
Habitat Herbicide - Price per $ 18250 [$  365.00 NoBid |$ 71090 |$ 1,421.80 |$ 18525 [$  370.50
2.5 Gallon Container 2 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Alligare's Ecomazapyr 25L Habitat Polaris by Nu Farm
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Glyphosate Herbicide - Price $ 6225|$% 2,988.00 NoBid |$ 6438 |$ 309024 |$ 6590 |$ 3,163.20
per 2.5 Gallon Cont. 48 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. | Alligare's Glyphosate 4 plus Glystar Plus Razor PRO by Nu Farm
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Ammonium Sulfate Activator - . .
Price/ 2.5 Gal Cont . 25 Gal No Bid No Bid |$ 750 [ $ 27750 | $ 8.15 | $ 301.55
Brand Bidding: cont. AM Sol 34% Actamaster AMS by LPI
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
85% Non-lonic Surfactant - . .
. No Bid No Bid 38.70 464.40 22.00 264.00
Price per 2.5 Gal. Cont. 12 2.5 Gal $ $ $ $
Brand Bidding: cont. Chemsurf 90 Brewer 90 by Brewer Int.
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Pathway Herbicide 25 Gal | NoBid [ NoBid |[$ 79.40]$% 158.80 |[$ 6850 [$  137.00
Brand Bidding: 2 ;:ont Pathway Pathway by DOW Agro
Container Size: ) 2.5gal 2.5 gal
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Buyer: Rita Kucera 2866 OF Rebid Opening Date: 04/21/09

Game Parks
AWARD AWARD AWARD
Chemicals Alligare Benes Service Creston Fertilizer Co Inc | Crop Production Services
Description Qty| UOM | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
BASSET MAINTENANCE

SAHARA DG - Price per 2.5 $ 31800 |$ 19,716.00 NoBid |$ 399.84 |$ 24,790.08 |$ 350.40 |$ 21,724.80
Gallon Container 62 | 40 Lb
Brand Bidding: bag Alligare's Mojave 70 EG Sahara DG Sahara DG by BASF
Container Size: 5 or 25Ib bag 40 Ib 40 Ib bag
Amine 2-4-D - Price per 2.5 No Bid NoBid |$ 3578 |$ 28624 |$ 2965 |$ 237.20
Gallon Container 8 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Amine 4 Ib Plantoon by UAP
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Crossbrow - Price per 2.5 $ 10500 |$  1,050.00 NoBid |$ 139.10 [$ 1,391.00 |$ 12215 [$ 1,221.50
Gallon Container 10 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Alligare's Everett Crossbow Crossbow L by LPI
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Razor - Price per 2.5 Gallon $ 6225($  996.00 NoBid |$ 84.00|$ 1534400 |$ 6550 [$ 1,048.00
Container 16 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. [ Alligare's Glyphosate 4 plus Glystar Pro Razor by Nu Farm
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal

BRANCHED OAK WILDLIFE
Hi Dep - Price per 2.5 Gallon

No Bid $ 131.25|$157500|$ 4750 ($ 570.00 | $ 48.35 | $ 580.20

Container 12 |25 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Hi Dep Hi Dep Hi Dep by PBI Gordon
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal

Crossbrow - Price per 2.5 $ 10500 [$  630.00|$ 4400 |$ 264.00|$ 13910 |$ 83460 |$ 12215|$  732.90

Gallon Container 6 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Alligare's Everett gen Everett Crosshow Crossbow L by LPI
Container Size: 2.5 gal 1 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal

Remedy - Price per 2.5 Gallon $ 16250 |$ 97500 |$ 257.50 | $1,287.50 |$ 20470 |$ 122820 |$ 14730 |$  883.80

Container 6 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Alligare's Triclopyr 4 Dow Remedy Remedy Ultra Remedy by DOW Agro
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
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Buyer: Rita Kucera 2866 OF Rebid Opening Date: 04/21/09

Game Parks
AWARD AWARD AWARD
Chemicals Alligare Benes Service Creston Fertilizer Co Inc | Crop Production Services
Description Qty| UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
Grazon - Price per 2.5 Gallon $ 60.00|$  480.00|$  60.00 |$ 480.00|$ 5210|$ 41680 |$ 5275 |$  422.00
Container g |25 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Alligare's Picloram+D F.B. Pictoram +D (gen) HieredHand Hired Hand by DOW
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Plateau - Price per 2.5 Gallon $ 198.00 |$  198.00 |$ 220.00 [$ 22000 |$ 22523 |$ 22523 |$ 19500 [$  195.00
Container N Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Alligare's Panoramic 25L gen Panoramic Panoramic 25L Plateau by BASF
Container Size: 1 gal 1 gal 1 gal 1 gal cont
Todon 22K - Price per 2.5 $ 14500 |$ 29000 |$ 152.50 [$ 305.00 [$ 146.45|$  292.90 |$ 128.00 [$  256.00
Gallon Container 5 |25 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Alligare's Picloram 22K gen Pictoram 22K Outpost 22K Outpost 22K by DOW
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Pathway - Price per 2.5 Gallon NoBid |$ 7850 |$1,099.00 |$ 79.40 [$ 1,111.60 |[$ 6850 |$  950.00
Container 14 |25 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Dow Pathway Pathway Pathway by DOW
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Prowl - Price per 2.5 Gallon NoBid |$  60.00|$ 360.00|$% 5365|$ 32190 |$ 69.10 [$  414.60
Container 6 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Accumen Pendimax 3.3 Stealth by LPI
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Volunteer - Price per 2.5 NoBid |$ 7300|$ 7300|$ 7275|$ 7275 |$ 80.00 |$  240.00
Gallon Container 1 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Clethedum (gen) Arrow Intensity by LPI
Container Size: 1 gal 1gal cont. 1 gal cont
Pasturegard - Price per 2.5 25 Gal [ No Bid $  145.00 [$1,740.00 |$ 12230 |$ 1,467.60 [$ 134.95|$ 1,619.40
Brand Bidding: 12 (':ont Dow Pasture Guard PastureGard Pasturegard by DOW
Container Size: ) 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Roundup - Price per 2.5 $ 6225|% 298800|$ 5500 |$2640.00|$ 64.38|% 309024 [$ 6590 [$ 3,163.20
Gallon Container 48 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. | Alligare's Glyphosate 4 plus Strike Out Extro Glystar Plus Razor PRO by Nu Farm
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Non-lonic Surfactant - Price $ 21.25|$ 25500 |$ 1750 |$ 21000 |$ 3305 |$ 39660 |$ 2200 |$  264.00
per 2.5 Gal. Container 12 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Alligare's Alligare 90 Drexel 80-20 Chemsurf 80 Brewer 90 by Brewer Int
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
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2866 OF Rebid
Game Parks

Buyer: Rita Kucera Opening Date: 04/21/09

AWARD AWARD AWARD
Chemicals Alligare Benes Service Creston Fertilizer Co Inc | Crop Production Services
Description Qty| UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Pramitol - Price per 2.5 Gallon NoBid |$ 7240 |$ 14480|$ 7035|$ 14070 |[$ 6325 |$  126.50
Container 2 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Tenkoz Pramitol Pramitol 25E Pramitol 25E by LPI
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Ammonium Sulfate - Price/
25 Gal Cont X 25 Gal $ 10.00 [$ 20.00|$ 750 | $ 15.00 | $ 815 | $ 16.30
Brand Bidding: cont. Drexel AMS Extra Amsol 34% Actamaster AMS by LPI
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Methalted Seed Oil - Price per
25 Gallon Cont ) 25 Gal $ 28.13 | $ 56.26 | $ 1800 |$ 36.00|$ 2738 (% 54.76 | $ 2250 | $ 45.00
Brand Bidding: cont. Alligare's Alligare MSO Drexel MSO Succeed MSO by LPI
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
2-4D Amine - Price per 2.5 $ 3220|$% 6440|$ 3580|% 7160 |$ 29.65|$  59.30
Gallon Container 2 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Tenkoz Amine Amine Platoon by UAP
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Habitat - Price per 2.5 Gallon $ 18250 |$ 18250 |$ 497.50 [$ 49750 [$ 710.90 |$ 71090 |$ 18525 [$  185.25
Container 1 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Alligare's Ecomazapyr25L Habitat Habitat Polaris by Nu Farm
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Lo Vol 6 Ester - Price per 2.5 $ 5450 |$ 436.00|$ 5160 |$ 41280 |$ 5025 |$  402.00
Gallon Container 8 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Tenkoz LV6 LV6 LV 6# Ester by Nu Farm
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Select 2 EC - Price per 2.5
Gallon Container L 25 Gal $ 73.00 $ 7275 (% 7275 | $ 80.00 | $ 240.00
Brand Bidding: cont. Clethodium (gen) Arrow Intensity by LPI
Container Size: 1 gal lgal cont. 1 gal cont
Peak - Price per 2.5 Gallon NoBid |$1,031.40 |$ 1,031.40 |$ 188.70
Container 1 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Peak Peak by Syngenta
Container Size: 900z; 6x15 oz dry 15 oz cont dry
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Buyer: Rita Kucera 2866 OF Rebid Opening Date: 04/21/09

Game Parks
AWARD AWARD AWARD
Chemicals Alligare Benes Service Creston Fertilizer Co Inc | Crop Production Services
Description Qty| UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
SHERMAN RESERVOIR
4Lb Amine 2-4-D (Aquatic .
. No Bid 27.25 327.00 35.80 429.60 29.65 355.80
Label)-Price/ 2.5 Gal. Cont. 12 2.5 Gal 05! $ $ $ $ $ $
Brand Bidding: cont. Cornbelt Amine Amine 4 Ib Platoon by UAP
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Banvel 4E - Price per 2.5 .
. No Bid $ 8750 [$1,575.00|$ 8270 |$ 148860 [$ 8825 ($ 1,588.50
Gallon Container 18 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. J.P Oliver Dicamba -4 Banvel Diablo by Nu Farm
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
2-4-D Ester 6 Lb - Price per 2.5 NoBid |$ 5463 |$1966.50|$ 51.60|$ 1,857.60 |$ 50.25 |$ 1,809.00
Gallon Container 36 2 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Tenkoe LV6 LV6 LU 6 Ib Ester by Nu Farm
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Premier 90 - Price per 2.5 NoBid |$ 2500|$ 40000|$ 3870|$ 61920 [$ 2200 |$  352.00
Gallon Container 16 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Drexel 90-10 Chemsurf 90 Brewer 90 by Brewer Int
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Milestone - Price per 2.5 NoBid |$ 845.00|%$6,760.00|% 28230 |$ 2,258.40 |$ 697.85 |$ 5,582.80
Gallon Container 8 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Dow Milestone Milestone Milestone by DOW
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Escort - Price per 8 Gallon $ 4640 |$ 18560 |$ 8240 [$ 32060 $ 4576 |$  183.04 |$ 5120 [$  204.80
Container 4 8oz
Brand Bidding: cont. Alligare's MSM60 Escort MSM Escort XP by DuPont
Container Size: 8 0z 8 0z 8 oz cont
Gardian - Price per 2.5 Gallon NoBid |$ 4275|$ 34200|$% 4500|$ 36000 [$ 815|$  65.20
Container g |25¢Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Cornbelt Gardian Actamaster AMS by LPI
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
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Buyer: Rita Kucera

2866 OF Rebid
Game Parks

Opening Date: 04/21/09

AWARD AWARD AWARD
Chemicals Alligare Benes Service Creston Fertilizer Co Inc | Crop Production Services
Description Qty| UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price [ Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Roundup Weather Max - Price NoBid |$ 16250 |$ 650.00|% 64.38|$ 25752 |$ 68.00 [$  272.00
per 2.5 Gallon Container 4 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Monsanto Weather Max Glystar Plus Makaze by LPI
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Plateau - Price per 1 Gallon $ 10800 |$ 19800 |$ 22500 |$ 22500 |$ 22523 |$ 22523 [$ 19500 |$  195.00
Container ;| tea
Brand Bidding: cont. Alligare's Panoramic 25L gen Panoramic Panoramic 25L Plateau by BASF
Container Size: 1 gal 1 gal 1 gal cont
Soy-Stick (MSO) - Price per .

. No Bid 18.75 37.50 27.35 54.70 22.50 45.00
2.5 Gallon Container 5 |25Gal ¥ $ i - $ $
Brand Bidding: cont. Drexel MSO Succeed MSO by LPI
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Overdrive - Price per 7.5 NoBid |$ 270.00|$ 540.00|$% 31350 |$  627.00 [$ 225.00 |$  450.00
Gallon Container 2 7.5Lb
Brand Bidding: cont. Overdrive Overdrive Overdrive by BASF
Container Size: 7.5 7.51b 7.5 Ib cont
Payment Terms 0% 10 0% 15
Delivery Days ARO 4 to 5 business days 30 10 5 or as requested

Comments

Bid item #7 in different sz
than req., but extended at
requested 2,480 Ibs

Peak is a dry product - it
comes in 15 oz containers,
price bid is per 15 oz cont.
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Buyer: Rita Kucera

2866 OF Rebid
Game Parks

Opening Date: 04/21/09

AWARD
Chemicals CWC Chemical Inc DeAngelo EI:;:Z?S Inc, T/A McClure Land Unlimited Van Diest Supply Co M D'St”bll_llt_'gn Partners
Description Qty| UOM | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price [ Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price [ Unit Price [ Ext. Price
MEDICINE CREEK
Milestone Herbicide - Price $ 7750 |$ 310000 |$  73.95|$ 2958.00 |$ 382.05|$15282.00 |$ 73.84|$ 2,953.60|$% 80.00|$ 3,200.00
per 1 Quart Bottle 40 1Qt
Brand Bidding: bottles Milestone Dow Milestone VM Dow Elanco Milestone Milestone VM
Container Size: quart 1 gt bottle 12x1 gt qt 1qt
Habitat Herbicide - Price per $ 40250 |$ 80500 |$ 33750 |$ 675.00 |$ 816.00|$ 1,632.00 |$ 224.93|$ 449.86|$ 387.50|$ 775.00
2.5 Gallon Container 2 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Habitat Polaris from Nufarm Base Habitat Habitat
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal cont. 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Glyphosate Herbicide - Price $ 66.25|% 318000 |$ 7250 |$ 348000 |$ 104.10|$ 499680 |$ 62.43|$ 2,996.64 |$ 58.73|$ 2,819.04
per 2.5 Gallon Cont. 48 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Razor Pro Razor Pro from Nufarm Glystar Plus Credit Extra Glyphosate Herbicide
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal cont. 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Ammonium Sulfate Activator - . .
Price/ 2.5 Gal Cont a7 25 Gal $ 20.00($ 740.00 No Bid $ 2740|% 1,01380|$% 1288 |% 476.56 No Bid
Brand Bidding: cont. AMS Supreme Van Diest Gardian Plus
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal
85% Non-lonic Surfactant - .
. $ 30.00(% 360.00 | $ 3825 |$% 459.00 [$ 6063|$ 72756 |% 26.18|$ 314.16 No Bid
Price per 2.5 Gal. Cont. 12 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. CWC 90 Alenza 90 from Alenza Corn Belt Pure & Simple
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal cont. 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Pathway Herbicide 25 Gal L5__77.00 [$ 154.00|$ 7825]$ 156.50 [$ 128.13[$ 25626 [$ 72.35[$ 14470 [$ 92.50[$  185.00
Brand Bidding: 2 ;:ont Pathway Dow Pathway Herbicide Dow Pathway Pathway Herbicide
Container Size: ’ 2.5 gal 2.5 gal cont. 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
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Buyer: Rita Kucera

2866 OF Rebid
Game Parks

Opening Date: 04/21/09

AWARD

DeAngelo Brothers Inc, T/A

VM Distribution Partners

Chemicals CWC Chemical Inc Alenza McClure Land Unlimited Van Diest Supply Co LLC
Description Qty| UOM | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price [ Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price [ Unit Price [ Ext. Price
BASSET MAINTENANCE
égl'l*cﬁ]Réoagi'nzrr'ce per 2.5 soLb | & 35280 (% 2187360 |$ 20625 |$ 20,625.00 |$ 822.00 [ $50,964.00 [$ 346.80 | $21,501.60 [ $ 360.00 | $22,320.00
Brand Bidding: 62 bag Sahara DG Mojave 70 EG from Alligare Base Sahara DG Sahara DG
Container Size: 40# bag 25 Ib bag 10x2 Ibs 40# 40 |b bag
ér;]:c”,ﬁ é'g;]?a'i:err'ce per 2.5 o5cal|® 3510|$ 28080 |$ 3588 |$  287.04 |$ 57.50($ 46000 |$ 29.90 |$ 239.20 |$ 3462($  692.40
Brand Bidding: 8 cont. Weedestroy Weedestroy AM40 Nufarm Nufarm Amine 2-4-D Weedestroy
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
g;‘l’lzsnbéoo";’]t'a'ijr:'ecre per 2.5 o5 G| 10900 ($ 109000 |$ 12125 |$  1,21250 |$ 200.00 |$ 200000 |$ 123.68 |$ 1,236.80 | $ 130.00 |$ 1,300.00
Brand Bidding: 10 cont. Candor Alligare's Everett Hebicide Dow Tenkoz Crossbow Crossbow
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal cont. 4x1 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
(F;Z‘f]‘t’;i'n'::'ce per 2.5 Gallon 5cal|® 6490|$ 103840 |$ 7238 |$ 115808 [$ 13750 |$ 2,20000 [$ 64.93|$ 103883 |$ 58.73|$  939.68
Brand Bidding: 16 cont. Razor Razor from Nufarm Nufarm Glyphosate Pro 4 Glyfos X-tra
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal cont. 4x1 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
BRANCHED OAK WILDLIFE
g'o'r?f;;n'e':”ce per 2.5 Gallon 5Gal|$ 48003 576.00 NoBid |$ 69.13|$ 82956 |$ 4673|$ 560.76 No Bid
Brand Bidding: 12 cont. Hi-Dep PBI / Gordon Hi-Dep
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal
g;‘l’lzsnbéoo";’] t'a'ijn”ecre per 2.5 5Gq|$ 109008 65400 [$ 12125 |$  727.50 |$ 19413 |$ 1,16478 [$ 12368 ($ 742.08 |$ 130.00|$  780.00
6 |2
Brand Bidding: cont. Candor Everett Herb. From Alligare Dow Tenkoz Crosshow Crosshow
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Ezr:t?:e'r Price per 2.5 Gallon 05 Gal|$ 236003 141600 NoBid |$ 331.63|$ 1,989.78 |$ 187.10 |$ 1,122.60 | $ 232.50 [ $ 1,395.00
6 |2
Brand Bidding: cont. Garlon 4 Ultra Dow Remedy Remedy
Container Size: 2.5 gal 4x1 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
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Buyer: Rita Kucera

2866 OF Rebid
Game Parks

Opening Date: 04/21/09

AWARD

DeAngelo Brothers Inc, T/A

VM Distribution Partners

Chemicals CWC Chemical Inc Alenza McClure Land Unlimited Van Diest Supply Co LLC
Description Qty[ UOM | Unit Price [ Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price [ Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price [ Unit Price [ Ext. Price

Grazon - Price per 2.5 Gallon No Bid NoBid |$ 119.13|$ 953.04 |$ 5543 |$ 44344 |$ 84.88|$ 679.04
Container g |25 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Dow Hired Hand P&D Grazon P&D
Container Size: 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Plateau - Price per 2.5 Gallon $ 23500 (%  235.00 NoBid |$ 303.63|$ 303.63|$ 167.87 |$ 167.87 |$ 195.00|$ 195.00
Container N Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Plateau Alligats Plateau Plateau
Container Size: 1 gal 4x1 gal 1 gal 2.5 gal
Todon 22K - Price per 2.5 No Bid NoBid |$ 294.13|$ 58826 |$ 13893 |$ 277.86|$ 261.25|$ 52250
Gallon Container 2 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Dow Outpost 22K Tordon 22K
Container Size: 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Pathway - Price per 2.5 Gallon $ 77.00|$ 1,07800 |$  7825|$ 1,00550 |$ 119.13|$ 1,667.82 |$ 72.35|$ 1,012.90|$ 71.25|$ 997.50
Container 14 |25 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Pathway Pathway from Dow Dow Pathway Pathway
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal cont. 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Prowl - Price per 2.5 Gallon No Bid NoBid |$ 106.63|$ 639.78 |$ 84.80|$ 508.80 No Bid
Container 6 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Base Prowl
Container Size: 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Volunteer - Price per 2.5 No Bid NoBid |$ 314.13|$ 31413 [$ 12697 |$ 126.97 No Bid
Gallon Container 1 |25¢cal
Brand Bidding: cont. Tenkoz Volunteer
Container Size: 1 gal 1 gal only
Pasturegard - Price per 2.5 [ NoBid [ No Bid $ 169.13[$ 2,029.56 [$ 13298 |$ 1,595.76 | $ 133.75[$ 1,605.00

= 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: 12 cont Dow Pasturegard Pasturegard
Container Size: ) 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Roundup - Price per 2.5 $ 9500|$ 456000 |$ 6588 |$ 316224 |$ 217.28($10,429.44 |$ 6243 |$ 2,996.64 |$ 5873 |$ 2,819.04
Gallon Container 48 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Roundup Razor Pro from Nufarm Monsanto Credit Extra Glyfos X-tra
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Non-lonic Surfactant - Price $ 3000[$ 36000 (% 3825|% 45000 [$ 6950|$ 83400 |$ 2618 |$ 314.16 No Bid
per 2.5 Gal. Container 12 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. CWC 90 Alenza 90 from Alenza Cornbelt Pure & Simple
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal
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Buyer: Rita Kucera

2866 OF Rebid
Game Parks

Opening Date: 04/21/09

AWARD

DeAngelo Brothers Inc, T/A

VM Distribution Partners

Chemicals CWC Chemical Inc Alenza McClure Land Unlimited Van Diest Supply Co LLC

Description Qty[ UOM | Unit Price [ Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price [ Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price [ Unit Price [ Ext. Price
Pramitol - Price per 2.5 Gallon No Bid NoBid |$ 10163|$ 20326 |$ 67.45($ 134.90 No Bid
Container 2 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. UAP Pramitol
Container Size: 4x1 gal 2.5 gal
Ammonium Sulfate - Price/ . .
25 Gal Cont X 25 Gal $ 25.00(% 50.00 No Bid $ 2163 |% 4326 |$ 1288 (|% 25.76 No Bid
Brand Bidding: cont. AMS Supreme Van Diest Gardian Plus
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Methalted Seed Oil - Price per . .
25 Gallon Cont ) 25 Gal $ 2850 (% 57.00 No Bid $ 5163|$% 10326 |$ 33.98|% 67.96 No Bid
Brand Bidding: cont. MES - 100 Cornbelt Soy - Stick
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal
2-4D Amine - Price per 2.5 $ 3510|% 7020 |$  40.00|$ 80.00 |$ 51.63|$ 10326 |$ 29.90($ 59.80|$ 34.63|$  69.26
Gallon Container 2 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Weedestroy AM 40 Weedestroy AM40 from Nufarm 2-4D Amine Weedestroy
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal cont. 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Habitat - Price per 2.5 Gallon $ 40250 |$ 402,50 NoBid |$ 806.63|$ 80663 |$ 22493 |$ 224.93|$ 387.50|$ 387.50
Container 1 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Habitat Base Habitat Habitat
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Lo Vol 6 Ester - Price per 2.5 $ 53.00[$  424.00 NoBid |[$ 9413|$ 753.04 |$ 49.98|$ 399.84|$ 52.38|$% 419.04
Gallon Container 8 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. 2,4 - D LV6 Ester Nufarm Lo Vol 6 Ester Weedone EC LV6
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Select 2 EC - Price per 2.5 No Bid NoBid |$ 376.63|$ 37663 |% 32750 |$ 327.50 No Bid
Gallon Container 1 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Valent Select Max
Container Size: 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Peak - Price per 2.5 Gallon No Bid NoBid |$23.21/0z | TBD $1,132.20 | $ 1,132.20 No Bid
Container 1 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Syngenta Peak Custom pk
Container Size: 6x15 0z 6x150z
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Buyer: Rita Kucera

2866 OF Rebid
Game Parks

Opening Date: 04/21/09

AWARD

DeAngelo Brothers Inc, T/A

VM Distribution Partners

Chemicals CWC Chemical Inc Alenza McClure Land Unlimited Van Diest Supply Co LLC
Description Qty| UOM | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price [ Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price [ Unit Price [ Ext. Price
SHERMAN RESERVOIR
4Lb Amine 2-4-D (Aquatic
Label)-Price/ 2.5 Gal. Cont. " 25 Gal $ 4700($ 564.00 | $ 3725 | $ 44700 [$ 5500|%$ 660.00($ 2990($ 35880|% 3463|$% 415.56
Brand Bidding: cont. Weedar 64 Weedestroy AM40 from Century Amine 4lb/US 4 Ib Amine Weedestroy
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal cont. ax1 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Banvel 4E - Price per 2.5 $ 150.00 |$ 2,700.00 NoBid |$ 237.50|$ 427500 [$ 89.68|$ 1,61424 |$ 88.75|$ 1,597.50
Gallon Container 18 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Vanquish Agristar Agri-Star Dicamba Diablo
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
2-4-DEster 6 Lb - Price per 2.5 $ 53.00($ 1,908.00 NoBid |[$ 87.50|$ 3,150.00 |$ 49.98 |$ 1,799.28 |$ 52.38|$ 1,885.68
Gallon Container 36 2 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. 2,4 - D LV6 Ester Nufarm 2-4-0 Ester 6lb 2-4-D Ester
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Premier 90 - Price per 2.5 $ 30.00|$%  480.00 NoBid |$ 7530|$ 1,20480|$ 26.18|$ 41888 No Bid
Gallon Container 16 |25 CGal
Brand Bidding: cont. CWC 90 Cornbelt Pure & Simple
Container Size: 2.5 gal 4x1 gal 2.5 gal
Milestone - Price per 2.5 $ 760.00 |$ 6,080.00 |$ 74450 |$  5956.00 |$3,817.00 | $30,536.00 |$ 717.93 |$ 5743.44 |$ 745.00 |$ 5,960.00
Gallon Container g |25¢Cal
Brand Bidding: cont. Milestone Milestone UM from Dow Dow Milestone Milestone VM
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2.5 gal cont. 12x1 gt 2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Escort - Price per 8 Gallon $ 56.00|%  224.00 NoBid |$ 149.00|$ 596.00 |$ 53.92|$ 21568 |$ 60.00|$ 240.00
Container 4 | 802
Brand Bidding: cont. Escort Dupont Escort XP Escort
Container Size: 8 oz 8x16 oz 8 0z 8 oz
Gardian - Price per 2.5 Gallon . . .
. No Bid No Bid $ 2750|$ 22000 ($ 4338 ($ 347.04 No Bid
Container g |25¢Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Van Diest Gardian
Container Size: 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal
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Buyer: Rita Kucera

2866 OF Rebid
Game Parks

Opening Date: 04/21/09

AWARD

DeAngelo Brothers Inc, T/A

VM Distribution Partners

Chemicals CWC Chemical Inc Alenza McClure Land Unlimited Van Diest Supply Co LLC

Description Qty[ UOM | Unit Price [ Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price [ Ext. Price | Unit Price | EXxt. Price [ Unit Price [ Ext. Price
Roundup Weather Max - Price $ 197.00[$  788.00 NoBid |[$ 22315|$ 89260 |$ 6243|$ 249.72 No Bid
per 2.5 Gallon Container 4 2.5Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. Roundup Weathermax Monsanto Credit Extra
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Plateau - Price per 1 Gallon $ 235.00($  235.00 NoBid |$ 30500|$ 30500 |$ 167.87|$ 167.87 |$ 195.00|$ 195.00
Container ;| tea
Brand Bidding: cont. Plateau Alligale Plateau Plateau
Container Size: 1 gal 4x1 gal 1 gal 1 gal
Soy-Stick (MSO) - Price per $ 2850|$%  57.00 NoBid |$ 5750|$ 115.00|$ 33.98|$  67.96 No Bid
2.5 Gallon Container 2 2.5 Gal
Brand Bidding: cont. MES 100 Cornbelt Soy - Stick
Container Size: 2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal
Overdrive - Price per 7.5 $ 22950 |$  459.00 NoBid |$ 42500|$ 850.00 |$ 239.55|$ 479.10 |$ 240.00|$  480.00
Gallon Container 2 7.5Lb
Brand Bidding: cont. Base Overdrive Overdrive
Container Size: 75# 4x7.5lbs 7.5# 7.5lb cntnr
Payment Terms 0% 30 Net 30
Delivery Days ARO 7 5 30 7 30

Comments
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