Buyer: Todd Dlouhy

2674 OF
Grocery and Frozen Foods

Western Nebraska Veteran's Home

Opening Date: 11/07/08

AWARD
Line Asrf .
41 Grocery and Frozen Foods Cash-Wa Distributing Co.
. Est. _— .
Acceptable Description Case §|ze Usage Brand Billing, Cr.;\se Size and Prod Code| Unit Price Exetgnded
Brand & Weight Ind. Weight Price
Total
CANNED FRUIT
101 ?ggls;auce, US Grade A or Better, Sweetened. Brix 17. NDW 6/410 13 Nifda 45960 2530( 3 328.90
1.02 Applesauce, U.S. Grade A. Water pack Diet. Fancy 24/300 15 Nifda 46250 $ 23.10| $ 346.50
Apricots, Unpeeled Halves, US Grade A, Packed in Heavy . .
1.03 Syrup. 86-108 count. NDW 64 oz. 6/#10 21 Nifda Light Syrup 45660 $ 31.15( $ 654.15
1.04 Cherrleg, dark sweet, pitted, US Grade A, Choice. 270-310 ct. 6/410 9 Juice Pak Nifda 46000 $ 61.90| 3 557.10
Packed in heavy syrup. NDW. 66 oz.
1.05 Cherries Red Tart Pitted 6/4lb 15 Comsource 46010 $ 65.55| $ 983.25
1.06 Cherries, Maraschino, halves, US Grade A. Red. 1/2gal 4 Oregon Growers 121030 | $ 7.90| $ 31.60
107 Fruit Cocktail, US Grade A., Choice. Packed in heavy syrup. 6/410 17 Light Syrup Nifda 46110 $ 3270| 3 555.90
NDW. 71 oz.
1.08 Fruit Cocktail, Grade A Choice, Diet Pack 24/303 32 Del Monte 717602 $ 42.00| $ 1,344.00
1.09 Fruit Salad 6#10 6 Nifda 46140 $ 36.95| $ 221.70
110 Grapefruit Sections, US Grade A. Packed in heavy syrup. 12/46 oz 5 Not U.S. World Horizon 46200 $ 36.35| 3 181.75
NDW 30 oz. Isreal
111 Oranges, Mandarin, Broken sections. US Grade A. Packed in 61410 10 Not US World Horizon 46160 $ 37.45| 3 37450
heavy syrup. China- Light Syrup
Peaches, Yellow Cling. Sliced US Grade A Choice. Packed in . .
1.12 Heavy Syrup. NDW 68 oz. 6/#10 29 Nifda Light Syrup 45490 $ 30.85( $ 894.65
113 Peaches, halves, Y.C., US Grade A. Choice, 35-40 ct. Packed 6/410 10 Light Syrup Nifda 45480 $ 3085| 3 308.50
in heavy syrup. NDW 68 oz.
114 Pgaches, Sliced, Y.C. Grade A Choice Diet Pack. 14 degree 24/303 33 Nifda 46230 $ 2565| 3 846.45
Brix or water
1.15 Peach Halves, Y.C. Grade A, Choice. Diet Pack. 24/303 15 No Bid
116 Pears, Bartlett, Sliced, US Grade A. Packed in heavy syrup. 6/410 21 Light Syrup Nifda 45590 $ 28.10| 3 590.10
NDW 65 oz.
117 \I/DVZ?erf, Halves, Diet Pack, U.S. Grade A 14 degree Brix or 24/303 26 Nifda 46240 2055| 3 534,30
1.18 Pear Nectar, U.S. Grade A 12/46 oz. 20 Seneca 44980 28.80| $ 576.00
1.19 Pineapple, Crushed, Hawaiian or Phillippine. US Grade A. 6/#10 2 Thailand Juice Pak 45710 32.45| $ 64.90
Packed in heavy syrup
1.20 Pineapple, Tidbits, Hawaiian or Philippine. US Grade A. 6/#10 16 Thailand Juice Pak 45760 | $  31.35|% 501.60
Packed in natural juice. NDW 65 oz.
121 Pineapple, Sliced, Hawaiian or Phillippine. US Grade A.55-66 | - ¢, 5 Dole Juice Pak 46167 | $  33.30(% 166.50
count. Packed in natural juice NDW 62 oz.
Plums, Purple, Halves, US Grade A, Choice Pitted. Packed in .
1.22 heavy syrup 120-140 Ct. NDW 63 oz. 6/#10 19 Nifda 45790 $ 27.80| $ 528.20
Prunes, Pitted, Nectarized Type. US Grade A, No Sugar
1.23 Added. 190-220 ct. NDW 96 oz. 6/#10 7 Comsource 46440 85.50( $ 598.50
1.24 Raisins Bulk 150z 33 Sunmaid 710124 | $ 2.10] $ 69.30
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CANNED VEGETABLES 0

Beans, Green Cut. Stringless, sieve #4. Bluelake type. US .
2.01 Grade A. NDW 60 0z. 6/#10 41 Nifda 43221 $ 2550 $ 1,045.50
202 g/el%ns, Green, French Style Bluelake, US Grade A, Fancy 6/410 4 Nifda 43320 $ 26.20| 3 104.80

Beans, Wax Cut. Stringless, Sieve #4. US Grade A. Extra .
2.03 Standard. NDW 60 oz. 6/#10 3 Nifda 43300 $ 24.20| $ 72.60
2.04 Beans, Dry. Great Northern, US Grade A. Re-cleaned. 1/20# bag 9 Kelly Bean 49990 $ 16.35| $ 147.15
2.05 Beans, Kidney. Dark Red. US Grade A Fancy 6/#10 4 Allen's 43350 $ 25.60| $ 102.40
2.06 Beans, Pinto US Grade A 6/10# 16 Kumer 43416 $ 24.25| $ 388.00
2.07 Beans, Lima. Green, Medium. US Grade A NDW 72 oz. 6/#10 3 Allen 43210 $ 24.75] $ 74.25
2.08 ng(;znépss Beans, with Pork and Tomato Sauce US Grade A 6/#10 13 Van Camp 43395 | $  33.60($ 436.80
2.09 Beans, Refried. US Grade A 6/#10 4 Rosita 43410 $ 33.80| $ 135.20
2.10 Beets, Sliced, Medium. US Grade A Fancy. NDW 68 oz. 6/#10 14 Nifda 43440 $ 21.95| $ 307.30
2.11 Carrots Whole Baby 100/120ct 6#10 5 Nifda No Bid
2.12 Carrots, Whole, 225/over. US Grade A Fancy. NDW 69 oz. 6/#10 10 200 ct Cortona 43512 $ 3256 % 325.60
2.13 Corn, Cream Style, Yellow. US Grade A Fancy. NDW 106 oz. 6/#10 8 Nifda 43540 $ 27.80| $ 222.40
214 s;uerkraut, Shredded. US Grade A Extra Standard. NDW 79 61410 7 Nifda 43870 $ 18.90| 3 132.30
2.15 Tomato Diced in juice 6/#10 16 Nifda 43970 $ 18.55| $ 296.80
216 Tomatoes, Whole, Peeled. Packed in juice. US Grade A 61410 8 Nifda 43960 $ 1835| 3 146.80

Choice. NDW 67 oz.

5 -

217 Hunts Tomato Paste. US Grade A. Not less than 24% tomato solids. 6/#10 1 Red Gold 43710 $ 29.15| 3 20.15

NW 100 oz. pouch
2.18 Hunts Tomato Sauce. US Grade A. NW 106 oz. s(/)ﬁ:?] 9 6/10 Cans Nifda 43940 $ 17.45] $ 157.05
2.19 Uncle Ben Rice, Converted, US Grade #1 1/25# bag 12 U Ben 50021 $ 24.65| $ 295.80
2.20 Peas, Green Split, Re-cleaned 1/20# bag 3 Kelly Bean 50022 $ 13.73| $ 41.19
2.21 Spinach, Grade A 6/#10 6 Pop Eye/Allen 43920 $ 22.75| $ 136.50
2.22 Yams Cut in Syrup 6#10 13 Nifda 43800 $ 31.50| $ 409.50
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BASES AND SOUPS 0
Campbell's . 12/50 oz
3.01 NO SUBS Cream of Chicken Soup. Condensed. en/cs 5 Campbells 49666 $ 42.40| $ 212.00
Campbell's 12/50 oz
3.02 NO SUBS Cream of Mushroom Soup. Condensed. en/cs 13 Campbells 49681 $ 42.95|$ 558.35
Campbell's Tomato Soup. Condensed. Campbell’s reconstitution ratio by 12/50 oz
3.03 NO SUBS volume equal to or less than 1:1. cn/cs 18 Szl 49477 $ e 596.70
Campbell's .
3.04 Tomato Soup Low Sodium 24/7.50z 1 Campbells 49822 $ 16.90| $ 16.90
NO SUBS
Campbell's 12/50 oz
3.05 NO SUBS Vegetable Soup. Condensed. en/cs 1 Campbells 49760 $ 42.25| $ 42.25
Campbell's . .
3.06 NO SUBS Chicken Noodle Soup, Condensed 12/50 oz 11 No Bid
3.07 Chicken Broth, Canned 12/490z 47 College Inn 44720 $ 26.40| $ 1,240.80
3.08 Beef Broth, Canned 12/490z 49 College Inn 47721 $ 26.40| $ 1,293.60
BAKING MIXES AND SUPPLIES 0
4,01 Calumet Baking Powder. Double acting #1 70z 17 Calumet 733775 | $ 155( % 26.35
Arm & Hammer .
4.02 NO SUBS Baking Soda 1lb 24 Arm & Hammer 733795 $ 0.75| $ 18.00
403 Bakeéf’E';i:\slheys Chocolate Chips, Semisweet 1/25lb 2 Hershey 75420 |$  4435|$ 88.70
2.04 Coconut, Medium Shred, Unsweetened in sealed container. 10b 4 Kerry 50210 $ 17.86| 3 71.44
Grade A
4.05 QI(IZ)PSUL:EOSE Flour, Enriched style #2, Bleached type. #3 class. 1/25lb bag 77 Caeh 40778 $ 950( 3 731.50
4.06 Dry Yeast, Active-Vac Pack Type Il 1/2Ib 11 Tone Brothers 41190 $ 4.30| $ 47.30
G. Mills #11432 ) . . . .
4.07 NO SUBS Muffin Mix, Basic Enriched. 6/5Ib 16 No Bid
4.08 Krﬁ%"gﬁg;“" Marshmallow, Minature 12/1lb 12 Hospitality 50180 | $  11.35($ 136.20
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COOKIES, CRACKERS AND SNACKS 0
Keebler- Nabisco |Cookies, Sandwich, Vanilla. Uniformly Baked with Color .
501" NosuBs  |suitable to type. 120z 62 No Bid
5.02 Keebler Graham Crackers 1/10lb 1 Sunshine 43630 $ 25.65| $ 25.65
5.03 Nat;lztg)SNO Crackers, Graham. 60-90 ct. pkg. per pound. 200/2 pk 7 No Bid
5.04 Saltine Crackers, 8# bulk 1/8lb 3 Sunshine 42670 $ 19.35]| $ 58.05
5.05 Saltine Crackers. 60-90 ct. pkg per pound. 500/ 2 pk 35 Unipro/Sunshine 42630 $ 12.55| $ 439.25
5.06 Cracker Meal Fine 1/20lb 8 Kerry 43011 $ 18.00| $ 144.00
Keebler- Nabisco .
5.07 Crackers, Graham, Crumbs 1/101b 6 Sunshine 43041 $ 17.60| $ 105.60
NO SUBS
5.08 Crackers Oyster 300/.650z 3 Keebler 42720 $ 28.15| $ 84.45
PASTA NOODLES 0
6.01 Noodles, Chow Mein. Bulk Pack 6/240z 4 Fairbury Foods 44050 20.65| $ 82.60
6.02 Noodles, Lasagna}. Enriched durum or hard wheat flour. In 12/1602 2 A. Zerega 41340 1415| 3 28.30
poly sealed containers.
6.03 Noodles, Homestyle #1 Grade, 10# poly sealed containers 1/10lb 3 Zerega Kluski's 41330 14.00| $ 42.00
6.04 Noodles extra wide 1/2" 1/10lb 14 Zerega 41370 $ 13.00| $ 182.00
Spaghetti, Long Style #7. Enriched seminola, durum or hard
6.05 wheat flour or any combination of 2 or more of these and 1/20lb 6 Zerega 41270 $ 20.05| $ 120.30
water. In poly sealed containers.
6.06 Pasta Noodles Orig Egg 1/4" 4/3lb 3 10# Zerega 41310 $ 13.00| $ 39.00
Macaroni, Elbow (Seminola, Farina, Durum or hard wheat
6.07 Flour) or any of these ingredients & water enriched, in poly 1/20lb 7 Zerega 41230 $ 19.60| $ 137.20
sealed containers
DRESSINGS, SAUCES AND CONDIMENTS 0
7.01 Cattleman's Barbeque Sauce 4/1gal 16 Cattleman's 41530 $ 41.95| $ 671.20
7.02 Cocktail Sauce 1gal 7 Lasco 41524 $ 9.65| $ 67.55
703 Heinz Canup, Red Pack or Equivalent. US Grade A Fancy. With U#10 1 Red Gold 47060 $ 200( s 290
solids not less than 33%
7.04 Heinz Catsup, US Grade A Fancy. With solids not less than 33% 1/240z 371 Heinz 715627 | $ 2.05| % 760.55
7.05 Heinz Mustard, Prepared, pure, smooth, heavy consistency. 1/140z 107 French's 715703 | $ 1.75] $ 187.25
7.06 Heinz 57 Sauce 24/50z 2 HZ 49050 $ 40.00| $ 80.00
7.07 Worcestershire Sauce 1gal 7 HZ 49030 $ 6.80| $ 47.60
7.08 Sweet and Sour Dip Cup 100/10z 5 HZ 49116 $ 14.15] $ 70.75
7.09 Tobasco Sauce 24/20z 2 Mcllhenny 41630 $ 27.60| $ 55.20
7.10 | Pace NO SUBS |Picante Sauce, Mild 4/1 gal. 4/1 gal 7 Pace Meas Grande 41793 $ 31.30| $ 219.10
7.11 | Kraft NO SUBS |Thousand Island Dressing, Low Calorie, 100/1.50z. 2 No Bid
7.12 | Kraft NO SUBS |Dressing, Thousand Island 200/12gr 3 No Bid
7.13 Kraft or equiv  |Dressing, Italian 200/12gr 1 Portion PakK 47043 $ 8.50| $ 8.50
7.14 Soy Sauce 1gal 10 Kikkeman 41600 $ 8.95| $ 89.50
7.15 Sauce Ind Malt Vinegar 200/9gm 8 HZ 47185 $ 13.10| $ 104.80
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716 Pet?\lrggrbgrs.llffy gsfenut Butter, US Grade A, Fine Ground, smooth texture 8/4002 5 Skippy 47671 $ 39.10| $ 195.50
7.17 Honey Bear Squeeze bottle 120z 60 Sure Fine 412022 | $ 3.00]| $ 180.00
7.18 Vinegar, Cider, 50 grain 6/1 gal 4 Speaco 47150 $ 14.05| $ 56.20
7.19 Vinegar, White. 50 grain 6/1 gal 27 Speaco 47160 $ 11.65| $ 314.55
7.20 Nondairy Creamer, Powder 1000/cs 7 Comsource 75150 $ 18.40| $ 128.80
7.21 nggeggggey Hidden valley Original flavor salad Dressing 84/1.50z 17 No Bid
7.22 nggeggggey Dressing Ranch Fat Free Individual Packets 841150z | 11 Hid Val 48400 |$  17.00|% 187.00
7.23 nggeggggey Ranch Dressing Individual Packets 200/cs 11 No Bid
7.24 Dressing Mix Ranch Original 18/3.20z 4 Hid Val 48410 $ 32.10| $ 128.40
7.25 Kraft or Equiv  |French Dressing, Low calorie Individual packets 200/12gr 3 Heinz 47921 $ 13.35]| $ 40.05
7.26 Kraft or Equiv |Dressing, French Individual Packets 200/12gr 6 Portion PakK 47044 $ 12.85| $ 77.10
7.27 Wishbone Dressing Italian 4/1gal 8 Wishbone 48445 $ 38.50| $ 308.00
7.28 NO SUBS Dorothy Lynch Dressing 4/1gal 8 Dorthy Lynch 48140 $ 29.00| $ 232.00
7.29 Pimento Pieces 24/280z 2 Dunbar 50099 $ 67.45| $ 134.90
730 Crigco or OIL, Vegetable, refined, bleached, deodorized, lightly 6/1 gals per 12 Ventura 48786 $ 2450 3 534.00
Equivalent hydrogenated. cs
7.31 Mayonnaise 4/1gal 20 Ventura Nifda 47959 $ 34.35| $ 687.00
Kraft Miracle-
7.32 Whip Maronite, Miracle Whip, LITE, Kraft No Substitute 4/1 gal 26 Kraft 47945 $ 50.00| $ 1,300.00
NO SUBS
Kraft Miracle-
7.33 Whip Miracle Whip Individual Packets 200/.44 26 Kraft 47616 $ 16.60| $ 431.60
NO SUBS
7.34 | Prego NO SUBS |Spaghetti Sauce, Prego Brand, No Substitute 6/1060z 15 Prego 44784 $ 41.00| $ 615.00
7.35 Reeses Big Cup 16ct 76 31000 $ 9.10] $ 691.60
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0
8.01 Sugar, Granulated, White, Beet or Cane, Individual Packets 2000/cs 25 300 Ct. Reflections 47306 $ 16.90| $ 422.50
8.02 Sugar, Granulated, White, Beet or Cane. Multiwall bags. 25Ib bag 89 United 47210 $ 14.70| $ 1,308.30
8.03 Sugar, Light Brown, free of lumps. Plastic bags. 12/2Ib bags| 24 Sure Fine 47250 $ 15.45| $ 370.80
8.04 Sugar, Powdered confectioners, Multiwall Bag 12/2Ib bags| 18 Sure Fine 47220 $ 15.45| $ 278.10
8.05 nglgr&c:aas zx%agjxgsli\"tge' Artificially sweetened with Aspertame. NO 1/3000 14 2000 Ct. Splenda 47339 | $  31.60($ 442.40
8.06 Syrup, Pancake, Maple Flavor, Corn syrup base, balance 4/1 gal 27 Lyons/Unipro 47720 | $  1755|% 473.85

granulated sugar syrup, plastic jugs.

8.07 | Morton or Equiv. |Salt, Individual lodized #1 quality 3/1000 14 Diamond Crystal 47340 $ 4.80] $ 67.20
8.08 | Morton or Equiv. |Salt, lodized #1 quality, free running. 24/26 oz 8 Unipro 47410 $ 14.45] $ 115.60
8.09 Pepper, Individual packets 3/1000 14 Diamond Crystal 47370 $ 6.15]| $ 86.10

GELATIN AND PUDDINGS 0
9.01 Gelatin, Cherry, Jello, Kraft, Royal or Equivalent. 1/4.5Ib 11 Diamond Crystal 40100 $ 5.55] $ 61.05
9.02 Gelatin, Lemon, Jello, Kraft, Royal or Equivalent. 1/4.5Ib 13 Diamond Crystal 40080 $ 5.55] $ 72.15
9.03 Gelatin, Lime, Jello, Kraft, Royal or Equivalent. 1/4.5Ib 12 Diamond Crystal 40090 $ 5.55] $ 66.60
9.04 Gelatin, Orange, Jello, Kraft, Royal or Equivalent. 1/4.5Ib 9 Diamond Crystal 40110 $ 5.55] $ 49.95
9.05 Gelatin, Strawberry, Jello, Kraft, Royal or Equivalent. 1/4.5Ib 15 Diamond Crystal 40120 $ 5.55] $ 83.25
9.06 Gelatin, Raspberry, Jello, Kraft, Royal or Equivalent. 1/4.5Ib 3 Diamond Crystal 40130 $ 5.55] $ 16.65
9.07 Pudding Mix, Vanilla Instant 12/280z 2 Diamond Crystal 40300 $ 40.20| $ 80.40
9.08 Pudding Banana 6/#10 1 Knouse 40460 $ 24.05| $ 24.05
9.09 Pudding Vanilla 6/#10 3 Knouse 40400 $ 24.05| $ 72.15

CEREALS AND BREAKFAST ITEMS 0
10.01 Cream of Wheat 12/28 oz 10 Nabisco 42420 $ 22.25| $ 222.50
10.02 Malt-O-Meal 12/420z 9 Malto Meal 10/36 oz. 42440 $ 37.00| $ 333.00
10.03 Oatmeal, Quick 12/46 oz. 19 Hospitality 12/42 oz. 42236 $ 22.25| $ 422.75

SPICES AND FLAVORINGS 0
11.01 Black Pepper, purchased individually 4lb 14 Custom Blend 39678 $ 26.60| $ 372.40
11.02 Garlic Powder, Purchased individually 180z 15 Custom Blend 39231 $ 5.90| $ 88.50
11.03 Paprika, purchased individually 180z 8 Custom Blend 39391 $ 7.90] $ 63.20
11.04 Onion Powder, purchased individually 180z 4 Custom Blend 39341 $ 7.10] $ 28.40
11.05 Cumin, purchased individually 160z 1 Custom Blend 18 oz. 39151 $ 8.60| $ 8.60
11.06 White Ground Pepper, purchased individually 180z 2 Custom Blend 39451 $ 15.15| $ 30.30
11.07 Garlic Salt, purchased individually 360z 2 Custom Blend 39251 $ 6.05] $ 12.10
11.08 Whole Bay Leaves, purchased individually 100z 4 Custom Blend 2 oz. 39061 $ 4.15] $ 16.60
11.09 Cream of Tartar, purchased individually 320z 6 Custom Blend 39181 $ 16.50| $ 99.00
11.10 Pumpkin Pie Spice, purchased individually 1lb 1 Custom Blend 18 oz. 39521 $ 7.85] % 7.85
11.11 Seasoned Salt, purchased individually 5lb 1 Custom Blend 8 Ibs. 39631 $ 5.40] $ 5.40
11.12 Ground Clover, purchased individually 160z 1 Custom Blend 18 oz. 39201 $ 10.00| $ 10.00
11.13 Cloves Whole, purchased individually 120z 1 Custom Blend 39203 $ 7.90] $ 7.90
11.14 Pickling Spice, purchased individually 160z 1 Custom Blend 39031 $ 6.20] $ 6.20
11.15 Extract Banana, purchased individually 160z 2 Custom Blend 39716 $ 7.30] $ 14.60
11.16 Extract Almond, purchased individually 160z 1 Custom Blend 39771 $ 6.20] $ 6.20
11.17 Chili Powder, purchased individually 4.5lb 2 Custom Blend 39591 $ 38.10| $ 76.20
11.18 Parsley Flakes, purchased individually 80z 1 Custom Blend 39401 $ 14.90| $ 14.90
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11.19 Poultry Seasoning, purchased individually 120z 6 Custom Blend 39491 $ 7.90] $ 47.40
11.20 Lemon Pepper, purchased individually 280z 1 Custom Blend 39026 $ 6.40] $ 6.40
11.21 Sage, purchased individually 60z 1 Custom Blend 39531 $ 6.50] $ 6.50
11.22 Celery Salt, purchased individually 280z 1 Custom Blend 39131 $ 4.75] $ 4.75
11.23 Chopped Dried Onions, purchased individually 3lb 2 Gilroy 50320 $ 10.05| $ 20.10
11.24 Whole Celery Seed, purchased individually 1lb 1 Custom Blend 39121 $ 6.30]| $ 6.30
11.25 Onion Salt, purchased individually 360z 1 Custom Blend 39331 $ 6.70]| $ 6.70
11.26 Ground Ginger, purchased individually 1lb 2 Custom Blend 39261 $ 6.50] $ 13.00
11.27 Poppy Seed, purchased individually 220z 1 Custom Blend 39037 $ 13.15]| $ 13.15
11.28 Vanilla purchased individually 1pt 11 Custom Blend 39039 $ 9.15] $ 100.65
11.29 Spice Cinnamon Ground 160z 3 Custom Blend 39141 $ 5.60] $ 16.80
11.30 Cloves Ground 180z 1 $ =
11.31 Cinnamon Sticks 100z 1 Custom Blend 39040 $ 8.80| $ 8.80
RELISHES 0

12.01 Relish ind Sweet Pickle 200/9gm 7 Portion Pak 46645 $ 10.45| $ 73.15
12.02 Pickle Dill CC Waf 1gal 14 Pinnacle Pickle 46480 $ 4.95] $ 69.30
12.03 Pickle Sweet Midget 1gal 1 No Bid

12.04 Pickles, Kosher Dill Spears, US Grade A. 90-110 Count 1/#10 34 Heinz 49231 $ 4.85] $ 164.90
12.05 Pickles, Sweet Relish, Fancy. NDW 85 oz. US Grade A 4/1gal 5 Pinnacle 46630 $ 21.15| $ 105.75

JELLIES 0
Smuckers .
13.01 NO SUBS Jellies Assorted, US Grade A Fancy 200/1/2 oz 93 Smucker 47641 $ 11.95| $ 1,111.35
13.02|  Smuckers 1y Individual Strawberry 200/.50z | 70 Smucker 47642 | $  13.90|% 973.00
NO SUBS
13.03 Eg”gﬁesré Jelly Ind Diet 80 gr 80 ap 40 mf 200/12gm | 12 No Bid
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FRUIT AND VEGETALBE JUICES 0
14.01 Applg Juice, US Qrade A. Style 1/clear. Natural Vitamin C 12/46 oz 141 Lyons 44892 $ 2710| 3 3.821.10
fortified. In Aseptic Pak only cn/cs
14.02 Aprlcgt Nectar. Unsweetened. US Grade A Viscosity L/L=50- 12/46 oz a1 Lyons 44900 $ 27.15| 3 1,113.15
90 Brix 14-15 degrees cn/cs
14.03 Grapefruit Juice. US Grade A. Unsweetened, amber or white. 1%’;‘2;2 1 Lyons 44894 $ 32.90( $ 32.90
14.04 Orange Juice. US Grade A or better. Unsweetened. In 12/46 oz 214 Lyons 44891 $ 27.15| 3 5.810.10
Aseptic Pak only cn/cs
14.05 Pineapple Juice, Unsweetened Hawaiian. Natural US Grade 12/46 oz 24 Lyons 44893 $ 21.00| 3 525,60
A cn/cs
. 12/46 oz
14.06 Prune Juice, Natural. US Grade A cnlcs 73 Lyons 44895 $ 40.05| $ 2,923.65
Campbell's . . 12/46 oz :
14.07 NO SUBS Vegetable Juice Cocktail US Grade A cnjcs 51 Campbell's 45040 $ 2485| $ 1,267.35
Campbell's . . . 12/46 oz :
14.08 Tomato Juice. US Grade A or better. Viscosity L/L 50-90 95 Campbell's 45031 $ 16.65| $ 1,581.75
NO SUBS cn/cs
14.09 Grape Juice Us Grade A, Fancy Unsweetened, Natural in 12/46 0z. | 138 Lyons 45042 | $  2385|$  3,291.30
Aseptic Pak
14.10 Cranberry Juice Contains 25% Juice Aseptic Pack 12/460z 69 Lyons 45041 $ 27.25| $ 1,880.25
14.11 Horrrl‘_ib';ea'th Suppl. Juice Orange Drink 50/602 34 Hormel Health 39305 |$  5810|$  1,975.40
1412 Hor”ﬂb';ea'th Suppl Juice White Grape 50/60z 13 No Bid
14.13 Suppl Juice Tropical 50/60z 5 No Bid
14.14 Suppl Mighty Shake Plus Choc 50/40z 8 Hormel 59236 $ 23.75| $ 190.00
14.15 Suppl Cookie Rasp Filled 50/20z 7 Hormel 59082 $ 20.50| $ 143.50
14.16 Nectar Consistency Thickened Coffee 75/120z 10 Hormel 49385 $ 25.95| $ 259.50
14.17 Honey Consistency Thickened Coffee 75/120z 14 Hormel 49386 $ 25.95| $ 363.30
14.18 Nectar Consistency Thickened Cranberry Juice 6/460z 9 Lyons 46026 $ 15.90| $ 143.10
14.19 Nectar Consistency Thickened Apricot Juice 12/460z 33 No Bid
14.20 Nectar Consistency Thickened Apple Juice 6/46 10 Lyons 46025 $ 16.75| $ 167.50
14.21 Nectar Consistency Thickened Orange Juice 6/480z 11 Lyons 46024 $ 16.60| $ 182.60
14.22 Nectar Consistency Pear Juice 12/460z 11 No Bid
14.23 Honey Consistency Thickened Cranberry Juice 6/480z 10 Lyons 46023 $ 17.15]| $ 171.50
14.24 Honey Consistency Thickened Apple Juice 6/480z 17 Lyons 46022 $ 18.05| $ 306.85
14.25 Honey Consistency Thickened Orange Juice 6/480z 14 Lyons 46021 $ 17.10| $ 239.40
14.26 Honey Consistency Thickened Water 6/480z 55 Hormel 49395 $ 16.10| $ 885.50
14.27 Nectar Consistency Thickened Water 6/480z 34 Hormel 49396 $ 16.10| $ 547.40
14.28 Honey Consistency Thickened Milk 12/320z 23 Lyons 49384 $ 29.65| $ 681.95
14.29 Nectar Consistency Thickened Milk 12/320z 17 Lyons 49383 $ 29.20| $ 496.40

Page 8 of 11



Buyer: Todd Dlouhy 2674 OF Opening Date: 11/07/08
Grocery and Frozen Foods
Western Nebraska Veteran's Home

. Est. - .
Acceptable . Case Size Brand Billing, Case Size and I Exetended
Brand Description & Weight Usage ), el Prod Code| Unit Price Price
Total
DIETARY ITEMS 0
15.01 Cod Scrod Loin 2-30z 10lb 38 Fishery Products Int'l 51170 $ 54.40] % 2,067.20
15.02 | Starkist NO SUBS|Salmon, Pink canned 6/4lb 13 No Bid
15.03 Clams Chopped 12/510z 2 USA Comsource 44670 $ 96.15| $ 192.30
15.04 | Starkist NO SUBS|Tuna. Light Meat Fancy. Packed in Water. Low Sodium. 6/66.50z 8 Starkist 44683 $ 65.15]| $ 521.20
15.05 %%nggilss Chicken Noodle Soup. Low Sodium 24/7.25 oz 1 Campbells 49840 $ 62.05| $ 62.05
Campbell's . .
15.06 NO SUBS Turkey Noodle Soup, Low sodium 24/7.25 oz 1 No Bid
15.07 %%nggilss Vegetable Soup, Low Sodium 24/7.25 oz 1 Campbells 49823 $ 18.25| $ 18.25
DAIRY PRODUCTS 0
16.01 Cheese. American Processed Sliced. 160 count per 5# 6/5Ib 10 Land O Lakes 60588 $ 71.78| $ 717.80
16.02| Kraft or Equiv. |Cheese. Swiss Processed Sliced. 160 count per 5# 4/5lb 8 6/5# Land O Lakes 60590 $ 76.73| $ 613.84
16.03 Cheese, Mozzarella. US Grade A 5lb 15 Nifda -Shredded 60810 $ 13.92]| $ 208.80
- " -
16.04| Kraftor Equiv |C1eeSe: American Us Grade A, 50 % or more milkfat based 51b 10 Land O Lakes 60380 | $  12.37$ 123.70
on dry weight block.
16.05 Margarine Spread Trans fat free 900/5gm 73 Land O Lakes 61691 $ 21.55| $ 1,573.15
16.06 Cream Cheese Block 3lb 58 Nifda 61010 $ 6.05]| $ 350.90
16.07 Cheese Parmesan Grated 12/30z 6 Kraft 653448 | $ 23.50| $ 141.00
16.08 Sour Cream Individual Packs 100/10z 41 Roberts 66246 $ 13.10| $ 537.10
16.09 Evaporated Milk 48/120z 12 Diehl 41470 $ 40.50| $ 486.00
16.10 | Rich's NO SUBS |Non Dairy Whipped Topping 12/2lb 25 Rich 58191 $ 43.00| $ 1,075.00
FROZEN FOODS 0
Simplot Payette, |, . ~ . . .
17.01 422301598 15" Crinkle Cut French Fries. Deep fat fry. 6/5Ib 27 Simplot 50535 $ 16.35 | $ 441.45
Simplot Simplot Tater Gems (Logs). Oven preparation, processed in
17.02|  Preformers |~ stable e dersgor'ﬁ”ers prep P 6/5lb 12 Simplot Oven 4189 50580 [$  15.10 | $ 181.20
#3700101A 9 : :
17.03 Seasoned Waffle Fries 6/5lb 3 Simplot 50540 |$ 18.00 | $ 54.00
Beans, Cut Green Beans. Must meet US Grade A. Small light
17.04 segded variety. '2,3 & 4 sieve blend. Unlform'l orl 1/2' cut. 12/2Ib 1 Nifda 57530 |3 2140 | $ 21.40
Uniform color with very small percentage of light Grn units.
Tender, not fibrous, and shows no sign of sloughing.
California Country Blend. Must meet US Grade A. Vegetable
blend must contain the following: Broccoli cuts 1" minimum .
17.05 30% head materials 40%; Cauliflower 3/4" to 1 1/4" 30%, and 1/20lb 8 <liig el S $ 2Ll ez
Crinkle Cut Carrots, uniform small or medium 30%
17.06 Asparagus spears- Med 6/2.5lb 19 Simplot 57490 |$ 47.30 | $ 898.70
17.07 Broccoli Cuts, Qrade A. Uniform cuts of good green color. No 12/2.5b 21 Nifda 57610 3 2750 | 3 57750
yellow or gray pieces.
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Cauliflower. Must meet US Grade A. Uniform cluster size 1
17.08 1/2" to 2" across top (No. 2 %2" size). Count range 25-35 units 12/2Ib 10 Simplot 57550 $ 30.65 | $ 306.50
per 32 oz. container. Good white to light cream color.

Sliced Carrots. Must meet US Grade A Uniform bright color
orange to orange-yellow. Not more than 10% by weight of the
units shall be yellow. Uniform size 7/8" to 1 1/4" diameter.
Smooth slice 5/16", crinkle cut, 3/8" thick.

17.09 1/201b 52 Simplot 57690 |[$ 1715 | $ 891.80

Cut Kernel Corn. Must meet US Grade A. The kernels
17.10 possess a uniform yellow color typical of tender sweet corn, 1/20Ib 24 Simplot 57710 |$ 1745 | $ 418.80
free of off-variety kernels.

5-way Mixed Vegetables. Must meet US Grade A. Made up of
the following vegetables and % by weight; whole kernel corn,
17.11 20-25%; peas 1-4 sieve, 20-25%; carrots, 3/8" diced, 20-25%; 1/20lb 20 Nifda 57729 |$ 16.55 | $ 331.00
baby lima beans, 8-15%; green beans 1" cut, 1-4 sieve, 15-
20%.

Chopped Spinach. Must meet US Grade A. 1/4" x 1/4",
17.12 uniform bright green color, tender leaves, maximum 22% stem 12/3lb 1 Simplot 57660 |$ 3350 | $ 33.50
by weight.

Peas. Must meet US Grade A. Blend of 2,3,4 sieve (Maximum
17.13 10% 5 sieve allowable) Good bright uniform color. No more 20lb 48 Nifda 57721 |$ 17.90 | $ 859.20
than 5 blond peas per 10% sample.

17.14 Cooked Squash, US Grade A 12/4lb 3 Simplot 57670 |$ 39.60 | $ 118.80

Brussel Sprouts. Must meet US Grade A. 3/4" to 1" diameter,
80 to 100 units per 2 %# or 140 to 160 units per 4#. Uniform

17.15 color green to greenish-yellow, not more than 4% by count 127216 3 e SELY |6 2B || 89.25
yellow. No pink or discolored centers.
17.16 Cherries, Frozen IQF (No Juices) 6/5lb 15 Gems of Fruit 52107 |$ 39.35 | $ 590.25
17.17 GardeEgl';:fSh " [strawberries, Whole. IQF. No Sugar, US Grade A 6/3lb 13 Gems of Fruit 57161 |[$ 2770 |$ 360.10
17.18 Blueberries, NO Sugar 30 Ib. 1/30lb 4 Dot 57210 |$ 44.00 | $ 176.00
0

18.03 Grape Juice Cups Frozen 96/40z 11 Country Pure 58176 $ 14.25 | $ 156.75
18.04 Apple Juice Cups Frozen 96/40z 15 Country Pure 58105 |$ 13.75 | $ 206.25
18.05 Cranberry Juice Cups Frozen 96/4 8 Country Pure 58177 |$ 16.80 | $ 134.40
18.06 Orange Juice Cups Frozen 96/40z 15 Country Pure 58088 $ 15.25 | $ 228.75
18.08 Real Lemon  [Real Lemon Juice 12/32 oz. 5 No Bid
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00D 0
19.01 Reames Reames Egg Noodles 4/3lb 8 Masyeth 58879 |$ 20.60 | $ 164.80

0
20.01 Walnuts 1/2lb 6 Azar 37857 $ 14.80| $ 88.80
20.02 | Rich's NO SUBS |Biscuit dough Homestyle 216/2.5 7 Rich 58922 $ 41.00| $ 287.00
20.03 | Lipton NO SUBS |Decaf Ind Tea Bags 1/72ct 51 Lipton 74075 $ 4.90] $ 249.90
20.04 | Lipton NO SUBS |Ind Tea Bags 100/Box 36 Lipton 74070 $ 3.85]| $ 138.60
20.05 Dawn Dish Soap 4/1gal 63 Proctor & Gamble Dawn 3/1 gal. 90034 $ 36.15( $ 2,277.45

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO
Comments
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