
Buyer: Connie Heinrichs 2646 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date: 10/09/08

PRIMARY AWARD THIRD AWARD
POLICE ONLY

SECONDARY 
AWARD

Li
ne

# 4WD Large Special Service Vehicle, 7-
Passenger Performance Dodge Sid Dillon Wahoo, Inc 

Bid #1
Sid Dillon Wahoo, Inc  

Bid #2
Tekamah Ford 
Lincoln Mercury

Life Cycle Cost Calculation $38,381.33 $40,757.00 $36,083.95 
Base Price $23,998.00 $26,397.00 $24,397.00 $25,549.00 
Make: Dodge Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford
Model: Durango Tahoe - SSV Traverse Expedition

Series, Code, Trim Level: SLT' 'HB5H74' 1500-CK10706-5W4-
SSV

Traverse - CV14526 
AWD - LS XLT

Engine 4.7L V-8 5.3L Vortec V8 3.6L SIDI V-6 5.4L V8
EPA 13-18 14 City/20 Hwy 16 city/ 23 Hwy NA
Delivery Time ARO 90-120 45/120 45/120 45-90
E85 Model Price $23,998.00 NA @ this time
Engine 4.7L V-8 FFV 5.3L Vortec V8 NA @ this time

3 Engine, Diesel with block heater, factory or 
dealer installed NA NA NA NA

Engine, Gasoline (other)  $851.00 NA NA NA
Specify Engine Size: 5.7L V-8 Hemi NA

5 Heavy duty bench front seat W/lumbar support 
(deduct) NA NA NA NA

6 40-40 power bucket electric seats NA $997.00 NA NA
7 40-40 manual cloth bucket seats STD NA STD STD

Console between front seats (deduct) STD ($397.00) NA STD

Comments
No armrests & Floor 

is exposed & 
untrimmed

9 Third Rear Seat (deduct) ($215.00) Std on SSV - 5W4 NA NA

10 Tires and Rims (4), 16” minimum, (specify if 
not standard) STD Std STD STD

11 Additional remote fob from manufacturer Inc. in Bid $197.00 $197.00 $80.00 

12 Standard Paint - Attach List and Identify as No 
Additional Cost Paints See attached sheet NC - See attached NC - See attached STD

13 Extra Cost Paint- Attach List and Identify as 
Extra Cost Paints

$194.00           
See attached sheet

$597.00           
See attached NA on model NA

14 Second Power Outlet STD STD STD STD
15 Trailer towing package (deduct) ($391.00) ($147.00) ($197.00) $340.00 

2 wheel drive model (deduct) ($2,453.00) ($1,597.00) ($897.00) ($2,610.00)
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Comments Requires Commercial 
Pkg 1 FL

17 Protective safety cage position determined by 
the Fleet Manager. No bid $997.00 $997.00 $720.00 

18

Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop 
shipment outside the Lincoln area. Drop 
shipment charges would be for vehicles 
bought by political entities and other Divisions 
of Government.

$400.00 $400.00 $400.00 $500.00 

Courtesy signal or Internal light inoperable No bid $97.00 $97.00 NC
Comments Total Inop Total Inop $80.00 

20

Dome Light: Dome light (or courtesy light) to 
be centered not more than approximately 4” to 
8” from top of windshield to light driver’s area 
and controlled by rotating headlight switch to 
maximum position or by separate switch. This 
may require adding an additional light, and 
dealer installation is acceptable if not available 
from factory.

No bid $197.00 $197.00 $80.00 

21

Spotlight: Mounted on driver’s side (left door 
post). Spotlight shall be fused in accordance 
with manufacturer’s specifications. Unity #250 
(or equal) 5-inch diameter spotlight with 
halogen lamp is preferred. Unity #255 (or 
equal) 6-inch diameter spotlight with halogen 
lamp is an acceptable substitute. 

No bid $397.00 $397.00 $330.00 

22 Factory or dealer disconnect of Daylight 
Running Lights (law enforcement only)              No bid $147.00 $197.00 NC

Two wheel drive pursuit vehicle (addition) NA ($1,397.00) NA NA
State seating 5

16

19

Police Package Additions

23
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24 Stability traction control system (if not available
as standard equipment) STD STD STD STD

0% 0%, 15 0%, 15
90-120 45/120 45/120 30

1.H. NA                     
4.B. 750 amp            
4.C. 160 amp            
2009 Dodge 
Durango SLT: X - 
Standard, XX - 
Extra Cost Paint

1.H. Rear Seat - NA 
on Large Special 
Service Vehicle 
(5W4) 4WD 
requested.  Requires 
Commercial Pkg 
vehicle for seven 
passenger seating @ 
an increased price of 
$3895.00                    
4.B.  Max RPO 
Battery 600 CCA        
4.C. 160 amp

2.H. Vehicle is AWD     
4.B. 770 CCA                
4.C. 170 amp

4.B. 78 amp             
4.C. 150 amp

No Bids
Anderson Ford

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

Comments
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