
Buyer: Connie Heinrichs 2637 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date: 10/06/08

PRIMARY AWARD SECONDARY AWARD

Life Cycle Cost Calculation $37,636.00 $37,890.36 $38,220.33 
Base Price $24,196.00 $23,593.00 $21,987.00 $23,597.00 $23,287.00 
Make: Ford Chevy Dodge GMC Chevrolet
Model: Super Crew Silverado Ram Quad Cab Sierra Silverado
GVWR: 6950 7000 6700 7000 7000
Series, Code, Trim Level: XLT 1500, CK10543, LT SLT' 'DS6H41' 1500 CT 10543 SLS 1500-CK 10543-LS
Engine 4.6 V-8 4.8 4.7L V-8 4.8L Vortec V8 4.8L Vortec V8
EPA 15-20 Hiway 15/18 14-19 15 City/18 Hwy 15 City/18 Hwy
Delivery Days ARO 90-120 60-90 90-120 45/120
E85 model price $25,996.00 $24,386.00 $21,987.00 $25,297.00 $24,984.00 
Engine 5.4 V-8 5.3 4.7L V-8 FFV 5.3L Vortec V8 5.3L Vortec V8
Engine (other gas).  $1,800.00 $2,624.00 $1,153.00 $1,697.00 $1,697.00 
Specify Engine Size: 5.4 3V V-8 6.0 V-8 5.7L V-8 Hemi 5.3L Vortec V8 5.3L Vortec V8
Comments LC9 Requires pkg 

LLT LC9 Requires pkg LLT

 Engine (other diesel), including block 
heater, factory or dealer installed.   NA NA $79.00 NA NA

Specify Engine Size: block heater

5 40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench seat W/ 
lumbar support (vinyl) (deduct) NA NA NA NA NA

6 Bucket type seats - Vinyl covering NA NA NA NA NA
Bucket type seats - Cloth w/vinyl trim $550.00 $895.00 $902.00 $2,197.00 $2,197.00 
Comments requires upgrade pkg 

ILT
requires upgrade pkg 

ILT
8 Rear seat (deduct) NA NA NA NA NA

Electronic compass/temp display NA $280.00 NA $297.00 $297.00 
Comments Incl. camper mirrors
Heavy duty highest output alternator 
from standard equipment. NA STD STD STD STD

Bidder state amps: 145 amps 160 amp

11 Deduct for no sliding rear-vision window 
(deduct) ($90.00) ($169.00) STD ($109.00) ($109.00)

12 Second Power Outlet $250.00 STD STD STD STD
Increased pickup box length of 
approximately 8 feet with corresponding 
wheelbase.  

NA NA NA NA NA

Bidder state wheelbase: 
14 Trailer towing package (deduct) ($250.00) ($212.00) STD ($147.00) ($147.00)
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 # Sid Dillon GMC Sid Dillon Wahoo, Inc.
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1/2 Ton Crew Cab 4-Door 4x4 Pickup Anderson Ford Husker Auto Group
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15 Cargo light STD STD STD $97.00 $97.00 

16 Standard Paint - Attach List and Identify 
as No Additional Cost Paints NC NC See attached sheet NC - See attached NC - See attached

17

For Department of Roads Use: Yellow 
color of: Dodge #PY5269, Ford #84S53, 
Chevrolet/GMC #WA-253A code (9W3) NC NA See attached sheet NC - 9W3 NC - 9W3

18 Extra Cost Paint- Attach List and 
Identify as Extra Cost Paints NC NA See attached sheet $597.00            

See attached $597.00 - See attached

19 Additional remote fob from 
manufacturer NC $95.00 Inc. in bid $97.00 $97.00 

Non-standard gear ratio(s).  $90.00 NA Inc. in bid NA NA
Indicate: 3.92 w/ anti-spin
Deduction for two wheel drive model (to 
include all season tires) (deduct) ($1,900.00) ($3,296.00) ($1,729.00) ($997.00) ($997.00)

Comments No Skip Plates
Add: On/Off road mud and snow all 
terrain tires and spare (can be steel 
rim), 8-10 ply, size  LT255/70R17 or 
LT245/75R17 or LT265/75R17, such as 
Goodyear Wrangler AT/S steel-belted 
tires. 

$850.00 $180.00 $220.00 $297.00 $297.00 

Comments All Terrain 6 ply LT275/70R17OWLAT Load Range C Load Range C

23 Equipment & engine service repair 
manual. $400.00 $145.00 $493.75 $297.00 $297.00 

24 Equipment & engine service repair 
manual on CD ROM $750.00 $500.00 $112.50 $797.00   DVD when 

available
$797.00   DVD when 

available
25 Equipment & engine parts manual $400.00 $175.00 NA NA @ this time NA @ this time

26 Equipment & engine parts on CD ROM NA $375.00 NA @ this time NA @ this time

27

Additional costs of charges for vehicle 
drop shipment outside the Lincoln area. 
Drop shipment charges would be for 
vehicles bought by political entities and 
other Divisions of Government.

$490.00 $400.00 $400.00 $400.00 $400.00 

28 Reverse Sensing Alarm System factory 
or dealer installed

$350.00 $180.00 No Bid $997.00           
Requires PCW

$997.00              
Requires PCW

29 Factory disconnect of daylight running 
lights $25.00 NA No Bid $147.00 $147.00 

30 Factory disconnect of factory dome light 
or courtesy lamps $150.00 NA No Bid $97.00             

Total Inop
$97.00               

Total Inop
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LAW ENFORCEMENT ONLY
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31

Courtesy/courtesy lamp:  To be 
centered not more than approximately 
4” to 8” From the top of the windshield 
to light the driver’s area and controlled 
by rotating headlamp switch to 
maximum position or by a  separate 
switch. This may require adding an 
additional light. Dealer installation is 
acceptable if not available from the 
factory.

$250.00 NA

No Bid

$197.00 $197.00 

32

Spotlight: Mounted on driver’s side (left 
door post). Spotlight shall be fused in 
accordance with manufacturers 
specifications. Unity # 250 (or equal) 5-
inch diameter spotlight with halogen 
lamp is preferred. Unity #225 (or equal) 
6-inch diameter spotlight with halogen 
lamp is an acceptable substitute. All 
spotlights for one make and model of 
vehicle must be the same size. Dealer 
installation is acceptable if not available 
from the factory.

$550.00 NA

No Bid

$397.00 $397.00 

Payment Terms 100%, 30 Net 30 0% 0%, 15 0%, 15
Delivery Days ARO 90-120 60-90 90-120 45-120 45-120

Comments

Warranty 3/36 
bumper to bumper, 
5/60 powertrain, 
5/100K on corrosion

1.A.-No special paint 
available                      
P.-Supplier: Mfg          
4.B.-660 CCA              

1.F-body side molding 
NA             1.G.-See 
attached sheet (cloth 
40/20/40 w/o lumbar 
std.)                                 
1.P.-Supplier: Chrysler 
Corp.  Includes front 
suspension & transfer 
case skid plates and tow 
hooks (Inc. in Bid)           
1.BB.-Floor Mats-Carpet-
STD (Aftermarket 
Rubber $80.00)               

1.P.-Factory comes 
STD with Federal 
DOT approved & 
required Factory 
installed shield            
4.B.-Max Pro Battery 
is 600 CCA

1.P.-Factory comes STD 
with Federal DOT 
approved & required 
Factory installed shield    
4.B.-Max Pro Battery is 
600 CCA
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