
Buyer: Connie Heinrichs 2630 OF
Diesel Trucks

Opening Date: 10/02/08

PRIMARY AWARD SECONDARY AWARD

Li
ne

 #

3/4 Ton Regular Cab 4X4 Diesel (Base Truck) Performance Dodge Sid Dillon GMC Sid Dillon Wahoo, Inc.

Base Price $24,527.00 $26,597.00 $26,288.00 
Gas Engine
Make: Dodge GMC Chevrolet
Model: RAM RC Sierra Silverado
GVWR: 9000 w/Diesel 9200 9200
Series, Code, Trim Level: ST, DH7L62, 2500 2500-TK20903-WT 2500-CK20903-WT

Engine           6.7: Cummins Turbo Diesel 6.6L Duramax V8 6.6L Duramax V8

EPA N/A N/A
Comments

2 E85 model price N/A N/A N/A

Engine (other gas).  ($6,719.00) ($6,727.00)
LY6 with MYD Transmission

($6,427.00)
LY6 with MYD Transmission

Specify Engine Size: 5.7L V-8 Hemi 6.0L Vortec V8 6.0L Vortec V8
Engine (other gas).  N/A N/A N/A
Specify Engine Size:

Engine (other diesel), including block heater, factory or dealer installed. $79.00 N/A N/A

Model: w/gasoline engine
Warranty:
Specify Engine Size:

6 Bench seat heavy duty w/cloth covering Included with line 8 N/A N/A
7 40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench seat W/ lumbar support w/vinyl Included with line 8 NC NC
8 40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench seat W/ lumbar support w/cloth covering $405.00 NC NC

9 Electric Power Windows $458.00
includes power mirrors

$997.00
requires power locks & mirrors

$997.00
requires power locks & mirrors

10 Power door Locks Included with line 9 $497.00
requires keyless entry

$497.00
requires keyless entry

11 Automatic Speed (cruise) control, factory installed $220.00 $257.00 $257.00 

12
Snow plow attachment of pickup manufacturer’s  (Western, Boss, Meyer, 
and Northman brands with power angling, 8-foot bolt on blade, plow head 
and turn lights, snow deflector, blade markers.)

No Bid $4,997.00 $4,997.00 

13 Sliding rear-vision window $123.00 $397.00 $397.00 

Chassis with eight foot Utility Body for single wheel. See attachment. No Bid $6,397.00
Colors: white & yellow only

$6,397.00
Colors: white & yellow only

State make and model: Omaha STD OSB96V or 
Knapheide 696J w/56" CA

Omaha STD OSB96V or 
Knapheide 696J w/56" CA

15 Color of Utility Body to match manufacturer color charts No Bid $597.00
STD colors

$597.00
STD colors

16 Deduction for no lid on Utility Body No Bid ($497.00) ($497.00)
17 Glow plug package (diesel engine) N/A N/A N/A
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18 Second Power Outlet STD STD STD
Deduction for pickup box length of approximately 6 ½ feet with 
corresponding wheelbase. N/A N/A N/A

Bidder state wheelbase: 
20 Cargo light STD $97.00 $97.00 

21 Standard Paint - Attach List and Identify as No Additional Cost Paints See attached list NC NC

22 For Department of Roads Use: Yellow color of: Dodge #PY5269, Ford 
#84S53, Chevrolet/GMC #WA-253A code (9W3) See attached list NC-9W3 NC-9W3

23 Extra Cost Paint- Attach List and Identify as Extra Cost Paints $397.00 $397.00 
24 Deduction for two wheel drive model (to include all season tires) ($2,223.00) ($1,297.00) ($1,297.00)

25 Power remote controlled mirrors See lines 9 & 10 $997.00
requires power locks & mirrors

$997.00
requires power locks & mirrors

26 Two 12V batteries which delivers a total of at least 1000 CCA  (Diesel) (2) 750 Amp /Diesel STD STD

27 Keyless Remote entry system $625.00 $497.00 $497.00 
28 Electronic compass/temperature display system N/A $297.00 $297.00 
29 Equipment & engine service repair manual. $493.75 $297.00 $297.00 

30 Equipment & engine service repair manual on CD ROM $112.50 
$797.00

DVD when available
$797.00

DVD when available

31 Equipment & engine parts manual N/A N/A N/A
32 Equipment & engine parts on CD ROM $375.00 N/A N/A

33
Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop shipment outside the Lincoln 
area. Drop shipment charges would be for vehicles bought by political 
entities and other Divisions of Government.

$400.00 $400.00 $400.00 

34 Factory or dealer disconnect of Daylight Running Lights if factory 
equipped (Law enforcement only). No Bid $147.00 $147.00 

35 Disconnect of the factory dome light or courtesy lamps. No Bid $97.00 $97.00 

36

Dome light or courtesy lamps:  To be centered not more than 
approximately 4" to 8" from the top of the windshield to light the driver's 
area.  Controlled by rotating headlamp switch to maximum position or by 
separate switch.  This may require adding an additional light.  Dealer 
installation is acceptable if not from the factory. 

No Bid $197.00 $197.00 
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37

Spotlight:  Mounted on driver's side (left door post).  Spotlight shall be 
fused in accordance with manufacturers specifications.  Unity #250 (or 
equal) 5-inch diameter spotlight with halogen lamps is an acceptable 
substitute.  All spotlights for one make and model of vehicle must be the 
same size.  Dealer installation is acceptable if not available from the 
factory. 

No Bid $397.00 $397.00 

38 Heavy duty alternator minimum 200 amp, indicate Amps: No Bid $97.00
160 Amp max

$97.00
160 Amp max

39 Reverse sensing alarm system.  Dealer installation is acceptable if not 
available from the manufacturer. No Bid N/A N/A

40 Cloth bucket seats. No Bid N/A N/A
41 No rear seat. N/A N/A

0/15 0/15
90-120 45-120 45-120

1.F: Body side molding-option $66.00
1.G: 40/20/40 H.D. vinyl std.

1.K: See option sheet items 9 & 10.
1.O: Skid plate-Fuel tank-N/A

4.B: 750 amp battery (2) std. w/diesel
750 amp battery-gas engine-option 

$53.00
Popular equipment package includes: 

40/20/40 cloth split bench seat
BF Goodrich brand tires

LT 245/70R17E on/off road tires
speed control

stain repel seat fabric
Cost $405.00

If sturdy mount is needed for 
Block Heater on Diesel add 

$157.00.
1.G: Seats 40/20/40

1.K: Mirrors will be manual 
adjust.  Outside electric mirrors 
require SEO (5B5) with power 
windows. Locks & mirrors @ 

cost of $997.00 extra.
1.O: Fuel Tank-comes std with 

Federal/DOT approved & 
required factory installed shield.

4.B: 2@ 730 CCA each

If sturdy mount is needed for 
Block Heater on Diesel add 

$157.00.
1.G: Seats 40/20/40

1.K: Mirrors will be manual 
adjust.  Outside electric mirrors 
require SEO (5B5) with power 
windows. Locks & mirrors @ 

cost of $997.00 extra.
1.O: Fuel Tank-comes std with 

Federal/DOT approved & 
required factory installed shield.

4.B: 2@ 730 CCA each

Bid Withdrawn
Anderson Ford

Payment Terms
Delivery Time ARO

Comments
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