
Buyer:  Todd Dlouhy 2594 OF
Office of the CIO

Opening Date:  09/04/08

Description Qty UOM Unit Price  Ext Price Unit Price  Ext Price Unit Price  Ext Price Unit Price  Ext Price 
1 Yamaha Digital Audio Processor 7 EA  No Bid  $            -    $ 2,425.00  $ 16,975.00  $ 4,918.00  $ 34,426.00  $ 5,156.00  $ 36,092.00 
2 Yamaha Mini YGDAI AES Exp Mod 7 EA  $    439.00  $ 3,073.00  $    424.92  $   2,974.44  $    445.00  $   3,115.00  $    473.00  $   3,311.00 

3 Yamaha 8-channel 24-bit head amp & AD 
converter 14 EA  No Bid  $            -    $ 1,606.24  $ 22,487.36  $ 1,693.00  $ 23,702.00  $ 1,769.00  $ 24,766.00 

4 Yamaha Mini YGDAI AES Digital Output 12 EA  $    324.00  $ 3,888.00  $    313.22  $   3,758.64  $    355.00  $   4,260.00  $    349.00  $   4,188.00 

5 Yamaha cable from MY16-AD to AD8HR 14 EA  No Bid  $            -    $      93.25  $   1,305.50  $      98.00  $   1,372.00  $      96.00  $   1,344.00 

6 Yamaha Break-out cable 12 EA  No Bid  $            -    $      43.75  $      525.00  $      45.00  $      540.00  $      56.00  $      672.00 
7 Yamaha Digital Mixer 1 EA  $ 1,710.00  $ 1,710.00  $ 1,643.78  $   1,643.78  $ 1,723.00  $   1,723.00  $ 1,846.00  $   1,846.00 
8 Yamaha Digital I/O Module 1 EA  $    475.00  $    475.00  $    459.24  $      459.24  $    523.00  $      523.00  $    516.00  $      516.00 

 $ 9,146.00  $ 50,128.96  $ 69,661.00  $ 72,735.00 
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Buyer:  Todd Dlouhy 2594 OF
Office of the CIO

Opening Date:  09/04/08

Description Qty UOM
1 Yamaha Digital Audio Processor 7 EA
2 Yamaha Mini YGDAI AES Exp Mod 7 EA

3 Yamaha 8-channel 24-bit head amp & AD 
converter 14 EA

4 Yamaha Mini YGDAI AES Digital Output 12 EA

5 Yamaha cable from MY16-AD to AD8HR 14 EA

6 Yamaha Break-out cable 12 EA
7 Yamaha Digital Mixer 1 EA
8 Yamaha Digital I/O Module 1 EA

Comments

Li
ne

 # Yamaha Audio Equipment

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
Totals

Vendor can fulfill deliver ARO

Unit Price  Ext Price Unit Price  Ext Price Unit Price  Ext Price Unit Price  Ext Price 
 $ 5,113.00  $ 35,791.00  $ 5,187.00  $ 36,309.00  $ 4,865.00  $ 34,055.00  $ 4,815.00 $ 33,705.00 
 $    463.00  $   3,241.00  $    495.00  $   3,465.00  $ 1,679.00  $ 11,753.00  $    435.91 $   3,051.37 

 $ 1,750.00  $ 24,500.00  $ 1,808.00  $ 25,312.00  $    447.00  $   6,258.00  $ 1,647.80 $ 23,069.20 

 $    341.00  $   4,092.00  $    351.00  $   4,212.00  $    330.00  $   3,960.00  $    358.77 $   4,305.24 

 $    463.00  $   6,482.00  $    116.00  $   1,624.00  $      98.00  $   1,372.00  $      95.65 $   1,339.10 

 $      48.00  $      576.00  $      53.00  $      636.00  $      46.00  $      552.00  $      44.41 $      532.92 
 $ 1,791.00  $   1,791.00  $ 1,895.00  $   1,895.00  $ 1,728.00  $   1,728.00  $ 1,686.32 $   1,686.32 
 $    501.00  $      501.00  $    421.00  $      421.00  $    483.00  $      483.00  $    471.12 $      471.12 

 $ 76,974.00  $ 73,874.00  $ 60,161.00 $ 68,160.27 

14

line 6:  PN DA96-CABLE

Ford Audio Video 
Systems

Imaging Products 
International

0%, 30

7-10

Leo's Professional Audio, 
Inc.

Professional Video 
Supply, Inc.

30 NA

13 45

On 9/2/08, Yamaha 
Commercial Audio 

Systems responded to our 
availability request, 
thusly: - "All items 

currently in stock, except 
the model AD8HR (Item 
3) which are expected to  
be available to ship on 

9/17/08.-

7-10 13 45
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Buyer:  Todd Dlouhy 2594 OF
Office of the CIO

Opening Date:  09/04/08

Description Qty UOM
1 Yamaha Digital Audio Processor 7 EA
2 Yamaha Mini YGDAI AES Exp Mod 7 EA

3 Yamaha 8-channel 24-bit head amp & AD 
converter 14 EA

4 Yamaha Mini YGDAI AES Digital Output 12 EA

5 Yamaha cable from MY16-AD to AD8HR 14 EA

6 Yamaha Break-out cable 12 EA
7 Yamaha Digital Mixer 1 EA
8 Yamaha Digital I/O Module 1 EA

Comments

Li
ne

 # Yamaha Audio Equipment

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
Totals

Vendor can fulfill deliver ARO

Unit Price  Ext Price Unit Price  Ext Price Unit Price  Ext Price 
 $ 4,598.00  $ 32,186.00  $ 6,720.98  $ 47,046.86  $ 4,810.00 $ 33,670.00 
 $    694.00  $   4,858.00  $    701.33  $   4,909.31  $    437.00 $   3,059.00 

 $ 1,568.00  $ 21,952.00  $ 2,273.80  $ 31,833.20  $ 1,612.00 $ 22,568.00 

 $    308.00  $   3,696.00  $    442.71  $   5,312.52  $    326.00 $   3,912.00 

 $      96.00  $   1,344.00  $    154.49  $   2,162.86  $    116.00 $   1,624.00 

 $      48.00  $      576.00  $      85.87  $   1,030.44  $      49.00 $      588.00 
 $ 1,635.00  $   1,635.00  $ 2,594.91  $   2,594.91  $ 1,690.00 $   1,690.00 
 $    458.00  $      458.00  $    649.78  $      649.78  $    486.00 $      486.00 

 $ 66,705.00  $ 95,539.88 $ 67,597.00 

S.C.M.S. Southeast

Net 30

Troxell Communications Washington Professional 
Systems

0%, 0 Net 30

NOTE:  Delivery within 10 
days ARO is subject to 

manufacturer availability.
10

NOTE:  Delivery within 10 
days ARO is subject to 

manufacturer availability.  
Please see attached 

manufacturer warranty 
statement.  All products to 
be ordered and shipped 1 

time to 1 location.

Freight Included - FOB 
Dest

Broadcast Supply Worldwide withdrew bid on Line #1
Leo's Professional Audio, Inc withdrew bid on line #3.

Award Explanation:

PARTIAL AWARD
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