
Buyer:  Tom Morgan 2489 OF
Multiple Locations

Opening Date: 06/02/08

Qty UO
M

Unit 
Price Ext. Price Unit 

Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit 
Price Ext. Price

1 Region-1-Southeastern-
Off-Peak 28666 TN  No Bid  $                  -    $ 54.50  $ 1,562,297.00  $120.00  $ 3,439,920.00  $  42.26  $ 1,211,425.16  $ 50.00  $ 1,433,300.00 

2 Region-1-Southeastern-
Peak 14334 TN  No Bid  $                  -    $ 56.50  $    809,871.00  $150.00  $ 2,150,100.00  $  51.51  $    738,344.34  $ 60.00  $    860,040.00 

Weighted average

3 Region 2-East-Central-
Off-Peak 28000 TN  $ 42.28  $ 1,183,840.00  $ 58.40  $ 1,635,200.00  $140.00  $ 3,920,000.00  $  91.50  $ 2,562,000.00  $ 53.33  $ 1,493,240.00 

4 Region 2-East-Central-
Peak 14000 TN  $ 42.28  $    591,920.00  $ 60.40  $    845,600.00  $190.00  $ 2,660,000.00  $112.50  $ 1,575,000.00  $ 64.44  $    902,160.00 

Weighted average

5 Region 3-West-Central-
Off-Peak 18000 TN  No Bid  $                  -    $ 58.40  $ 1,051,200.00  $150.00  $ 2,700,000.00  $  47.53  $    855,540.00  $ 58.88  $ 1,059,840.00 

6 Region 3-West-Central-
Peak 9000 TN  No Bid  $                  -    $ 60.40  $    543,600.00  $190.00  $ 1,710,000.00  $  58.41  $    525,690.00  $ 71.88  $    646,920.00 

Weighted average

7 Region 4- Panhandle-
Off Peak 8000 TN  $ 89.39  $    715,120.00  $ 63.25  $    506,000.00  $205.00  $ 1,640,000.00  $  55.81  $    446,480.00  $ 65.77  $    526,160.00 

8 Region 4- Panhandle-
Peak 4000 TN  $ 89.39  $    357,560.00  $ 65.25  $    261,000.00  $240.00  $    960,000.00  $  62.77  $    251,080.00  $ 81.70  $    326,800.00 

Weighted average

 $                            42.28 

 $                            89.39 

 $                           163.33 

 $                           216.67 

No Bid
Central Salt

Independent Salt 
Company

Paul Bartels Trucking Co.

100%,10 days
10 

 $                            53.33 

 $                            57.03 

 $                            63.21 

 $                            71.08 

Nebraska Salt & Grain Co.

Net 30

 $                             45.34 

 $                             98.50 

 $                             58.13 

 $                             51.16 

DeBruce Grain Inc.

10%,0days

Description

Blackstrap, Inc. Comade, Inc.Salt

 $                           130.00 

 $                           156.67 

As requested
0.5%, 10 days

 $                            59.07 

 $                            55.17 

 $                            59.07 

 $                            63.92 

AWARD AWARD

North American Salt 

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

Comments  No Bid for Solar Salt. 

21 
 2%, 10days 
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