Buyer: Tom Morgan

2449 OF
Multiple Locations

AWARD AWARD
Concrete PR-1 Beatrice Concrete Company Binder Bros. Inc.
Description Qty UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1 |D-1 PR1 Concrete, W Barneston Hwy 8, MP 82 thru 86 50 CY | $ 101.50( $ 5,075.00( $ 99.00( $ 4,950.00
2 [D-1 PR1 Concrete, Fairbury Hwy 15, MP4 5 CY [$ 104.70| $ 523.50 $ -
3 [D-1 PR1 Concrete, E. of Crete Hwy 33, MP 10 thru 25 30 CY | $ 98.70| $ 2,961.00 $ -
4 |D-1 PR1 Concrete, SO. Beatrice Hwy 77, MP 0 thru 20 150 CY | $ 101.50| $ 15,225.00 $ -
5 |D-1 PR1 Concrete, NO. Beatrice Hwy77, MP 25 thru 36 100 [ CY | $ 101.50( $ 10,150.00 $ -
6 [D-1 PR1 Concrete, SO. Lincoln Hwy 77, MP 36 thru 63 30 CY | $ 100.70| $ 3,021.00 $ -
7 |D-1 PR1 Concrete, W. of Peru Hwy 67, MP 25 thru 33 50 CY No Bid $ -1 $ 98.00( $ 4,900.00
8 ;)4%) PR1 Concrete, E. of Auburn Hwy 136, MP 229 thru 75 cy No Bid $ i $ i
9 ?E))ll PR1 Concrete, NO. Tecumseh Hwy 136, MP 33 thru 75 ey | s 96.00| $ 7.20000] $ 98.00| $ 7.350.00
10 I:)),I-: PRI TONcrete, m recumsen Awy 130, ViF ZUg Tnru 30 cY 95.20 $ 2,856.00 $ 98.00 $ 2’940.00
11|D-1 PR1 Concrete, SO. Humbolt Hwy 105, MP7 thru 8 15 CY No Bid $ -1$ 9439 $ 1,415.85
12 ?9% PR1 Concrete, W. Table Rock Hwy 4, MP 196 thru 10 cy No Bid $ s 9650 | $ 965.00
13 ?;;;Rl Concrete, NO. Falls City, Hwy 73, MP 11 thru 22, 50 cy No Bid $ i $ i
14 i)(—)é/l;’Rl Concrete, Dubois Area Hwy 8, MP 129 to 135, Jct 75 cy No Bid $ s 9439 | $ 7.079.25
Payment Terms 100%,45days 100%, 30days
Delivery Days ARO 1 1
3. Hot water may be
required to achieve 50° or
more - Hot water not in
price quote.
Comments 6. Holes in blades are by
manufacturer and are larger
and lower on blade.
7. Delivered in transit
mixers only.
No Bid
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Hill Materials Company
Marksen Sand & Gravel

Opening Date: 04/25/08




