
Buyer:  Rita Kucera 2442 OF
HHSS

Opening Date: 04/18/08

Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 Initial License Lots of 5,000 each 25 M $326.00  $         8,150.00 $481.70  $                   12,042.50 $495.50  $        12,387.50 
2 Initial License Lots of 10,000 each 25 M $216.00  $         5,400.00 $462.90  $                   11,572.50 $495.50  $        12,387.50 
3 Initial License Lots of 25,000 25 M $146.60  $         3,665.00 $390.80  $                     9,770.00 $495.50  $        12,387.50 
4 Renewal License Card Lots of 5,000 75 M $406.00  $       30,450.00 $411.70  $                   30,877.50 $465.53  $        34,914.75 
5 Renewal License Card Lots of 10,000 75 M $290.00  $       21,750.00 $363.83  $                   27,287.25 $308.64  $        23,148.00 
6 Renewal License Card Lots of 25,000 75 M $213.00  $       15,975.00 $309.22  $                   23,191.50 $250.96  $        18,822.00 
7 Wall License Lots of 5,000 10 M $270.00  $         2,700.00 $477.11  $                     4,771.10 $495.50  $          4,955.00 
8 Wall License Lots of 10,000 10 M $185.00  $         1,850.00 $477.11  $                     4,771.10 $495.50  $          4,955.00 
9 Recycled- Initial License Lots of 5,000 25 M N/B N/B No Bid Recycle No Bid Recycle N/A N/A

10 Recycled- Initial License Lots of 10,000 25 M N/B N/B No Bid Recycle No Bid Recycle N/A N/A

11 Recycled- Initial License Lots of 25,000 25 M N/B N/B No Bid Recycle No Bid Recycle N/A N/A

12 Recycled- Renewal License Card Lots of 
5,000 75 M N/B N/B No Bid Recycle No Bid Recycle N/A N/A

13 Recycled Renewal License Card Lots of 
10,000 75 M N/B N/B No Bid Recycle No Bid Recycle N/A N/A

14 Recycled Renewal License Card Lots of 
25,000 75 M N/B N/B No Bid Recycle No Bid Recycle N/A N/A

15 Recycled - Wall License Lots of 5,000 10 M N/B N/B No Bid Recycle No Bid Recycle N/A N/A

16 Recycled - Wall License Lots of 10,000 10 M N/B N/B No Bid Recycle No Bid Recycle N/A N/A

 Colonial Press 
 No Bid 

 Secure Mark Decal 

Payment Terms
Delivery Days Society

Comments

Samples will be similar to bid items, but may not 
be an exact sample of Bid product.
There are a couple of chokes for paper that 
need further discussion/consultation to your 
needs.
We recommend updating the void panto.
If artwork is not available, we recommend 
updating and enhancing the security of the 
panto

On Request
0%,0days

 Test cost of actual products would 
be charged to the State- other on 
hand samples woul not. 

Description: Forms

FAC Performance Group Inc.License RR Donnelley

 Souix Printing Inc. 
Standard Register

0%,30days
Per Bid

 Cohesive is compatible for use in fuser 
oil-based printers. Cohesive is applied 
in one press pass.
Art work is direct to plate, no negitives. 
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