
Buyer Tom Morgan 2404 OF
Dept of Roads

Opening Date: 04/07/08

PARTIAL AWARTIAL AWAARTIAL AWARRTIAL AWARTIAL AWA

Darkwater 
Asphalt

Flint Hills 
Resources

, LP
Hills Material 

Company

Jebco 
Incorporat

ed
Monarch 

Oil

Description 1 Qty Uom Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Unit 
Cost

1 D-1 CSS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 1154 TN No Bid No Bid $205.93 $214.91
2 D-1 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 3948 TN $368.52 No Bid $436.96 No Bid
3 D-1 HFE-300 ROAD OIL 249 TN $409.20 No Bid $423.48 No Bid
4 D-2 CSS-H 50/50 ROAD OIL 17 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid $210.95
5 D-3 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 3931 TN $380.76 No Bid $411.11 No Bid
6 D-3 CSS-1H 50/50 ROAD 715 TN No Bid No Bid $188.33 $218.66
7 D-4 MC-250 ROAD OIL 121 TN No Bid No Bid $637.76 No Bid
8 D-4 HFE-300 ROAD OIL 890 TN $428.50 No Bid $421.70 No Bid
9 D-4 HFE-1000 ROAD OIL 1347 TN No Bid No Bid $473.12 No Bid

10 D-4 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 6059 TN $378.97 No Bid $444.09 No Bid
11 D-5 MC-250 ROAD OIL 97 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 D-5 HFE-500 ROAD OIL 375 TN No Bid $488.00 No Bid No Bid
13 D-5 HFE-1000 ROAD OIL 49 TN No Bid $489.00 No Bid No Bid
14 .D-5 CSS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 230 TN $215.64 No Bid $243.00 No Bid $344.01
15 D-5 CRS-2L ROAD OIL 2836 TN $434.34 $431.61 $529.00 No Bid No Bid
16 D-6 MC-250 ROAD OIL 117 TN No Bid No Bid $657.19 No Bid
17 D-6 CSS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 983 TN No Bid No Bid $233.32 $301.87
18 D-6 HFE-300 ROAD OIL 2987 TN $452.50 No Bid $442.04 No Bid
19 D-6 HFE-1000 ROAD OIL 122 TN No Bid No Bid $494.67 No Bid
20 D-6 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 2608 TN $396.25 No Bid $461.31 No Bid
21 D-7 CMS-1 ROAD OIL 1184 TN $467.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
22 D-7 CSS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 434 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid $318.47
23 D-7 HFE-150 ROAD OIL 100 TN $372.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 D-7 HFE-300 ROAD OIL 624 TN $469.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 D-7 HFE-1000 ROAD OIL 142 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 D-7 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 3171 TN $413.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 D-7 CRS-2L ROAD OIL 2589 TN $411.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 D-8 MC-250 ROAD OIL 121 TN No Bid No Bid $613.06 No Bid
29 D-8 CSS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 179 TN No Bid No Bid $220.16 $312.00
30 D-8 HFE-150 ROAD OIL 75 TN $390.40 No Bid $378.53 No Bid
31 D-8 HFE-300 ROAD OIL 873 TN $444.00 No Bid $420.03 No Bid
32 D-8 HFE-1000 ROAD OIL 416 TN No Bid No Bid $475.05 No Bid
33 D-8 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 3640 TN $399.45 No Bid $425.42 No Bid
34 CMS-1 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 EA $411.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
35 CRS-2L FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 EA $378.00 $340.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36 CRS-2P FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 EA $378.00 $340.00 No Bid $410.00 No Bid
37 CSS/SS-1H 50/50 FOB PLANT LOCA 1 EA $172.24 No Bid No Bid $188.00 $600.00
38 HFE-1000 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 EA No Bid No Bid $475.00 No Bid
39 HFE-150 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 EA $317.00 No Bid $380.00 No Bid
40 HFE-300 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 EA $370.00 No Bid $425.00 No Bid
41 HFE-500 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 EA No Bid No Bid $475.00 No Bid
42 MC-250 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 EA No Bid No Bid $615.00 No Bid

43 DEMURRAGE CHARGE PER DELIVERY 1 EA $90.00 $0.00
Per contract 
Specification

$75.00 per 
hour after 
two free 
hours $70.00

30days 0%,30days Net 30
$2.00 $1.00 Per one Per Spec

Vanc

We are not bidding 
the MC Cutbacks We 

are not bidding 
Asphalt for mixing We 
are not bidding high
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Liquid Asphaltic Road Oil

Comments for Darkwater Asphalt only

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
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Buyer Tom Morgan 2404 OF
Dept of Roads

Opening Date: 04/07/08

PAR

Description 1 Qty Uom 
1 D-1 CSS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 1154 TN
2 D-1 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 3948 TN
3 D-1 HFE-300 ROAD OIL 249 TN
4 D-2 CSS-H 50/50 ROAD OIL 17 TN
5 D-3 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 3931 TN
6 D-3 CSS-1H 50/50 ROAD 715 TN
7 D-4 MC-250 ROAD OIL 121 TN
8 D-4 HFE-300 ROAD OIL 890 TN
9 D-4 HFE-1000 ROAD OIL 1347 TN

10 D-4 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 6059 TN
11 D-5 MC-250 ROAD OIL 97 TN
12 D-5 HFE-500 ROAD OIL 375 TN
13 D-5 HFE-1000 ROAD OIL 49 TN
14 .D-5 CSS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 230 TN
15 D-5 CRS-2L ROAD OIL 2836 TN
16 D-6 MC-250 ROAD OIL 117 TN
17 D-6 CSS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 983 TN
18 D-6 HFE-300 ROAD OIL 2987 TN
19 D-6 HFE-1000 ROAD OIL 122 TN
20 D-6 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 2608 TN
21 D-7 CMS-1 ROAD OIL 1184 TN
22 D-7 CSS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 434 TN
23 D-7 HFE-150 ROAD OIL 100 TN
24 D-7 HFE-300 ROAD OIL 624 TN
25 D-7 HFE-1000 ROAD OIL 142 TN
26 D-7 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 3171 TN
27 D-7 CRS-2L ROAD OIL 2589 TN
28 D-8 MC-250 ROAD OIL 121 TN
29 D-8 CSS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 179 TN
30 D-8 HFE-150 ROAD OIL 75 TN
31 D-8 HFE-300 ROAD OIL 873 TN
32 D-8 HFE-1000 ROAD OIL 416 TN
33 D-8 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 3640 TN
34 CMS-1 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 EA
35 CRS-2L FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 EA
36 CRS-2P FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 EA
37 CSS/SS-1H 50/50 FOB PLANT LOCA 1 EA
38 HFE-1000 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 EA
39 HFE-150 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 EA
40 HFE-300 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 EA
41 HFE-500 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 EA
42 MC-250 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 EA

43 DEMURRAGE CHARGE PER DELIVERY 1 EA

Li
ne

 #

Liquid Asphaltic Road Oil

Comments for Darkwater Asphalt only

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

RTIAL AWA

Sem 
Materials

Unit Cost
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$399.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$233.00
No Bid
No Bid

$243.00
No Bid
No Bid

$419.00
$440.00
$240.00

No Bid
$460.00

No Bid
$414.00

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$425.00
No Bid

$375.00
$185.00

No Bid
No Bid

$425.00
No Bid
No Bid

55/hr
Net 30
$1.00

No Bid
ce Brothers,
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