Buyer: Tom Morgan

2400 OF

Department of Roads
PARTIAL AWARD

Opening Date: 04/03/08

Chip Seal (Ledge Rock) Aggregate G3 Enterprises, Inc. Hills Materials Company Jeffres"i:ar;jid&lGravel Jeffreslriar;jid&zGravel
“ . .
@ . . Extended . Extended : Extended
c
= |pescription 1 oty |uom Unit Cost| Extended Cost|Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost
D-1 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Agar. . i i i
1|Greenwood Maint Yard 220[TN $ -| NoBid | '$ $ $
D-3 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr. i . i i i
2|Jct 14&20, 15 Mi No. Nelighon 20 |1750|TN $ No Bid $ $ $
D-3 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr. i . i i i
3|1 Mi. E. of Jct.12/13, 4 W. Pierce 1000(TN $ No Bid $ $ $
D-3 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr. . i i i
4|NewCastle Maint. Yard 535[TN $ -| NoBid | '$ $ $
D-3 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr. i . i i i
5 |E. Jct 20&9,3 So.of Martinburg 2310|TN 3 No Bid $ $ $
D-3 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr. i . i i i
6/1Mi No. Ponca on Spur 26F 435|TN 3 NoBid | $ $ $
D-5 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr. . S . S
) ) - . ,640. 26.00 78,000.00
7|15Mi So Gering Hwy 71, 2 W.on 88 |3000|TN $ $33.88 [ $ 101,640.00 | invalid bid| invalid bid $ $
D-5 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr. $ -| $26.05 | $ 130,250.00 $38.03 | $190,150.00| $36.78 | $183,900.00
8|15 Mi East Chadron, Hwy 20 RP75 |5000|TN
D-5 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr. i
9(18 So. Chadron, Hwy 385, RP149 | 2000|TN $ $26.59 [ $ 53,180.00( $35.36 | $ 70,720.00 $34.11 | $ 68,220.00
D-5 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr. i
10|crawford Maint. Yard 3500|TN $ $26.41 [ $ 92,435.00( $34.16 | $119,560.00 $32.91 | $115,185.00
D-6 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr. i
11[1 MI No. of Arthur on Hwy 61 500|TN $ $36.75 [ $ 18,375.00( $42.28 | $ 21,140.00 $41.03 | $ 20,515.00
D-6 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr.
12[10 Mi W of Mullen on Hwy 2 250l TN $45.00 | $ 11,250.00| $36.04 | $ 9,010.00| $42.50 [ $ 10,625.00( $41.25 | $ 10,312.50
D-6 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr.
13|1Mi West of Hyannis on Hwy 2 1500| TN $45.00 | $ 67,500.00( $32.52 | $ 48,780.00| $38.88 | $ 58,320.00| $37.63 | $ 56,445.00
D-6 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr. i
14|1 Mi West of Paxton on Hwy 30 1500|EA $ $42.38 [ $ 63,570.00( $43.27 | $ 64,905.00 $42.02 | $ 63,030.00
Payment Terms 100%, 30days 100%, 30days 100%, 30days
Delivery Days ARO 20 As Needed As Needed
We are offering an
alternate Gradation the
Wyoming DOT
Specification for Type C
Comments. Chips. We will need 60
days notice prior to
hauling for production of
this material.
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Buyer: Tom Morgan

2400 OF

Department of Roads

PARTIAL AWARD

PARTIAL AWARD

PARTIAL AWARD

Opening Date: 04/03/08

Chip Seal (Ledge Rock) Aggregate L.G. Everist, Inc. Spencer Quarries Inc. Wesstg\r/lzr IF:::Ck &
H* S
o : Extended : Extended : Extended
c
= |Description 1 Qty |Uom Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost unit Cost Cost
D-1 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr.
1|Greenwood Maint Yard 220[TN $ i $ g e || & Gy
D-3 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr. i
2|Jct 14&20, 15 Mi No. Nelighon 20 |1750(TN $31.23 | $ 54,65250|$26.72 | $46,760.00 $
D-3 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr.
3|1 Mi. E. of Jct.12/13, 4 W. Pierce 1000|TN $29.95 | $  29,950.00 e R $ i
D-3 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr.
4|NewCastle Maint. Yard 535/ TN $24.35 | $ 13,027.25| $24.45 | $13,080.75 $ -
D-3 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr.
5 |E. Jct 20&9,3 So.of Martinburg 2310|TN SRS | & SR j T $ i
D-3 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr.
6/1Mi No. Ponca on Spur 26F 435|TN $22.75 | $ 9,896.25| $26.07 | $11,340.45 $ -
D-5 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr. $ i $ i $ i
7|15Mi So Gering Hwy 71, 2 W.on 88 |3000|TN
D-5 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr. $ ) $ ) $ )
8|15 Mi East Chadron, Hwy 20 RP75 |5000|TN
D-5 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr. $ $ $
9(18 So. Chadron, Hwy 385, RP149  [2000(TN ] ] )
D-5 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr. $ $ $
10|Crawford Maint. Yard 3500(TN ] ) )
D-6 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr.
11[1 MI No. of Arthur on Hwy 61 500[{TN 3 - | $57.00 | $28,500.00 $ i
D-6 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr.
12|10 Mi W of Mullen on Hwy 2 250|TN 3 - | $5025 | $12,562.50 $ J
D-6 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr.
13|1Mi West of Hyannis on Hwy 2 1500{TN 3 - | $5413 | $81,195.00 $ i
D-6 ChipSeal (Ledge Rock) Aggr.
14|1 Mi West of Paxton on Hwy 30 1500(EA 3 - | $55.75 | $83,625.00 $ i No Bid
Payment Terms 100%, 30days 100%, 30days 100%, 30days Marxsen Sand & Gravel
Delivery Days ARO 90 90 As Ordered

Comments.

04/18/08: Vendor
withdrew bid on line
item #5
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