
Buyer: Tom Morgan 2393 OF 
Department Of Roads

Opening Date: 03/31/08

Qty Tr. 
UoM

Unit 
Price  Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 D-1   S Jct 105 &136 2300 TN $14.48 33,304.00$  $12.55 28,865.00$     
2 D-1   Pawnee City Yard 2300 TN $13.60 31,280.00$  $14.30 32,890.00$     
3 D-1   Jct 8 & 65 Pawnee City 3000 TN $13.50 40,500.00$  $14.80 44,400.00$     

Marxsen Sand & Gravel

100%, 30days
As Requested

No Bid

Li
ne

 #

Windrow Gravel

Description

Payment Terms 20
100%,30daysComment

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Westover Rock & Sand, 
Inc.

Beatrice Concrete 
Company Inc.



Buyer: Tom Morgan 2393 OF 
Department Of Roads

Opening Date: 03/31/08

Qty Tr. 
UoM

 Unit 
Price  Ext. Price  Unit 

Price  Ext. Price  Unit 
Price  Ext. Price  Unit 

Price  Ext. Price 

4 D-4   Hwy 11 mp 78 2 mi N of Ord 1400 TN -$              -$                -$              -$             
5 D-4   Hwy 11  5 mi SE of Ord 2600 TN -$               -$                 -$               -$              
6 D-4   Hwy 281 10 mi N of Greeley 2300 TN -$               -$                 -$               -$              
7 D-4   Hwy 66 1/2 mi E of Jct 14/66 2000 TN -$               9.39$      18,780.00$      -$               -$              
8 D-4   Hwy 58 2 mi N of Rockville 2100 TN -$               8.48$      17,808.00$      -$               -$              
9 D-4   Hwy 92 1 mi W of Loup city 2800 TN -$               -$                 -$               -$              

10 D-4   Hwy 281 2 mi N of Greeley 2300 TN -$               -$                 -$               -$              
11 D-4   Hwy 81 3 mi S of Hebron 700 TN -$               12.95$    9,065.00$        -$               -$              
12 D-4   Hwy 2 E edge of Cairo 500 TN -$               7.23$      3,615.00$        -$               7.65$    3,825.00$     
13 D-4   Ravenna Yard 700 TN 9.85$    6,895.00$      8.35$      5,845.00$        10.24$    7,168.00$       9.45$    6,615.00$     
14 D-4   Hwy 2 mp 328 Ravenna 700 TN 9.85$    6,895.00$      8.35$      5,845.00$        10.54$    7,378.00$       9.45$    6,615.00$     
15 D-4   Hwy 40 2.5 mi E of Miller 2100 TN 8.75$    18,375.00$    -$                 9.03$      18,963.00$     -$              
16 D-4   Hwy 281 2 mi E of Ary 500 TN -$               6.98$      3,490.00$        -$               -$              
17 D-4   Hwy 4 11 mi W of Davenport 1000 TN -$               11.49$    11,490.00$      -$               -$              
18 D-4   Hwy 281 2 mi N of Red Cloud 700 TN -$               9.49$      6,643.00$        -$               -$              
19 D-4   Hwy 14 1/2 mi S of Superior 1200 TN -$               16.95$    20,340.00$      -$               -$              
20 D-4   Hwy 78 3 mi N of Guide Rock 700 TN -$               14.23$    9,961.00$        -$               -$              

As NeededPayment Terms 10 10
100%,60days100%,30daysNet 30 Net 45Comment

Hooker Sand & GravelDeweese Sand & Gravel, 
Inc.

Ed Broadfoot & Sons 
Sand & Gravel

Broadfoot Sand & 
Gravel Inc.

Li
ne

 #

Windrow Gravel

Description

PARTIAL AWARD



Buyer: Tom Morgan 2393 OF 
Department Of Roads

Opening Date: 03/31/08

Qty Tr. 
UoM

4 D-4   Hwy 11 mp 78 2 mi N of Ord 1400 TN
5 D-4   Hwy 11  5 mi SE of Ord 2600 TN
6 D-4   Hwy 281 10 mi N of Greeley 2300 TN
7 D-4   Hwy 66 1/2 mi E of Jct 14/66 2000 TN
8 D-4   Hwy 58 2 mi N of Rockville 2100 TN
9 D-4   Hwy 92 1 mi W of Loup city 2800 TN

10 D-4   Hwy 281 2 mi N of Greeley 2300 TN
11 D-4   Hwy 81 3 mi S of Hebron 700 TN
12 D-4   Hwy 2 E edge of Cairo 500 TN
13 D-4   Ravenna Yard 700 TN
14 D-4   Hwy 2 mp 328 Ravenna 700 TN
15 D-4   Hwy 40 2.5 mi E of Miller 2100 TN
16 D-4   Hwy 281 2 mi E of Ary 500 TN
17 D-4   Hwy 4 11 mi W of Davenport 1000 TN
18 D-4   Hwy 281 2 mi N of Red Cloud 700 TN
19 D-4   Hwy 14 1/2 mi S of Superior 1200 TN
20 D-4   Hwy 78 3 mi N of Guide Rock 700 TN

Payment Terms
Comment

Li
ne

 #

Windrow Gravel

Description  Unit 
Price  Ext. Price  Unit 

Price  Ext. Price  Unit 
Price  Ext. Price  Unit 

Price  Ext. Price 

-$               -$               -$              -$             
-$                -$               -$               -$              
-$                -$               -$               -$              
-$                8.00$    16,000.00$     -$               -$              

11.35$  23,835.00$     -$               -$               -$              
-$                -$               -$               -$              
-$                -$               -$               -$              
-$                -$               -$               -$              
-$                -$               -$               -$              

9.40$    6,580.00$       -$               -$               -$              
9.40$    6,580.00$       -$               -$               -$              

-$                -$               10.08$    21,168.00$    6.75$   14,175.00$   
-$                -$               -$               -$              
-$                -$               -$               -$              

11.95$  8,365.00$       -$               -$               -$              
-$                -$               -$               -$              
-$                -$               -$               -$              

30 Upon Request 30
100%,30days100%,30days

T & F Sand & Gravel, 
Inc.Overland Sand & Gravel Overton Sand and Gravel 

Co.Mid-Nebraska Aggregate

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD



Buyer: Tom Morgan 2393 OF 
Department Of Roads

Opening Date: 03/31/08

Qty Tr. 
UoM

4 D-4   Hwy 11 mp 78 2 mi N of Ord 1400 TN
5 D-4   Hwy 11  5 mi SE of Ord 2600 TN
6 D-4   Hwy 281 10 mi N of Greeley 2300 TN
7 D-4   Hwy 66 1/2 mi E of Jct 14/66 2000 TN
8 D-4   Hwy 58 2 mi N of Rockville 2100 TN
9 D-4   Hwy 92 1 mi W of Loup city 2800 TN

10 D-4   Hwy 281 2 mi N of Greeley 2300 TN
11 D-4   Hwy 81 3 mi S of Hebron 700 TN
12 D-4   Hwy 2 E edge of Cairo 500 TN
13 D-4   Ravenna Yard 700 TN
14 D-4   Hwy 2 mp 328 Ravenna 700 TN
15 D-4   Hwy 40 2.5 mi E of Miller 2100 TN
16 D-4   Hwy 281 2 mi E of Ary 500 TN
17 D-4   Hwy 4 11 mi W of Davenport 1000 TN
18 D-4   Hwy 281 2 mi N of Red Cloud 700 TN
19 D-4   Hwy 14 1/2 mi S of Superior 1200 TN
20 D-4   Hwy 78 3 mi N of Guide Rock 700 TN

Payment Terms
Comment

Li
ne

 #

Windrow Gravel

Description  Unit 
Price  Ext. Price 

6.98$    9,772.00$      
8.15$     21,190.00$     
9.62$     22,126.00$     

-$                
10.37$   21,777.00$     

9.25$     25,900.00$     
11.00$   25,300.00$     

-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                

No Bid

Marxsen Sand & Gravel

As Needed

Ulrich Gravel Inc.

PARTIAL AWARD



Buyer: Tom Morgan 2393 OF 
Department Of Roads

Opening Date: 03/31/08

Qty Tr. 
UoM

Unit 
Price  Ext. Price Unit 

Price Ext. Price Unit 
Price Ext. Price

21 D-6   Lexington Yard 700 TN -$              -$              -$              
22 D-6   Gothenburg Yard 700 TN -$              -$              -$              
23 D-6   Hwy 25 1 mi S of Sutherland 1000 TN -$              -$              $7.50 7,500.00$     
24 D-6   Hwy 23 1 mi W of Dickens 2000 TN -$              -$              $11.84 23,680.00$   
25 D-6   8 mi. W of Jct. 83/23 2000 TN -$              -$              -$              
26 D-6   Hwy 136 10 mi NW of Ogallala 3000 TN -$              -$              $5.96 17,880.00$   
27 D-6   Hwy 30 2 mi E of Roscoe 1200 TN -$              -$              $5.62 6,744.00$     
28 D-6   Big springs Yard 3000 TN -$              -$              $5.51 16,530.00$   
29 D-6   Hwy 2 1/2 mi E of Arnold 400 TN -$              -$              -$              
30 D-6   Hwy 2 5 mi S of Dunning 2000 TN $10.00 20,000.00$   $9.32 18,640.00$   -$              
31 D-6   Hwy 2 1/2 mi N of Anselmo 700 TN -$              -$              -$              
32 D-6   Hwy 70 1 mi E of Broken Bow 1000 TN -$              -$              -$              
33 D-6   Hwy 21 5 mi S of Broken Bow 400 TN -$              -$              -$              
34 D-6   Hwy 183 at Ansley 2000 TN -$              -$              -$              
35 D-6  Hwy 183 3 mi S of Sargent 1500 TN -$              -$              -$              
36 D-6   Hwy 2 10 mi W of Mullen 4600 TN $10.68 49,128.00$   $8.35 38,410.00$   -$              
37 D-6   Hwy 2 1 mi W of Mullen 2000 TN $9.42 18,840.00$   $7.87 15,740.00$   -$              
38 D-6   Hwy 61 1 mi N of Arthur 2000 TN -$              $17.38 34,760.00$   $9.32 18,640.00$   
39 D-6   Hwy 61 6 mi n of Arthur 1300 TN -$              $16.68 21,684.00$   $10.30 13,390.00$   
40 D-6   Hwy 83 12 mi N of Stapleton 1300 TN $8.86 11,518.00$   $8.50 11,050.00$   -$              
41 D-6   Hwy 83 15 mi N of Stapleton 1300 TN $8.44 10,972.00$   $8.06 10,478.00$   -$              
42 D-6   Hhwy 83 18 mi n of Stapleton 1300 TN $8.02 10,426.00$   $7.63 9,919.00$     -$              
43 D-6   Hwy 92 2 mi W of Stapleton 300 TN $10.82 3,246.00$     $10.53 3,159.00$     -$              
44 D-6   Hwy 92 11 mi E of Arthur 1000 TN -$              $15.76 15,760.00$   $10.58 10,580.00$   
45 D-6   Hwy 92 3 mi E of Tryon 2000 TN -$              $12.26 24,520.00$   -$              
46 D-6   Hwy 97 9 mi N of Jct 83/97 1300 TN -$              -$              -$              

1015Payment Terms
100%,30days100%,30daysComment

L & L Gravel Ogallala Ready Mix 
CCLG3 Enterprises, Inc.

Li
ne

 # Windrow Gravel

Description

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD



Buyer: Tom Morgan 2393 OF 
Department Of Roads

Opening Date: 03/31/08

Qty Tr. 
UoM

21 D-6   Lexington Yard 700 TN
22 D-6   Gothenburg Yard 700 TN
23 D-6   Hwy 25 1 mi S of Sutherland 1000 TN
24 D-6   Hwy 23 1 mi W of Dickens 2000 TN
25 D-6   8 mi. W of Jct. 83/23 2000 TN
26 D-6   Hwy 136 10 mi NW of Ogallala 3000 TN
27 D-6   Hwy 30 2 mi E of Roscoe 1200 TN
28 D-6   Big springs Yard 3000 TN
29 D-6   Hwy 2 1/2 mi E of Arnold 400 TN
30 D-6   Hwy 2 5 mi S of Dunning 2000 TN
31 D-6   Hwy 2 1/2 mi N of Anselmo 700 TN
32 D-6   Hwy 70 1 mi E of Broken Bow 1000 TN
33 D-6   Hwy 21 5 mi S of Broken Bow 400 TN
34 D-6   Hwy 183 at Ansley 2000 TN
35 D-6  Hwy 183 3 mi S of Sargent 1500 TN
36 D-6   Hwy 2 10 mi W of Mullen 4600 TN
37 D-6   Hwy 2 1 mi W of Mullen 2000 TN
38 D-6   Hwy 61 1 mi N of Arthur 2000 TN
39 D-6   Hwy 61 6 mi n of Arthur 1300 TN
40 D-6   Hwy 83 12 mi N of Stapleton 1300 TN
41 D-6   Hwy 83 15 mi N of Stapleton 1300 TN
42 D-6   Hhwy 83 18 mi n of Stapleton 1300 TN
43 D-6   Hwy 92 2 mi W of Stapleton 300 TN
44 D-6   Hwy 92 11 mi E of Arthur 1000 TN
45 D-6   Hwy 92 3 mi E of Tryon 2000 TN
46 D-6   Hwy 97 9 mi N of Jct 83/97 1300 TN

Payment Terms
Comment

Li
ne

 # Windrow Gravel

Description Unit 
Price Ext. Price Unit 

Price  Ext. Price Unit 
Price  Ext. Price 

$5.03 3,521.00$     $5.09 3,563.00$       -$              
-$             $5.46 3,822.00$       -$              
-$             -$               -$              
-$             $7.89 15,780.00$     -$              
-$             $10.55 21,100.00$     -$              
-$             $5.19 15,570.00$     -$              
-$             $5.19 6,228.00$       -$              
-$             $7.45 22,350.00$     -$              

$18.66 7,464.00$     $9.49 3,796.00$       -$              
-$             $7.93 15,860.00$     -$              

$15.70 10,990.00$   $6.55 4,585.00$       -$              
$11.70 11,700.00$   $7.25 7,250.00$       -$              
$10.50 4,200.00$     $7.75 3,100.00$       -$              
$11.70 23,400.00$   $8.93 17,860.00$     $11.00 22,000.00$   

-$             $7.08 10,620.00$     -$              
-$             -$               -$              
-$             -$               -$              
-$             $8.81 17,620.00$     -$              
-$             $9.58 12,454.00$     -$              
-$             -$               -$              
-$             -$               -$              
-$             -$               -$              
-$             $9.32 2,796.00$       -$              
-$             $10.11 10,110.00$     -$              
-$             $9.60 19,200.00$     -$              
-$             $7.45 9,685.00$       -$              

Marxse

When Requested 30Upon Request
100%,30days 100%,30days

T & F Sand & Gravel, 
Inc.

Overton Sand and 
Gravel Co. Paulsen, Inc.

PARTIAL AWARDPARTIAL AWARD



Buyer: Tom Morgan 2393 OF 
Department Of Roads

Opening Date: 03/31/08

Qty Tr. 
UoM

21 D-6   Lexington Yard 700 TN
22 D-6   Gothenburg Yard 700 TN
23 D-6   Hwy 25 1 mi S of Sutherland 1000 TN
24 D-6   Hwy 23 1 mi W of Dickens 2000 TN
25 D-6   8 mi. W of Jct. 83/23 2000 TN
26 D-6   Hwy 136 10 mi NW of Ogallala 3000 TN
27 D-6   Hwy 30 2 mi E of Roscoe 1200 TN
28 D-6   Big springs Yard 3000 TN
29 D-6   Hwy 2 1/2 mi E of Arnold 400 TN
30 D-6   Hwy 2 5 mi S of Dunning 2000 TN
31 D-6   Hwy 2 1/2 mi N of Anselmo 700 TN
32 D-6   Hwy 70 1 mi E of Broken Bow 1000 TN
33 D-6   Hwy 21 5 mi S of Broken Bow 400 TN
34 D-6   Hwy 183 at Ansley 2000 TN
35 D-6  Hwy 183 3 mi S of Sargent 1500 TN
36 D-6   Hwy 2 10 mi W of Mullen 4600 TN
37 D-6   Hwy 2 1 mi W of Mullen 2000 TN
38 D-6   Hwy 61 1 mi N of Arthur 2000 TN
39 D-6   Hwy 61 6 mi n of Arthur 1300 TN
40 D-6   Hwy 83 12 mi N of Stapleton 1300 TN
41 D-6   Hwy 83 15 mi N of Stapleton 1300 TN
42 D-6   Hhwy 83 18 mi n of Stapleton 1300 TN
43 D-6   Hwy 92 2 mi W of Stapleton 300 TN
44 D-6   Hwy 92 11 mi E of Arthur 1000 TN
45 D-6   Hwy 92 3 mi E of Tryon 2000 TN
46 D-6   Hwy 97 9 mi N of Jct 83/97 1300 TN

Payment Terms
Comment

Li
ne

 # Windrow Gravel

Description Unit 
Price  Ext. Price 

-$                
-$                

$7.95 7,950.00$       
$10.24 20,480.00$     

$9.28 18,560.00$     
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                

$10.88 14,144.00$     
$11.36 14,768.00$     
$11.84 15,392.00$     

$9.28 2,784.00$       
-$                

$9.28 18,560.00$     
$6.40 8,320.00$       

n Sand & Gravel
No Bid

14
100%,30days

Western Materials Inc.

PARTIAL AWARD



Buyer: Tom Morgan 2393 OF 
Department Of Roads

Opening Date: 03/31/08

Qty Tr. 
UoM

Unit 
Price Ext. Price Unit 

Price  Ext. Price Unit 
Price  Ext. Price 

47 D-7    Arapahoe Yard 2900 TN -$                -$              $10.56 30,624.00$      
48 D-7    Hwy 83 4 mi S of Maywood 600 TN -$                -$              -$                 
49 D-7   Hwy 23 4 mi E of Moorefield 600 TN -$                -$              -$                 
50 D-7    Hwy 23 1/2 mi W of Elwood 600 TN -$                -$              -$                 
51 D-7    Hwy 6 4.5 mi W of Mc Cook 2300 TN -$                -$              -$                 
52 D-7    Hwy 136 1 mi E of Orleans 900 TN -$                -$              $9.99 8,991.00$        
53 D-7    Hwy 136 1 mi W of Franklin 900 TN -$                $10.45 9,405.00$     $8.94 8,046.00$        
54 D-7    Hwy 23 W edge of Holdrege 1400 TN -$                -$              -$                 
55 D-7   Minden Yard 1200 TN -$                $7.21 8,652.00$     -$                 
56 D-7   Hwy 23 5 mi W of Grant 500 TN -$                -$              -$                 
57 D-7   Hwy 61 6 mi N of Grant 500 TN -$                -$              -$                 
58 D-7    Hwy 6 14 mi W of Imperial 500 TN -$                -$              -$                 
59 D-7   Hwy 6 1 mi E of Palisade 1900 TN -$                -$              -$                 
60 D-7   Hwy 6 8 mi S of Enders 500 TN $9.26 4,630.00$       -$              -$                 
61 D-7   Hwy 34 2 mi E of Benkelman 1000 TN $5.56 5,560.00$       -$              -$                 
62 D-7   Hwy 34 3 mi E of Haigler 1400 TN $9.44 13,216.00$     -$              -$                 

Payment Terms 10 10 10
100%, 30days Net 30 Net 45Comment

Deweese Sand & 
Gravel, Inc.Brads Sand and Gravel Broadfoot Sand & 

Gravel Inc.

Li
ne

 # Windrow Gravel

Description

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD



Buyer: Tom Morgan 2393 OF 
Department Of Roads

Opening Date: 03/31/08

Qty Tr. 
UoM

47 D-7    Arapahoe Yard 2900 TN
48 D-7    Hwy 83 4 mi S of Maywood 600 TN
49 D-7   Hwy 23 4 mi E of Moorefield 600 TN
50 D-7    Hwy 23 1/2 mi W of Elwood 600 TN
51 D-7    Hwy 6 4.5 mi W of Mc Cook 2300 TN
52 D-7    Hwy 136 1 mi E of Orleans 900 TN
53 D-7    Hwy 136 1 mi W of Franklin 900 TN
54 D-7    Hwy 23 W edge of Holdrege 1400 TN
55 D-7   Minden Yard 1200 TN
56 D-7   Hwy 23 5 mi W of Grant 500 TN
57 D-7   Hwy 61 6 mi N of Grant 500 TN
58 D-7    Hwy 6 14 mi W of Imperial 500 TN
59 D-7   Hwy 6 1 mi E of Palisade 1900 TN
60 D-7   Hwy 6 8 mi S of Enders 500 TN
61 D-7   Hwy 34 2 mi E of Benkelman 1000 TN
62 D-7   Hwy 34 3 mi E of Haigler 1400 TN

Payment Terms
Comment

Li
ne

 # Windrow Gravel

Description Unit 
Price Ext. Price Unit 

Price  Ext. Price Unit 
Price  Ext. Price Unit 

Price  Ext. Price 

-$                -$             -$             -$             
$15.81 9,486.00$       -$             $9.89 5,934.00$    -$             

-$                -$             -$             -$             
-$                -$             -$             -$             

$5.21 11,983.00$     -$             $5.89 13,547.00$  -$             
-$                -$             -$             -$             
-$                -$             -$             -$             
-$                -$             -$             -$             
-$                $7.26 8,712.00$     -$             $7.45 8,940.00$    
-$                -$             -$             -$             
-$                -$             -$             -$             

$16.99 8,495.00$       -$             -$             -$             
$8.24 15,656.00$     -$             $8.97 17,043.00$  -$             

$10.49 5,245.00$       -$             -$             -$             
$5.53 5,530.00$       -$             -$             -$             
$9.46 13,244.00$     -$             -$             -$             

307As Needed60
100%,30daysNet 30100%, 30days 100%,30days

Mid-Nebraska 
AggregateHancock GravelE.I.A LLC Ed Broadfoot & Sons 

Sand & Gravel

PARTIAL AWARD



Buyer: Tom Morgan 2393 OF 
Department Of Roads

Opening Date: 03/31/08

Qty Tr. 
UoM

47 D-7    Arapahoe Yard 2900 TN
48 D-7    Hwy 83 4 mi S of Maywood 600 TN
49 D-7   Hwy 23 4 mi E of Moorefield 600 TN
50 D-7    Hwy 23 1/2 mi W of Elwood 600 TN
51 D-7    Hwy 6 4.5 mi W of Mc Cook 2300 TN
52 D-7    Hwy 136 1 mi E of Orleans 900 TN
53 D-7    Hwy 136 1 mi W of Franklin 900 TN
54 D-7    Hwy 23 W edge of Holdrege 1400 TN
55 D-7   Minden Yard 1200 TN
56 D-7   Hwy 23 5 mi W of Grant 500 TN
57 D-7   Hwy 61 6 mi N of Grant 500 TN
58 D-7    Hwy 6 14 mi W of Imperial 500 TN
59 D-7   Hwy 6 1 mi E of Palisade 1900 TN
60 D-7   Hwy 6 8 mi S of Enders 500 TN
61 D-7   Hwy 34 2 mi E of Benkelman 1000 TN
62 D-7   Hwy 34 3 mi E of Haigler 1400 TN

Payment Terms
Comment

Li
ne

 # Windrow Gravel

Description Unit 
Price Ext. Price Unit 

Price Ext. Price Unit 
Price  Ext. Price Unit 

Price  Ext. Price 

-$              $8.25 23,925.00$   $8.22 23,838.00$     -$              
-$              -$             $9.60 5,760.00$       -$              
-$              -$             $7.75 4,650.00$       -$              
-$              $7.25 4,350.00$     $6.60 3,960.00$       -$              
-$              -$             $6.37 14,651.00$     -$              
-$              $11.70 10,530.00$   -$               $9.50 8,550.00$     
-$              $15.70 14,130.00$   -$               -$              
-$              $7.38 10,332.00$   -$               $6.95 9,730.00$     
-$              -$             -$               -$              

$6.90 3,450.00$     -$             $5.82 2,910.00$       -$              
$5.90 2,950.00$     -$             $5.62 2,810.00$       -$              

$12.08 6,040.00$     -$             $11.56 5,780.00$       -$              
-$              -$             $8.81 16,739.00$     -$              

$13.20 6,600.00$     -$             $11.46 5,730.00$       -$              
-$              -$             $12.31 12,310.00$     -$              
-$              -$             $15.10 21,140.00$     -$              

Marxse

When Requested 30Upon Request
100%,30days 100%,30days

T & F Sand & Gravel, 
Inc.

Overton Sand and 
Gravel Co. Paulsen, Inc.Ogallala Ready Mix 

CCL

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD



Buyer: Tom Morgan 2393 OF 
Department Of Roads

Opening Date: 03/31/08

Qty Tr. 
UoM

47 D-7    Arapahoe Yard 2900 TN
48 D-7    Hwy 83 4 mi S of Maywood 600 TN
49 D-7   Hwy 23 4 mi E of Moorefield 600 TN
50 D-7    Hwy 23 1/2 mi W of Elwood 600 TN
51 D-7    Hwy 6 4.5 mi W of Mc Cook 2300 TN
52 D-7    Hwy 136 1 mi E of Orleans 900 TN
53 D-7    Hwy 136 1 mi W of Franklin 900 TN
54 D-7    Hwy 23 W edge of Holdrege 1400 TN
55 D-7   Minden Yard 1200 TN
56 D-7   Hwy 23 5 mi W of Grant 500 TN
57 D-7   Hwy 61 6 mi N of Grant 500 TN
58 D-7    Hwy 6 14 mi W of Imperial 500 TN
59 D-7   Hwy 6 1 mi E of Palisade 1900 TN
60 D-7   Hwy 6 8 mi S of Enders 500 TN
61 D-7   Hwy 34 2 mi E of Benkelman 1000 TN
62 D-7   Hwy 34 3 mi E of Haigler 1400 TN

Payment Terms
Comment

Li
ne

 # Windrow Gravel

Description Unit 
Price  Ext. Price 

-$                
-$                

$10.24 6,144.00$       
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                
-$                

n Sand & Gravel
No Bid

14
100%,30days

Western Materials Inc.



Buyer: Tom Morgan 2393 OF 
Department Of Roads

Opening Date: 03/31/08

Qty Tr. 
UoM

Unit 
Price  Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit 

Price Ext. Price

63 D-8  Ainsworth Yard 900 TN -$            9.80$      8,820.00$    11.90$  10,710.00$  
64 D-8  Hwy 12 1 mi W of Norden 1200 TN -$            14.00$    16,800.00$  17.25$  20,700.00$  
65 D-8  Hwy 183 3 mi S of Basset 600 TN -$            7.78$      4,668.00$    -$            
66 D-8   Hwy 183 2 mi N of Springview 1200 TN -$            11.62$    13,944.00$  13.94$  16,728.00$  
67 D-8   Hwy 137 22 mi N of Newport 300 TN -$            9.60$      2,880.00$    -$            
68 D-8  Hwy 20 2 mi E of Atkinson 700 TN -$            5.58$      3,906.00$    -$            
69 D-8  Hwy 281 10 mi S of O' Neill 1800 TN 8.10$  14,580.00$  7.49$      13,482.00$  -$            
70 D-8   Hwy 12 2 mi E of Naper 400 TN -$            8.90$      3,560.00$    -$            
71 D-8   Hwy 281 2 mi E of Spencer 750 TN 7.95$  5,962.50$    7.78$      5,835.00$    -$            
72 D-8  Hwy 183 12 mi N of Taylor 2800 TN -$            16.92$    47,376.00$  -$            
73 D-8   Hwy 11 1 mi S of Burwell 2800 TN -$            15.80$    44,240.00$  -$            
74 D-8   Hwy 20 1 mi W of Merriman 600 TN -$            26.40$    15,840.00$  21.85$  13,110.00$  
75 D-8   Hwy 20 5.5 mi E of Cody 600 TN -$            22.20$    13,320.00$  17.65$  10,590.00$  
76 D-8   Hwy 20 1 mi W of Norden 300 TN -$            13.50$    4,050.00$    17.40$  5,220.00$    
77 D-8   Hwy 83 49 S of Valentine 300 TN -$            24.86$    7,458.00$    -$            
78 D-8   Hwy 20 5.5 mi E of Valentine 600 TN -$            16.32$    9,792.00$    12.25$  7,350.00$    

76. Norden is quoted if 
this is Ninzel this is the 

bid priceComments

Payment Terms 30 35 30
100%,30daysComment 100%, 30days 100%, 30days

D&L Sand & Gravel 
LLC

Li
ne

 # Windrow Gravel
Anthony R Emme 

dba Emme Sand & 
Gravel

Atkinson Sand & Gravel

Description

PARTIAL AWARD



Buyer: Tom Morgan 2393 OF 
Department Of Roads

Opening Date: 03/31/08

Qty Tr. 
UoM

63 D-8  Ainsworth Yard 900 TN
64 D-8  Hwy 12 1 mi W of Norden 1200 TN
65 D-8  Hwy 183 3 mi S of Basset 600 TN
66 D-8   Hwy 183 2 mi N of Springview 1200 TN
67 D-8   Hwy 137 22 mi N of Newport 300 TN
68 D-8  Hwy 20 2 mi E of Atkinson 700 TN
69 D-8  Hwy 281 10 mi S of O' Neill 1800 TN
70 D-8   Hwy 12 2 mi E of Naper 400 TN
71 D-8   Hwy 281 2 mi E of Spencer 750 TN
72 D-8  Hwy 183 12 mi N of Taylor 2800 TN
73 D-8   Hwy 11 1 mi S of Burwell 2800 TN
74 D-8   Hwy 20 1 mi W of Merriman 600 TN
75 D-8   Hwy 20 5.5 mi E of Cody 600 TN
76 D-8   Hwy 20 1 mi W of Norden 300 TN
77 D-8   Hwy 83 49 S of Valentine 300 TN
78 D-8   Hwy 20 5.5 mi E of Valentine 600 TN

Comments

Payment Terms
Comment

Li
ne

 # Windrow Gravel

Description Unit 
Price Ext. Price Unit 

Price  Ext. Price Unit 
Price Ext. Price

10.23$  9,207.00$    -$            8.70$    7,830.00$    
15.31$  18,372.00$  -$            14.10$  16,920.00$  

7.49$    4,494.00$    -$            -$            
12.41$  14,892.00$  -$            11.40$  13,680.00$  

9.22$    2,766.00$    -$            -$            
4.99$    3,493.00$    -$            -$            

-$            -$            -$            
9.05$    3,620.00$    -$            -$            

-$            -$            -$            
-$            -$            -$            
-$            -$            -$            
-$            23.70$  14,220.00$  21.00$  12,600.00$  
-$            13.58$  8,148.00$    16.80$  10,080.00$  
-$            -$            14.10$  4,230.00$    
-$            7.50$    2,250.00$    -$            

17.05$  10,230.00$  -$            11.25$  6,750.00$    

10 15 30
100%,30days100%,30days 100%,30days

G3 Enterprises, Inc. Garrison Sand & 
GravelElkhorn Sand & Gravel

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD



Buyer: Tom Morgan 2393 OF 
Department Of Roads

Opening Date: 03/31/08

Qty Tr. 
UoM

63 D-8  Ainsworth Yard 900 TN
64 D-8  Hwy 12 1 mi W of Norden 1200 TN
65 D-8  Hwy 183 3 mi S of Basset 600 TN
66 D-8   Hwy 183 2 mi N of Springview 1200 TN
67 D-8   Hwy 137 22 mi N of Newport 300 TN
68 D-8  Hwy 20 2 mi E of Atkinson 700 TN
69 D-8  Hwy 281 10 mi S of O' Neill 1800 TN
70 D-8   Hwy 12 2 mi E of Naper 400 TN
71 D-8   Hwy 281 2 mi E of Spencer 750 TN
72 D-8  Hwy 183 12 mi N of Taylor 2800 TN
73 D-8   Hwy 11 1 mi S of Burwell 2800 TN
74 D-8   Hwy 20 1 mi W of Merriman 600 TN
75 D-8   Hwy 20 5.5 mi E of Cody 600 TN
76 D-8   Hwy 20 1 mi W of Norden 300 TN
77 D-8   Hwy 83 49 S of Valentine 300 TN
78 D-8   Hwy 20 5.5 mi E of Valentine 600 TN

Comments

Payment Terms
Comment

Li
ne

 # Windrow Gravel

Description Unit 
Price  Ext. Price Unit 

Price Ext. Price  Unit 
Price Ext. Price Unit 

Price Ext. Price

-$            -$            -$            -$            
-$            -$            14.99$  17,988.00$  -$            
-$            -$            -$            -$            
-$            -$            12.00$  14,400.00$  -$            
-$            -$            -$            -$            
-$            -$            -$            -$            
-$            -$            -$            -$            
-$            -$            -$            -$            
-$            -$            -$            -$            

8.50$  23,800.00$  -$            -$            -$            
6.95$  19,460.00$  -$            -$            8.50$  23,800.00$  

-$            21.92$  13,152.00$  -$            -$            
-$            18.56$  11,136.00$  -$            -$            
-$            18.00$  5,400.00$    -$            -$            
-$            7.60$    2,280.00$    -$            -$            
-$            13.38$  8,028.00$    -$            -$            

Marxsen Sand & Gravel
No Bid

30 As NeededAs Needed 10
100%,30days100%,30days100%,30days

Ulrich Gravel Inc.Quinn Sand & GravelJeffres Sand & 
Gravel Inc. L & L Gravel

PARTIAL AWARD


