Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

2386 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date: 03/19/08

“ Tee Shirts ATD American | Canada Most|r_1 Trading Chill Marketing Comade, Inc. Deena Supply Co.,
@ Co Corporation Inc.
c
5 - - - -
Qty/| Unit ) Unit . o Ext. Unit ) Unit .
Description bz | Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Unit Price Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
White Tee Shirts size medium to 5XL 4788 $ - | $ 40.68| $194,775.84 $ - | $26.80| $128,318.40 $ -
Brand and Style Bidding G"da”EZSjOOO oM Andlong 101510#-01 Gildan 8000 Gildan Inwear & FM
1 $16.24 - Med -
XL M-XL 1012dz @ M-XL $15.30
Comment $25.28 -2XL $19.08 2X $19.80
$25.68 - 3XL 2X-5X 3776dz @ $ 3X $22.20
$26.08 - 4XL 36.00 4X-5X $25.50
$27.08 - 5XL
White Tee Shirts size 6XL to 8XL [ 212 [ 3 - | $ 43.08] $ 9,132.96 [ $ -[$3350[$ 7,102.00] $32.10] $6,805.20
T Tees- R-US ) Just Big Sportswear
Brand and Style Bidding: #7985 Andlong 101510#-01 Basic Tee FMC FM
2
$39.84 - 6XL 6X 170dz @ $130.52
Comment $43.98 - 7XL 7X 22dz @ $145.68
$48.44 - 8XL 8X 20dz @ $168.20
Light Grey Tee Shirts size Medium to 5XL | 320 $ -1 $ 4068 $ 13,017.60 $ -1 $47.35| $ 15,152.00 $ -
Brand and Style Bidding: Glldarllzz:ﬁ-:-;ooo ol Andiong 101510#-02 Gildan 8000 Gildan #8000 FM
3 $21.54- Med - XL M-XL 115dz @
$30.98 - 2XL $24.24 M-XL $28.75
Comment $32.98 - 4XL 2X-5X 265dz @ 2X-3X $37.67
$33.84 - 4XL $36.00 4X-5X $45.00
$35.84 - 5XL ’
Light Grey Tee Shirts 6XL to 8XL [ 50 [ $ - | $ 43.08] $ 2,154.00 [ $ -]$65.00]$ 3,250.00] $67.22] $3,361.00
Brand and Style Bidding: Gildan #G8000 or Andlong 10151#-02 Just Big Sportswear Gildan FM
Equal Basic Tee
4
$66.94 - 6XL 6X 30dz @ $130.52
Comment $92.12 - 7XL On 4X 7X 15dz @ $145.68
$113.12 - 8XL 8X 5dz @ $168.20
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 2386 OF Opening Date: 03/19/08

All Agencies
“ Tee Shirts ATD American | Canada Most|r_1 Trading Chill Marketing Comade, Inc. Deena Supply Co.,
@ Co Corporation Inc.
c
3 n n n n
Qty/| Unit . Unit . o Ext. Unit ) Unit .
Description o7 | Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Unit Price Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
Dark Grey Tee Shirt size medium to 5XL 130 $ -|$ 40.68| $ 5,288.40 $ -| $47.35| $ 6,155.50 $ -
S Gildan #G8000 or| Gildan 8000 - M-3XL .
Brand and Style Bidding: Equal Andlong 10150 #-03 Gildan 2000 4X-5X Gildan #8000 FM & TND
5 $21.54 - Med-XL M'é’éfi‘f @
$30.98 - 2XL 2%-3X 4.5dz @ M-XL $28.78
Comment $32.98 - 3XL $36.00 2X-3X $37.67
igg'gj ) git 4X-5X 20dz @ AX-5X $45
' $38.40
Dark Grey Tee Shirt [ 20 K -|$ 43.08] $  861.60 [ $ -13$6500] $ 1,300.00] $67.22] $1,344.40
Tees-R- Just Big Sportswear
Brand and Style Biddling: Us#8340, 100% Andlong 101510#-03 9P Gildan FM & TND
Basic Tee
6 Cotton
$66.94 - 6XL 6X 10dz @ $130.52
Comment $92.12 - 7XL 7X5dz @ $145.68
$113.12 - 8XL 8X 5dz @ $168.20
Payment Terms Net 30 n/a 50% net 15 Net 30 Net 30
Delivery Days ARO 15-30 30 25 30
1ld&e: 4x & 5X Sport
Re: Items 1-6: Grey - are 100%
Same as supplied cotton first quality
on your contract Gildan 2000 all 6x-8X
Comments #115750C are 100% cotton-cut
1d. 6XL-8XL LT longer & side stitched
and DK Gray are for durability & to
100% Cotton allow for shrinkage.
Gildan 8000 is 5.60z
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Opening Date: 03/19/08

Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 2386 OF
All Agencies
AWARD
. . . Mid-Eastern . .
T+ Tee Shirts Fruit of the Loom Govpromotions Inc. o Murray & Co. Promotional Design Inc.
o Advertising
c
5 - - - : -
Description %t;/ Plii?:g Ext. Price Pl;'ir;g Ext. Price Pl;'ir;g Ext. Price PL:ir;g Ext. Price Pl;'ir;g Ext. Price
White Tee Shirts size medium to 5XL 4788| $ 1.99] $9,528.12| $ 35.88| $171,793.44 $ - $ - [ $ 25.75( $123,291.00
Fruit of the Loom 593 Fruit-of-the-Loom
Brand and Style Bidding (sm-4X) or Jerzees Big Top's T's 5XL . y Gildan G800 Gildan 8000
& Big Top T's
29M (5X)
Med-20.76
1 Lg.-20.76
XL-20.76 Med-X-Large
Comment 2XL-31.20 $17.25
3XL-31.20 2XL-5XL $27.50
4XL-31.20
5XL-108.00
White Tee Shirts size 6XL to 8XL [ 212 [ 3 - | $150.00] $ 31,800.00 $ - [ s - | $ 58.00] $ 12,296.00
Brand and Style Bidding: NA Big Top's T's 8XL Big Top T's Tarheel 31 S/S Just Big
2
6XL 120.00 6XL $52.00
Comment no bid 7XL 147.00 7XL $56.00
8XL 189.00 8XL $60.00
Light Grey Tee Shirts size Mediumto 5XL | 320 $ 4.04( $1,292.80( $ 48.00| $ 15,360.00 $ - $ - | $ 3050 $ 9,760.00
Fruit of the Loom Fruit-of-the-Loom
Brand and Style Bidding: 5993X (sm-3X) Big Top T's 5XL & Big Top T's Gildan G800 Gildan 8000
Jerzees 29m (4X-5X)
Med-28.20
3 Lg.-28.20
XL-28.20 Med-X-Large
Comment 2XL-39.00 $22.20
3XL-39.00 2XL-5XL $33.35
4XL-100.20
5XL-111.00
Light Grey Tee Shirts 6XL to 8XL [ 50 [ 3 - [ $150.00] $ 7,500.00 [ 3 - [ s - | $ 69.00] $ 3,450.00
Brand and Style Bidding: NA Big Top T's 8XL Big Top T's Tarheel 31 S/S Just Big
4
6XL 135.00 6XL $60.70
Comment no bid 7XL 165.00 7XL $65.00
8XL 204.00 8XL $69.40
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

Opening Date: 03/19/08

2386 OF
All Agencies
. . . Mid-Eastern ) .
T+ Tee Shirts Fruit of the Loom Govpromotions Inc. o Murray & Co. Promotional Design Inc.
o Advertising
c
3 n n n - -
Qty/ Unit . Unit ) Unit . Unit . Unit .
Description D7 Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
Dark Grey Tee Shirt size medium to 5XL 130| $ 4.04| $ 52520|$ 54.72| $ 7,113.60 $ - $ $ 3050 $ 3,965.00
Fruit of the Loom Fruit-of-the-Loom
Brand and Style Bidding: 5994X (SM-3X) Big Top T's 5XL & Big Top T's Gildan G800 Gildan 8000
Jerzees 29M (4X-5X) g top
Med-28.20
5 Lg.-28.20
XL-28.20 Med-X-Large
Comment 2XL-39.00 $22.20
3XL-39.00 2XL-5XL $33.35
4XL-100.20
5XL-111.00
Dark Grey Tee Shirt [ 20 [ 3 - [ $150.00] $ 3,000.00 [ 3 - [ s $ 69.00] $ 1,380.00
Brand and Style Biddling: na Big Top T's 8XL Big Top T's Tarheel 31 S/S Just Big
6
6XL 135.00 6XL $60.70
Comment no bid 7XL 165.00 7XL $65.00
8XL 204.00 8XL $69.40
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Delivery Days ARO 20-25 30 30 30 30
Brand and Style of
Tee Shirts The
le. 5.6 0z
Comments other means the
5b. N/a . ;
bigger sizes are
100% 6.10z.
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

2386 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date: 03/19/08

TD Sanderss & More,

T+ Tee Shirts Pro Procure RT & Associates Screen Co. Stroud Safety Apparel LLC
(O]
c
] B
- Qty/ U.mt E.Xt' Unit Price | Ext. Price| Unit Price | Ext. Price| Unit Price| Ext. Price | Unit Price| Ext. Price
Description Dz Price Price
White Tee Shirts size medium to 5XL 4788 $ - $ - $ 4.70] $22,503.60
Brand and Style Bidding G8000 50/50 Gildan & Port Aut. Gildan 8000 Gildan 8000 W Gildan 50/50
1
Comment xLszed0 | XL szon | 101202 MXLS2040|  MXL81920
3XL-5XL $26.80 3776dz 2X-5X $30.24 2X-5X $35.10
White Tee Shirts size 6XL to 8XL [212 [ 5 - [ [ -[$ 50.70] $10,748.40[ $ 15.20] $ 3,222.40
Brand and Style Bidding: Texas Tee 100% | YUStBi9 S‘NT,\jes RUS| Alstyle #1302 (6X-7X) Gildan 8000 W Big Top T's
2
6XL $100.80 6XL $50.00
Comment 7XL $114.13 7XL $55.00 1%‘322 2))((';?8%43668
8XL $134.13 8XL $60.00 '
Light Grey Tee Shirts size Medium to 5XL | 320 $ - $ - $ -[$ 5721 $ 1,830.40
Brand and Style Bidding: G8000 50/50 Gildan Gildan 8000 Gildan 8000 LG Gildan 50/50
3
M-XL $22.00 Sm-XL $23.40
M-XL $24.60 M-XL $25.80
Comment 2XL $32.67 2XL-5XL $38.40
XL $33.47 2X-5X $36.12 2X-5X $42.15
Light Grey Tee Shirts 6XL to 8XL | 50 [ - [ [ s -1 $ 5715[$ 2,857.50] $ 15.20[ $  760.00
Brand and Style Bidding: Texas Tee 100% | YUt Bi9 S‘NT,\jes RUSI Alstyle #1302 Gildan 8000 LG Big Top T's
4
6XL $100.80 6XL $65.00
Comment 7XL $114.13 7XL $70.00 6;;2(133%34
8XL $134.13 8XL $75.00 '
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Opening Date: 03/19/08

Buyer: Julie Dabydeen 2386 OF
All Agencies
T+ Tee Shirts Pro Procure RT & Associates Screen Co. Stroud Safety Apparel D Sandfisés & More,
2
5 -
e Qty/ U.mt E.Xt' Unit Price | Ext. Price| Unit Price | Ext. Price| Unit Price| Ext. Price | Unit Price| Ext. Price
Description Dz Price Price
Dark Grey Tee Shirt size medium to 5XL | 130 $ - $ -1 $ - $ 572 $ 743.60
A . Gildan 800 (M-3X) . .
Brand and Style Bidding: G8000 50/50 Gildan/BNM Alstyle #1302 (4X-5X) Gildan 8000 DG Gildan 50/50
5
M-XL $24.60
M-XL $24.96 Sm-XL $23.40 2X-3X $36.12 M-XL $25.80
Comment 2XL $37.56 2XL-5XL $38.40
AXLEXL $37.44 4X $42.36 2X-5X $42.15
' 5X $46.32
Dark Grey Tee Shirt [ 20 [ s - [ [ s -1'$ 57.15] $ 1,143.00] $ 18.25] $ 365.00
Brand and Style Biddling: Texas Tee 100% | YUStBi9 S‘NT,\jes RUSI Alstyle #1302 Gildan 8000 DG Big Top T's
6
6XL $100.80 6XL $65.00
Comment 7XL $114.12 7XL $70.00 6§<x7$)<1§g%g4
8XL $134.16 8XL $75.00 '
Payment Terms 0% of 30 0.5% 15 Net 30 2% 20 days
Delivery Days ARO 14 30/90 14-21 30
All or None

Comments

1d&e:All 6X-8X shirts
are 100% Cotton and
6.10z

1d. Sizes 6XL-7XL
8XL 100% cotton
jersey 5.60z
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

2386 OF
All Agencies

Volunteer Knit Apparel,

8X $159.00/dz

S Tee Shirts Uniforms MFG Inc. Union Supply Co. Inc
2 '
- Qty/[  unit ] o : o )
L . Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price| Unit Price Ext. Price
Description Dz Price
White Tee Shirts size medium to 5XL 4788 $ -1 $ 3.12| $14,938.56
i 0,
Brand and Style Bidding Umi 321-0 Gilden 100% Cotton Volunteer 1325A
6.10z as spec.
1
Comment S-XL $17.11 Med-XL $23.40/dz
2X-5X $30.50 2X-5X $35.40/dz
White Tee Shirts size 6XL to 8XL [212 [ [ s -1s 467] $  990.04
USC/Phoenix-
Brand and Style Bidding: Umi 321-0 100%Cotton 6.10z - as Volunteer 1325A
spec.
2
Comment 6X $31.20 6X-7X $120.00/dz
7X-8X $34.10 8X $156.00/dz
Light Grey Tee Shirts size Medium to 5XL | 320 $ - $ -8 3.21| $ 1,027.20
i 0,
Brand and Style Bidding: Umi 321-0 Gilden 100% Cotton Volunteer 1325A
6.10z as spec.
3
Comment S-XL $23.06 Med-XL $30.00/dz
2X-5X $36.46 2X-5X $42.60/dz
Light Grey Tee Shirts 6XL to 8XL [ 50 |$ 49.48] $2,474.00 [ $ -8 478 $  239.00
USC/Phoenix-
Brand and Style Bidding: Umi 321-0 100%Cotton 6.10z - as Volunteer 1325A
4 spec.
6X-7X $120.00/dz
Comment
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Opening Date: 03/19/08



Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

2386 OF
All Agencies

Volunteer Knit Apparel,

Opening Date: 03/19/08

Award Explanation:

8X $159.00/dz

T+ Tee Shirts Uniforms MFG Inc. Union Supply Co. Inc
= '
- Qty/[  unit ] o : o )
L . Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price| Unit Price Ext. Price
Description DZ Price
Dark Grey Tee Shirt size medium to 5XL | 130 $ -1 $ 3.46| $ 449.80
i 0,
Brand and Style Bidding: Umi 321-0 Gilden 100% Cotton Volunteer 1325A
6.10z as spec.
5
S-XL $23.06
Comment 2X-3X $36.46 e
4X-5X $42.04 ’
Dark Grey Tee Shirt [ 20 [ $ 49.48] $ 989.60 [ $ -1 s 5.16] $  103.20
USC/Phoenix-
Brand and Style Biddling: Umi 321-0 100%Cotton 6.10z - as Volunteer 1325A
6 spec.
Comment 6X-7X $120.00/dz

Payment Terms

0%, 30days

Delivery Days ARO

Net 30 for stock sizes

14

30

Deena Supply - did not supply all the samples
that were requested - Samples did not meet
specs in fabrication and sizing.

ATD American Co. - Bid Gildan #G800 or
equal - not acceptable. Sample FM Brand
shirt did not meet specs in fabrication.

RT & Associates withdrew their bid.

Invaild Bid

Comments

1d.& e.: 100% cotton, 6.1
oz.

All items bid as ea rather
than dz
5a & b. 30 days ARO
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Bob Barker Co. - no signature

No Bid

Jerry Flag Store
Outdoor Outfits



